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T A G                                                                  
The Aden Group, LLC.                                                   
 
8022 Fairfax Road   
Alexandria, VA 22308 
(571) 274-7821 
www.theadengroup.com 
 
By email 
 
October 18, 2021 
 
Michelle Heyer 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 
 
Tim Mygatt 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 
 
Barbara A. Langhenry 
Gary Singletary 
Sharon Dumas 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 
 
 
 RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team — September 2021 Invoice 
 
 
I. INTRODUCTION 
 
This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 
 
The Team’s invoice for services rendered in September 2021 was $86,328.17. The bill accounts 
for 569.8 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from September 1, 2021 
through September 30, 2021.  Of this time 153.2 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated 
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to the City of Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of over 33 percent of its time for September 2021 as 
pro bono time saved $38,300.00 
 
Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total, five-year budget cap of $4.95 million to which the City, 
Department of Justice, and Court agreed in October 2015. The budget for year six is $794,000.00, 
which the monitoring team invoicing is well within. 
 
Activities, work, and tasks conducted during September 2021 included but were not limited to: 
 

• Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing 
training addressing:   (In-person audits resumed) 

 

! Force Review Board; 

! Crisis intervention; 

! Bias-Free policing; and 

! Supervision. 
 

• Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and drafting of new policies, processes, 
procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to: 

! Supervisory response to use of force incidents; 

! Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command; 

! Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”); 
! Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs (“IA”); 

! Chain of command misconduct review process; 

! Discipline process and 

! Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”). 

! Officer Intervention Program (OIP) 
 

• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding 
implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to: 

! Crisis intervention; 

! Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”); 

! District Policing Committees (“DPC”s); 

! Staffing; 

! Recruitment and hiring; and 
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• Ongoing meetings and discussions with the CPC regarding proposed meetings and ways 
to better collaborate on deliverables. 

• Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system and drafting several memorandums 
regarding matters of concern; 

• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and 
Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting 
regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and functions; 

• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome 
measurements; 

• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”), 
including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian complaint 
investigations; 

• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and 
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and development; 
provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB Manual, and 
regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and 

• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer organizations, 
and community organizations. 

• Ongoing Use of Force outcome assessment, including reconciliation meetings and updates 
to assessors and the monitor. 

• Ongoing project management and coordination for deliverables (internal and with the City 
and DOJ) 

• Ongoing development and discussions of the consent decree timeline for the Court.   
• Ongoing discussions regarding training and methods of delivery during Covid-19 

limitations. 
• Significant drafting assignments regarding the 10th Semiannual Report.  The report was 

completed in September 2021. 
• Project management and planning for the next monitoring period and anticipated costs, 

resources and personnel needed to achieve the Court’s Consent Decree mandates.   
• Project management regarding priorities in the upcoming year. 
• Coordination with the United Way and the NAACP regarding the monthly public sessions 

on key areas of the Consent Decree 
• Correspondence with the Court regarding a change in frequency for Court hearings and 

logistics for Public Hearings to keep the public informed of the progress of the Consent 
Decree. 

• Preparation for and coordination for hearings with the Court and the September in-person 
Site Visit. 

• 2021 extensive OPS assessment was launched and is in progress. 
• Full Monitoring Team site visit since 2019, to include an in-person Global Six meeting 

with the Court. 
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II. INVOICE SUMMARY 
 
 

 September 2021 

Billable Hours $79,580.00 

Overhead/Expenses $6,748.17 

TOTAL $86,328.17 

 
Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 
 
 

 Total 
Hours 

Billed 
Hours 

Pro 
Bono 

Hours 
Total Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 95.60 35.60 60.00 $8,900.00 $1,475.18 

Modupe Akinola 23 14.00 9.00 $3,500.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 23.20 21.20 2.00 $5,300.00 $683.06 

Ronnie Dunn 26.30 23.80 2.50 $5,950.00 $16.00 

Randy Dupont 9.50 7.00 2.50 $1,750.00 $0.00 

Lisa Fink 42.40 30.10 12.30 $7,525.00 $1,266.14 

Ayesha Hardaway 25.60 21.00 4.60 $5,250.00                  $0.00 

Brian Maxey 11.60 8.80 2.80 $2,200.00 $0.00 

Megan McDonough 28.50 22.40 6.10 $5,600.00 $0.00 



5 

Rick Myers 23.50 13.60 9.90 $3,400.00 $1,576.09 

Charles Ramsey  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 53.10 37.9 15.20 $9,475.00 $1,731.70 

Victor Ruiz 7.60 6.10 1.50 $1,525.00 $0.00 

Scott Sargent  10.50 8.00 2.50 $2,000.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 8.50 7.00 1.50 $1,750.00 $0.00 

Charles See  35.30 19.30 16.00 $4,825.00 $0.00 

Sean Smoot  28.60 23.80 4.80 $5,950.00 $0.00 

Tim Tramble  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 117.00 117.00 0 $4,680.00 $0.00 

TOTAL 569.8 416.6 153.2 $79,580.00 $6,748.17 

 
* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland 
project.  

 
 
III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
 
The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 
 
The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 
so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 
for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 
compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 
or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 
constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 
 
Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 
the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 
redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 
charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 
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IV. CONCLUSION 
 
We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 
 
Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 
 
       Sincerely, 

       
                                                                                     
cc: Michelle Heyer 
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Detailed time report: 09/01/2021 — 09/30/2021

Total hours

686.80
416.60 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client
City of Cleveland
Projects
All projects
Tasks
All tasks
Team
Everyone

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Aden Hassan 95.60

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 5.00

Review of dra� budget documents (list of assessments and resources needed) in support of
new 2022 budget document. Call with MT leadership to �nalize the latest dra� of the 10th
Semiannual Report. Email and correspondence. Project management.

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 4.00

Meeting with M. Bretz re: logistics, meetings, timelines and the upcoming site visit agenda, as
well as the Global 6 hearing in Court (September 27). Continued work on the budget
document(s) for the 2022 MT budget. Review of recent discipline letters and CDP DNs. Email
and correspondence.

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 2.00

Email and correspondence re: training, budget, assessments and other upcoming priorities.
Review of Court order issued by Judge Oliver.

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 4.50

Call with M. Bretz re: deliverables and upcoming meetings. Call with M. Heyer re: upcoming
training meetings and budget process for the MT. Weekly update call with the DOJ/USAO.
Budget development work.

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 2.50

Travel to Cleveland for meetings and training observation (search and seizure).

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.60

Site visit-attended Search and Seizure Training with A. Hardaway and R. Dunn.

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 2.00

Travel from CLE to DC.

Total 686.80
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Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 4.40

Site visit-attended Search and Seizure Training with A. Hardaway and R. Dunn.

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 4.00

Completion of Search and Seizure training auditing feedback form. Review of DOJ comments
to 10th Semiannual Report and logistics to address/incorporate the feedback through a
meeting with the MT workgroups. Continued work on the Budget documents for 2022.
Meeting with City IT o�cials and the MT data workgroup re: progress on data collection
e�orts and technology on the part of the City.

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 3.50

Continued review of feedback on 10th Semiannual. Logistics and assignments on pending
reviews. Review and coordination for upcoming site visit. Communication with the Court and
the parties on the next Global Six scheduled for September 27 (in-person with an option for
virtual).

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 7.00

Reviewed the ABLE, Employee Assistance and Support policies as well as two training
section videos that will accompany the upcoming e-learning courses. Attended the MHRAC
meeting. MT leadership weekly logistics meeting. MT meeting to incorporate or discuss
DOJ's edits to the MT's 10th Semiannual Report. Completion of the 2022 MT budget. Email
and correspondence.

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 5.50

Weekly update call with DOJ re: upcoming meetings, deliverables, budget, training
observations (Search and Seizure). Monthly Stakeholders meeting (City/CPC/DOJ/MT).
Biweekly meeting with the City/DOJ and the MT. Finalized the 2022 budget dra� and
submitted it to the parties. Call with US Attorney (Brennan) re CD related matters. Email and
correspondence general CD related matters.

09/15/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 3.50

Call with G. White re: Budget submission and follow up questions regarding the planned
assessments. Call with C. Cole re: assessments (planned and updates on ongoing ones). Call
with M. Bretz re: site visit agenda and space needs for MT meetings with the parties.
Participated in Compstat (time includes presentation review and preparation). Email and
correspondence.

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 3.00

Budget memo preparation and follow up on timeline document to be submitted to the Court.
Email and correspondence. Logistics coordination with M. Bretz re: upcoming site visit and
meeting space(s) required for safe and distanced participation. Review of recent DNs and
discipline disposition letters. MT workgroup discussion regarding reassigning some UF cases
to streamline the �nal push to complete the comprehensive UF Assessment underway.

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.80

Email and correspondence re: several policies and the Crown Management suite of policies.
Project management. review options for a safe and disinfected meeting space.

Total 686.80
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Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 4.40

Email and correspondence. Weekly logistics meeting with MT leadership. Call with M. Bretz
and L. Fink re: various deliverables including the OIP policies, the 5th Year MT Plan and other
documents pending and under review. Call with M. Bretz re: logistics for next week's in-
person site visit and priority meetings for this week. Call with CDP command re: feedback to
Search and Seizure training that was observed by me and other MT members. Review of
several budget documents, including a Gantt timeline chart and a crosswalk document for the
public to easily review the 10th Semiannual Report when it is �les. This crosswalk document
is intended to provide a key information snapshot to members of the public who either don't
have the time or inclination to review the 70 page report.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 1.10

Email and correspondence. Weekly logistics meeting with MT leadership. Call with M. Bretz
and L. Fink re: various deliverables including the OIP policies, the 5th Year MT Plan and other
documents pending and under review. Call with M. Bretz re: logistics for next week's in-
person site visit and priority meetings for this week. Call with CDP command re: feedback to
Search and Seizure training that was observed by me and other MT members. Review of
several budget documents, including a Gantt timeline chart and a crosswalk document for the
public to easily review the 10th Semiannual Report when it is �les. This crosswalk document
is intended to provide a key information snapshot to members of the public who either don't
have the time or inclination to review the 70 page report.

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 2.50

Review of two amendments re: PRB. Call with A. Hardaway re: PRB, DPCs, and the upcoming
Global Six meeting in CLE on September 27. Email and correspondence with DOJ and MT
workgroups re: Global Six and other upcoming meetings.

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 1.00

Email and correspondence re: 10th Semiannual report, Training Plan and other deliverables.
Call with M. Bretz re: project management.

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 2.50

Meeting with the City to go over the 10th Semiannual Report. Call with M. Bretz re: various
deadlines, agendas and deliverables. Email and correspondence.

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.80

Call with C. See re: various CD related matters. Meeting with MT members in CLE re: site visit
assignments etc. Arrived to CLE for site visit.

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 3.00

Travel to CLE.

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 7.00

Cleveland site visit. Meeting with City IT re: Data Analysis. Meeting re: UOF Data analysis
(internal). OPS Data Collection and Analysis Compliance meeting. Meeting with G. White re:
10th Semiannual Report feedback. Global Six Court hearing. MT meeting re: site visit and
debrief from meetings.

Total 686.80
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Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 6.00

Meeting with DOJ re FRB and other CD related matters. FRB hearing at CDP HQ. Weekly
meeting with DOJ/USAO re: training, OPS and other matters pending review. Meeting with
the City/CDP/DOJ and MT re: numerous deliverables, training, policies and other matters
pending review of approvals. Meeting with MT re: upcoming assessments, budget and other
project management matters. Meeting with L. Fink re: 10th Semiannual Report community
document. MT meeting to debrief the day and logistics for tomorrow.

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 2.00

PRO BONO HOURS for the day.Meeting with DOJ re FRB and other CD related matters. FRB
hearing at CDP HQ. Weekly meeting with DOJ/USAO re: training, OPS and other matters
pending review. Meeting with the City/CDP/DOJ and MT re: numerous deliverables, training,
policies and other matters pending review of approvals. Meeting with MT re: upcoming
assessments, budget and other project management matters. Meeting with L. Fink re: 10th
Semiannual Report community document. MT meeting to debrief the day and logistics for
tomorrow.

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 4.50

CLE MT meeting. Meeting with IA Captain Pillow. Meeting with DPS recruitment team.
Meeting to �nalize the 10th Semiannual Report to consider the parties' comments. MT
meeting to debrief the site visit and assign follow up activities.

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 3.00

Travel back to DC from CLE site visit.

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 2.50

Follow up and assignments re: site visit and tasks. Review of �nal 10th Semiannual Report.
Email and correspondence with MT workgroups. Project management re: budget memo and
submission to City.

Charles See 35.30

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.80

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

1st District Community policing meeting

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Engagement Team meeting

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.70

Total 686.80
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Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

phone calls

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

Document review and comment, District training proposal

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.00

United Way Panel Discussion

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Phone call re: United Way panel discussion

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.50

MHRAC full board meeting and Community Engagement sub-committee meeting

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Stakeholders' meeting

09/15/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

DOJ/MT/CDP/ meeting

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.50

phone calls and document review

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Engagement Team Meeting

09/18/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.50

Attended two community events one East side and one West side

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Phone call

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Document review

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.00

Audit Dispatch Training at the 3rd District

Total 686.80
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Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

09/25/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.50

Attended Community Event re: policing and the community

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.50

Pre. and report out at global Six meeting

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.00

Team meeting and debrief

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.50

City/DOJ/MT/CDP. And MT Budget Analyzation

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.70

phone calls

CJI - Cole Christine 23.20

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.00

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.80

review of DNs on separation from service, updating spreadsheet on same, and comms with
recruitment

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.50

DOJ MT weekly meeting

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.80

review and comment on DOJs comments on 10th report

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 0.60

comms with Recruitment o�ce, and with MT members on scheduling and data. sharing data
with LJ and CM

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.00

DOJ/MT meeting

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.30

DOJ/CITY/MT/CDP meeting

09/15/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.60

compstat meeting

Total 686.80
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Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

09/15/2021
City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor

0.30

call on budget and assessments

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.40

UOF data and reviews emails to complete the assessment

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 0.30

coordination with remaining uof assessments, reading emails, data presentation questions

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.50

MT/DOJ weekly meeting

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 0.20

reading daily emails

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 0.50

emails, analysis of UOF assessment, planning next steps, organizing for on site visit, review of
survey

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 0.50

review daily emails, 10th report, setting up for upcoming in person meetings

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 7.00

In person meetings, Data, UOF, Global Six, work with MT members on data

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 5.00

in person meetings, DOJ/MT, City/CDP/MT/DOJ meeting, MT Budget meeting

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 2.50

in person meetings on 10th report, recruitment, planning

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 0.40

EAP survey planning and comms

Django Sibley 8.50

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

Review case 2019-0094

Total 686.80
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09/25/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.40

Review of use of force case 2019-199929

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.40

Review use of force case 2018-174301

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.10

Review use of force case 2019-190687

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.60

Review use of force case 2018-310599

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Begin review of use of force case 2018-023524

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Complete review of use of force case 2018-023524

Hardaway Ayesha 25.60

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Prepare for and participate in internal Monitoring Team meeting regarding dra� semi-annual
report.

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Prepare for and participate in internal Monitoring Team meeting regarding dra� semi-annual
report.

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.60

Participate in meeting with DOJ.

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.60

Prepare for and observe Search and Seizure In-Service Training to assess instruction.

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.40

CLE MT Member Rate–  
Prepare for and observe Search and Seizure In-Service Training to assess instruction.

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Complete assessment of Search and Seizure In-Service Training.

Total 686.80
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09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.90

Participate in meetings with OPS.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.10

Participate in MT Logistics Call.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.10

Participate in meeting to review and analyze DOJ feedback on dra� semiannual report.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.60

Participate in meeting with DOJ and CPC.

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Participate in meeting with Community Engagement Team.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Participate in conference call with M. Heyer and R. Rosenthal.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Participate in bi-weekly Training meeting w/ Commander Maguth, M. Heyer, and S. Decaro.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.10

Prepare for and participate in meeting regarding Search & Seizure In-Service Training.

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Participate in OPS Bi-Weekly call.

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.30

Prepare for and participate in Global Six conference with Judge Oliver and meeting with OPS
personnel.

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 5.30

Prepare for and participate in meetings with DOJ and City; monitor Force Review Board
hearing.

Lisa Fink 42.40

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.80

10th semiannual report call with MT members and �nalizing of report dra�

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.90

Total 686.80
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Emails, review court order re: CPC; DOJ/MT meeting

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.50

United Way Community Conversation re CPC

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.90

10th Semiannual report; emails and communications re 10th semiannual and sept site visit.

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.90

Edits Crisis Intervention section of 10th Semiannual Report; email communications

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.40

Review ABLE policy & DOJ comments; emails re: EAP/OIP/ABLE

09/11/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

10th Semiannual editing; reviewed Employee Assistance Policy

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.50

MT Logistics call; 10th Semiannual Report call

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Budget doc review, 10th Semiannual follow-ups, review of discipline DN

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.50

MT/DOJ call; Stakeholders call; City/CDP/MT/DOJ call; follow-up call with DOJ re 10th
Semiannual; �nalizing 10th Semiannual dra� for distribution to CDP/City; ABLE edits and
follow-up.

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.70

Finalizing 10th Semiannual dra� for distribution to CDP/City

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.20

Emails & crowd management/UOF policy review call with CDP

09/18/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

Dra�ing of user-friendly version of 10th Semiannual Report

09/18/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.00

Dra�ing of user-friendly version of 10th Semiannual Report

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Total 686.80
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MT pre-logistics call and logistics call

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Review revised Monitoring Plan; Reviewed OPS response to MT's 10th Semiannual; reviewed
CPC o�cer wellness survey; reviewed OIP policy.

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.40

Review of Gantt chart timelines and emails

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.30

Emails and site visit prep

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.50

10th Semiannual meeting with CDP

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.00

10th Semiannual meeting with CDP and meeting follow-ups

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 3.70

Ride-along - 2nd District

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.40

Ride-along 2nd District; Global 6 hearing on DPCs and TRC

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.60

CDP ID; Review MT and DOJ comments on EAP policy, updates to meetings; MT/DOJ
meeting; Meeting prep and City/CDP/DOJ Meeting meeting; MT meeting re: 2022 budget,
2022; dra� user-friendly 10th semiannual.

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.80

MT 10th Semiannual internal meeting; MT 10th Semiannual work; OIP internal meeting

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.90

emails; OIP policy and reference materials review

Maxey Brian 11.60

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.30

10th Semiannual report; website updates

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.00

10th Semiannual Report - edits

Total 686.80
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09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.60

UOF reviews

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.30

Commission presentation; t/c K. Olson

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 0.80

UOF case administration

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.00

UOF/CM policy discussion

09/18/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.40

Revise Gantt chart of CD timeline

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Senior
Advisor 2.00

10th Semiannual Report review

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Senior
Advisor 1.20

10th Semiannual report review

McDonough Megan 28.50

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.70

MT/DOJ Call

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.30

Call with H. Aden to discuss budget

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Update budget spreadsheet with assessment totals

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.60

Review materials for 9/9 data meeting with CDP

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Data Call with L. Jones, C. Meissner, C. Cole and H. Aden

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.70

Follow up emails from calls with DOJ, CLE data/IT

Total 686.80
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09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.20

Weekly Logistics Meeting

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.40

2022 Cleveland budget spreadsheet adjustments, call with H. Aden

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.50

Edits to 2022 budget; weekly DOJ/MT call; monthly DOJ/CPC call; biweekly DOJ/MT/City
call

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.10

Survey correspondence

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Logistics Meeting

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Review O�cer Wellness Survey

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.30

Email

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.20

Edit budget spreadsheet

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Review OPS documentation

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

OPS historical document Review

09/25/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Email with team members re: billing, site visit

09/25/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.50

Email correspondence, call with R. Rosenthal, review of OPS documents

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Review dra� OPS Compliance Assessment

Total 686.80
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09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.70

Call with R. Rosenthal re: OPS site visit

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.40

OPS review, meeting prep, technology acquisition

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.10

OPS Data collection and compliance meeting

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Global 6 Meeting with Judge, DOJ, City, MT

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.50

DOJ/MT Meeting, DOJ/CityMT Meeting, Budget Meeting

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Call with Richard to discuss OPS assessment and background

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Email correspondence regarding assessments

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.70

Review OPS Access data format, Outreach Plan

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

IT setup

Melissa Bretz 234.00

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 6.50

Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List. Emails to parties regarding website
content, cancellations, scheduling, site visit agendas, ride-alongs, meeting information,
status updates, letters of engagement, bios for new MT members, and other information.

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 6.50

Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List. Emails to parties regarding website
content, cancellations, scheduling, site visit agendas, ride-alongs, meeting information,
status updates, letters of engagement, bios for new MT members, and other information.

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 2.50

Emails to parties regarding meeting information, documents, deadlines, bios, and other
information.

Total 686.80
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09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 2.50

Emails to parties regarding meeting information, documents, deadlines, bios, and other
information.

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 3.50

Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and
Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding documents, deadlines, meeting information,
scheduling, and other information.

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 3.50

Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and
Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding documents, deadlines, meeting information,
scheduling, and other information.

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 7.50

DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, and BOX documents. Emails to parties
regarding trainings, agendas, travel, court orders, engagement letters, audit forms,
documents, document requests, and other information.

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 7.50

DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, and BOX documents. Emails to parties
regarding trainings, agendas, travel, court orders, engagement letters, audit forms,
documents, document requests, and other information.

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 5.00

Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding scheduling,
meeting information, documents, deadlines, and other information.

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 5.00

Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding scheduling,
meeting information, documents, deadlines, and other information.

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 5.50

Data Analysis Meeting and OPS Workgroup Call. Emails to parties regarding scheduling,
meeting information, documents, and other information.

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 5.50

Data Analysis Meeting and OPS Workgroup Call. Emails to parties regarding scheduling,
meeting information, documents, and other information.

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 4.50

Emails to parties regarding travel information, site visit plans, scheduling, document requests,
status updates, documents, deadlines, and other information.

Total 686.80



10/18/21, 9:02 AM Detailed Reports – 21CP Solutions, LLC – Harvest

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients=9896079&end_date=2021-09-30&group=users&start_date=2021-09-01 16/26

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 4.50

Emails to parties regarding travel information, site visit plans, scheduling, document requests,
status updates, documents, deadlines, and other information.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 4.50

MT Logistics Meeting and 10th Semiannual Report Meeting (internal). Work on Tracking
Sheet, Task List, and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding meeting information,
documents, status updates, deadlines, and other information.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 4.50

MT Logistics Meeting and 10th Semiannual Report Meeting (internal). Work on Tracking
Sheet, Task List, and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding meeting information,
documents, status updates, deadlines, and other information.

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 8.50

DOJ/MT Meeting, Monthly Stakeholders Meeting, and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on
Stakeholders Meeting Agenda, City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting Agenda, MT Site Visit Agenda,
Tracking Sheet, Task List, and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding documents,
deadlines, training, agendas, meeting information, travel information, scheduling, site visit
plans, status updates, training, meeting participants, site visit agenda, and other information.

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 8.50

DOJ/MT Meeting, Monthly Stakeholders Meeting, and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on
Stakeholders Meeting Agenda, City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting Agenda, MT Site Visit Agenda,
Tracking Sheet, Task List, and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding documents,
deadlines, training, agendas, meeting information, travel information, scheduling, site visit
plans, status updates, training, meeting participants, site visit agenda, and other information.

09/15/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 4.50

Check-in Call with Hassan Aden and CompStat Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX
documents. Emails to parties regarding documents, deadlines, agendas, and other
information.

09/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 4.50

Check-in Call with Hassan Aden and CompStat Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX
documents. Emails to parties regarding documents, deadlines, agendas, and other
information.

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 3.00

Emails to parties regarding site visit meeting space, agendas, site visit plans, and other
information.

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 3.00

Emails to parties regarding site visit meeting space, agendas, site visit plans, and other
information.

Total 686.80
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09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 8.00

Crowd Management Policies Discussion and Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call. Call
with Alison Parks at Marriott regarding meeting space. Work on BOX documents, Tracking
Sheet, and Task List. Emails to parties regarding scheduling, documents, deadlines, meeting
information, site visit meeting space, site visit participation, and other information.

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 8.00

Crowd Management Policies Discussion and Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call. Call
with Alison Parks at Marriott regarding meeting space. Work on BOX documents, Tracking
Sheet, and Task List. Emails to parties regarding scheduling, documents, deadlines, meeting
information, site visit meeting space, site visit participation, and other information.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 6.50

MT Logistics Meeting and Training Discussion. Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, and BOX
documents. Emails to participants regarding training calendars, agendas, documents,
training evaluation forms, site visit plans, and other information.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 6.50

MT Logistics Meeting and Training Discussion. Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, and BOX
documents. Emails to participants regarding training calendars, agendas, documents,
training evaluation forms, site visit plans, and other information.

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 7.50

Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Call with Surayyah Spears at Huntington
Convention Center of Cleveland regarding meeting space. Emails to parties regarding
scheduling, meeting information, cancellations, site visit agenda, site visit meeting space,
documents, deadlines, court session topics, reminders, contracts for meeting space, and
other information.

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 7.50

Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Call with Surayyah Spears at Huntington
Convention Center of Cleveland regarding meeting space. Emails to parties regarding
scheduling, meeting information, cancellations, site visit agenda, site visit meeting space,
documents, deadlines, court session topics, reminders, contracts for meeting space, and
other information.

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 4.50

Work on MT Site Visit Agenda. Emails to parties regarding site visit agenda, travel
information, scheduling, meeting information, and other information.

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 4.50

Work on MT Site Visit Agenda. Emails to parties regarding site visit agenda, travel
information, scheduling, meeting information, and other information.

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 6.00

Total 686.80
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Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, BOX documents, and MT Site Visit Agenda. Emails to
parties regarding site visit questions, documents, deadlines, meeting requests, scheduling,
cancellations, meeting participation, and other information.

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 6.00

Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, BOX documents, and MT Site Visit Agenda. Emails to
parties regarding site visit questions, documents, deadlines, meeting requests, scheduling,
cancellations, meeting participation, and other information.

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 6.50

10 Semiannual Report Discussion with City/CDP. Work on the MT Site Visit Agenda. Emails to
parties regarding travel information, meeting information, agendas, site visit information, and
other information.

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 6.50

10 Semiannual Report Discussion with City/CDP. Work on the MT Site Visit Agenda. Emails to
parties regarding travel information, meeting information, agendas, site visit information, and
other information.

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 5.50

MT Site Visit (Day 1). OPS Data Collection & Analysis Compliance Meeting. Call with Hassan
Aden regarding logistics for meeting space. Emails to parties regarding meeting information,
site visit questions, meeting space contract, and other information.

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 5.50

MT Site Visit (Day 1). OPS Data Collection & Analysis Compliance Meeting. Call with Hassan
Aden regarding logistics for meeting space. Emails to parties regarding meeting information,
site visit questions, meeting space contract, and other information.

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 8.50

MT Site Visit (Day 2). DOJ/MT Meeting, City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting, and MT Budget
Meeting. Emails to parties regarding site visit agenda, meeting information, biweekly case
spreadsheets, documents, deadlines, site visit questions, laptops, and other information.

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 8.50

MT Site Visit (Day 2). DOJ/MT Meeting, City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting, and MT Budget
Meeting. Emails to parties regarding site visit agenda, meeting information, biweekly case
spreadsheets, documents, deadlines, site visit questions, laptops, and other information.

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 6.50

MT Site Visit (Day 3). Work on Tracking Sheets, EAP Policy, and BOX documents. Emails to
parties regarding scheduling, meeting information, meeting participation, agendas, meeting
space information, documents, and other information.

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 6.50

Total 686.80
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MT Site Visit (Day 3). Work on Tracking Sheets, EAP Policy, and BOX documents. Emails to
parties regarding scheduling, meeting information, meeting participation, agendas, meeting
space information, documents, and other information.

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Finance and Admin Administrative

Costs
Associate
Consultant 2.00

Emails to parties regarding zoom links, status updates, cancellations, and other information.

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Administrative
Costs

Associate
Consultant 2.00

Emails to parties regarding zoom links, status updates, cancellations, and other information.

Modupe Akinola 23.00

09/25/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 8.00

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 4.00

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 6.00

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 5.00

Randolph Dupont 9.50

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Discussion of CPD Crisis Event with Monitoring Team Member C. See

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Review of CPD Critical Events and Review of OIP Process

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.70

Discussion of OIP Issues with Monitoring Team Member L. Fink.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.70

Mental Health Advisory Bi-monthly meeting and follow up discussion with Monitoring Team
member C. See on impact on CPD o�cers of County Diversion Center

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.20

Discussion of various diversion options available to CPD with Monitoring Team members C.
See.

09/15/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.70

Discussion with parties regarding CPD diversion strategies and County Diversion Center

Total 686.80
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09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.30

Follow up discussion with parties on CPD Diversion options.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.10

Follow up discussion with parties on CPD Diversion options.

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.90

Review of CPD Crisis Events and discussion of impact of County Diversion Center as it relates
to the Consent Decree with parties.

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Discussion of CPD O�cer Improvement Programs with Monitoring Team Member R. Myers
and follow up discussion on CPD Diversion options with parties.

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Crisis Program discussion with MHRAC Leadership including CPD, DOJ and ADAHMS Board

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Review of CPD Crisis Events, follow up discussion on CPD OIP programs.

Richard Rosenthal 53.10

09/06/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.30

Correspondence review (including 2 Chief Departure letters requiring IA Pro review ; 3 COP
charge letters, 2 dismissal letters, 1 Written Reprimand, 1 suspension letter, 1 DPS charge
letter, 6 letters of reinstruction & 5 COP charge letters); Review of Law Dept. advice to PRB on
jurisdiction (& follow up correspondence); Review of PRB assessments.

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.10

DOJ/MT call; Review of PRB assessments; Review of court order re: CPC; Correspondence
review, including 1 COP suspension letter.

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.40

OPS workgroup meeting & follow up meeting: Call with OPS.

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 5.10

Correspondence review, including review of Case prep bi-weekly case sheets, 5 discipline
letters, 1 charge letter; Discipline case letter download to BOX; MT weekly logistics meeting;  
MT meeting re: semi-annual report; Editing of semi-annual report; review of DN on discipline;
Download and review of OPS-PRB assessment; Dra�ing of email to IA Captain; Final updates
to semi-annual report; Review of CD re: OPS jurisdiction & correspondence; Review of �nal 3
OPS-PRB assessments.

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.70

Total 686.80
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DOJ/MT meeting; Review of OPS/PRB manuals; Prep for meeting with City;
DOJ/MT/City/CDP meeting; Review of two OPS cases in IA Pro.

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.90

Correspondence review (including response to inquiry re: semi-annual report), 18 charge
letters & 2 discipline letters; Review of 4 OPS cases iin IA Pro at request of Law Department &
follow-up correspondence.

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Call with OPS Administration.

09/18/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.20

Work on OPS-PRB assessment report, �rst dra� (creation of 8-page preliminary dra�).

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.40

MT Logistics meeting; Correspondence review and response (including 1 DPS charge letter &
review of IA Pro & correspondence to MT; review of 1 dismissal letter & follow up; Call with
OPS;  
Dra�ing of OPS – PRB assessment report - timeliness section, �rst dra�; Call with DOJ.

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Call with OPS.

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 5.90

Review of OPS comments to 10th semi-annual & correspondence to Monitoring Team;
Correspondence review & review of correspondence re: 10th semi-annual; work on OPS
assessment report – timeliness & completion of timeliness workpapers.

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.90

Completion of work papers – OPS-PRB assessment report; Prep for OPS biweekly
workgroup, including review OPS bi-weekly report; Continuing work on OPS-PRB
assessment report - competency section; OPS biweekly meeting; OPS biweekly follow-up.

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.30

Completion of 1st dra� of OPS PRB assessment report; Meeting with City/CDP re: 10th
Semi-annual report.

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.30

Correspondence review; 2d dra� of OPS PRB assessment report and transmittal to MT.

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.80

Call with Monitoring Team member re: OPS on-site MIS review; OPS meeting (MIS & Dra�
assessment discussion; Court hearing; Correspondence review (including 11 COP letters
(charge letters, LOR’s & suspension letters).

Total 686.80
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09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 3.40

Preparation for OPS on-site MIS review – review of prior reports & notes; Review of OPS dra�
Community Outreach plan and follow-up correspondence; Preparation for OPS meeting re:
OPS-PRB assessment �ndings; IT meeting with Larry Jones and City consultant; UOF data
analysis MT meeting.

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 5.40

Monitoring of Force Review Board; Meeting with OPS; MT/City/CDP meeting; Follow-up: call
with Monitoring member re: OPS MIS; Monitoring Team meeting; Follow up call with
Monitoring Team Member.

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 2.00

Meeting with IA Captain & Deputy Chief: Monitoring Team Meeting re 10th semi-annual
report.

Rick Myers 23.50

09/01/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

review 10th Semi Annual dra�

09/06/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

weekly Mt CALL

09/06/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.30

completion of weekly MT call, post important document on Box for all MT members

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.80

weekly MT/DOJ meeting; Stakeholder's meeting

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

weekly MT, City CDP and DOJ meeting

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

weekly logistics call

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.80

complete Box assignments for EAU/OIP policies

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Prep meeting with Aden, Rosenthal

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 5.00

Total 686.80
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Meetings with IT sta�, U of F data analysis discussion, OPS discussion and Global 6 meeting
with judge

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Meetings with IT sta�, U of F data analysis discussion, OPS discussion and Global 6 meeting
with judge

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

get photo'ed and obtain ID card for entry into CDP

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 4.80

FRB meeting at CDP; CDP/DOJ/MT meeting; Budget meeting

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.80

breakfast team meeting, airport ride

09/29/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.00

Meeting with IA sta�; meeting with Recruiting Team; OIP internal discussion

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

enter all expenses/time for Cleveland on site visit

Ronnie Dunn 26.30

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

CIT Literature Review

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

Documents review

09/06/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.50

Documentation review

09/06/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.00

Review of documents and District Neighborhood Training PPs

09/07/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

DOJ/MT Call/ Neighborhood PP presentation review

09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 3.00

CDP Search & Seizure Training

Total 686.80
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09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.30

CIT Data Analysis Working Group Mtg and completion of S&S training notes

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.00

MHRAC, Logistics Meetings, Memo review

09/20/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.50

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

09/26/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 5.00

Scott Sargent 10.50

09/02/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Emails/correspondence

09/16/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Assess new cases, emails

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 6.00

UOF Cases (review and survey)  
- 2018-070934  
- 2019-012193  
- 2019-100329

09/21/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Emails, access new cases/ prep reviews

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 2.00

UOF Case  
2019-386266  
8 o�cers and 1 supervisor

Total 686.80
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Smoot Sean 28.60

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 1.30

Review disciplinary case documents - 12 cases recvd 9/1-3

09/10/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 1.10

Review disciplinary �le docs 11 cases recvd 9/6-10

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours Partner 2.00

Rev compstat slide deck and conf call w rank and �le rep

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 2.30

Review disciplinary �le docs for 25 cases recvd 9/15-17

09/22/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 1.00

Review EAP Policy

09/23/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 2.00

Review and comment policies on OSW, EAP, and ABLE

09/24/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 3.30

Review UoF docs for assessments, review of discipline �le docs for 15 cases recvd 9/21-24

09/25/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 9.50

Complete 4 Level 5 UoF Assessments

09/28/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 1.50

Review disciplinary case docs for 12 cases rec’d 9/27-28

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate Partner 1.80

Review disciplinary case docs for 12 cases recvd 9/30

09/30/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours Partner 2.80

Review emails and activity reports for month of Sept and analyze comparison between Aug
and Sept

Victor Ruiz 7.60

09/03/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call

Total 686.80
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09/08/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.50

United Way Community Conversation - Cleveland Police Commission and Citizen
Involvement

09/09/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.50

Cleveland Consent Decree Workgroup United Way

09/13/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

Review of Neighborhood Awareness Training PPTs and search and seizure notes.

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Invitation: Monthly Stakeholders' Meeting (CPC, CPD, DOJ, City) @ Monthly from 11am to
12pm on the second Tuesday (EDT)

09/14/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 1.00

City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting

09/17/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

CLE MT
Member Rate

Associate
Consultant 0.80

Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call

09/27/2021 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Pro Bono
Hours

Associate
Consultant 1.50

Global Six Court Session

Total 686.80



Timeframe 09/01/2021 — 09/30/2021

Total $6,748.17

Clients All clients

1 Project Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Categories All categories

Team Everyone

Date C ent Project Category Ro es Amount

Aden Hassan $1,475.18

09/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$249.80

 AA F ght to CLE for FRB Board hear ng on August 20, 2021

09/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$24.67

 Uber from Home to DCA

09/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$26.92

 Uber from Hopk ns to hote

09/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$37.24

 Uber from Hote  to Hopk ns

09/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$32.00

 Uber from DCA to home

09/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Sen or
Adv sor

$165.68

 Marr ott Rece pt August 19-20, 2021. The tota  b  s $167.57, I subtracted $1.89 that was somehow carr ed
over from the restaurant. The new re mbursab e tota  s $165.68.

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Sen or
Adv sor

$165.68

 Hote  B  s te v s t September 7-8

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$228.79

 AA RT F ght to CLE

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$25.86

 Lyft to DCA

Total $6,748.17

Expense report 21CP Solutions, LLC
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09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$40.11

 Uber from Hopk ns to hote

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$43.77

 Lyft to Hopk ns from Hote

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$48.20

 Uber from DCA to home

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$266.79

 AA RT from DCA to CLE

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$25.22

 Uber to DCA from home

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$46.80

 Tax  from Hopk ns to hote

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$47.65

 Uber from DCA to home

CJI - Co e Chr st ne $683.06

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$168.60

 a rfare BOS to CLE, f ghts on 9/27 and 9/29

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$43.20

 tax , a rport to hote  on 9/27

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Sen or
Adv sor

$331.36

 check out 9/29

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Sen or
Adv sor

$25.90

 uber hote  to CLE on 9/29

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Other Sen or
Adv sor

$114.00

 park ng at Boston Logan a rport on 9/29

L sa F nk $1,266.14

Date C ent Project Category Ro es Amount

Total $6,748.17
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09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$689.40

 Roundtr p a rfare from Eugene, OR to C eve and, OH for S te V s t n September 2021.

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$41.40

 Rece pt for tax  r de from C eve and A rport to the Marr ott n Downtown C eve and for S te V s t Sept 2021.

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Assoc ate
Consu tant

$535.34

 Stay at Marr ott n Downtown C eve and for S te V s t, September 26-29, 2021.

R chard Rosentha $1,731.70

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$161.34

 Internat ona  Trave  Requ red Cov d Test - L fe Lab - $208.95 CAD

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$275.00

 Internat ona  Trave  Requ red Cov d Test - 9/27/21 - Tack  Hea th - CLE A rport

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$36.00

 Tax  from a rport to hote  - 9/27/21

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$19.95

 Uber Transport to overn ght hote  at A rport - 9/26/21

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

M eage Assoc ate
Consu tant

$24.53

 M eage from home to Vancouver A rport - 43.8 m es [43.8 m es]

09/28/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Other Assoc ate
Consu tant

$33.00

 Per D em - 1/2 day

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$54.47

 Park ng at Vancouver A rport - $70.55 CAD

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Assoc ate
Consu tant

$331.36

 C eve and Marr ott Downtown 9/27-9/29/21

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Assoc ate
Consu tant

$153.74

 Ho day Inn Express A rport - 9/26-9/27/21

Date C ent Project Category Ro es Amount

Total $6,748.17
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09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

M eage Assoc ate
Consu tant

$24.53

 M eage from Vancouver A rport to home - 43.8 m es [43.8 m es]

09/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Other Assoc ate
Consu tant

$66.00

 Per D em - 1 fu  day

09/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$551.78

 Un ted A r nes (9/26/21 departure & 9/26/21 return). $714.61 CAD.

R ck Myers $1,576.09

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodg ng Assoc ate
Consu tant

$497.04

 3 n ghts stay, m nus mea s,. snacks, etc

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$852.80

 Or g na  t cket was over $1000, but by mov ng t up one n ght I saved $172. Th s $852 does NOT INCLUDE
my seat upgrade, I pay for that myse f.

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$220.25

 $5.25 for Den A rport to Bou der on 9/29 $45.00 for CLE a rport to Marr ott on 9/26 $170 for Marr ott to CLE
for Myers, Hassan, Rosentha , and F nk

09/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Other Assoc ate
Consu tant

$6.00

 Park ng for a rport bus stat on n Bou der

Ronn e Dunn $16.00

09/08/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$16.00

 Park ng rece pt for 9/8 Search & Se zure Tra n ng

Total $6,748.17

Date C ent Project Category Ro es Amount
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$249.8009/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

AA Flight to CLE for FRB Board hearing on August
20, 2021
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$24.6709/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from Home to DCA
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$26.9209/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from Hopkins to hotel
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$165.6809/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Aden Hassan

Marriott Receipt August 19 20, 2021. The total bill is
$167.57, I subtracted $1.89 that was somehow
carried over from the restaurant. The new
reimbursable total is $165.68.
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$165.6809/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Aden Hassan

Hotel Bill site visit September 7 8
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$228.7909/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

AA RT Flight to CLE
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$25.8609/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Lyft to DCA
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$40.1109/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from Hopkins to hotel
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$43.7709/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Lyft to Hopkins from Hotel
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$48.2009/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from DCA to home
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$266.7909/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

AA RT from DCA to CLE
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$25.2209/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber to DCA from home
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$46.8009/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Taxi from Hopkins to hotel
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$47.6509/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from DCA to home
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$168.6009/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

airfare BOS to CLE, flights on 9/27 and 9/29
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$43.2009/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

taxi, airport to hotel on 9/27
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$331.3609/29/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person CJI - Cole Christine

check out 9/29
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$25.9009/29/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

uber hotel to CLE on 9/29
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$114.0009/29/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Other

Person CJI - Cole Christine

parking at Boston Logan airport on 9/29
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$689.4009/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Lisa Fink

Roundtrip airfare from Eugene, OR to Cleveland, OH
for Site Visit in September 2021.
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$41.4009/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Lisa Fink

Receipt for taxi ride from Cleveland Airport to the
Marriott in Downtown Cleveland for Site Visit Sept
2021.
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$535.3409/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Lisa Fink

Stay at Marriott in Downtown Cleveland for Site Visit,
September 26 29, 2021.
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$161.3409/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Richard Rosenthal

International Travel Required Covid Test  Life Lab 
$208.95 CAD
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$275.0009/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Richard Rosenthal

International Travel Required Covid Test  9/27/21 
Tackl Health  CLE Airport
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$36.0009/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Richard Rosenthal

Taxi from airport to hotel  9/27/21
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$19.9509/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Richard Rosenthal

Uber Transport to overnight hotel at Airport  9/26/21
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$331.3609/29/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Richard Rosenthal

Cleveland Marriott Downtown 9/27 9/29/21
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$153.7409/29/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Richard Rosenthal

Holiday Inn Express Airport  9/26 9/27/21
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$497.0409/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Rick Myers

3 nights stay, minus meals,. snacks, etc
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$852.8009/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Rick Myers

Original ticket was over $1000, but by moving it up
one night I saved $172. This $852 does NOT
INCLUDE my seat upgrade, I pay for that myself.
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$220.2509/27/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Rick Myers

$5.25 for Den Airport to Boulder on 9/29 $45.00 for
CLE airport to Marriott on 9/26 $170 for Marriott to
CLE for Myers, Hassan, Rosenthal, and Fink
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$16.0009/08/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Ronnie Dunn

Parking receipt for 9/8 Search & Seizure Training
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