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T A G                                                                  
The Aden Group, LLC.                                                   
 
8022 Fairfax Road   
Alexandria, VA 22308 
(571) 274-7821 
www.theadengroup.com 
 
By email 
 
October 31, 2022 
 
Michelle Heyer 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 
 
Tim Mygatt 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 
 
Mark Griffin  
Ahmed Abonamah 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 
 
 
 RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team —September 2022 Invoice 
 
 
I. INTRODUCTION 
 
This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 
 
The Team’s invoice for services rendered in September 2022 was $123,199.17. The bill accounts 
for 656 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from September 1, 2022 
through September 30, 2022.  Of this time 98.3 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated 
to the City of Cleveland.  The Team’s billing over 17 percent of its time for September 2022 as 
pro bono time saved $24,575.00. 
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Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total budget for year seven of $1,104,670.40, which the monitoring team 
invoicing is well within. 
 
Activities, work, and tasks conducted during September 2022 included but were not limited to:   
 
• Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing  
training addressing:  
  
• Force Review Board;  
  
• Crisis intervention;  
  
• Bias-Free policing; and  
  
• Supervision.  
  
• Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and editing policies, processes,  
  
procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to:  
  
• Supervisory response to use of force incidents;  
  
• Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command;  
  
• Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”);  
  
• Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs (“IA”);  
  
• Chain of command misconduct review process;  
  
• Discipline process and  
  
• Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”).  
  
• Officer Intervention Program (OIP)  
  
• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding  
implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to:  
  
• Crisis intervention;  
  
• Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”);  
  
• District Policing Committees (“DPC”s);  
  
• Staffing;  
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• Recruitment and hiring; and  
  
• Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system.  
  
• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and  
Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting  
regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and  
functions;  
  
• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome  
measurements;  
  
• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”),  
including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian  
complaint investigations;  
  
• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and  
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and  
development; provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB  
Manual, and regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and  
  
• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer  
organizations, and community organizations.   
  
• Actively assessing Use of Force cases as part of the assessment launched in  
May 2022.  
  
• Site visit to attend the Status Conference to address matters contained in the 11th Semiannual 
Report. 
  
• Bi-weekly meetings with City Law, DOJ and the Monitoring Team to discuss Section 115 
implementation progress, hiring of key positions and sensitive issues handled by and through 
City Law.   
 
 
II. INVOICE SUMMARY 
 

 September 2022 

Billable Hours $117,669.00 

Overhead/Expenses $5,530.17 

TOTAL $123,199.17 

 
 



4 

 
Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 
 
 

 Total 
Hours 

Billed 
Hours 

Pro 
Bono 

Hours 
Total Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 77.3 70.7 6.6 $17,675.00 $830.23
  

Modupe Akinola 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Shunta Boston 30.9 30.9 0.0 $7,725.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 13.0 11.0 2.0 $2,750.00 $0,0 

Ronnie Dunn 95.5 83.4 12.1 $20,850.00 $90.00 

Randy Dupont 22.1 14.7 7.4 $3,675.00 $1,010.06 

Lisa Fink 50.6 37.2 13.4 $9,300.00 $1,265.24 

Ayesha Hardaway 41.9 40.1 1.8 $10,025.00 $16.00 

Tammy Hooper 29.2 23.2 6.0 $5,800.00 $0.00 

Brian Maxey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Megan McDonough 23.7 19.5 4.2 $4,875.00 $0.00 

Rick Myers 9.8 8.0 1.8 $2,000.00 $0.00 

Charles Ramsey  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 78.6 53.7 24.9 $13,425.00 $1,367.21 

Victor Ruiz 2.3 2.3 0 $575.00 $0.00 
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Scott Sargent  13.5 10.5 3.0 $2,625.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Charles See  35.5 28.4 7.1 $7,100.00 $0.00 

Sean Smoot  28.5 20.5 8.0 $5,125.00 $951.43 

Tim Tramble  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 103.6 103.6 0 $4,144.00 $0.00 

TOTAL 656 557.7 98.3 $117,669.00 $5,530.17 
 
* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland 
project.  

 
III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
 
The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 
 
The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 
so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 
for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 
compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 
or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 
constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 
 
Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 
the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 
redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 
charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 
 
 
IV. CONCLUSION 
 
We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 
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Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 
 
       Sincerely, 

                                                                                     
cc: Michelle Heyer 



Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 656.00 Hours
557.70 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client City of Cleveland

1
Project

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Tasks All tasks

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Aden Hassan 77.30

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.80

 Call with A. Hardaway re Status Conference, OPS and other CD related matters. Call with C. Cole re Status
Conference, outcome assessments and other CD related comments. Review of IA case updates, discipline letters,
recent DNs and Box document reviews/approvals. Email and correspondence.

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.80

 Review of numerous discipline charging letters. Review/correspondence re internal audits being conducted by the
MT. Correspondence with City officials. Email and correspondence.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

 Weekly Update call with the DOJ. Site visit planning and agenda development. Email and correspondence re
documents in review and status (Bolawrap, Performance Management, Promotions etc). Project management and
correspondence with the Court.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

 Review of the 11th Semiannual Report feedback from the City and CDP. Review of several Box documents for
edits and approvals. Email and correspondence.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.30

 Box document reviews, reviews of recent discipline letters and DNs. Email and correspondence.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

 Document reviews and approvals. Call with MT re consideration of City’s response to the 11th Semiannual Report.
Email and correspondence.

Total 656.00
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09/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.50

 Reviewed assigned BOX documents including the updated Search and Seizure report, various evaluation
documents and matrices and some training PPTs. Reviewed the City's comments on the 11th Semiannual Report,
MT responses to those comments and made the necessary compliance determinations in order to finalize the
report for filing. Email, logistics and correspondence.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.50

 MHRAC Monthly full committee meeting. MT Weekly Logistics meeting. Review of new DNs and Chief's and PS
Director's case spreadsheet. Review of several methodologies for upcoming assessments. Discussion and
preparation for several key MT members who will present at the upcoming Status Conference. Call with L. Fink
and M. Bretz re site visit agenda and other logistics and assignments.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.50

 Weekly Update call with DOJ. Bi-weekly call with the parties (City/CDP/DOJ/MT). Call with Chief Drummond re
various CD related matters. Call with R. Dunn re: outcome assessments and the latest Search and Seizure data.
Review of several documents in Box. Email and correspondence and project management.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.50

 Reviewed and approved Box documents (OIP, Community Engagement Report, and the Performance
Management GPO. Bi-weekly call with DOJ and City Law to discuss ongoing CD related matters. Began drafting
of the 2023 MT Budget documents. Call with A. Hardaway re: CD related matters. Call with Judge Oliver re: Status
Conference and other CD related topics. Email and correspondence.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.30

 Call with City Law to discuss the City/CDP feedback on the draft 11th Semiannual Report. Follow up calls with A.
Hardaway. Call with C. See re community perspectives and other CD related matters. Call with Cleveland Official
re CD related matters. Call with MT members re 11th Semiannual Report compliance status post City feedback.
Email and correspondence.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

 Review of new draft of Semiannual Report incorporating recent changes. Work on Letter from the Monitor and the
Executive Summary. Call with L. Fink re CD related matters. Review of latest DNs and recently issued Discipline
Letters. Project management.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

 Weekly MT Logistics call. Call with R. Dupont and R. Dunn re MHRAC matters related to the CD. Finalizing the
11th Semiannual Report after all input was received. Review of MT travel agenda and meeting assignments while
on-site in CLE. Call with judge Oliver and the parties re visual aids for the Status Conference. Follow up call with A.
Hardaway.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.30

 Call with S. Smoot re CD related matters. Weekly call with the DOJ re CD related matters and priorities. Review of
final documents and Court preparation. Email, correspondence and logistics with CLE officials.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.80

 Cleveland site visit. Meeting and preparation with MT members in Cleveland. Review and preparation for Court.
Review of City slides distributed today. Email and correspondence.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 3.00

 Travel to Cleveland for the site visit/Status Conference.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 9.00

 Site visit: Meetings with MT. Meetings with DOJ and other stakeholders. Meeting with Judge Oliver re CD related
matters. Preparation for the Status Conference. Follow up with MT after the Status Conference. Email and
correspondence.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 2.30

 Travel from Cleveland to DC.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.80

 Email and correspondence.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.80

 Email and correspondence.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 Email and correspondence.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Senior Advisor 0.50

 Review of recent DNs and latest Chief and Director's Discipline Case spreadsheet.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.80

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Email and correspondence and review of latest DNs and Discipline letters. Review/edits of two Box documents.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.30

 Email and correspondence. Review of numerous Discipline Letters.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

 Reviewed the Bola Wrap policy, the Disciplinary Guidance GPO and the accompanying Manual of Rules. Reviewed
and edited the latest FIT Assessment Methodology Memo that will be sent out to the parties next week. Email and
correspondence. Project management.

Charles See 35.50

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 1St District Community Committee Policing Meeting

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Local Engagement Team Meeting

09/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.00

 second district safety fair

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Full MHRAC meeting and sub-committee Community Engagement meeting

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Meeting: MT/DOJ/City/CDP

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Spoke with community members from the recovery community interested in the operation of the MHRAC
committee's work and effectiveness.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Engagement Team call

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

7.50

 Monitored CIT training

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

8.00

 Monitored CIT training

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.00

 Meetings: County Diversion Center; Briefing with MT/DOJ; Court Hearing status conference

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.00

 MT briefing on meeting with Diversion Center staff, debrief Diversion Center meeting, briefing on upcoming court
status conference, and attendance of court status conference.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Conversations with community members regarding the previous day's court status conference.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review documents - CIT training manual and previous court filings.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Meeting: MT/DOJ/City/CDP

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Engagement Team meeting

Christine Cole 13.00

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Senior Advisor 0.80

 meeting with CDP and Assessment Team on data for methodolgy on SSA, follow up on open assessments

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 MT/DOJ meeting and review of supervisory training docs

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.00

 review and respond in document of City comments on 11th report

09/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 review of emails and documents related to the management of several ongoing assessments and methodologies

09/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Senior Advisor 0.60

 Review and comment on revised stop report

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

 reading notes from meetings and sending comments, working on UOF assessment scheduling, emails and news

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 reviewed emails related to administrative CD work and reading local news from week

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.90

 review of CDP data questions on 11th annual report, reading SS methodology, review of DOJ comments on UOF
memo

09/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Senior Advisor 1.10

 review and comment on final SS methodolgy

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 1.00

 email exchanges on a variety of CD topics regarding ongoing assessments, news, scheduling and certifying
homicide numbers for 11th report

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Senior Advisor 0.30

 review and comment on stop and search assessment

09/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Reading and sharing articles relevant to recruitment innovations

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 review and comment on handcuffing memo

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.30

 Reading and responding to emails, methodologies, court notes

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.20

 review and comment on compstat questions/responses submitted by CDP

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.80

 review and comment on handcuffing methodology

Hardaway Ayesha 41.90

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Review and analyze memorandum from IA Viland along with suggested edits to IA manual; revise draft version of
Kilnapp review.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Review and analyze CPOP Review Committee memo and asset map.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prepare for and participate in MT meeting to discuss CDP’s responses to the 11th Semiannual Report.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prepare for and participate in MT meeting to discuss CDP’s responses to the 11th Semiannual Report.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prepare for and participate in MT meeting to discuss CDP’s responses to the 11th Semiannual Report.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prepare for and participate in MT meeting to discuss CDP’s responses to the 11th Semiannual Report.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review and revise draft assessment instrument.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Participate in MT logistics meeting.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Review and analyze Performance Management Manual, associated matrices, and evaluation form.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Review and analyze Performance Management Manual, associated matrices, and evaluation form.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Revise draft report on Kilnapp OIS.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Revise draft report on Kilnapp OIS.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Participate in meeting with DOJ.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Participate in meeting with CDP, City Law, and DOJ.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Participate in meeting with City Law and DOJ.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Prepare for and participate in meeting with Judge Oliver regarding upcoming status conference.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prepare for and participate in bi-weekly OPS meeting with City Law, DOJ, OPS, and PRB.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Prepare for and participate in meeting regarding 11th semiannual draft report with City Law and CDP.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Prepare for and participate in internal MT meeting regarding draft semiannual report.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Participate in MT logistics call.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Participate in call with Judge Oliver and the parties.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Prepare for status conference hearing.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Review and analyze slides from City Law; prepare for and participate in meeting with DOJ.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Prepare for and participate in status conference hearing.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Prepare for and participate in status conference hearing.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Prepare for and participate in status conference hearing.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Prepare for and participate in status conference hearing.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Participate in meeting with DOJ.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Prepare for and participate in bi-weekly meeting with City and DOJ.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Meet with City Law and DOJ.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Revise assessment tool.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Prepare for and participate in OPS bi-weekly meeting.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

DPS Discipline Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.90

 Review, analyze and revise draft Chief of Police discipline assessment.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Prepare for and participate in CET meeting.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review and analyze CDP Community Engagement Report.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

DPS Discipline Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Review and analyze Disciplinary Guidance GPO.

Lisa Fink 50.60

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Active Threat Response check-in with MT members; call with Melissa re: admin responsibilities; emails.

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 CD related emails & communications.

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 CD related emails; active threat training comments; IA manual review

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 FIT methodology/response to CDP review.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.30

 Tracking of MT member review of CDP/City documents and materials; MT/DOJ Meeting; follow-ups on Supervisor
Training, Bolawrap, Semiannual Report, Promotions Process Materials; Reviewed City's response to MT's draft
11th Semiannual and offered initial comments for consideration.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Setting up meeting with MT members re Semiannual Report response; reviewing DOJ's comments on recording
police activity policy; emails (supervisor training, compstat, bolawrap).

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Follow-up on document reviews by MT members; work on feedback re: recording police activity policy; skim
active threat response training.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.20

 CD related emails; reviewing Stop & Search report; call re: City's response to 11th semiannual and making edits to
the report; call with Melissa re MT members' document review logistics.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Search & Seizure Data Report review

09/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Semiannual report edits; tracking of status of MT member document reviews; Monitoring Plan tracking/deliverable
statuses; preparing for MT logistics meeting.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.70

 Working on semiannual report; MT logistics pre-call; MT logistics call.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Semiannual report editing; review MT comments on OIP/EAU documents and performance evaluations
documents; MT document review tracking; emails (DNs, site visit agenda).

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.50

 DOJ/MT call; Bolawrap comments and draft email to CDP; DOJ/MT/City/CDP meeting; review meeting notes and
sent to Christine; CD related emails.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Box permissions and community engagement report assignments; Emails re semiannual report, bias-free policy,
community engagement report; Reviewing crowd management policies and status of other documents; Reviewed
community engagement data report and email communications about the report and bias-free policy.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Review promotions process emails and notes; meeting with City Law; follow-ups on training plan, OIP documents,
performance management documents.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.70

 Emails re various document reviews by MT members; call with City and CDP re feedback on semiannual report.
Call w MT members about City feedback on semiannual report; follow up emails and editing to address feedback.
Edits to semiannual report.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Review of BWC audit materials, emails re outcome measures section, Call w Christine and email to CDP to follow-
up on outcome measure data issue; community engagement report emails; Call w Hassan re Semiannual report
status and other filings; edits to Semiannual Report; prepping for drafting of filings for Session III and crowd
management policies.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.10

 Semiannual report editing & formatting.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.20

 MT logistics call; follow-ups on semiannual report; Semiannual report finalizing.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 DOJ/MT Meeting

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails (DNs, Semiannual Report)

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

7.00

 Travel to Cleveland from Eugene, OR

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

7.00

 Diversion Center visit/tour; MT prep meeting pre-status conference; Status Conference; debrief of status
conference and follow ups w MT members.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.20

 Observe subject control training at Academy; emails (Box and bolawrap)

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 FIT methodology and assessment reviewer capacity emails; Reviewing and sending final FIT methodology to
City/CDP.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Tracking and follow ups regarding CDP policy and training documents and materials.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails (meeting agenda, DNs, CIT)

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Biweekly call with Law Department; CD emails (UOF, CDPstat follow-ups, news article).

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Q1 2022 UOF report review & spoke with Megan about report and data; sent report to City/CDP.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 OIP policy and manual comments; emails (DNs, Monitoring Plan tracking, UOF, community letter).

McDonough Megan 23.70

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Handcuffing data

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

1.00

 DOJ call

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.60

 CoP Assessment data analysis

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Handcuffing data for Ronnie

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Check on progress of UoF Assessment.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Handcuffing assessment

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 CoP data analysis

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Handcuffing assessment

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review Search and Seizure Report

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Call with research team

09/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Review CDP revised search and seizure report

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Handcuffing update; weekly logistics call

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Search and Seizure document review and call

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 FIT Methodology; convert to Alchemer

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 CoP data

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

1.50

 MT/DOJ Weekly Call; Call with City; Handcuffing Followup

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Review data request

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Review DoJ Feedback

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review revised methodology

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Assessment Call

09/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review revised assessment instrument

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 weekly logistics meeting

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.70

 CDPStat

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Update UoF data

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review memo feedback

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Update draft, send data

09/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.90

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Convert assessment instrument to Alchemer

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Review handcuffing draft

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Alchemer instrument for FIT assessment

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 MT/DOJ weekly call; MT/DOJ/City Call

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.10

 review instrument

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Finalize draft for circulation to parties; second round

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Handcuffing data followup; assessment team weekly meeting

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 DOP Discipline reviision

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Revise FIT assessment instrument in Alchemer

Melissa Bretz 103.60

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Update Tracking Sheets. Check upcoming deadlines. Preparation for status update for Hassan Aden and Lisa
Fink.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding Search & Seizure Report meeting dates.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink about upcoming deadlines on the Monitoring Plan.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Christine Cole regarding setting up a meeting for the Assessment Team each week.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Sending confirmation email and setting up Zoom link and sending calendar invitation for weekly Assessment Team
Meetings.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email string to MT members cancelling MT Logistics Meeting scheduled for Monday, September 5, 2022.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Prep and Emails back and forth regarding scheduling the Search & Seizure Report Discussion

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Email string with Christine Cole regarding BOX access, calendar invitations, and other items that require her new
email address. Updating all calendar invitations with new address and BOX access.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Add October Deliverables and deadlines to internal Monitoring Plan Tracking Sheet.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding next steps for Active Threat Response document.

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Team Meeting.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Ayesha Hardaway regarding calendar invitations for the Citizens Police Academy Classes for October
2022.

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Update calendar by adding Citizen Police Academy Classes for October 2022

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Emails to MT members regarding Active Threat Response document feedback and next steps.

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding draft of the Eleventh Semiannual Report

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prep, Follow-up, and Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Team Meeting

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Update internal tracking sheets and send out email to MT members regarding status and deadlines.

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding Citizens Police Academy upcoming trainings.

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails regarding status and next steps on the Crowd Management Policies.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Prep, Follow-up, and DOJ/MT Call

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding status of Active Threat Response document.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Randy Dupont about meeting information.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Prepare documents and email to send MT/DOJ comments on Active Shooter Threat Training documents to
City/CDP, copying DOJ, for review. Update Tracking documents.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email to Sgt. Hernandez regarding receipt of Community Engagement Report. Updating BOX document and
sharing to necessary MT members for review and updating internal tracking sheets and calendar deadlines.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Researching notes for last comments made on Promotions Materials requested from the City and email string
between MT members regarding status of this subject.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email string regarding OIP Policy and EAU Manual status.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email string with MT members regarding Eleventh Semiannual Report.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email string with MT members regarding the review status and next steps for the Bola Wrap documents.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email string with Hassan Aden and Lisa Fink to schedule a time to work on the Site Visit Agenda.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email string regarding the status and next steps for the Supervisor Training documents.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding the CPOP Community Engagement Report and it's next steps.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Updating Tracking documents and uploading documents to BOX, sharing for review with MT members.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to Tammy Hooper and Christine Cole regarding availability to participate in the upcoming CompStat
Meeting scheduled for September 21, 2022 and forwarding the calendar invitation.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Updating and researching internal Tracking sheets, updating Task Lists and preparing for status email to Lisa Fink
for upcoming deadlines.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prep, Follow-up, CompStat Meeting

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails with Hassan Aden and Lisa Fink regarding setting up a time to discuss the upcoming site visit.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding tracking process.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding the CPOP Community Engagement Report.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Preparation of document and email to send the CPOP Community Engagement Report to MT members for review.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Tammy Hooper about CompStat meeting information.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Christine Cole regarding CompStat calendar invitation.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Email string with MT members regarding contact information for Christine Cole's new email address.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to Hassan Aden regarding upcoming site visit schedule.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Preparation of documents and email to send MT comments on the 2022 Supervisor Training documents to DOJ
for review.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Updating of internal Tracking Sheets and Task Lists and uploading documents to appropriate BOX folders,
assigning to the appropriate people for review.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Email to MT members regarding status updates and deadlines.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Emails to MT members regarding upcoming agenda items for MT Logistics Meeting.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Preparation and sending status update email to Lisa Fink.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, Task Lists, and BOX documents throughout the day.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Work on Site Visit Travel Agenda.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Emails to Hassan Aden regarding site visit.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Hassan Aden regarding Travel Agenda.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to DOJ regarding meeting location for site visit meetings.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding Interactions with Citizens Recording Police Activity review and next steps.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails with MT members regarding CPOP Review Committee Quarterly Summary comments.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding Asset Maps status and review.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Email string with MT members regarding DOJ's comments on the Search & Seizure Report.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Preparation of document and emails to MT members regarding DOJ's comments on the Interactions with Citizens
Who are Recording Police Activity Policy.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Preparation of documents and emails to City/CDP regarding Crowd Management Policies.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Emails to DOJ and MT regarding DOJ/MT feedback on the 2022 Supervisor Training Documents.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Work on merging DOJ and MT comments and adding any additional comments on the 2022 Supervisor Training
Documents.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to DOJ regarding Trainings that will be occurring during the site visit.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding travel information for upcoming site visit.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Preparation and follow-up and call with Hassan Aden to discuss administrative items and upcoming site visit.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding status update on CPOP Review Committee Quarterly Summary.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.40

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, Task Lists, and BOX documents throughout the day.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Sean Smoot regarding travel information.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding review and comments of the Search & Seizure Report in preparation for the
meeting scheduled for September 12, 2022.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding next steps for Interactions with Citizens Recording Police Activity.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Preparation of Interactions with Citizens Who are Recording Police Activity document with DOJ/MT comments and
email to send to City/CDP, copying DOJ.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Emails to CDP regarding receipt of committee responses for Crowd Management Policies.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding CDP/City responses on two Crowd Management Policies for review.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding status of 2022 Supervisor Training documents.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding meeting information.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Preparation of document and emails to MT members regarding City/CDP comments on the Integrate Active Threat
Response Curriculum for review.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Preparation of documents and email to send MT/DOJ comments on the 2022 Supervisor Training Documents to
City/CDP, copying DOJ.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Preparation of document and email to City/CDP, copying DOJ, relaying that DOJ/MT had no further comments to
return on the Asset Maps Updates but to send comments on the CPOP Review Committee Meeting Summary.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Chief Drummond regarding CPOP Review Committee Meeting Summary.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Call with Edna Orozco regarding a message received that DC O'Neill had retired.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ regarding training information for upcoming site visit.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Work on Site Visit Travel Agenda.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding travel plans for upcoming site visit.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding meeting information for upcoming site visit.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Review of Tracking documents to prepare for and sending status email to Lisa Fink.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Logistics Prep Call with Lisa Fink

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.30

 MT Logistics Call and Follow-up Notes

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Search & Seizure Report Discussion

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding agenda items for DOJ/MT Meeting.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding review status of EAU Policy.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding 2022 Session III Impact Weapons - OC Spray policy review status.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review of Tracking Sheets, BOX documents, and deadlines for preparation of status email to Lisa Fink.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.40

 Update Tracking Sheets, Task Lists, BOX documents through out the day.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Work on Travel Agenda for upcoming Site Visit.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Hassan Aden and Lisa Fink regarding travel agenda.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to CDP regarding receipt of Biweekly Discipline Hearing Reports.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding the Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding travel information for upcoming site visit.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Gary Singletary regarding participation in the Search & Seizure Report Discussion.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Emails to MT members regarding scheduling a meeting to discuss MHRAC Issues.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Emails to MT members regarding scheduling a meeting to discuss the Kilnapp Report.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding Search & Seizure Report comments.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Work on DOJ/MT feedback on the Search & Seizure Report document prior to sending back to City/CDP.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Send the MT/DOJ feedback on the Search and Seizure document to City/CDP through BOX for review and
sending DOJ an email confirming that the document was sent to City/CDP.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Emails to parties regarding scheduling a meeting to discuss the Eleventh Semiannual Feedback.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Work on Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Preparation, Follow-up and DOJ/MT Meeting

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Preparation, Follow-up and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ regarding agenda items for DOJ/MT Meeting.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding DOJ/MT meeting agenda items.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding City/CDP/DOJ/MT agenda items.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Email to Charles See regarding City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting participation.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ regarding MT's Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to City/CDP regarding MT Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to City/CDP regarding City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting agenda items.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Richard Rosenthal regarding Chief's Office Disciplinary Hearings.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ, City, and CDP regarding agenda items for Biweekly Meeting with City/DOJ/MT on September 14,
2022.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email sending City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting agenda to parties for meeting.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Preparation of document and email to send the BolaWrap Policy document to the City/CDP and DOJ.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding DOJ's comments on the first Quarterly UOF Compliance Assessment for review.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Email to DOJ regarding receipt of of their comments on the Quarterly UOF Compliance Assessment.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding MT's comments and review status of additional BolaWrap documents and next
steps.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to City, CDP, and DOJ regarding MT/DOJ feedback on the Active Threat Response Training and requesting
clean versions of the Session III modules for filing.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Lisa Fink regarding next steps for Active Threat Response Training/Session III IST documents.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Email to Commander Maguth regarding timeline for trainings occurring during upcoming site visit.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Emails to parties regarding scheduling the Semiannual Report Feedback Meeting.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding DOJ's comments on CDP's Three Year Training Plan.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Work on Travel Agenda.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.20

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Preparation, Follow-up, and Biweekly Meeting with City/DOJ/MT.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Email to MT members regarding BolaWrap Training Documents.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding review deadlines and status updates.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to CDP and MT members regarding information on trainings occurring during upcoming site visit.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding MT review deadline of the OIP Policy.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to Hassan Aden about calendar invitations and meeting information.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Work on Calendar clean-up - cancellations of old meetings and additions of new meetings and trainings that need
to be added.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding calendar invitations for Citizen Police Academy Dates.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to CDP regarding receipt of Crisis Intervention Team Policy.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Emails to MT members regarding review deadlines and filing status for the CIT Policy.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Emails to parties regarding scheduling of the Semiannual Report Feedback meeting.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Emails to Lisa Fink regarding review deadlines and status of the OIP and Performance Management documents.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Work on cleaning up the comments/formatting of the OIP Policy in preparation to send MT comments to DOJ.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding DOJ's comments on CDP's Three Year Training Plan.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Preparation and sending of Calendar Invitation for the Semiannual Report Feedback Meeting with Zoom Link.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prep, Follow-up and Semiannual Report Feedback Meeting.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Work on merging DOJ/MT comments and preparing the Three Year Training Plan to send to City/CDP.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Lisa Fink regarding MT/DOJ comments on the Three Year Training Plan.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Sent 2023 Training Plan to City/CDP via Box and prepared an email copying DOJ on the document and letting
them know it was sent to CDP.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding review deadlines and status update on the Performance Management
Documents.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Emails to Hassan Aden regarding Electronic Filing Notices recipients and removal of some past MT/DOJ members.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Richard Rosenthal regarding OPS meeting occurring during site visit.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and upcoming review deadlines.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Work on Updating Task List.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Work on Travel Agenda.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding agenda items for Upcoming MT Logistics Meeting.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding site visit travel agenda.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Team Meeting.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to CDP regarding BOX access for Deputy Chief Todd and sending BOX invitation.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Email to MT members regarding Divisional Notice BOX location.

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and upcoming review deadlines.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Lisa Fink regarding Logo for Semiannual Report cover.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Work on Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ, City, and CDP regarding Travel Agenda for upcoming site visit.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding travel information.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding meeting locations for onsite meetings.

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding agenda items for upcoming MT Logistics Meeting.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 MT Logistics Preparation call with Lisa Fink and Hassan Aden.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MT Logistics Meeting

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Email to CDP regarding cancellation of the Bi-weekly Training Meeting and removal from the calendar.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Hassan Aden regarding review of the 2022 CDP Mid-Year Budget Report.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to CDP regarding receipt of the Interactions with Citizen Who Are Recording Police Activity Policy.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ confirming receipt of Interactions with Citizens Recording Police Activity Policy.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Emails to MT members regarding review of the Interactions with Citizens Recording Police Activity Policy.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Lisa Fink regarding the WCS Quarterly Reviews and BOX storage location.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding OPS onsite meeting.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Work on Travel Agenda.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and upcoming review deadlines.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prep, Follow-up and DOJ/MT Meeting.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Lisa Fink regarding the WCS Quarterly Review BOX location.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding meeting information for upcoming site visit.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Update Travel Agenda.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding status updates of reviews.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to DOJ, City, and CDP with an updated version of the Travel Agenda for the upcoming site visit.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 CompStat Meeting

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Finalize Travel Agenda.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Emails to MT members regarding an internal meeting while onsite in Cleveland.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Email with Lisa Fink regarding DC Todd's BOX access and work on fixing the issue.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Emails with MT members regarding internal MT meeting while onsite in Cleveland.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Update Task List.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Call with Hassan Aden regarding meeting follow-ups.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to CDP regarding reciept of the BolaWrap Policy and Internal Affairs Unit Training.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding review deadlines for BolaWrap Policy.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Emails to members regarding review deadline for the IA Training document.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and upcoming review deadlines.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding agenda items for upcoming MT Logistics Meeting.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to CDP regarding receipt of Discipline Policy and Manual.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding review deadline for Discipline Policy and Manual.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Hassan Aden about upcoming MT Logistics Meeting.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding cancellation of MT Logistics Meeting.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to CDP regarding agenda items for City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting on September 27, 2022

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding travel information for invoicing.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Emails to MT members regarding status updated and upcoming review deadlines.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Preparation, Follow-up and DOJ/MT Meeting.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Preparation, Follow-up and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to City/CDP regarding agenda items for City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding next steps for FIT Assessment.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Randy Dupont about meeting information.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Preparation of agenda and email to parties regarding agenda for City/CDP/DOJ/MT meeting.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding travel information and invoices.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding review status and deadlines for the Discipline Policy and Manual.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Emails to MT members regarding CompStat follow-up questions.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding a possible meeting to discuss CompStat follow-up questions.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and review deadlines.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Work on Task List.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prep, Follow-up and Bi-weekly Meeting with DOJ/Law/MT.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Email to MT members regarding travel information and invoices.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Hassan Aden regarding review of the Discipline Policy and Manual.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Lisa Fink regarding Semiannual Report filing.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to Ayesha Hardaway regarding review deadlines for the OPS/PRB Manuals.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Email to CDP regarding the receipt of the Case Hearing Spreadsheets.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding CompStat Follow-up question review.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and upcoming review deadlines.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Update internal Tracking Sheets, BOX documents for sharing and review throughout the day.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to MT members regarding possible meeting to discuss CompStat Follow-up questions.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Emails to MT members regarding travel information and invoices.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Email to Charles See regarding Community Engagement Report and Crowd Management Policies BOX access.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to Hassan Aden regarding Task Lists and reminders.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails to MT members regarding billing questions.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Emails to MT members regarding OIP document review and next steps.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Emails to MT members regarding status updates and upcoming review documents.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Engagement Report

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Meeting.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Work on Task Lists.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Preparation and email to MT members regarding Monitoring Plan Deadlines and status updates.

Randolph Dupont 22.10

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Discussion of CIT Policy with Monitoring Team Members C. See

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.20

 Mental Health Response Advisory Committee Meeting including meeting preparation time.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Follow up discussion on CIT Policy with Monitoring Member C. See and MHRAC Leadership

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 MHRAC Quality Improvement Meeting, review of MHRAC recommended Training Video on Ohio Commitment
Process.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.60

 Discussion of CIT Restraint Issues with Monitoring Team Members C. See and R. Dunn and discussion of CIT
Policy with Consent Decree Parties

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Consent Decree Report Development on Crisis Intervention Progress

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

4.00

 On-site review of CPD CIT Training, Meeting regarding CIT progress with CPD.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.50

 County Diversion Center Visit, Meetings with Monitoring Team regarding Court Appearance, Court Testimony on
CIT Progress

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Meeting with Consent Decree Parties to assess progress, Review of CIT Data Report

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Discussion of CPD Restraint Data with CPD

Richard Rosenthal 78.60

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 OPS Bi-weekly meeting.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.80

 Assessment Data cleaning / Case Timeliness & Correspondence.

09/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Correspondence review and response, including DPS discipline letters; Review of IA Manual revision memo; follow
up correspondence.

09/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review of pending FIT cases – updates to FIT case population; review of CPD response to FIT methodology.

09/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.30

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Drafting of special assessment report; data collection.

09/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Review and edits to draft assessment report.

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Correspondence review, including 10 charge letters; Review of IA manual comments.

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Edits to OIS report & correspondence.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.90

 DOJ/Monitoring Team meeting; Review of OPS Administrator applications & documentation; Correspondence.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Review of OIS Homicide & Preliminary question interviews; Documentation of recent OIS.

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Drafting of timeliness section of assessment report; correspondence.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Review and documentation – OIS Homicide Interview; Review of Evidence.com OIS videos.

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.70

 Review of City’s response to semi annual report; Review and correspondence re: city request on semi-annual
report; Correspondence review (including charging and disciplinary letters & IA Pro review of OPS case WCS.

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Calls with/to Monitoring Team members re: FIT Assessment methodology.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.40

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Meeting preparation – semi-annual report response; 
Monitoring Team meeting re; semi-annual report; Correspondence review, including charge and discipline letters;
Weekly upload of discipline letters.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Edits to assessment report timeliness section & correspondence.

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.30

 File review and edits to draft report.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Monitoring Team logistics meeting; Correspondence review, including Case Prep Timeliness reports & semi-annual
report correspondence.

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.60

 FIT investigation updates to Monitor; FIT assessment methodology correspondence.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Monitoring Team / DOJ weekly call; Monitoring Team/CDP/City/DOJ biweekly meeting.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Assessment report edits.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Call re: FIT assessment report.

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Correspondence review; Technical assistance issue and correspondence; call with AUSA.

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

4.30

 Semi-annual report meeting; City/CDP/Monitoring Team; Correspondence review, including OPS biweekly report
and discipline letters; OPS bi-weekly meeting, documentation and correspondence; Monitoring Team internal
meeting re: semi-annual report.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 call re: OPS; Correspondence review and responses.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Monitoring Team Logistics meeting.; Correspondence, including meeting scheduling and PRB information request;
Semi-annual report documentation; Correspondence review; On site visit planning.

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.20

 Assessment documentation of PRB departures.

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Monitoring Team/DOJ Call; Correspondence review; Court preparation; Correspondence review and response.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

10.00

 Travel from home residence in British Columbia to Cleveland Hotel.

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

5.30

 CLE On Site: County Diversion Center Visit; Monitoring Team Internal Meeting/ and DOJ meeting; court
preparation; Court hearing; Monitoring Team Debrief.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.30

 Meeting with OPS & City Law; Meeting with Commander Carney & Lt. DePenti; Monitoring of ABLE training;
Documentation; Review of discipline matrix and supporting documents; Review of OPS/PRB manual edits by City.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

8.30

 Travel from CLE to British Columbia.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Correspondence review; Review of DPS & COP charge letters; Correspondence and documentation re: OPS/PRB
policy changes & CPD matrix edits.

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.20

 FIT assessment methodology and instrument edits & correspondence to reviewers.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 MT meeting with DOJ; Follow up correspondence, documentation; call with Melissa B.; Biweekly meeting with
City/CDP/DOJ.

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.90

 FIT follow-up; assignments; documentation; Review of FIT online assessment tool and follow up correspondence.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 MT/DOJ/City Law biweekly meeting; Correspondence review.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 FIT assessment correspondence.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 OPS biweekly call; Follow up documentation; Calls with Monitoring Team member; Correspondence and
correspondence review, including COP charge and discipline letters.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 FIT assessment correspondence.

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review of edits to draft assessment report.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Correspondence review, including discipline letters; Correspondence with OPS; documentation for meeting;
Weekly discipline letter upload.

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Edits to FIT methodology & correspondence; FIT assessment correspondence and documentation.

Rick Myers 9.80

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 review IA manual and Active Shooter training curriculum

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 review Box assignments and 1 UofF review

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.80

 review case 2022-067771, UOF2022-0061

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.60

 review 2022-087229

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 review 2022-087229 use of force assessment

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

3.60

 Use of Force reviews

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 use of force reviews

Ronnie Dunn 95.50

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Preparation and meeting with CDP Data Team on S&S data needs and access.

09/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Compiling benchmarking datasets for comparison of Traffic & Investigatory Stop Forms by District

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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09/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MT/DOJ mtg

09/06/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Writing Search & Seizure Methodology Memo and Reviewing CDP Search & Seizure Report Review

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Reviewing CDP S&S Report with DOJ comments and providing feedback in preparation for meeting

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Review and comment on CDP S&S Report

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Review and comments on CDP S&S Report

09/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Review of CDP S&S Report

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 MT Logistics mtg

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.80

 CDP S&S Report Review mtg

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing Memo

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing Memo

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 MT/DOJ & Parties Mtgs (45 min. each)

09/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.30

 S&S Benchmarking Datasets Technical Assistance

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Assessment Team Meeting

09/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

 S&S Methodology draft

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Drafting Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Drafting Juvenile Handcuffing Report

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.50

 S&S Methodology draft revisions

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Drafting Juvenile Handcuffing Memo

09/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Drafting Juvenile Handcuffing Memo

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 MT mtg

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Drafting Juvenile Handcuffing Memo

09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MHRAC mtg

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

8.50

 Monitoring Team site visit and Status Conference

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

8.00

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo draft

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00

Page 51 of 57



09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo draft

09/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Juvenile Handcuffing memo draft

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Writing Juvenile Handcuffing memo

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 MT/DOJ mtg

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

5.00

 Making Juvenile Handcuffing memo revisions

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Revising Juvenile Handcuffing memo draft

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review revisions to S&S methodology draft

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Assessment Team Mgt

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Reviewing, finalizing Juvenile Handcuffing memo draft

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00

Page 52 of 57



09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Final draft of S&S Methodology Memo

Scott Sargent 13.50

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Emails Re recording police/DOJ comments review

09/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Recording police policy. Call with Lisa, review final DOJ emails.

09/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Emails, follow up notes on polices.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Email review Re policies and UOF status.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 CD related Correspondence/emails

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 BolaWrap policy assessment and comments/feedback.

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Case 2022-051560, level 2 
Case 2021-335769, Level 2 
Case 2921-389844, Level 2 review 
Case files, reports, videos and assessment/survey

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.00

 UOF review, cases: 
2022-070627, Lvl 2 
2022-082011, Lvl 2 
Reports, videos, report & survey tool

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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Shunta Boston 30.90

09/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

2.80

 Reviewed assigned random cases 830pm-1118pm (2hrs 48mins) (2.8)

09/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Review Random Use of Force cases 11am-1230pm and 100pm-200pm (2 hrs 30 mins) (2.5)

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.50

 Review random assigned UOF cases. 
11am-12pm 1215pm -345pm (4hr 30 mins) (4.5)

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

3.80

 Review assigned random cases 7pm-1050pm 3hrs 50 mins (3.8)

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Review assigned cases 9-1018pm (1 hr 18mins)(1.3)

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.40

 Review assigned cases: 620pm-1040pm (4.3hours; 4hrs and 22 mins)

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.30

 Review assigned cases 3p-430p(1.5); 500p-615p (1.2), 815p-945p(1.5). Total: 4.2

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.90

 Review assigned UOF cases 1208pm-230pm (2.4) 630p-900p (2.5) Total 4.9

09/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

2.40

 Review assigned cases 245p-301pm. (0.2)) 725-930pm (2.0) Total 2.2

Smoot Sean 28.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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09/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 2.50

 Virtual meeting w MT and DOJ, review file, fu call w Monitor

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 8.00

 Prep for court hearing. Site visit - on site observation training etc. rank and file outreach.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Partner 4.00

 Travel from SPI to STL and CLE

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 10.00

 Meeting w Monitor and US Atty office prep for hearing, attend status hearing, post hearing meetings with USAO
and MT members.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Partner 4.00

 Travel from CLE to STL to SPI

Tammy Hooper 29.20

09/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Juvenile Handcuffing Assessment

09/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Prep for UF assessment; emails

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

5.00

 Quarterly assessment

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Quarterly assessment

09/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Quarterly UF assessment

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 COMPSTAT meeting

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Quarterly assessment

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Prep for COMPSTAT

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Quarterly Assessment

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Quarterly UF Assessment

09/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Initial review of Juvenile Handcuffing report

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review and response to Juv Handcuffing Report

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

 COMPSTAT follow up memo review and response

09/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Quarterly UF Review

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 656.00
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 Juv Handcuffing Memo Review

09/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Juv Handcuffing Memo Review

Victor Ruiz 2.30

09/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Local team meeting.

09/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Call with CDP and doj

09/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Call with CDP and doj

Total 656.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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Expense report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total $5,530.17

1 Client City of Cleveland

1 Project Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Categories All categories

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Aden Hassan $830.23

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $351.21

 RT Airfare DCA to CLE

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $35.06

 Uber from CLE Hopkins to Hotel

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $54.00

 Parking at DCA

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $16.65

 Lyft Receipt for trip to Federal Courthouse from Hotel.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Senior Advisor $321.96

 Hotel for site visit (Room and tax)

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $51.35

 Uber 9/23/2022 from Hotel to Cle Hopkins Airport. (4:45 am reservation as Ubers are very difficult to get that early
in the morning)

Hardaway Ayesha $16.00

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$16.00

Total $5,530.17
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 Parking - status conference hearing

Lisa Fink $1,265.24

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$398.60

 Flight to EUG to CLE - See highlighted portion of receipt. The post-visit flight on this receipt was cancelled, as a
better and cheaper flight was found afterward (see other flight receipt).

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$188.98

 Flight post-site visit from CLE to BWI.

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$567.53

 I made several efforts to book the hotel at the government rate for the Sept 2022 site visit, but I was unsuccessful.
I searched for the gov't rate online and received a message that none were available. I then spoke with Courtyard
University Circle reservations personnel on the phone on 8/27/22 and was told that the gov't rate was not available
for the nights of 9/21 and 9/22. I emailed other MT members and were told by them that they were able to get the
rate via the Marriott app. I downloaded the app and searched for the government rate, but it continued to say that
this rate was unavailable for my dates of travel. The cheapest rate I was able to find was the AAA rate because I
am a AAA member. Thus, I made the reservation at the AAA rate.

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$35.12

 Uber from hotel to Courtyard University Circle on 9/21/22.

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$15.96

 Uber from Courtyard University Circle to Drury, near CDP Academy, for observation of subject control training at
Academy on 9/23/22.

09/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$59.05

 Uber from Drury (near Academy) to Airport for flight out of Cleveland on 9/23/22.

Randolph Dupont $1,010.06

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$359.00

 Airfare Memphis to Cleveland: Listed airfare reduced to estimated minimum airfare of $359. Lowest rate previously
submitted during last seven years. (*As a reminder Mr. Dupont cannot fly economy for health reasons but does not
charge the city for the higher seat grade)

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$51.75

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $5,530.17
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 Per Diem Partial Day = $51.75

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$40.00

 Taxi from Court to Airport Hotel

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$69.00

 Per diem full day: $69.00 per Conus Cleveland rate

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$383.36

 Note: receipt rate reduced to lowest available group rate for Monitoring Team of $383.36.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$44.00

 Airport Parking

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$11.20

 Mileage to and from Airport 10 miles each way, 20 miles total [20.0 miles]

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$51.75

 Partial Day Per diem - $51.75

Richard Rosenthal $1,367.21

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$782.69

 UAL flight YVR to CLE. $1,028.46 CAD

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$47.00

 Taxi from CLE to hotel

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$24.53

 Home to YVR airport [43.8 miles]

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $5,530.17
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09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$10.97

 Uber ride to County Diversion Center

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Other Associate
Consultant

$66.00

 1 day per diem

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$48.64

 YVR Airport Parking. $66.30 CAD

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$321.96

 Court Yard Marriott 9/21/22 through 9/23/22.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$12.93

 Uber to OPS.

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$27.96

 Uber to CLE airport

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$24.53

 Mileage from YVR airport to home. [43.8 miles]

Ronnie Dunn $90.00

09/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$90.00

 Parking in Downtown Cleveland lot for Status Conference at Federal Courthouse. Used moblie app to park for 4
hrs. $45 per charge (x2) due to Browns football game and parking premium. No receipt given.

Smoot Sean $951.43

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Partner $321.96

 Hotel during site visit: 9/21/2022 - 9/23/22

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $5,530.17
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09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Partner $38.66

 Uber from Airport to hotel

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Partner $331.96

 RT Flight from STL to CLE.

09/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Partner $75.00

 Parking at STL TERMINAL 2 3 Days @ $25.00

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Partner $51.35

 Uber to CLE Airport

09/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Partner $132.50

 Milage - RT SPI-STL = 212mi x .625

Total $5,530.17

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount
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$351.2109/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

RT Airfare DCA to CLE
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$35.0609/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Uber from CLE Hopkins to Hotel

Page 13 of 115



Page 14 of 115



Page 15 of 115



Page 16 of 115



Page 17 of 115



$54.0009/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Parking at DCA
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$16.6509/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Lyft Receipt for trip to Federal Courthouse from
Hotel.
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$321.9609/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Aden Hassan

Hotel for site visit (Room and tax)
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$51.3509/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Uber 9/23/2022 from Hotel to Cle Hopkins
Airport. (4:45 am reservation as Ubers are very
difficult to get that early in the morning)
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$16.0009/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Hardaway Ayesha

Parking - status conference hearing

$398.6009/25/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Flight to EUG to CLE - See highlighted portion of
receipt. The post-visit flight on this receipt was
cancelled, as a better and cheaper flight was
found afterward (see other flight receipt).

Page 30 of 115



Page 31 of 115



Page 32 of 115



Page 33 of 115



Page 34 of 115



Page 35 of 115



Page 36 of 115



Page 37 of 115



Page 38 of 115



$188.9809/25/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Flight post-site visit from CLE to BWI.
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$567.5309/25/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Lisa Fink

I made several efforts to book the hotel at the
government rate for the Sept 2022 site visit, but I
was unsuccessful. I searched for the gov't rate
online and received a message that none were
available. I then spoke with Courtyard University
Circle reservations personnel on the phone on
8/27/22 and was told that the gov't rate was not
available for the nights of 9/21 and 9/22. I
emailed other MT members and were told by
them that they were able to get the rate via the
Marriott app. I downloaded the app and
searched for the government rate, but it
continued to say that this rate was unavailable for
my dates of travel. The cheapest rate I was able
to find was the AAA rate because I am a AAA
member. Thus, I made the reservation at the AAA
rate.
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$35.1209/25/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Uber from hotel to Courtyard University Circle on
9/21/22.
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$15.9609/25/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Uber from Courtyard University Circle to Drury,
near CDP Academy, for observation of subject
control training at Academy on 9/23/22.
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$59.0509/25/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Uber from Drury (near Academy) to Airport for
flight out of Cleveland on 9/23/22.
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$359.0009/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Randolph Dupont

Airfare Memphis to Cleveland: Listed airfare
reduced to estimated minimum airfare of $359.
Lowest rate previously submitted during last
seven years. (*As a reminder Mr. Dupont cannot
fly economy for health reasons but does not
charge the city for the higher seat grade)

Page 58 of 115



Page 59 of 115



Page 60 of 115



Page 61 of 115



$51.7509/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Randolph Dupont

Per Diem Partial Day = $51.75

$40.0009/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Randolph Dupont

Taxi from Court to Airport Hotel
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$69.0009/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Randolph Dupont

Per diem full day: $69.00 per Conus Cleveland
rate

$383.3609/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Randolph Dupont

Note: receipt rate reduced to lowest available
group rate for Monitoring Team of $383.36.
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$44.0009/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Randolph Dupont

Airport Parking
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$11.2009/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Randolph Dupont

Mileage to and from Airport 10 miles each way,
20 miles total [20.0 miles]

$51.7509/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Randolph Dupont

Partial Day Per diem - $51.75
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$782.6909/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

UAL flight YVR to CLE. $1,028.46 CAD
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$47.0009/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Taxi from CLE to hotel
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$24.5309/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Richard Rosenthal

Home to YVR airport [43.8 miles]
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$10.9709/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Uber ride to County Diversion Center
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$66.0009/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Other
Person Richard Rosenthal

1 day per diem

$48.6409/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

YVR Airport Parking. $66.30 CAD
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$321.9609/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Richard Rosenthal

Court Yard Marriott 9/21/22 through 9/23/22.
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$12.9309/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Uber to OPS.
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$27.9609/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Uber to CLE airport
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$24.5309/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Richard Rosenthal

Mileage from YVR airport to home. [43.8 miles]
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$90.0009/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Ronnie Dunn

Parking in Downtown Cleveland lot for Status
Conference at Federal Courthouse. Used moblie
app to park for 4 hrs. $45 per charge (x2) due to
Browns football game and parking premium. No
receipt given.

$321.9609/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Smoot Sean

Hotel during site visit: 9/21/2022 - 9/23/22

Page 101 of 115

Bank Statement included.
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$38.6609/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Smoot Sean

Uber from Airport to hotel
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$331.9609/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Smoot Sean

RT Flight from STL to CLE.
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$75.0009/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Smoot Sean

Parking at STL TERMINAL 2 3 Days @ $25.00
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$51.3509/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Smoot Sean

Uber to CLE Airport
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$132.5009/23/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Smoot Sean

Milage - RT SPI-STL = 212mi x .625

Page 112 of 115



Page 113 of 115



Page 114 of 115



Page 115 of 115


	CLE Cover Memorandum -- Sept 2022 - 10.31.22 Aden comments
	harvest_time_report_from2022-09-01to2022-09-30 (1)
	harvest_expense_receipt_from2022-09-01to2022-09-30 (3)



