## **T A G** The Aden Group, LLC.

8022 Fairfax Road Alexandria, VA 22308 (571) 274-7821 www.theadengroup.com

By email

November 22, 2022

Michelle Heyer U.S. Attorney's Office, Northern District of Ohio 801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 Cleveland, OH 44113

Tim Mygatt U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division Special Litigation Section 950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW Washington, DC 20530

Mark Griffin Ahmed Abonamah City of Cleveland 601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 Cleveland, OH 44114

#### RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team —October 2022 Invoice

#### I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the "Team") invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement Agreement in *U.S. v. City of Cleveland*.

The Team's invoice for services rendered in October 2022 was \$77,180.23. The bill accounts for 433.6 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from October 1, 2022 through October 31, 2022. Of this time 66 hours were *pro bono*, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of Cleveland. The Team's billing over 18 percent of its time for October 2022 as *pro bono* time saved \$16,500.00.

Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates within the confines of the total budget for year seven of \$1,104,670.40, which the monitoring team invoicing is well within.

Activities, work, and tasks conducted during October 2022 included but were not limited to:

• Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing training addressing:

- Force Review Board;
- Crisis intervention;
- Bias-Free policing; and
- Supervision.
- Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and editing policies, processes,

procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to:

- Supervisory response to use of force incidents;
- Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command;
- Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board ("FRB");
- Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs ("IA");
- Chain of command misconduct review process;
- Discipline process and
- Community and Problem-Oriented Policing ("CPOP").
- Officer Intervention Program (OIP)

• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to:

- Crisis intervention;
- Community and Problem-Oriented Policing ("CPOP");
- District Policing Committees ("DPC"s);
- Staffing;

- Recruitment and hiring; and
- Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system.

• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative "COMPSTAT" meeting regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and functions;

• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome measurements;

• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards ("OPS"), including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian complaint investigations;

• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board ("PRB") regarding review and adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and development; provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB Manual, and regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and

• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer organizations, and community organizations.

• Actively assessing Use of Force cases as part of the assessment launched in May 2022. Reviews intensified in October for the next batch. Relatedly, the FIT Investigations assessment began in October 2022.

• Bi-weekly meetings with City Law, DOJ and the Monitoring Team to discuss Section 115 implementation progress, hiring of key positions and sensitive issues handled by and through City Law.

#### II. INVOICE SUMMARY

	October 2022
Billable Hours	\$76,500.00
Overhead/Expenses	\$680.23
TOTAL	\$77,180.23

# Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses

	Total Hours	Billed Hours	Pro Bono Hours	Total Billed	Expenses
Hassan Aden	61.4	55.1	6.3	\$13,775.00	\$0.00
Modupe Akinola	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jennifer Albright	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Matthew Barge	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Shunta Boston	9.0	9.0	0	\$2,250.00	\$0.00
Christine Cole	30.5	27.3	3.2	\$6,825.00	\$0.00
Ronnie Dunn	24.3	20.1	4.2	\$5,025.00	\$0.00
Randy Dupont	17.1	10.6	6.5	\$2,650.00	\$0.00
Lisa Fink	36.7	28.8	7.9	\$7,200	\$0.00
Ayesha Hardaway	27.5	19.8	7.7	\$4,950.00	\$0.00
Tammy Hooper	16.4	12.9	3.5	\$3,225.00	\$0.00
Brian Maxey	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Megan McDonough	21.0	15.7	5.3	\$3,925.00	\$0.00
Rick Myers	33.1	17.9	15.2	\$4,475.00	\$680.23
Charles Ramsey	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Richard Rosenthal	33.6	31.9	1.7	\$7,975.00	\$0.00
Victor Ruiz	1.0	1.0	0	\$250	\$0.00

Scott Sargent	19.8	18.8	1.0	\$4,700.00	\$0.00
Django Sibley	7.2	6.5	0	\$1,625.00	\$0.00
Charles See	18.5	15	3.5	\$3,750.00	\$0.00
Sean Smoot	4.0	4.0	0	\$1,000.00	\$0.00
Tim Tramble	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Melissa Bretz*	72.5	72.5	0	\$2900.00	\$0.00
TOTAL	433.6	366.9	66	\$76,500.00	\$680.23

\* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of \$40/hour on the Cleveland project.

### **III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION**

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations.

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day. (Thus, for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be compensated for the half day of \$34.50.) Some Team members have waived their *per diem* charges or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland. This constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland.

Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City. In some instances, those items have been redacted by the team members. In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed charges are subtracted from the total. In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear.

#### IV. CONCLUSION

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland. Upon receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and approval.

Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever.

Sincerely,

Dol

Hassan Aden Monitor

cc: Michelle Heyer

Timeframe	10/01/2022 – 10/31/2022	1 Client	City of Cleveland
Total	433.60 Hours	1	Cleveland December 2021 - November
	0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours	Project	2022
		Tasks	All tasks
		Team	Everyone

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
Aden Hassar	ı				61.40
10/02/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Senior Advisor	2.30
		exits to the Kolnapp Inquiry memo. I roject management.	Email and correspondence. Conti	nued work on 2023 Budg	get
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	5.50
	deadlines an	ogistics meeting to discuss meeting d deliverables to the parties. Continut, including assessing resources and natters.	ued budget preparation and fisca	I review 2022 to date. Pro	oject
10/04/0000	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	2.00
10/04/2022	Cleveland	November 2022			
10/04/2022	Cleveland Weekly upda T. Mygatt an		rables and other matters pertaini nd upcoming priorities for maintai		
10/04/2022	Cleveland Weekly upda T. Mygatt an	November 2022 te call with DOJ re: meetings, delive d M. Heyer re: CD related matters an	rables and other matters pertaini nd upcoming priorities for maintai		
	Cleveland Weekly upda T. Mygatt and compliance. City of Cleveland Review of ref	November 2022 te call with DOJ re: meetings, delive d M. Heyer re: CD related matters at Project management call with L. Fin Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 turned drafts for several MT reports/ e scheduled meetings with the Mayo	erables and other matters pertaini nd upcoming priorities for maintain k and M. Bretz. CLE MT Member Rate inquiries. Follow ups on assigned	ining a good pace toward Senior Advisor d tasks and logistics for n	d 2.00 neetings,
	Cleveland Weekly upda T. Mygatt and compliance. City of Cleveland Review of ret to include the	November 2022 te call with DOJ re: meetings, delive d M. Heyer re: CD related matters at Project management call with L. Fin Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 turned drafts for several MT reports/ e scheduled meetings with the Mayo	erables and other matters pertaini nd upcoming priorities for maintain k and M. Bretz. CLE MT Member Rate inquiries. Follow ups on assigned	ining a good pace toward Senior Advisor d tasks and logistics for n	d 2.00 neetings,
10/05/2022	Cleveland Weekly upda T. Mygatt and compliance. City of Cleveland Review of ret to include the and correspond City of Cleveland	November 2022 te call with DOJ re: meetings, delive d M. Heyer re: CD related matters at Project management call with L. Fin Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 turned drafts for several MT reports/ e scheduled meetings with the Mayo ondence.	erables and other matters pertaining and upcoming priorities for maintain k and M. Bretz. CLE MT Member Rate inquiries. Follow ups on assigned or. Call with C. Cole re ongoing ar	ining a good pace toward Senior Advisor I tasks and logistics for n nd upcoming assessmen	2.00 neetings, ts. Email
10/05/2022	Cleveland Weekly upda T. Mygatt and compliance. City of Cleveland Review of ret to include the and correspond City of Cleveland	November 2022 te call with DOJ re: meetings, delive d M. Heyer re: CD related matters at Project management call with L. Fin Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 turned drafts for several MT reports/ e scheduled meetings with the Mayo ondence. Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	erables and other matters pertaining and upcoming priorities for maintain k and M. Bretz. CLE MT Member Rate inquiries. Follow ups on assigned or. Call with C. Cole re ongoing ar	ining a good pace toward Senior Advisor I tasks and logistics for n nd upcoming assessmen	2.00 neetings, ts. Email

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20
	Review of No	otice to the Court to be filed.			
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40
	Email and co	prrespondence.			
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50
	Logistics and	d planning for the MT attendance at	the next two supplemental FRB s	sessions.	
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	2.00
	Research an	d training design in Task Based billir	ng models.		
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20
	Review of su	spension letters (Spencer-Phillips a	nd Santa)		
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40
	CD related E	mail and correspondence.			
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50
	Review of Ch spreadsheet	nief's and DPS cases provided by ca	ase review. Drafted several emails	relating to cases include	ed in the
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60
	Reviewed an BOX.	d edited the Review of CIT Cases In	volving Handcuffing of Female Ju	uveniles Results Memora	ndum in
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80
	Activity. Revi	(comments and edits applied) of GF ewed the second version which had r sending back to the city.		-	
10/10/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.90

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours				
		nd provided comments and edits to to to MT internal comments and sugge		ay training Course outlir	ıe.				
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10				
	reviewed the	e Letter of Re instruction (Coleman)							
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10				
	Reviewed DI	Ns 22-349, 22-350 and22-351).							
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30				
	Additional C	D related email and correspondence	).						
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.80				
	Administrative tasks and project management.								
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30				
	CD related email and correspondence.								
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70				
	Call with DO	J re CD related matters. Follow up o	all with T. Mygatt (CRT).						
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20				
	Call with L. F	Fink re project progress Gantt chart	updates and budget process for 2	2023.					
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60				
	Weekly Upda reviews and	ate call with DOJ to discuss CD relater preparation.	ted materials and upcoming deliv	erables (including pre-m	neeting				
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20				
	Reviewed lat	test draft of the CIT Handcuffing me	mo that addressed my edits and	comments.					
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30				
					133 60				

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
	Reviewed th	e latest draft of the Kilnapp memora	ndum for distribution to the partie	9S.				
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Corresponde Orders.	ence with the Court and logistics for	a call with Judge Oliver re CD rel	ated matters and severa	al Court			
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Administrativ	ve tasks and project management.						
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	CD related e	mail and correspondence.						
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Review and	edits of latest draft of the Chief of Po	lice Discipline Case assessment.					
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
		D documents and matters flagged fo MT members to address and resolv	-	-	ogistics			
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Call with Juc	lge Oliver re several CD related matte	ers, deadlines and deliverables.					
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Review of ne	ewly issued DNs (22-352, 22-353, 22	-354, 22-355 and 22-356).					
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Administrative tasks and project management.							
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	CD related e	mail and correspondence.						
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10			
				<b>T</b>	133 60			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
	Review of Co	ourt Order reappointing the Monitor	for two years and associated ema	ail.				
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	and process	Rosenthal re CDP IA Memo re: Kilna for delivering the Chief of Police Dis ents have been incorporated. (review	cipline Case review back to the p	arties after my requested	d			
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Phone call w	ith a community member regarding	CD related concerns.					
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Administrativ	e tasks and project management.						
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	Administrative tasks and project management.							
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	Call with M. Bretz and L. Fink to discuss pending deliverables, logistics for returning reviewed documents to the parties, Box assignments for MT staff, and other CD related matters pertaining to assessment and review assignments. (Call and review and preparation for meeting)							
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
		mail and correspondence re follow us (Force and FIT).	ups, review assignments and seve	eral pending and ongoing	)			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.10			
	Review and preparation followed by the weekly MT Logistics call to discuss weekly meetings, deliverables, review assignments, get progress updates on assessments, active and pending and other matters pertaining to the CD.							
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Participated	in the weekly training meeting with t	he parties.					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Review of M	T assignments in BOX, email and co	rrespondence related to review a	ssianmonts				

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	CD related e	mail and correspondence.						
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Review of Ch	nief's and Director's Discipline upda	ted spreadsheet of cases.					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Review of ne	w DNs (22-359, 22-360, 22-361, 22	-362).					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.90			
	Training Revi	iew-Cleveland Leadership Training L	DE 2					
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	CD related emails, correspondence and logistics.							
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Review/com	ments of Training Module 1 Expert A	Answers LDE CDP (LDE 1)					
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
		e latest version of the FIT methodolo at to be returned to the City and DO		stions and concerns. Ap	proved			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	-	DOJ update meeting (including revie assessments as well as other CD re		iverables, meetings, ong	oing			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	Review/comithe report ba	ment of the CDP 2021 Search and S ick.	Geizure Report. Review of MT com	nments and logistics for	sending			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Zoom meeting with L. Fink and C. Cole re: 2022 and 2023 assessments and related budget. Review of 2023 Budget documents. (Planning and review for the meeting is included)							

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	CD related e	mail and correspondence re logistic	s and meetings and ongoing revie	ews.				
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Review of Cl	T and Use of Force slide decks for	CDP Stat.					
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	Review of DI	Ns (22-363, 22-364, 22-365 and 22-	365A)					
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Review of DO	DJ's comments and edits to the IA	Fraining curriculum.					
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	Call with T. Mygatt re CD related matters.							
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Logistics and	d training agenda for All-team meeti	ng on Tuesday regarding new billi	ing instructions.				
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	Call with A. H	Hardaway re Performance Measurer	nent meeting.					
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Preparation a	and review for the Performance Mar t meeting.	nagement meeting with the City a	nd the CDP. Performanc	Э			
10/22/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
		DX documents (Cleveland Leader D nd Expertise)	evelopment Training and Module	on Developing CDP Lead	dership,			
10/23/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.50			
	Budget document drafting, review of proposed assessments for 2023 budget (including anticipated staffing resources and hours).							

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/23/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Email and co	rrespondence re budget planning a	nd general CD related.					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80			
	Email, corres	pondence and logistics with the Co	urt re several CD related matters.					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	Weekly MT L and status.	ogistics call to discuss upcoming m	neetings, logistics, agendas, delive	erables and assignment	updates			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Call with L. F	ink and M. Bretz re deliverables and	assignments and other CD relate	ed matters.				
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Call with M. Heyer re CD related matters.							
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Call with M.	Olsen re CD related invoicing and tra	aining for MT.					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Review of the	e Chief's and the Director of Public	Safety Discipline case spreadshee	ets.				
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Call with May	or Bibb re CD related matters and	priorities.					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Calls with T.	Hooper and R. Myers re CD related	matters and priorities.					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80			
	Call with the	Court regarding CD related matters	and priorities					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	Review of DN	ls (22-367, 368 and 369)						
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	Drafted emai	I regarding MT capacity increase to	meet the challenges of increased	I MT assessments in 202	23.			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80			
	Review of Ch	narge Letters (Sediak, Ortiz, Clemen	s, Benedictis, Graves, Kraynik, Ha	arris, Andrews, New, and	d Bick)			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Review of UF	Closed Case spreadsheet provide	d by Commander Carney.					
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.30			
	Preparation for and call with the DOJ (weekly update call).							
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	-	or and bi-weekly meeting call with t /discussions on ongoing work.	he City and the DOJ re: CD delive	erables, timelines,				
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	MT Monthly	All-Team meeting to discuss CD rela	ated operations, planning, and oth	ner matters related to the	e CD.			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Administrative time invoicing and project management.							
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Call with M. I	Bretz re deliverables, timelines and o	other CD related matters.					
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	CD related ca	alls with community members.						

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80			
	Call with J. G	Goodrick (CPC ED) re CD related ma	tters.					
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	CD related e	mail and correspondence.						
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.70			
	Superintende	e MT Kilnapp memo (updated since ent Viland's memo to ensure all remand advising the Court on this matter.	aining questions were addressed.					
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Review of the	e updated Chief's Discipline Assess	ment memo update.					
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	CD related email and correspondence.							
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	CD Project management.							
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	Court Status Conference							
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	Weekly MT le	eadership logistics meeting (includin	g review and preparation).					
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.30			
	Review and a	approval of September invoice for M	T. Project management.					
Charles See					18.50			
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.50			
				Total	433.60			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
	Monitored in	terviews for CPC						
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00			
	Monitored Ci	itizens' Police Training Academy Class						
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00			
	First District	Community Policing committee meetin	g					
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00			
	Monitoring T	eam progress update to community gr	oup re: MT 11th Semiannual R	eport.				
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00			
	Attended Sec	cond District Community Policing Com	mittee meeting.					
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00			
	Monitored Citizens' Police Acadamy Training							
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00			
	Two phone c	conversations: one re: MHRAC; one re:	New Police Commission					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80			
	Phone conversation re: New Commission's role							
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00			
	Phone confe	rence re: MHRAC and role of City with	CIT					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70			
	Phone call re	:: CIT						
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50			
				Total	433.60			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
	meeting: DO	J/MT/City/CDP - All MT Team meet	ing					
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00			
	Monitored C	itizens' Acadamy Training						
Christine Col	e				30.50			
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Status discu	ssion of various assessments in pro	gress, plan for next steps					
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.90			
	review and c	ommenting on notes on handcuffing	g memo to MT					
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	review of bias free final draft report							
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	reviewing ne	ws, emails, and planning for assess	ment budget					
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	review and re	espond to emails, updates on UOF r	review					
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Administrativ	re review reading and responding to	emails on recent meetings, UOF	assessment, and budge	ts.			
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	review of em the last week	ails, news, planning for assessment	s, reviewing pending assignments	s, reviewing divisional no	tices of			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	MT weekly te	eam meeting						

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	planning and	assessing budget needs for assess	sments in 2023					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	Bi weekly Tra	aining Meeting with MT, DOJ, and D	ivision personnel and related prep	o and follow up				
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.10			
		re work on budget planning for asse to schedule follow up meeting	ssments prep followed by meetin	g on this same topic with	n LF and			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Review and r	response to emails related to daily a	dministration, calendaring, and a	ssessment needs.				
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	Administrative scheduling for meeting on Assessment budget							
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	Review of en	nail exhange and attached documer	nt on FIT methodolgy					
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70			
	Zoom meetir	ng to discuss budget for assessmen	ts with LF and HA					
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	2.30			
	preparing budget for Assessments for 2023							
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	preliminary re	eview of DOJ comments on handcu	ffing assessment memo					
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	meeting with	MT colleagues on assessment cale	endar, budget, reviews, and next s	steps				

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	CD related a methodologi	-	g and sending budget, emails related	d to CD activities and	1			
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Stop and Search Assessment	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	review and c	comment on DOJ comments in Box f	for handcuffing memo					
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
		reading and responding to emails, r with other team members	reviewing shared DNs, reviewing new	vs, reviewing compsta	at slides			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	conversation	on admin issues and roles/respons	ibilities					
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80			
	Participation in MT weekly logistics meeting							
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	review and replying to emails relative to scheduling for FIT methodology and summit							
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.60			
	review, comment in Box on CDPs SSA report							
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	Administrative time reviewing and responding to CD related emails and other admin work on CD related activities							
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.20			
	Participate in MT/DOJ call							
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.20			
	Participate in All Parties meeting							

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Discussion a	nd resolution of questions on FIT M	ethodology with DOJ, CDP, CAO ar	nd MT members				
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.10			
		in MT all team meeting						
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	admin work r review of loc	related to CD including reading and al news.	responding to administrative and p	roject management en	ails and			
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Senior Advisor	0.80			
	Review of CI	DP comments and conversation with	n MCM on same					
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	review of DNs 22-370,22-371, 22-367,22-368,2-369							
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	Review and comment on 2023 Training Plan in Box							
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Senior Advisor	0.10			
	admin on sch	neduling for follow up meeting with (	CDP and Assessment Team followir	ng Q1 review memo				
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	Review and (	Comment on Intro Module Developir	ng DCP Leadership Excellence and	Expertise in Box				
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Review and o	comment in Box on Cleveland Leade	er Development Training					
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50			
	Review of Mo	odule 1 Expert Answers LDE CDP p	ptx					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	Review and	Comment on CLE Leader Developm	ent Training LDE 2					
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
		on team capacity around assessmen on, reviewing local news	nts, reviewing incoming emails from	the afternoon on CD r	elated			
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.60			
	updating cor	npliance status chart with assessme	ents from 11th report and assessme	ents planned for 2023				
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.30			
	Assessment coaching and	Team Meeting and follow up work on the second se	n scheduling with Megan's upcomi	ng leave, Alchemer.co	m			
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	administrative review of emails, DN 22-372, scheduling for meeting with CDP and MT members to discuss perceived discrepancies in UOF memo, other email work with MT members on assessments and logistics							
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.90			
	MT team me	eting						
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.30			
	admin work o call today.	of reading DNs (22-373-377), respor	nding to relevant emails on training,	and prep for the training	ng team			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Senior Advisor	0.40			
	review of Q1 and Q2 data and Q3 assignments with Assessment Team. Prep for 11/1 meeting and prep for assignment memo							
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00			
	participation	in Training Team meeting, engaged	in planning and follow up from that	meeting				
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.20			
	conversation	with DOJ on Search and Stops rep	ort					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.50
	admin on CE	related emails and scheduling			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Senior Advisor	0.80
	cleaning data	a, organizing Q2 UOF reviews data			
Django Sible	у				7.20
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10
	Review use o	of force case 2022-111550			
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Review use o	of force case 2022-082011			
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Review use o	of force case 2021-391556			
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50
	Review use of force case 2022-055806				
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Review case	2022-051560			
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Review use o	of force case 2022-106808			
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Review use of force case 2022-091721				
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
				Total	433 60

Total 433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
	Review use o	of force case 2022-024528					
Hardaway Ay	vesha				27.50		
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00		
	Participate in	MT logistics meeting and phone co	ponversation with H. Aden.				
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Participate in	bi-weekly training meeting.					
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.80		
	Participate in	meeting with DOJ.					
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	3.50		
	Review and a	analyze Session III In-Service Trainir	ng materials to prepare notice.				
10/07/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	2.50		
	Begin draft Notice for Session III Training curriculum.						
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	2.00		
	Complete dra	aft Notice for Session III Training cu	rriculum.				
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	0.30		
	Prepare for e	lectronic filing and file Session III In	-Service Training curricula.				
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.30		
	Discussion w	vith R. Rosenthal to revise draft Chie	of Police discipline assessment re	port.			
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Participate in	meeting with DOJ					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70		
	Participate in	meeting with DOJ, H. Aden, and L.	Fink.				
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.60		
		analyze proposed IA investigator trai	ining.	Consultant			
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Prepare for a	nd participate in bi-weekly meeting	with City Law.				
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.80		
	Participate in	meeting with T. Fischer.					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.20		
	Prepare for and participate in MT Logistics call.						
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CIT (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.30		
	Review, anal	yze, revise, and prepare revised CIT	Policy and Procedures with exhibits	to Court for approv	/al.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70		
	Participate in	meeting with Training Section.					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.20		
	Review and a	analyze recent edits to the OPS and	PRB manuals.				
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Review and analyze revised Bias-Free Policing policy.						
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.80		
	Participate in	meeting with DOJ.					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Participate ir	n meeting with CDP and DOJ to discuss	Performance Management docu	iments.	
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50
	Prepare for a	and participate in MT logistics meeting.			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Participate ir	n MT logistics call.			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (comp) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Prepare for a	and participate in bi-weekly Training Sec	ction meeting.		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Review sumr	mary of training meeting; phone discuss	sion with C. Cole.		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FRB Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.30
	Review and r	revise draft report on Gannon shooting.			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.30
	Review and r	revise draft report on Gannon shooting.			
Lisa Fink					36.70
10/01/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	FIT methodo	logy - update to parties			
10/01/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Stop and Search Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.50
	S&S assessr	nent methodology review			
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.90
					133 60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		discussing outstanding documents a sks for the week; follow-up call with			each
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Pre & Biwee	kly Training Call w CDP/City			
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Review com	ments on BolaWrap policy and sent	follow-up email.	stics call discussing of tracker. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant g transcripts provided Associate Consultant Bolawrap policy, Bias Associate Consultant Bolawrap policy, Bias	
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.40
	Skimmed M	T draft report IA case report		stics call discussing e rracker. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	ogistics call discussing each         in tracker.         Associate         Consultant         ring transcripts provided         Associate         Consultant         y, Bolawrap policy, Bias-         Associate         Consultant         y, Bolawrap policy, Bias-         Associate         Consultant         rap.         Associate         Consultant         rap.         Associate         Consultant	1.00
	Prep and M	Г/DOJ meeting			
10/04/2022	Cleveland November 2022	FIT Assessment		0.20	
	FIT methodo	ology skim & follow-up		Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant ag transcripts provideo Associate Consultant Bolawrap policy, Bias Associate Consultant	
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Calls w MT r	members re updating internal CD tim	neline chart and downloading hearin	tics call discussing e racker. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant transcripts provided Associate Consultant olawrap policy, Bias- Consultant olawrap policy, Bias- Associate Consultant dassociate Consultant	ed by City.
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.50
	Review and policy	document assignments for Interaction	ons with Citizens Recording policy,	stics call discussing e racker. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant a transcripts provideo Associate Consultant Bolawrap policy, Bias Associate Consultant Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	s-Free
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement		0.80
	Reviewed ju	venile handcuffing review memo.		etics call discussing e racker. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant a transcripts provideo Associate Consultant Bolawrap policy, Bias Associate Consultant Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.40
	Emails and f	ollow-ups on budget, Performance I	Evaluations materials, and BolaWra	о.	
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		2.30
				etics call discussing racker. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant transcripts provide Associate Consultant colawrap policy, Bias Associate Consultant colawrap policy, Bias	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours			
	Updating gai	ntt chart with CD timeline trajectory f	or section implementation and com	pliance.				
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20			
	Review Sess	ion III IST filing notice						
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20			
	Review/com	pare revisions on Citizens Recording	Police Activity policy					
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50			
	Updating gai	ntt chart timelines CD work.						
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90			
	Meeting with DOJ re CD implementation, follow-ups about City biweekly meeting and sent meeting notes to Christine.							
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20			
	Began reviewing Chief of Police Discipline Memo							
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	0.20			
	Finalizing draft of Juvenile Handcuffing memo.							
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	mpliance. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant and sent meeting notes Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	1.00			
	Weekly MT/E	OOJ Meeting and follow-ups.						
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.30			
	Call with Hassan about billing, 2023 assessments and budget planning, and Gantt chart of timeline for CD implementation and assessments and follow-ups to call.							
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20			
	Review of co	mments of community engagement	report and preparing for return to th	ne City.				
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.50			
				Associate   Consultant   Associate   Consultant	433.60			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Review of M	onitoring Plan deliverables and proje	ected implementation timelines.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Review of Cl	T policy notice of filing		Associate Consultant Associate Consultant og plan items; follow- Associate Consultant dology. Associate Consultant ocument reviews. Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant MT document review	
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours		1.00
			ewed status of all pending monitorin	Consultant Consultant Associate Consultant ing plan items; follow- Associate Consultant odology. Associate Consultant document reviews. Associate Consultant n and the several docu Associate Consultant n and the several docu Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	-ups via
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment		0.30
	Call with Ric	hard and follow-ups on Chief of Pol	ice Discipline Memo and FIT Method	Associate Consultant g plan items; follow- Associate Consultant dology. Associate Consultant ocument reviews. Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu	
10/14/2022	Review of Monitoring Plan deliverables and projected implementation timelines.       Review of Monitoring Plan deliverables and projected implementation timelines.         222       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       CLE MT Member Rate       Associate         222       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       Pro Bono Hours       Associate         222       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       Pro Bono Hours       Associate         223       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       FIT Assessment       Associate         224       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       FIT Assessment       Associate         224       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       FIT Assessment       Associate         225       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       Pro Bono Hours       Associate         224       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       Pro Bono Hours       Associate         225       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       Pro Bono Hours       Associate         225       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       DPS Discipline Assessment       Associate         226       City of       Cleveland December 2021 -       DPS Discipline Assessment       Associate         226       City of       Cleveland Dec	0.70			
	Prep, call an	d follow-ups w Hassan & Melissa re	garding pending deliverables and do	Associate Consultant ag plan items; follow-u Associate Consultant dology. Associate Consultant ocument reviews. Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu	
10/14/2022	•		DPS Discipline Assessment		1.00
	Review draft	CoP Discipline Assessment Report			
10/16/2022			CLE MT Member Rate	Consultant Consultant Associate Consultant ring plan items; follow-u Associate Consultant nodology. Associate Consultant document reviews. Associate Consultant an and the several docur Associate Consultant Associate Consulta	0.80
	-				uments for
10/17/2022	-		CLE MT Member Rate		1.10
	Prep and pa	rticipate in weekly MT logistics call.		Associate Consultant g plan items; follow-u Associate Consultant dology. Associate Consultant ocument reviews. Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu Associate Consultant and the several docu	
10/17/2022	-		CLE MT Member Rate	Consultant Associate Consultant ag plan items; follow-u Associate Consultant adology. Associate Consultant consultant Associate Consultant	0.30
			essment, Bolawrap training, internal	MT document revie	w
10/17/2022	-		CLE MT Member Rate		0.90
	Meeting with	MT members about assessment pl	an and budget for 2023 and follow-u	squ	
10/17/2022	-		CLE MT Member Rate		0.10
					400.00

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Review biwe	ekly training meeting notes.			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	FIT methodo	logy, returned to City.			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Prep & discu	ssion with Hassan & Christine re as	sessments and budget.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.60
	MT/DOJ wee	ekly meeting; follow-ups on supervis	or training, budget meeting, and ag	endas for upcoming	meetings.
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Skimmed co	mments on Juvenile Handcuffing me	emorandum.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Follow-up ca	Il with Christine re assessments & b	udget.		
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant pendas for upcoming m Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email review	(recording police activity policy, CD	PStat materials on UOF and CIT).		
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.10
	Follow-up or	n OPS/PRB Manual.		Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant endas for upcoming n Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.30
	Skimming IA	training comments and merging M	's comments into the document.		
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Emails (OPS/	/PRB Manual, IA Training, Recording	Police Activity policy, and discipling	ne policies)	
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.40
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Readying an	d sending IA Training back to City/C	DP with MT and DOJ comments.		
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Prep for call	and call with City/CDP on Performa	nce Evaluations.	Associate         Consultant         Associate         Consultant	
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Follow-ups r	e recording police activity policy and	bias-free policy review.	Associate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate ConsultantAssociate Consultant	
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		1.20
	Prep & MT lo	ogistics pre-call and MT logistics cal	I	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Follow-up wi	th Christine about assessment plan	ning and budget.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.10
	Bias-free pol	icy follow-up			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Searching of	d DNs for reference in OIS review.			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.10
	Reviewing er	mails about outstanding MT docume	ent reviews.	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.50
	Reviewing M up.	onitoring Plan deliverables and dead	dlines and determining which iten	ns are outstanding/requ	iire follow-
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Review OPS	/PRB Manual comments			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		1.20
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	DOJ/MT Cal	l and follow-ups			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
	City/CDP/DC	DJ/MT biweekly call			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Follow-ups o	on MT reviews (discipline policy and	OIS report)		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10
	Prep and atte	end MT All-Team meeting			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Administrativ	ve project management and tracking			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.30
	IA Manual co	pmments review and distribute to M	「 members		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Update docu	ument review tracker and check in or	n status of reviews	Associate         Consultant	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment		0.20
	FIT assessm	ent prep - accessing transcripts, fina	alizing and sending out final method	ology	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement		0.10
	Follow-up or	n MT UOF assessment report.			
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment		0.40
	COP Discipli	ne Assessment report review		Associate         Consultant         Associate         Consultant	
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours		0.20
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Emails and co	ommunications about CD assessme	ents and scheduling meetings re: as	sessments.	
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Reviewing ou	tstanding document reviews by MT	members	Sessments.  Associate Consultant	
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement		0.10
	Skimming and	d uploading CDP comments on Q1	2022 UOF review report.	sessments. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant ning Plan. Associate Consultant Supervisor Training. Associate Consultant Supervisor Training. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/30/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	ssessments. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant ining Plan. Associate Consultant a Supervisor Training. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	0.40
	Administrative	e project management and tracking			
10/30/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022       Pro Bono Hours       Association         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022       Pro Bono Hours       Association         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022       Pro Bono Hours       Association         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022       Pro Bono Hours       Association         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2021 - CLE MT Member Rate       Association       Co         10/31/2022       City of Cleveland December 2022       Co       Co       Co		1.00			
	Prep for and	facilitate MT weekly logistics call			
10/31/2022	-		CLE MT Member Rate		0.20
	Communicati	ons regarding MT document review	of S&S report, IA manual, and Trai	Consultant Associate Consultant aining Plan. Associate Consultant	
10/31/2022	-		CLE MT Member Rate		0.90
	Training biwe	ekly call with CDP/City and DOJ an	d follow-ups about Training Plan &	Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant ning Plan. Associate Consultant Supervisor Training. Associate Consultant Supervisor Training.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate		0.40
	Review MT co	omments on Supervisor Training Ma	aterials.		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement		0.40
	Juvenile Hand	dcuffing Report edits and communi	cations.		
McDonough	Megan				21.00
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       Pro Bono Hours       Associate Consultant         Prep for and facilitate MT weekly logistics call       Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland       CLE MT Member Rate November 2022       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       CLE MT Member Rate Consultant       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       CLE MT Member Rate Consultant       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       CLE MT Member Rate Consultant       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       CLE MT Member Rate Consultant       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       CLE MT Member Rate Consultant       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       Use of Force Assessment November 2022       Associate Consultant         City of Cleveland       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022       Use of Force Assessment November 2022       Associate Consultant         Vegan       Kegan       Cleveland December 2021 - November 2021 - November 2022       Pro Bono Hours       Associate	0.70			
	Weekly MT Lo	ogistics call			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Associate Consultant Professional Fees	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Call to discus	ss assessment progress and case a	ssignments	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement		0.40
	Check on Uc	F assessment progress, assign out	standing cases	Associate         Consultant         Associate         Consultant         Associate         Consultant         h DOJ/MT         Associate         Consultant	
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Associate Consultant Professional Fees		1.80
	review hando	cuffing draft and compose language	about data/methods; weekly call wit	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant DOJ/MT Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/07/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Associate Consultant Professional Fees	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant DOJ/MT Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Ment Associate Consultant Mana Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	0.20
	Review 2022	assessments budget			
Cleveland November 2022 Call to discuss assessment progress and cas 10/03/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 Check on UoF assessment progress, assign of 10/04/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 review handcuffing draft and compose langua 10/07/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 Review 2022 assessments budget 10/10/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 Track completed cases, request new data 10/10/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 Track completed cases, request new data 10/10/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 Convert stop and search instrument to Alche 10/13/2022 City of Cleveland December 2021 - Cleveland November 2022 Track UoF assessment progress.	Use of Force Assessement		0.30		
	Track comple	eted cases, request new data			
10/10/2022			Stop and Search Assessment		2.30
	Convert stop	and search instrument to Alchemer		Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant DOJ/MT Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	
10/13/2022			Use of Force Assessement	Associate         Consultant         Associate         Consultant	0.30
	Track UoF as	ssessment progress.			
10/16/2022	-		Pro Bono Hours		1.00
	Review Revis	sed Search and Seizure Report			
10/17/2022	-		Associate Consultant Professional Fees		1.00
	Weekly logis	tics meeting.			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Consultant Consultant Associate Consultant with DOJ/MT Associate Consultant	0.40
	Update UoF	Assessment tracking.			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Boles	Hours
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Associate Consultant Professional Fees	Consultant	0.80
	Internal budg	get discussions.			
10/18/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Associate Consultant	Associate	0.20
	Cleveland	November 2022 budget document.	Professional Fees	Consultant	
		budget document.			
10/18/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate	1.00
	Cleveland	November 2022		Consultant	
	Weekly MT/E	JOJ Call.			
10/18/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
	Cleveland	November 2022			
	Share handc	uffing data.			
10/19/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -			0.30
	Cleveland	November 2022	Professional Fees	Consultant	
	Review budg	get documentation.			
10/19/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Associate Consultant		0.80
	Cleveland	November 2022	Professional Fees	Consultant	
	Attend CDPs	stat.			
10/20/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Associate Consultant	Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant d sharing documentation Associate	1.90
	Cleveland	November 2022	Professional Fees		
	Weekly asse	ssment team meeting and follow up	activity (meeting scheduling and	sharing documentation	n internally)
10/24/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Associate Consultant	Associate	0.80
	Cleveland	November 2022	Professional Fees	Consultant	
	Weekly logis	tics call with monitoring team.			
10/25/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Associate Consultant	Associate	2.00
	Cleveland	November 2022	Professional Fees	Consultant	
	Weekly Moni	itoring Team/DOJ call and biweekly	call with the city		
10/25/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate	0.20
	Cleveland	November 2022		Consultant	
	Poviso Alcho	emer instrument to reflect methodold	av changes		

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Call on October 3, 202 Associate Consultant	1.00		
	Review CDP	comments on report					
10/27/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Use of Force Assessement		1.40		
	Cleveland Assessment	November 2022 Team weekly meeting		Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant all on October 3, 202 Associate Consultant all on October 3, 202 Associate Consultant ew throughout the d Associate Consultant all Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours		0.90		
	Weekly MT lo	ogistics call		Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Call on October 3, 202 Associate Consultant			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement		0.60		
	Meeting re: Q3 randomization, clean export for Q2 data						
Melissa Bretz	Z				72.50		
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs		0.20		
	Set up and e	mail of a Zoom Link and meeting inv	ritation for Lisa Fink for a Training C	Call on October 3, 20	22.		
Cleveland November 2022 Set up and email of a Zoom Link and	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs		2.30			
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and E	OX documents for sharing and rev	iew throughout the o	lay.		
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs		1.60		
	Preparation,	Follow-up and MT Logistics Meeting	gs.				
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs		0.70		
	Bi-Weekly Tr	raining Meeting.					
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs		0.20		
	Emails to par	rties regarding Training Meeting Zoo	m link.				
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant ng Call on October 3, 200 Associate Consultant d review throughout the d Associate Consultant d review throughout the d Associate Consultant d review throughout the d Associate Consultant d review throughout the d Associate Consultant d review throughout the d Associate Consultant	0.20		
				Tota	433.60		

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to MT	members regarding document revie	w status.		
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.30
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and I	review throughout the c	lay.
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Preparation,	Follow-up, and DOJ/MT Call.			
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DO	J regarding Zoom link for future Train	ning Calls.		
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Rich	nard Rosenthal regarding opening a	"bundled" file from a pre-discipli	nary hearing.	
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to MT	members regarding document deac	llines and review status.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.60
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and i	review throughout the c	lay.
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Rich	nard Rosenthal regarding un"bundlir	ng" the documents for a pre-disc	iplinary hearing.	
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Work on retr	ieving the documents from a "bundl	ed" file to send to Richard Roser	nthal.	
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Rich	nard Rosenthal regarding BOX locat	ion for arbitration decision files.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
				Total	433.60

	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Preparation of	of Bola Wrap document to be sent t	o DOJ with MT Comments.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DOJ	I regarding MT comments on the Bo	olaWrap Policy.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DOJ	I regarding receipt of Performance I	Aanagement Documents.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding assigning Hand	cuffing Memo for review.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to Rich	nard Rosenthal regarding FIT Assess	sment documents in BOX.		
10/05/0000	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Administrative Costs	Associate	0.10
10/05/2022	Cleveland	November 2022	Administrative 003t3	Consultant	0.10
10/05/2022	Cleveland			Consultant	
	Cleveland	November 2022		Consultant	
10/05/2022	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Man Cleveland December 2021 -	ual review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs	Consultant pcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant	scuss.
10/05/2022	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	ual review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs	Consultant pcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant	scuss.
	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members cancelling Logistics Meet Cleveland December 2021 -	al review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs Ing scheduled for October 10, 20 Administrative Costs	Consultant upcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant 022. Associate	ocuss. 0.10
10/05/2022	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members cancelling Logistics Meet Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	al review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs Ing scheduled for October 10, 20 Administrative Costs	Consultant upcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant 022. Associate	ocuss. 0.10
10/05/2022	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to City, City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members cancelling Logistics Meet Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 /CDP regarding feedback on the Bo Cleveland December 2021 -	al review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs ng scheduled for October 10, 20 Administrative Costs laWrap Policy. Administrative Costs	Consultant upcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant 022. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	o.10 0.10
10/05/2022	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to City, City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Manu Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members cancelling Logistics Meet Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 /CDP regarding feedback on the Bo Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	al review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs ng scheduled for October 10, 20 Administrative Costs laWrap Policy. Administrative Costs	Consultant upcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant 022. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	o.10 0.10
10/05/2022 10/05/2022 10/05/2022	Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland Email to City City of Cleveland Preparation of City of Cleveland	November 2022 members regarding OPS/PRB Manu Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members cancelling Logistics Meet Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 /CDP regarding feedback on the Bo Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 of BolaWrap Policy to be sent back	al review and discussion of an u Administrative Costs Ing scheduled for October 10, 20 Administrative Costs IdaWrap Policy. Administrative Costs to City/CDP with MT/DOJ feedba Administrative Costs	Consultant upcoming meeting to dis Associate Consultant 022. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant ack. Associate Consultant	o.10 0.10 0.10 0.30

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding additional MT comm	nents on the BolaWrap Policy.		
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to MT	members regarding status updates	and review deadlines.		
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Sco	tt Sargent regarding question about	his additional comments on the	BolaWrap Policy.	
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	2.30
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and E	3OX documents for sharing and I	review throughout the d	ay.
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Preparation,	Follow-up and DOJ/MT Meeting.			
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to part	ies regarding cancellation of City/CI	DP/DOJ/MT Meeting.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to CDF	P regarding additional MT comments	s on the BolaWrap Policy.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to CDF	P regarding receipt of Director and C	hief Hearing Status reports.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Emails to Ha	ssan Aden regarding IA Curriculum.			
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Emails to Lis	a Fink regarding OIP Documents red	ceived from DOJ.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding next steps on the Co	ommunity Engagement Report N	IT/DOJ feedback.	
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Preparation of	of OIP Documents to send back to 0	City/CDP.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to City	/CDP regarding OIP Documents wit	h MT/DOJ feedback.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Preparation of	of Community Engagement Report t	o send back to City/CDP.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to City	/CDP regarding Community Engage	ment Report with DOJ/MT feedb	back.	
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to CDF	P regarding status of the Search and	l Seizure Report.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Emails to Lis	a Fink regarding MT members com	pletion of the IA Unit Training doo	cuments and next steps	
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Preparation of attention.	document for Hassan Aden with full	update on Tracking Sheets and	items that need immedi	ate
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Emails to Ha meeting to d	ssan Aden and Lisa Fink regarding oiscuss.	deliverables that need immediate	attention and setting u	ра
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Set up calen	dar invitation for Tracking Sheet upo	date meeting.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	-	and sending of Weekly Status Upda and outstanding tasks.	te Email to Lisa Fink regarding meet	ings, Monitoring Plan	
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Preparation,	Follow-up and Bi-Weekly Call with	City/DOJ/MT.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Has	san Aden regarding Discipline Asse	ssment Report and BOX placement.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	DPS Discipline Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.70
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	3OX documents for sharing and revi	ew throughout the day	/.
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Emails to MT	members regarding internal pendir	ng documents meeting information.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Emails to MT	members regarding meeting notes	from City Law/DOJ/MT Meeting.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Creation of v	veekly deliverables deadline chart fo	r MT members.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Has	san Aden and Lisa Fink regarding W	/eekly Review Deadline Chart.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Mat	thew Barge regarding removing his	name from the Evidence.com system	n.	
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Emails to CD	P regarding the removal of Matthew	/ Barge and other unnecessary peop	ole from Evidence.com	1.
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding status of two of the	Monitoring Plan lines that need t	o be checked on.	
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	3OX documents for sharing and I	review throughout the d	lay.
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
		a Fink regarding next steps of the IA	Training documents.	Olisulan	
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Preparation	of IA Training documents to be sent	to DOJ with MT comments.		
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DO	J regarding MT comments on the IA	Training documents.		
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Emails to par	rties regarding people needing to be	removed from Evidence.com.		
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Meg	gan McDonough regarding review of	documents.		
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to MT	members regarding status updates	and deadline reviews.		
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.30
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	3OX documents for sharing and i	review throughout the d	lay.
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.60
	Preparation a	and Follow-up and Pending Docume	ents Internal Meeting.		
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Emails to MT	members regarding cancellation of	Bi-Weekly Community Engagen	nent Meeting.	
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Meg	gan McDonough regarding status re	view and deadlines.		
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to Has	san Aden regarding reminders to ac	ld two policies to next meeting w	vith Chief Drummond.	
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Rich	nard Rosenthal regarding the Brady	Memo.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	2.10
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and	review throughout the o	lay.
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.80
	Preparation,	Follow-up and MT Logistics Meetin	gs.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.50
	Bi-Weekly Tr	raining Meeting.			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Rich	nard regarding most up-to-date vers	ion to send for Logistics Meeting	].	
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding agenda for MT	Logistics Meeting.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Ran	dy Dupont regarding meeting inforn	nation.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
				Tota	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to CDF	P regarding receipt of Chief and Dire	ctor Case Reports.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	I Fink regarding Internal Tracking do	cument.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.80
	-	of Weekly Status Email to Lisa Fink eview deadlines.	regarding Monitoring Team delive	erables, meetings, outs	tanding
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Update of Re	eview Deadline Chart.			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding Review Deadlin	e Reminders.		
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to CDF	P regarding Emergency Vehicle Ope	rations LMS status.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.30
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and	review throughout the o	day.
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.20
	Preparation,	Follow-up and DOJ/MT Call.			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding review deadline	reminders.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Emails to DC	DJ regarding DOJ/MT Meeting agend	da items.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
				Tota	433.60

	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Emails to Cit	y/CDP regarding BOX access for Co	ommander Maguth.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to CDF	P regarding Emergency Vehicle Ope	rations LMS.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Emails regard	ding setting up an internal budget di	scussion.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Sending cale	ndar invitation for internal budget d	iscussion.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chri	stine Cole regarding internal budget	t meeting information.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Emails to DC	DJ regarding revised Search & Seizu	re Report sent by CDP on October	13th.	
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to Rich	nard Rosenthal regarding FIT Assess	sment Transcripts.		
	City of				
10/18/2022	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.90
10/18/2022	Cleveland				0.90
10/18/2022	Cleveland	November 2022			0.90
	Cleveland Emails to par City of Cleveland	November 2022 rties to schedule Performance Evalu Cleveland December 2021 -	ation Documents Meeting. Administrative Costs	Consultant	
	Cleveland Emails to par City of Cleveland	November 2022 rties to schedule Performance Evalu Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	ation Documents Meeting. Administrative Costs	Consultant	
10/18/2022	Cleveland Emails to par City of Cleveland Email to DOJ City of Cleveland	November 2022 rties to schedule Performance Evalu Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 J regarding receipt of DOJ's comme Cleveland December 2021 -	ation Documents Meeting. Administrative Costs nts on the Handcuffing Memo. Administrative Costs	Consultant Associate Consultant Associate	0.20
10/18/2022	Cleveland Emails to par City of Cleveland Email to DOJ City of Cleveland	November 2022 rties to schedule Performance Evalu Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 J regarding receipt of DOJ's comme Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	ation Documents Meeting. Administrative Costs nts on the Handcuffing Memo. Administrative Costs	Consultant Associate Consultant Associate	0.20

	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and	BOX documents for sharing and i	review throughout the c	lay.
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.00
	CompStat M	eeting.			
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding All Team Agenda.			
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Emails to par	rties regarding Performance Evaluat	ion Documents discussion.		
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DO	J regarding receipt of DOJ's comme	nts on the Interactions with Pers	ons Recording Police A	ctivity.
10/19/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding next steps on Intera	ctions with Persons Recording P	olice Activity.	
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.40
10/21/2022	Cleveland			Consultant	
	Cleveland	November 2022		Consultant	
10/21/2022	Cleveland Update intern City of Cleveland	November 2022 nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and Cleveland December 2021 -	BOX documents for sharing and i	Consultant review throughout the c Associate	lay.
	Cleveland Update intern City of Cleveland	November 2022 nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	BOX documents for sharing and i	Consultant review throughout the c Associate	lay.
10/21/2022	Cleveland Update intern City of Cleveland Email to Lisa City of Cleveland	November 2022 nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 Fink regarding OPS/PRB Manual for Cleveland December 2021 -	3OX documents for sharing and a Administrative Costs eedback. Administrative Costs	Consultant review throughout the c Associate Consultant Associate	lay. 0.10
10/21/2022	Cleveland Update intern City of Cleveland Email to Lisa City of Cleveland	November 2022 nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 Fink regarding OPS/PRB Manual for Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	3OX documents for sharing and a Administrative Costs eedback. Administrative Costs	Consultant review throughout the c Associate Consultant Associate	lay. 0.10
10/21/2022	Cleveland Update intern City of Cleveland Email to Lisa City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland	November 2022 nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 Fink regarding OPS/PRB Manual for Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members regarding Handcuffing Mo Cleveland December 2021 -	BOX documents for sharing and a Administrative Costs eedback. Administrative Costs emo review. Administrative Costs	Consultant review throughout the c Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate	lay. 0.10 0.10
10/21/2022	Cleveland Update intern City of Cleveland Email to Lisa City of Cleveland Email to MT City of Cleveland	November 2022 nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 Fink regarding OPS/PRB Manual for Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 members regarding Handcuffing Mo Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	BOX documents for sharing and a Administrative Costs eedback. Administrative Costs emo review. Administrative Costs	Consultant review throughout the c Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate	lay. 0.10 0.10

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding MT comments on In	teractions with Persons Recordin	ng Police Activity.	
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Emails to Ric	chard Rosenthal regarding Divisional	Notices in BOX.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Prep and Em	nail string to schedule a meeting to c	liscuss the FIT Methodology.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	2.20
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and E	BOX documents for sharing and I	review throughout the d	lay.
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.70
	Preparation,	Follow-up and MT Logistics Meeting	gs.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Ran	dy Dupont regarding Logistics Meet	ing information.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chri	stine Cole regarding calendar inform	nation.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to CDF	P regarding receipt of biweekly Case	Spreadsheets.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.10
	=	and sending of Weekly Status Email ocoming meetings, and outstanding		Nonitoring Plan deadline	es, review
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding receipt of clean vers	ion of Bias Free Policing Policy a	and next steps.	
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to CDF	P regarding receipt of clean version	of Bias Free Policing Policy.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Update Revie	ew Deadline Chart.			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to MT	members regarding review deadline	chart.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chri	stine Cole on S&S Report review.			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Forwarding c Meeting.	calendar invitation and meeting infor	mation to additional participants	for the City/CDP/DOJ/	MT
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Proofread/Ec	dit the CPRB Manual			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Rick	Myers on review deadline for 2023	Training Plan and 2022 Supervis	sor Training.	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Updating Re	view Deadline Chart			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Emails to Lis	a Fink on next steps for S&S Repor	t review.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to Lisa	Fink and Hassan about DOJ/MT M	eeting Agenda items.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
				Tota	I 433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to Aye	sha Hardaway about cancellation of	Bi-Weekly Meeting with Law and	d DOJ.	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DO.	J about MT/DOJ Meeting Agenda ite	ems.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Forwarding N	MT/DOJ Meeting agenda to MT Mer	nbers.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.50
	•	/PRB Manuals ready to send to City o documents and sending document		issues and adding BOX	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.00
	DOJ/MT Mee	eting			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email string t	to City/CDP asking for agenda items	s for City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Prepare City	/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting Agenda and	sending to meeting participants.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.50
	Administrativ	ve Follow-up and Preparation for the	following day.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Call with Cha	arles See regarding upcoming meeti	ng information.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding next steps for Bias-	Free Policy.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email string	to MT members on upcoming agenc	las.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email string	to schedule a meeting to discuss the	e FIT Methodology.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	-	of documents and sending MT comr r review and update tracking sheet.	nents on the Discipline Policy ar	nd Manual of Rules doc	uments to
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chr	istine Cole regarding upcoming Zoo	m meetings.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email respor	nse and uploading and sharing of the	e Chief Case List sent by Comma	ander Carney.	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Preparation tracking.	and sending the Interactions with Ci	tizens Recording Police Activity	documents to the City/	CDP and
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Has	san Aden regarding Telephonic Stat	us Conference and it's attendee	S.	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chr	istine Cole regarding UOF Review do	ocuments.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	a Fink regarding Divional Notice stora	age in BOX.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70
	City/CDP/D0	DJ/MT Meeting			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.50
				Tota	I 433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	FIT Methodo	logy Discussion and follow-up com	munications		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and	review throughout the c	day.
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chri	istine Cole regarding UOF spreadsh	eets.		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding Divisional Notices in	BOX.		
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and	review throughout the c	day.
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Email to MT	members regarding Zoom link for 20	022 Q1 UOF Compliance Meeting	g	
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Lisa	Fink regarding Divisional Notices in	BOX.		
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.20
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, calendar, and I	BOX documents for sharing and	review throughout the c	day.
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to Chri	istine Cole regarding meeting inform	nation to send to Superintendent	Viland.	
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Emails to MT	rembers regarding upcoming FRE	3 Meetings.		
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to CDF	P regarding upcoming FRB Meeting	3.		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	1.50
	Prep, Follow	-up, and MT Logistics Meeting			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding FRB Meeting or	n November 2, 2022		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding FRB Meeting or	n November 4, 2022		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	2.30
	Update inter	nal Tracking Sheets, BOX documen	ts for sharing and review through	nout the day.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Update Revi	ew Deadline Chart			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70
		gh all tracking sheets and calendars cuments/deadlines to Lisa Fink.	for Preparation and sending of V	Veekly Status Email on	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.50
	Preparation billing proces	of Notes and recording of All Team l ss.	Meeting for those that missed the	e meeting last week on t	he new
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Text commu Developmen	nication with Rick Myers about revie t Course).	ew status of the 2022 Supervisor	Training (Leadership	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Emails and t	exts with Lisa Fink regarding next st	eps on review deadlines and doo	cuments.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
					400.00

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Email to CDF	P regarding the status of the third Q	uarter Report of the CPOP Review	v Committee.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding participation of	the Mobile Citizens Academy Eve	ents.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to MT	members regarding the updated rev	iew deadline chart.		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Work on Sea	rch & Seizure Report MT feedback	and preparation to send to DOJ fo	or review.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Email to DOJ	I sending MT comments on the Sea	rch & Seizure Report for their revi	ew.	
Randolph Du	ipont				17.10
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.20
		velopment and policy document real n for approval of Crisis Intervention		olicies, drafting of cour	t
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.90
	Drafting of C	ourt Memorandum regarding revise	d CPD Crisis Intervention Policy.		
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.50
	Monitoring T	eam Administrative Tasks			
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Discussion w referrals.	vith local healthcare provider regard	ing CPD patrol officer options for	crisis intervention com	munity
10/14/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Discussion w events.	vith Consent Decree parties regardir	ng CPD Patrol officer referral optic	ons during crisis interve	ention

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Monitoring Troprogress.	eam Meeting to discuss CPD Crisis	Intervention Team progress and	general Consent Decre	e area
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50
		h Response Advisory Committee Qu data including review of materials fo		e meeting to review CP	D crisis
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
		vith Mental Health Response Adviso ecidivism data	ry Committee member regarding	Quality Assurance mee	eting and
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
	-	Monitoring Team and Consent Dec ree area progress	ree Parties regarding CPD Crisis	Intervention Team Pro	gress and
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Discussion o	f new CPD CIT Leadership with Mo	nitoring Team member C. See		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Monitoring T	eam Meeting to discuss CPD CIT P	rogress and general Consent Dec	ree area progress	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.80
	-	Consent Decree Parties regarding ree progress, review of materials fo		and discussion of over	all
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	2.00
	Monitoring T	eam Meeting to discussion Consent	t Decree issues.		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Discussion w	rith Monitoring Team member C. Se	e regarding Monitoring Team Me	eting.	
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Discussion o	f new CPD CIT Leadership Team wi	th MHRAC member.		

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
		vith Consent Decree Parties regardir enda for workgroup meeting	ng future crisis intervention workg	roup meetings and dis	scussion of
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Monitoring T progress	eam Meeting regarding CPD Crisis	ntervention Team progress and g	eneral Consent Decre	e area
Richard Rose	enthal				33.60
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Monitoring T	eam Logistics meeting.			
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Documentati	ion of pending and completed tasks	and follow up correspondence.		
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Meeting with	DOJ.			
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.00
		logy review and correspondence; Fl g of OIS assessment report .	T assessment population identific	cation from IA monthly	status
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FRB Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	FRB schedul	ling and correspondence.			
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Preliminary r	eview of IA training; correspondence	e review.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Call with Mo	nitoring Admin; documentation & fol	low-up.		
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.10
				Tota	I 433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	FIT assessm	ent documentation.			
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Corresponde	ence review; para 241 compliance d	ocumentation & related pre discip	linary transcript review.	
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Call with Mik	e Hess, PRB Chair re: OPS Admin h	iring process.		
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Research an	d correspondence re: OPS Admin h	ring process.		
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	Corresponde	ence review, including charge and di	scipline letters.		
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	FIT assessm	ent correspondence.			
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Corresponde	ence review and documentation of d	iscipline letters.		
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
	DOJ/Monitor	ring Team meeting.			
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Call re: Asse	ssment report edits,			
10/11/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.10
	Edits to asse	essment report & follow up correspo	ndence.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Monitoring T	eam/DOJ/City Law biweekly meeting.			
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Review of ed	lits to COP discipline assessment			
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
		S Administrator.		Consultant	
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10
	ICD docume	ntation; follow up correspondence with	OPS Administrator.		
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FRB Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.50
	Review of IA	memo re: FIT investigation analysis.			
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Call with Mor	nitor.			
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.20
	Call with re: I	DOC discipline assessment report.			
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60
	OPS biweekl	y meeting.			
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Corresponde	ence (email) review.			
10/16/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.30
	Discipline as	sessment report edits (COP discipline) .			
10/16/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Corresponde	ence review and response; review a	nd comment on IA training; weekl	y discipline letter upload	I to BOX.
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Monitoring T	eam logistics meeting.			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
	IA Pro Review	w of Subject Officer per Team reque	est; documentation and correspor	ndence.	
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.10
	COP assess	ment report edits and follow up corr	espondence.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Monitoring T	eam/DOJ weekly meeting.			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.40
	FIT assessm	ent correspondence and documenta	ation.		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Corresponde	ence re: OPS/PRB manuals.			
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Review of IA	training; review of DOJ comments t	o OPS manual.		
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.40
	FIT methodo	logy correspondence; FIT assessme	ent file review.		
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Corresponde	ence (email) review.			
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.30
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	FIT assessm	ent/methodology review/corresponde	ence.		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Monitoring T	eam Logistics Call.			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Call re: admi	nistrative tasks and scheduling			
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Corresponde	ence review, including PSU reports ar	nd Discipline letters; Review of C	PS/PRB manual edits	by DOJ.
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FRB Assessment	Associate Consultant	2.50
	Edits and pre	eparation of report assessing FRB co	mpliance re: OIS.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10
	Monitoring T	eam/DOJ weekly meeting			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Monitoring T	eam/DOJ/City/CDP meeting.			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.70
	FIT methodo	logy discussion and updates to FIT n	nethodology.		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10
	Monitoring T	eam - All Team Meeting.			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Administrativ	e Tasks and Project Management.			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.40
				Total	433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	•	ts to FIT assessment methodology a ence re: FIT pre-disciplinary hearing		d upload to BOX;	
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.10
	FIT assessm	ent pre-disciplinary transcript down	load and upload.		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	IA (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.60
	Edits to Asse	essment per feedback; Corresponde	ence.		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Review of OI	PS bi-weekly, report; Documentation	n and follow up correspondence.		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10
	Review of DI	PS Charge letters (2); Documentatio	n and download.		
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.30
10/26/2022	Cleveland			Consultant	
10/26/2022	Cleveland	November 2022		Consultant	
	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 -	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate	ng Team.
	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate	ng Team.
10/26/2022	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland Review of DO City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 OJ comments on updates to IA Man Cleveland December 2021 -	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate ual.	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate Consultant Associate	ng Team. 0.30
10/26/2022	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland Review of DO City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 OJ comments on updates to IA Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate ual.	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate Consultant Associate	ng Team. 0.30
10/26/2022	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland Review of DO City of Cleveland FRB assessor City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 OJ comments on updates to IA Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ment correspondence. Cleveland December 2021 -	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate ual. FRB Assessment IA (prelim) Assessment	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	ng Team. 0.30 0.10
10/26/2022	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland Review of DO City of Cleveland FRB assessor City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 OJ comments on updates to IA Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ment correspondence. Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate ual. FRB Assessment IA (prelim) Assessment	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant	ng Team. 0.30 0.10
10/26/2022 10/27/2022 10/27/2022	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland Review of DO City of Cleveland FRB assess City of Cleveland COP assess City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 OJ comments on updates to IA Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ment correspondence. Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ment report edits and corresponder Cleveland December 2021 -	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate ual. FRB Assessment IA (prelim) Assessment Ice, including call with Monitoring CLE MT Member Rate	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Team member. Associate	ng Team. 0.30 0.10 0.40
10/26/2022 10/27/2022 10/27/2022	Cleveland Assignment City of Cleveland Review of DO City of Cleveland FRB assess City of Cleveland COP assess City of Cleveland	November 2022 of cases to reviewers; Finalization o Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 OJ comments on updates to IA Man Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ment correspondence. Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ment report edits and corresponder Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	f documents for reviewers; Corres CLE MT Member Rate ual. FRB Assessment IA (prelim) Assessment Ice, including call with Monitoring CLE MT Member Rate	Consultant spondence to Monitorin Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Team member. Associate	ng Team. 0.30 0.10 0.40

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
	Assessment	correspondence review and respons	se.				
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.20		
	Corresponde	ence review (including 3 charge lette	rs, 1 suspension letter, 1 email cont	aining DN's).			
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.10		
	Weekly disci	pline letter upload to BOX.					
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70		
	Administrativ	e tasks.					
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90		
	Monitoring T	eam Logistics meeting.					
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	FIT Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	FIT case pop	ulation documents received and do	cumentation updates .				
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.60		
	-	ence review, including 3 Divisional Nance to Monitoring Team.	otices, 3 DPS Suspension letters (w	/IA Pro inquiries & fo	ollow up		
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20		
	Administrative tasks and project management.						
Rick Myers					33.10		
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	UoF review, 2	2022-076445					
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	2.00		
	use of force	review, 2022-076445					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	2.40
	UOF 2021-02	21967			
10/08/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate	0.60
	Cleveland UOF 2021-02	November 2022 21967		Consultant	
10/08/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate	0.20
	Cleveland UoF review 2	November 2022 2022-083678		Consultant	
10/08/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Use of Force Assessement	Associate	0.80
	Cleveland UoF 2022-08	November 2022 33678		Consultant	
10/08/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Use of Force Assessement	Associate	1.20
	Cleveland November 2022 Consultant uof 2022-026012				
10/08/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
	uof 2022-026	6012			
10/15/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	3.00
	2022-124402	2; 2022-124413; 2022-075078 reviewed			
10/15/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
	3 use of force	e reviews			
10/16/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.40
		se of force cases		Consultant	
10/16/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	1.40
		nter 2022-056977 and 064593			

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20		
	Box assignm	ents and Zoom with DOJ and CDP					
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80		
	Review 1.07.	08 and 4.08.05 and Zoom over Perf	Eval				
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.70		
	review '23 tra	aining plan; review Supervisory train	ing module; weekly MT/DOJ mee	ting Zoom meeting			
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20		
	CD related emails and administrative tasks following meetings and reviews						
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Prepare for FRB meeting tomorrow; find 3 files in IA Pro and watch 1 video. 21-0033; 21-0097; 21-0045						
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	5.50		
	travel time from Denver to Cleveland to hotel						
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.30		
	FRB Board n	neeting, 3 cases reviewed					
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	6.00		
	travel from C	leveland to Denver					
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80		
	review three	files/presentations, supervisory and	leadership training, 2022 as assig	gned in Box			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	organize receipts from Cleveland trip, submit last week's time and expenses						

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
Ronnie Dunn	1				24.30
10/02/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	2.00
	Stop, Search	n, & Seizure Methodology memo			
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Monitoring T	eam logistics meeting providing a st	atus update on work projects for the	week.	
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Monitoring T	eam/DOJ weekly logistics meeting			
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Monitoring T	eam Logistics Meeting			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CIT (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.50
	Attended MH	HRAC Meeting - Discussion of Annua	al Report		
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	DOJ/MT Mee	eting - documents status update			
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Review of DO	OJ feedback on Search & Seizure M	ethodology and Juvenile Handcuffing	g memos	
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Weekly Asse	essment Team meeting			
10/23/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.30
	CDP Search	& Seizure Report Review & checking	g emails		
10/24/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Stop and Search Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.00
				Total	433 60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
	Review CDP	Stop, Search, & Seizure Report					
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.20		
	MT/DOJ Me	eting					
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70		
	City/CDP/D0	DJ/MT Meeting					
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.20		
	Administrativ	ve tasks/tracking time					
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00		
	All Team Meeting						
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90		
	Review of CDP Stop, Search, & Seizure Report						
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CIT (prelim) Assessment	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Review of D	OJ feedback on Juvenile Handcuffing	g memo				
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	1.20		
	Review Alch	emer tool for UOF					
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	Respond to	DOJ Juvenile Handcuffing memo co	mments				
10/27/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50		
	Complete re	view and responding to DOJ comme	ents on Juvenile Handcuffing memo				
10/28/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Stop and Search Assessment	Associate Consultant	1.40		
				Total	433.60		

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
	Search & Se	izure methodology revisions			
10/30/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Administrativ	ve tasks, reconciling time, reading, tra	cking, and responding to emails e	tc.	
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Monitoring T	eam Logistics Mtg			
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Alchemer ins	strument walkthrough part 2			
Scott Sarger	nt				19.80
10/01/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00
	Case 2021-3	91556, Lvl 2, review reports/videos, o	complete survey		
10/02/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	3.00
	Cases 2022-	055806, Lvl 2, 2022-099035, Lvl 2 O	C, review files, videos, complete as	ssessment/survey.	
10/04/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	1.00
	Case 2022-1	35871, Level 1 with issues. Review v	ideo, reports/file complete survey	tool.	
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	2.00
	Complete ca 2022-053518 2022-095179	В,	SUMAY		
10/06/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Use of Force Assessement	Associate	2.00
10/00/2022	Cleveland	November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Consultant	2.00
		rs 2022-135896, 2022-114051, g, review files, CWS, complete survey	,		
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00
				Tatal	433 60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
	C D related (	Correspondence - emails					
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	2.00		
	Cases 2022-	133038 and 2022-157753, Lvl 1; revie	ew files/reports and videos. Comp	lete survey tool.			
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00		
	Review corre	spondence/ box file review on record	lings				
10/20/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00		
	Final review	of Recording Citizens policy, comm	ents and correspondence.				
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00		
	All team meeting on scheduling and time issues.						
10/26/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50		
	Review CD related correspondence, email and Memoranda re: FIT assessments/ MT review of UOF OIS cases						
10/31/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.30		
	CD related correspondence/ emails, Box file review Re UOF assessment						
Shunta Boste	on				9.00		
10/01/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	0.70		
	Review rando	om cases 315-400pm (45mins) (.7)					
10/02/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	2.00		
	Review rando	om cases 1030a-1230pm (2.5)(2hrs)					
10/06/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	1.50		
	Review assigned cases 830am-1000am (1.5) ( 1hr 30 mins)						

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
10/09/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	3.30		
	Reviewed UC	DF assigned cases 715p-815p (1hr)	845p-1100p (2.2)				
10/10/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	1.50		
		s 500-630pm (1.5)		Consultant			
Smoot Sean					4.00		
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	4.00		
		ting re potential leadership changes cer misconduct cases and training.	s, progress of monitoring and planni	ng. Review of CD re	lated		
Tammy Hoop	oer				16.40		
10/03/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30		
	CD related email, admin tasks						
10/05/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	3.00		
	Quarterly UF	Assessment					
10/12/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	1.00		
	Quarterly UF	Assessment					
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Use of Force Assessement	Associate Consultant	3.50		
	Quarterly UF	Assessment					
10/13/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50		
	CD related er	mails, admin tasks					
10/17/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30		
	CD related emails, admin tasks						

Total 433.60

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours		
		Project					
10/18/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20		
		mails and correspondence					
10/18/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate	0.70		
	Cleveland Prep for CDF	November 2022 P STAT meeting		Consultant			
10/19/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate	0.80		
	Cleveland CDP STAT M	November 2022 leeting		Consultant			
10/19/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	Pro Bono Hours	Associate	0.20		
	Cleveland CDP STAT fo	November 2022 bllow up review		Consultant			
10/21/2022	City of	Cleveland December 2021 -	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate	0.70		
	Cleveland     November 2022     Consultant       Performance Management Docs Mtg     Consultant						
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.30		
	Performance	Management Docs meeting prep					
10/21/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.20		
	CD related e	mails and correspondence (upcomin	ig FIT assessment)				
10/23/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.50		
	2022 Leader	ship Training Review (Five documen	ts, Modules, Power Points, etc)				
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.40		
	Review and J	prep for All Team Meeting					
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10		
	All Team Zoo	om Meeting					

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70
	Follow up ad	min tasks from All Team Meeting			
Victor Ruiz					1.00
10/25/2022	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
	All Team Mee	etina			

Total 433.60

# **Expense report**

Timeframe Total	10/01/2022 – 10/31/2022 \$680.23	1 Client Projects Categories Team	City of Cle All project All catego Everyone	S	
Date	Project	Category	Roles	Person	Amount
City of Cleve	land				\$680.23
10/27/2022	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 ride from airport to downtown hotel	Transportation	Associate Consultant	Rick Myers	\$31.24
10/27/2022	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 airfare, Denver to Cleveland	Transportation	Associate Consultant	Rick Myers	\$297.20
10/27/2022	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 stay at Aloft for Thurs, Oct 27	Lodging	Associate Consultant	Rick Myers	\$320.78
10/28/2022	Cleveland December 2021 - November 2022 taxi from downtown to Airport	Transportation	Associate Consultant	Rick Myers	\$31.01

Total \$680.23

Client	City of Cleveland		
Draigat	Cleveland December 2021 -		
Project	November 2022		
Category Transportation			
Person	Rick Myers		

ride from airport to downtown hotel



### **Rick Myers**

, .....

### \$31.24 Total amount

October 27 -October 27 2022 1 selected ride



### October 27, 9:00PM

5300 Riverside Dr, Cleveland
1111 W 10th St, Cleveland

\$31.24

Client	City of Cleveland	
Project	Cleveland December 2021 -	
	November 2022	
Category Transportation		
Person	Rick Myers	

airfare, Denver to Cleveland

### Myers, Richard - PD

From:	United Airlines <noreply@united.com></noreply@united.com>
Sent:	Thursday, October 6, 2022 3:47 PM
То:	
Subject:	united.com reservation for Cleveland, OH, US (CLE)

Add <u>unitedairli</u>	ines@united.com to your address book. <u>See instructions</u> .
×	
Tha	ank you for choosing United
This is yo	our confirmation email. You'll receive a receipt in a separate email.
Confirm	nation number A9M1SB
Vi	ew trip details
×	REAL ID Requirement
	Do you have a <u>REAL ID</u> ? Check for the star. Beginning October 1, 2021, every air traveler 18 and older will need a REAL ID-Compliant driver's
	license to fly within the United States. If you don't have a REAL ID, you'll need to use another acceptable form of identification, such as a <u>passport</u> , when flying within the U.S.

1

For everyone's health and safety, United travelers are required to wear a face covering on board. United representatives will have masks available for those who need one.				
	<b>xibility to change</b> are no change fees f		-	31, 2020.
Oct 27, 2022 UA 1816				
4:02 PM				8:51 PM
DEN	2H, 49M			CLE
Denver, CO, US (DEN)			Cleveland, C	H, US (CLE)
Oct 28, 2022 UA 486 4:35 PM CLE	——————————————————————————————————————		Denver, C	5:54 PM <b>DEN</b> O, US (DEN)
ravelers	FLIGHT	SEAT		
armann wivere	DEN - CLE CLE - DEN	12D 21C		
Purchase summary	,			
		2		

Fare		\$249.30
1 senior (65+) Taxes and fees		\$47.90
Tota Credit card payment	al	\$297.20

## Additional trip planning tools

- Baggage Policies: View current baggage acceptance allowances
- Passport and Visa information: International Travel Documentation requirements

### Carry-on baggage

United accepts the following items, per customer to be carried on the aircraft at no charge:

- One carry-on bag no more than 45 linear inches or 114 linear centimeters
- One personal item (such as a shoulder or laptop bag)

Due to FAA regulations, operating carriers may have different carry-on requirements. Please check with the operating carrier for more information or go to <u>united.com/baggage</u>.

Flight	First bag	Second bag	Weight per bag
Denver, CO, US (DEN) to Cleveland, OH, US (CLE) Oct 27, 2022	\$30 \$0 per traveler	<b>\$40 \$0</b> per traveler	70lbs (32kgs)
Cleveland, OH, US (CLE) to Denver, CO, US (DEN) Oct 28, 2022	\$30 \$0 per traveler	<b>\$40 \$0</b> per traveler	70lbs (32kgs)

Baggage check-in must occur with United or United Express, and you must have valid MileagePlus Premier® 1K® membership at time of check-in to qualify for waiver of service charges for up to three checked bags (within specified size and weight limits).

These amounts represent an estimate of the first and second checked baggage service charges that may apply to your itinerary. If your itinerary contains multiple travelers, the service charges may vary by traveler, depending on status or memberships.

First and second bag service charges do not apply to active-duty members of the U.S. military and their accompanying dependents. For additional information regarding baggage charges, allowances, weight/size restrictions, exceptions or embargoes, or charges for overweight, oversized, excess, odd-sized baggage, special items or sporting equipment, visit <u>united.com/baggage</u>.

×				
	Reservations	Deals & offers	MileagePlus®	My account
			<u>vers@gmail.com</u> by United Airlin accept electronic replies to this (	
	C	-	ts reserved. United Airlines, Inc. e Chicago, IL 60606	
			erences   Privacy policy	
		×		

Client	City of Cleveland	
Project	Cleveland December 2021 -	
	November 2022	
Category Lodging		
Person	Rick Myers	

stay at Aloft for Thurs, Oct 27

Aloft Cleveland Downtown 1111 W. 10th Street Cleveland, OH 44113 United States Tel: 216-400-6469 Fax: 216-664-0677

#### RICHARD MYERS



Information Invoice

Aloft Clevelan CLEAL OCT-28-2022 04:40 9999

Date	Reference	Description	Charges (USD)	Credits (USD)
27-OCT-22	RT523	Room Chrg - Standard Retail	273.00	
27-OCT-22	RT523	Sales Tax	21.84	
27-OCT-22	RT523	Occupancy Tax	25.94	
OCT-28-202	2 VI			- 320.78
		V Receipt 3F60987F98 IAD:06021203A02002 TVR:0080008000 00031010 Application Label:CHASE VISA		
		** Total	320.78	-320.78
		*** Balance	0.00	

I agreed to pay all room & incidental charges.

a		

Continued on the next page

Aloft Cleveland Downtown 1111 W. 10th Street Cleveland, OH 44113 United States Tel: 216-400-6469 Fax: 216-664-0677

#### RICHARD MYERS



For your convenience, we have prepared this zero-balance folio indicating a \$0 balance on your account. Please be advised that any charges not reflected on this folio will be charged to the credit card on file with the hotel. While this folio reflects a \$0 balance, your credit card may not be charged until after your departure. You are ultimately responsible for paying all of your folio charges in full.

Tell us about your stay. www.alofthotels.com/reviews

Client	City of Cleveland	
Project	Cleveland December 2021 -	
	November 2022	
Category Transportation		
Person	Rick Myers	

taxi from downtown to Airport



#### **Rick Myers**

October 28 -October 28 2022 1 selected ride



### October 28, 12:39PM

99 W St Clair Ave, Cleveland

5300 Riverside Dr, Cleveland

\$31.01

\$31.01

Total amount