
By email 

November 18, 2016 

Carole Rendon 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suit 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 

Rashida Ogletree 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 

Barbara A. Langhenry 
Gary Singletary 
Sharon Dumas 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 

RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team—October 2016 Invoice 

I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 

The Team’s invoice for services rendered in October 2016 totals   $156,310.71  The bill accounts 
for 1,008.8 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from October 1, 2016 
through October 31, 2016. 

This invoice represents, by far, the highest volume of activity and most significant span of work 
on the project to date.  (The 847.8 hours worked in March 2016 represent the next most active 
billing period.)  As the Parties can represent, significant work was underway on a host of fronts 
in October 2016, including but not limited to: 

• Finalization and submission to the Court five (5) policies relating to use of force;
• Development of sixteen (16)-hour use of force training curriculum on the new

force policies to be provided to officers in the first quarter of 2017;
• Development of the Division’s crisis intervention policy;
• Development of the Division’s initial eight (8)-hour training on crisis

intervention to be provided to all CPD officers;
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• Finalization of the first-ever Manual of processes and procedures for the Office
of Professional Standards (“OPS”);

• Finalization of the first-ever Manual of processes and procedures for the Police
Review Board (“PRB”);

• Drafting of the Division’s policy on Body-Worn Cameras;
• Review and discussion of the City’s Equipment & Resources Plan;
• Monitoring initial City and CPD planning for implementation of field-based

reporting Division-wide;
• A systemic analysis of the quality of Division Internal Affairs investigations;
• Planning for and execution of bid for proposal process for Consent-Decree-

required surveys of police officers and detained individuals;
• Start of collaboration on policies, procedures, processes, and Manuals relating to

the Division’s internal investigations, including:
o Supervisory response to force investigations;
o Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of

command;
o Investigation and review of force incidents by a new Force Investigation

Team (“FIT”);
o Review and analysis of force incidents by a new Force Review Board

(“FRB”);
o Restructuring of Internal Affairs (“IA”) function as required by the

Consent Decree and drafting of processes and Manuals relating to IA.
• Assessing the budgets of OPS, PRB, the Community Police Commission

(“CPC”), and the forthcoming Inspector General;
• Providing technical assistance to the Mental Health Advisory Committee

(“MHAC”) and ADAMHS Board on conducting community engagement and
feedback process on proposed crisis intervention policies;

• Coordinating with City and CPD officials on conducting the Consent Decree-
required outcome measurements for calendar year 2016;

• Discussing the status of progress to police officer organizations, community
organizations and groups, CPC, MHAC, and others.

Of the 1,008.8 ours worked by the Monitoring Team in October 2016, 469.0 hours were pro 
bono, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of more than 46 
percent of its time for October 2016 as pro bono time saved the City $117,250.00.  From the 
Team’s appointment on October 1, 2015 through October 31, 2016, over 48 percent of the 
Monitoring Team’s time has been donated as pro bono, saving the City approximately 
$904,145.00.  Team members also are not billing for travel time, which provides additional 
savings. 

The Monitoring Team anticipates that, as the calendar of deliverables among the various Consent 
Decree stakeholders is adjusted somewhat between now and the end of December 2016 to 
accommodate the holiday season, it remains on track with respect to the $1.2 million budget 
approved for the period of October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2016, and with respect to the 
$4.95 million, five-year budget that began October 1, 2015. 
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The Team continues to benefit from generous hotel arrangements with two hotels in downtown 
Cleveland, which are offering the Team the federal government rate of $125 per night – although 
the Parties should be advised that the federal rate will be increasing to $134 per night in 2017, 
which will be our new arrangements with these hotels in the new year.  This continues to 
translate into significant savings for the City and continues to allow Team members to be present 
with much greater regularity.   

Lutheran Metropolitan Ministries continues to graciously providing the Team with office space 
in the community at minimal cost, which provides the Team with some additional funding, as 
necessary, for travel and expenses within the existing scope of the First-Year Budget.  The 
Division of Police is likewise graciously providing the Team with space in the Division, which 
facilitates the Monitoring Team’s communication with the Division. 

II. INVOICE SUMMARY

October 2016 
Billable Hours $136,405.00 
Overhead $19,905.71
TOTAL    $156,310.71

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

Total 
Hours 

Billed 
Hours 

Pro Bono 
Hours 

Total 
Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 50 41 9 $10,250.00 $954.91 

Modupe Akinola 31 23 8 $5,750.00 $869.55 

Matthew Barge 159.3 55 104.3 $13,750.00 $2,313.17 

Joe Brann 42.9 29.1 13.8 $8,730.00 $1563.52 

Brian Center 29.4 17 12.4 $4,250.00 $898.25 

Christine Cole 51 41 10 $10,250.00 $895.21 

Randy Dupont 50.4 30 20.4 $7,500.00 $1,127.32 

Kelli Evans 41.9 28.9 13 $7,225.00 $624.96 

Maggie Goodrich - - - - - 

Ayesha Hardaway 66.7 50 16.7 $12,500.00 $30.00 

Tim Longo 31.9 21.9 10 $5,475.00 $2,121.18 

Meg Olsen - - - - $340.20 
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Policing Project 
NYU Law  

230.6 35 195.6 
(+64.8 Extern)

$8,750.00 $933.10 

Charles Ramsey 51 51 0 $12,750.00 $1,503.74 

Richard Rosenthal 8 8 0 $2,000.00 $923.14 

Victor Ruiz 11.5 7 4.5 $1,750.00 $0.00 

Scott Sargent 33.5 24.5 9 $6,125.00 $1,036.49 

Ellen Scrivner 22 17 5 $4,250.00 $1219.67 

Charles See 39.4 24.4 15 $6,100.00 $0.00 
Sean Smoot 39.5 25 14.5 $6,250.00 $ 2,533.30 

Tim Tramble 18.8 11 7.8 $2,750.00 $18.00 

TOTAL 1008.8 539.8 469 $136,405.00 $19,905.71 

III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well 
as receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated 
for meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project 
will do so on the standard, federal scale of $69 per day, with fractions of days rounded to the 
nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the 
end of the day would be compensated for the half day of $34.50.)   

Most Team members continue to waive their per diem charges, or elect to receive them only for 
some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This constitutes an additional, ongoing 
savings to the City of Cleveland. 

Finally, some Team member invoices or bills may contain reference to meals or other costs for 
which the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items 
have been redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that 
contains billed charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be 
clear. 

IV. CONCLUSION

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 
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Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 

Sincerely, 

Matthew Barge 
cc: 
Michelle Heyer 
Monica Madej 
Kevin Preslan 
Heather Tonsing Volosin 



October 2016 BILLABLE HOURS 
Hassan Aden 

TO: 
Matthew Barge 
Meg Olsen PARC 
Via email

FOR: 
Cleveland-Monitoring 

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT 

October 6: Read/Review Cleveland Consent Decree 
related documents, including issued reports by MT. 

5 $250.00 $1250.00 

October 8: Correspondence and logistics for October 
26-29 site visit

2 $500.00 

October 11: Call w th MB re:logistics (site visit 
frequency, travel, reimbursements etc.) and role on 
MT. Review, add content and edit CDP Policy/GPO 
1.1.11 Discipline Guidance 

2 $500.00 

October 13: Review of CDP policies/GPOs on UF 
(5 drafts), IA and Investigations. 

4 $1000.00 

October 18: MT call with parties. Rev ew of updated 
First Year Mon toring Plan.  Correspondence w th 
Mon tor re: upcoming site visit (October 26-29). 

3.5 $875.00 

October 21: MT weekly call 1 $250.00 

October 24: Review and edit training scenario 
documents (UF Scenario and Video Training).  MT call 
with MB, CC and ES to discuss and prioritize edits.  
Subsequent correspondence with CDP Train ng 
Division commanders regarding the training documents. 

1.5 $375.00 

October 27: Pro Bono Travel from Seattle to Cleveland. 0 $0.00 

October 28: MT team meet ng.  Meet ng w th DOJ, 
C ty, CDP and MT re: IA Process and UF Po cy.  
Meet ng re: UF Training schedule.  Meeting with 
citizens and leadership at the Cleveland City Club. 
MT Team dinner/meeting. 

8 $2000.00 

October 29: MT meeting on a aspects of CDP 
settlement agreement to include progress in key 
areas, instruments to assess performance, upcoming 
deadlines and deliverables.  Team logistics and other 
aspects of MT management were discussed. (Pro 
Bono Travel from Cleveland)

8 $2000.00 

October 31: Review, edit and comment on multiple 
CDP policies relating to Instructor Certifications, UF 
training and scenarios.  Logistics for meeting with COP 
and Judge White.  Correspondence with MT re: team 
calls and other logistics.   

6 $1500.00 
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DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT 

Total Billable Hours 41 $250.00 $10,250.00 

Reimbursable Expenses 

October 27:  RT Airfare-this visit involved a multiple 
site visit with a multi -city ticket (Seattle and 
Cleveland). Reimbursement is only for 50% of the 
ticket (receipt attached) 

$582.10 

October 27: Hotel room and tax for two nights $291.26 

October 27:  Tax to Marriott hotel $41.00 

October 28: Uber to Lutheran Church for MT meeting $6.76 

October 29: Uber to airport $15.13 

October 29: Uber from DCA to home $18.66 

Total Reimbursable Expenses $954.91 

 Pro bono hours 9 Pro Bono 
hours = 
$2250 

$250.00 

TOTAL 
BILLED 

$11,204.91 



10/11/2016 Print trip and receipt – Your trip details – American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/printItinerary.do?forward=itineraryReceipt&isReceipt=true&anchorLocation=%2Freservation%2FfindReservationSubmit.do+aacomT… 1/2

Receipt

Endorsements/Restrictions
CXL BY FLT T ME OR NOVALUE/NONREF/SVCCHGPLUS C98 99/

Terms and conditions:
f you ve already begun travel  this receipt may only show portions of your trip not flown

f your ticket involves travel outside the U S  Canada  U S  Virgin slands or Puerto Rico and has been reissued  your ticket total may not include all taxes  Please contact
Reservations for the correct total

A summary of all the terms and conditions that apply to your travel are available on aa com/conditionsofcarriage

AA RECORD LOCATOR: SDBFEC
Get your boarding pass faster
Scan this barcode at any
American Airlines Self-Service
Machine.

Multiple Destinations
1 Adu t
Tuesday October 25  2016  Saturday October 29  2016

Total Paid:

AA Record Locator

SDBFEC
Your record locator is your reservation confirmation number and
will be needed to retrieve or reference your reservation.

Reservation Name

DCA/SEA
Status: Ticketed Oct 09  2016

$1,164.20 USD

Flight Depart Arrive

American Airlines

6850
Operated by Alaska Airlines

Washington (DCA) October 25  2016 08:00 AM
ravel ime  5 h 45 m Cabin Class  Economy Seat  unassigned

Seattle (SEA) October 25
2016 10:45 AM
Booking Code  Y Plane ype  737

Flight Depart Arrive

American Airlines

1226
Seattle (SEA) October 26  2016 02:35 PM

ravel ime  4 h 1 m Cabin Class  Economy Seat  11D
Chicago (ORD) October 26  2016 08:36
PM
Booking Code  S Plane ype  738

American Airlines

3389
Operated by Envoy Air As
American Eagle

Chicago (ORD) October 26  2016 09:45 PM
ravel ime  1 h 12 m Cabin Class  Economy Seat  7C

Cleveland (CLE) October 26
2016 11:57 PM
Booking Code  S Plane ype  CR7

Flight Depart Arrive

American Airlines

3935
Operated by Air Wisconsin As
American Eagle

Cleveland (CLE) October 29
2016 03:30 PM

ravel ime  1 h 26 m Cabin Class  Economy Seat  2D

Philadelphia (PHL) October 29
2016 04:56 PM
Booking Code  G Plane ype  CRJ

American Airlines

2030
Philadelphia (PHL) October 29
2016 05:59 PM

ravel ime  1 h 9 m Cabin Class  Economy Seat  11D

Washington (DCA) October 29
2016 07:08 PM
Booking Code  G Plane ype  319

Flight Information

PASSENGER TICKET NUMBER FREQUENT FLYER NUMBER FARE Tax/Fee/Charge TICKET TOTAL

ADEN HASSAN 0012395630998 31LXC40 $1 037 22 USD 126 98 1164 20

Payment Type       Total $1 164 20 USD



10/11/2016 Print trip and receipt – Your trip details – American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/printItinerary.do?forward=itineraryReceipt&isReceipt=true&anchorLocation=%2Freservation%2FfindReservationSubmit.do+aacomT… 2/2

























10/31/2016 PayPal

https://www.paypal.com/us/receipt/INV2-2F39-KUKL-EQYE-89WA 1/2

Amount $36.00

Subtotal $36.00

Tip $5.00

TOTAL $41.00

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS.

PayPal makes shopping on the web faster and easier. Sign up today.

$41.00 USD

Created on October 27, 2016 at 9:56:50 PM PDT 
Order ID: 0123

I agree to pay above total amount according to card issuer agreement.

Payment Method

SALE (Swiped)



10/31/2016 PayPal

https://www.paypal.com/us/receipt/INV2-2F39-KUKL-EQYE-89WA 2/2

This transaction will appear on your credit card
statement as 'PP*AIRPORTTAXI'

Additional Details

Business Information

Airport Taxi ( CLE ) 
Merchant ID: 6CHMW4HNHUUPW 

4837 Columbia rd , #202 
North Olmsted OH 44070, US 

midnimo101@gmail.com 

Purchase Location

Location set by seller's device, may not be
accurate.

PayPal collects and uses your personal information in accordance with our Privacy Policy, which is available at
www.paypal.com.

Please retain your receipt as proof of transaction.

Leave your wallet at home, pay with the PayPal app.



 

 

MATTHEW BARGE 
 

OCTOBER 2016 INVOICE 
 

BILLABLE HOURS 
 
Date Activity Hours 
10-01-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 

and review documents. 
3.6 

10-02-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

1.7 

10-03-16 Meet with stakeholders.  Communicate re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

11.6 

10-04-16 Meet with stakeholders.  Communicate re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

7.5 

10-05-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.   Draft 
and review documents. 

6.6 

10-06-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

5.1 

10-07-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

5.2 

10-08-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 0.2 
10-09-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 

and review documents. 
1.6 

10-10-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

4.8 

10-11-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

8.1 

10-12-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.  

4.3 

10-13-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

4.9 

10-14-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

2.1 

10-16-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

1.3 

10-17-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.  

5.8 

10-18-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.   

6.0 

10-19-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.   

5.7 

10-20-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.   

8.0 



10-21-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

7.1 

10-22-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

3.5 

10-23-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 0.4 
10-24-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 

and review documents. 
5.2 

10-25-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

6.9 

10-26-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

3.3 

10-27-16 Meet with stakeholders.  Communicate re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

8.7 

10-28-16 Meet with stakeholders.  Communicate re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

10.7 

10-29-16 Meet with Monitoring Team.  Communicate re: 
various monitoring issues.  Draft and review 
documents. 

8.9 

10-30-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

3.1 

10-31-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

7.4 

Total Hours Worked 159.3 
Total Billed Hours     55.0  
              Rate: $250/hour 
TOTAL BILLED $13,750.00 
Pro Bono Hours   104.3 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 
03-Oct Dial7 (Residence to LGA) $  78.34 
03-Oct United Airlines (LGA to CLE, CLE to LGA)* $654.06 
03-Oct Taxi (CLE to Downtown) $  43.20 
04-Oct Uber (LGA to Residence) $  41.95 
04-Oct Westin Hotels (10/3 – 10/4) $145.63 
26-Oct American Airlines (1/2 of SEA to CLE)** $130.30 
27-Oct Taxi (CLE to Downtown) $  43.20 
28-Oct Taxi (Downtown to LMM) $  11.00 
29-Oct Westin Hotels (10/26 – 10/29) $436.89 
29-Oct Taxi (EWR to Residence) $101.50 
29-Oct United Airlines (CLE to LGA) $567.10 



 

 

29-Oct LMM Housing & Shelter (All-Team Meeting 
Transportation) 

$  60.00 

 TOTAL $2,313.1 
 
Notes: 
 
*  Payment for this ticket applied part of a previous, refunded/cancelled itinerary.  The City of 
Cleveland was not charged and did not pay this sum previously.  Accordingly, reimbursement is 
sought for the value of the whole itinerary, $654.06.  In other words, the ticket was paid for 
through a combination of credit card and application of a previous credit.  The credited amount 
was not previously paid by the City of Cleveland, which is why reimbursement for the whole 
cost of the itinerary is reflected here. 
 
**  Reimbursement is sought for one-half of airfare from Seattle-Tacoma to Cleveland on 
October 26, as Mr. Barge was traveling from another project site to Cleveland.  The other half 
will be billed to the other project. 
 
Mr. Barge does not bill for meals, travel/transport time, or miscellaneous personal expenses.  
Whenever feasible to do so, he coordinates ground transportation with other Monitoring Team 
members. 





Thursday,	September	29,	2016	at	12:44:35	PM	Eastern	Daylight	Time
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Subject: eTicket Iner ary and Receipt for Confirmaon N PYKHP
Date: Thursday, September 22, 2016 at 7:22:05 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: United Airlines, Inc.
To: Mahe w Barge

Confirmation: 

NPYKHP
Check-In >

Airfare: 582.32U
S
D

U.S. Transportation Tax: 43.54
U.S. Flight Segment Tax: 8.00
September 11th Security Fee: 11.20
U.S. Passenger Facility Charge: 9.00
Per Person Total: 654.06U

S
D

eTicket Total: 654.06U
S
D

Receipt for confirmation NPYKHP

Issue Date: September 22, 2016
Traveler eTicket Number Frequent Flyer Seats
BARGE/MATTHEW 0162319080143 ---/20C
FLIGHT INFORMATION
Day, Date Flight Class Departure City and Time Arrival City and Time Aircraft Meal
Mon, 03OCT16 UA4120 M NEW YORK, NY 

(LGA - LAGUARDIA) 8:40 AM
CLEVELAND, OH 
(CLE) 10:25 AM

ERJ-145

Flight operated by EXPRESSJET AIRLINES INC. doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.
Tue, 04OCT16 UA4314 M CLEVELAND, OH 

(CLE) 6:05 PM
NEW YORK, NY 
(LGA - LAGUARDIA) 7:43 PM

ERJ-145

Flight operated by EXPRESSJET AIRLINES INC. doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.

FARE INFORMATION

Fare Breakdown Form of Payment:

The airfare you paid on this itinerary totals: 582.32 USD

The taxes, fees, and surcharges paid total: 71.74 USD

Fare Rules:
Additional charges may apply for changes in addition to any fare rules listed.

NONREF/0VALUAFTDPT/CHGFEE
Cancel reservations before the scheduled departure time or TICKET HAS NO VALUE.

Add Collect: An additional amount for the difference in fare was charged to 
on Thursday, September 22, 2016. $1.86 USD per ticket for an

additional total of $1.86 USD was collected.

Additional
Charges:

Thu., Sep. 22, 2016/  was charged 200 USD for the SST / EDD 01629261232303
         200.00 USD for: Change Fee



Page	2	of	4

Baggage allowance and charges for this itinerary.

Baggage fees are per traveler

Origin and destination for checked baggage 1st bag 2nd bag Max wt / dim per piece
10/3/2016 New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia) to Cleveland, OH

(CLE)
25.00
USD

35.00
USD

50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in
(157.0cm)

10/4/2016 Cleveland, OH (CLE) to New York, NY (LGA -
LaGuardia)

25.00
USD

35.00
USD

50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in
(157.0cm)

MileagePlus Accrual Details

 
BARGE/MATTHEW
Date Flight From/To
10/3/2016 4120 New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia)-Cleveland, OH (CLE)
10/4/2016 4314 Cleveland, OH (CLE)-New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia)
 
Matthew's MileagePlus Accrual totals:

Important Information about MileagePlus Earning
Accruals vary based on the terms and conditions of the traveler’s frequent flyer program, the traveler’s
frequent flyer status and the itinerary selected. United MileagePlus® mileage accrual is subject to the rules of
the MileagePlus program
Once travel has started, accruals will no longer display. You can view your MileagePlus account for posted
accrual
You can earn up to 75,000 award miles per ticket. The 75,000 award miles cap may be applied to your posted
flight activity in an order different than shown
PQD are a Premier status requirement for members in the U.S. only.

Accrual is only displayed for MileagePlus members who choose to accrue to their MileagePlus account.
Additional Baggage Information

The above amounts represent an estimate of the first and second checked baggage
service charges that may apply to your itinerary.

If your itinerary contains multiple travelers, the service charges may vary by
traveler, depending on status or memberships.

Carry-on baggage information

United accepts one carry-on item with maximum dimensions of 9"x14"x22" (22 cm + 35 cm + 56 cm) in the
aircraft cabin, along with one personal item such as a laptop bag with maximum dimensions of 9"x10"x17" (22
cm + 25 cm + 43 cm).

Due to FAA regulations, operating carriers may have different carry-on requirements.

Please check with the operating carrier for more information or go to united.com.

General Baggage Information

First and second bag service charges do not apply to active-duty members of the U.S. military and their
accompanying dependents. For additional information regarding baggage charges

allowances, weight/size restrictions, exceptions or embargoes, or charges for overweight, oversized, excess,
odd-sized baggage, special items
or sporting equipment, visit united.com/baggage.
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eTicket Reminders
Check-in Requirement - Bags must be checked and boarding passes obtained at least 30 minutes prior to
scheduled departure. Baggage will not be accepted and advance seat assignments may be cancelled if this
condition is not met.
EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Chicago, Cincinnati, Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth,
Denver, Fort Lauderdale, Honolulu, Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville, Kahului, Kona, Las Vegas, Los Angeles,
Maui, Miami, Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando, Philadelphia, Phoenix, Reno, San Francisco, San Juan,
PR, St. Louis, Seattle, Tampa, Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA) or Austin, the check in requirement time
for Passengers and Bags is 45 minutes.
Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding
pass at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure.
Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding,
removal of checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation.
Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport.

The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop
computer, etc.) per passenger.

For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in
Spanish 1-800-426-5561.
If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to the
fare rules governing your ticket.
For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page.

Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare
rules above.

Refunds Within 24 Hours
When you book and ticket a reservation through united.com, the United mobile app, the United Customer
Contact Center, at our ticket counters or city ticket offices, or if you
use MileagePlus® miles to book an award ticket, we will allow you to cancel the ticketed reservation without
penalty and receive a 100 percent refund of the ticket price
to the original form of payment if you cancel the reservation within 24 hours of purchase and if the reservation
is made one week or more prior to scheduled flight departure.

Customer Care Contact Information

We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.

You may contact us using our Customer Care form

Hazardous materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A
violation can result in five years imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).

Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons,
corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods

include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and
corrosive materials.

Additional information can be found on:

united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States
(except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in
delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is
declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices).
For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items;
excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained
from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic portions of
the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per
passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the
domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that
customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was
to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in
connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged
baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within
21 days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of
United’s Contract of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability.
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Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United’s Contract of
Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1.
Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and
baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including
time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the
carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and
refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including
schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United’s
Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter.
Passengers have the right, upon request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States,
to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage.
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the
fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the
ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the
rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for
changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum
and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has
acquired a ticket in violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national,
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a
full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure within 24 hours of purchase.
Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes
prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and
boarding pass.
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate
destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties
known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may
apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty,
including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier in
respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of
passengers and baggage.
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat
will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no
one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in
exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny
boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from the air carrier,
persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding
locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries,
although other consumer protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © {0} United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the " reply " address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.2016
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The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Matthew Barge
Police Assessment Resource Cen

United States

Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 302532
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

03-OCT-16 10:39
04-OCT-16 09:31
1
1221

Tax ID :
The Westin Cleveland  04-OCT-16  09:40  HAIRSTO
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
03-OCT-16 1667 Internet Service In Room 12.95
03-OCT-16 RT1221 Room Charge 125.00
03-OCT-16 RT1221 State Sales Tax 10.00
03-OCT-16 RT1221 City Tax 3.75
03-OCT-16 RT1221 County Tax 6.88
04-OCT-16 1667 -ADJ Internet Service In Room -12.95
04-OCT-16 -145.63

Date        Code         Authorized DCC
03-OCT-16 19547P 162.5
03-OCT-16 49004P 100

** Total  158.58 -158.58
*** Balance     0.00

Continued on the next page



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Matthew Barge

New York, NY  10001
United States

Page Number  : 2 Invoice Nbr  : 302532
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

03-OCT-16 10:39
04-OCT-16 09:31
1
1221

REST EASY - Nothing recharges mind and body like sound sleep. Experience superior rest at home with the Westin Heavenly(R) Bed, a revitalizing 
retreat for the sleep of your dreams. Learn more at westin.com/store

Tell us about your stay. www.westin.com/reviews

Signature_____________________



Friday,	October	21,	2016	at	1:02:45	PM	Eastern	Daylight	Time

Page	1	of	3

Subject: E-Ticket Confirmaon-JJSO WL 26OCT
Date: Thursday, September 29, 2016 at 7:05:22 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: American Airlines@aa.com
To:

Ticket Issued: Sep 29, 2016

Matthew Barge,
Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your
trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at checkin options.   For information
regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please visit  baggage
information.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit
www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA
Self-Service machine. 

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.
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consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette ligh
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage e
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please see airport expectations.

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be tick
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on f  
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are 
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, 
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the 
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rig  
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the 
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free o
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of e  
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message con
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or other
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distr bute, or take action in reliance upon th
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from yo
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 5050292533522918050782400
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Subject: eTicket Iner ary and Receipt for Confirmaon M5R VF0
Date: Thursday, September 29, 2016 at 6:58:11 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: United Airlines, Inc.
To: Mahe w Barge

Confirmation: 

M5RVF0

Airfare: 514.42U
S
D

U.S. Transportation Tax: 38.58
U.S. Flight Segment Tax: 4.00
September 11th Security Fee: 5.60
U.S. Passenger Facility Charge: 4.50
Per Person Total: 567.10U

S
D

eTicket Total: 567.10U
S
D

Receipt for confirmation M5RVF0

Issue Date: September 29, 2016

Traveler eTicket Number Frequent Flyer Seats
BARGE/MATTHEW 0162319917327 12C
FLIGHT INFORMATION
Day, Date Flight Class Departure City and Time Arrival City and Time Aircraft Meal
Sat, 29OCT16 UA3484 B CLEVELAND, OH 

(CLE) 6:40 PM
NEWARK, NJ 
(EWR - LIBERTY) 8:19 PM

ERJ 170

Flight operated by REPUBLIC AIRLINES doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.

FARE INFORMATION

Fare Breakdown Form of Payment:

The airfare you paid on this itinerary totals: 514.42 USD

The taxes, fees, and surcharges paid total: 52.68 USD

Fare Rules:
Additional charges may apply for changes in addition to any fare rules listed.

NONREF/0VALUAFTDPT/CHGFEE
Cancel reservations before the scheduled departure time or TICKET HAS NO VALUE.

Baggage allowance and charges for this itinerary.
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Baggage fees are per traveler

Origin and destination for checked baggage 1st bag 2nd bag Max wt / dim per piece
10/29/2016 Cleveland, OH (CLE) to Newark, NJ (EWR -

Liberty)
25.00
USD

35.00
USD

50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in
(157.0cm)

MileagePlus Accrual Details

 
BARGE/MATTHEW
Date Flight From/To
10/29/2016 3484 Cleveland, OH (CLE)-Newark, NJ (EWR - Liberty)
 
Matthew's MileagePlus Accrual totals:

Important Information about MileagePlus Earning
Accruals vary based on the terms and conditions of the traveler’s frequent flyer program, the traveler’s
frequent flyer status and the itinerary selected. United MileagePlus® mileage accrual is subject to the rules of
the MileagePlus program
Once travel has started, accruals will no longer display. You can view your MileagePlus account for posted
accrual
You can earn up to 75,000 award miles per ticket. The 75,000 award miles cap may be applied to your posted
flight activity in an order different than shown
PQD are a Premier status requirement for members in the U.S. only.

Accrual is only displayed for MileagePlus members who choose to accrue to their MileagePlus account.
Additional Baggage Information

The above amounts represent an estimate of the first and second checked baggage
service charges that may apply to your itinerary.

If your itinerary contains multiple travelers, the service charges may vary by
traveler, depending on status or memberships.

Carry-on baggage information

United accepts one carry-on item with maximum dimensions of 9"x14"x22" (22 cm + 35 cm + 56 cm) in the
aircraft cabin, along with one personal item such as a laptop bag with maximum dimensions of 9"x10"x17" (22
cm + 25 cm + 43 cm).

Due to FAA regulations, operating carriers may have different carry-on requirements.

Please check with the operating carrier for more information or go to united.com.

General Baggage Information

First and second bag service charges do not apply to active-duty members of the U.S. military and their
accompanying dependents. For additional information regarding baggage charges

allowances, weight/size restrictions, exceptions or embargoes, or charges for overweight, oversized, excess,
odd-sized baggage, special items
or sporting equipment, visit united.com/baggage.

eTicket Reminders
Check-in Requirement - Bags must be checked and boarding passes obtained at least 30 minutes prior to
scheduled departure. Baggage will not be accepted and advance seat assignments may be cancelled if this
condition is not met.
EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Chicago, Cincinnati, Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth,
Denver, Fort Lauderdale, Honolulu, Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville, Kahului, Kona, Las Vegas, Los Angeles,
Maui, Miami, Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando, Philadelphia, Phoenix, Reno, San Francisco, San Juan,
PR, St. Louis, Seattle, Tampa, Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA) or Austin, the check in requirement time
for Passengers and Bags is 45 minutes.
Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding
pass at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure.
Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding,
removal of checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation.
Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport.

The FAA now restricts carry on baggage to one bag pl s one personal item (p rse  briefcase  laptop
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The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop
computer, etc.) per passenger.

For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in
Spanish 1-800-426-5561.
If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to the
fare rules governing your ticket.
For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page.

Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare
rules above.

Refunds Within 24 Hours
When you book and ticket a reservation through united.com, the United mobile app, the United Customer
Contact Center, at our ticket counters or city ticket offices, or if you
use MileagePlus® miles to book an award ticket, we will allow you to cancel the ticketed reservation without
penalty and receive a 100 percent refund of the ticket price
to the original form of payment if you cancel the reservation within 24 hours of purchase and if the reservation
is made one week or more prior to scheduled flight departure.

Customer Care Contact Information

We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.

You may contact us using our Customer Care form

Hazardous materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A
violation can result in five years imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).

Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons,
corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods

include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and
corrosive materials.

Additional information can be found on:

united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States
(except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in
delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is
declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices).
For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items;
excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained
from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic portions of
the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per
passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the
domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that
customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was
to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in
connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged
baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within
21 days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of
United’s Contract of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability.
Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United’s Contract of
Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1.
Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and
baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including
time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the
carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and
refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including
schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United’s
Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter.
Passengers have the right, upon request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States,
to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage.
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the
fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the
ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the
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rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for
changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum
and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has
acquired a ticket in violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national,
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a
full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure within 24 hours of purchase.
Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes
prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and
boarding pass.
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate
destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties
known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may
apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty,
including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier in
respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of
passengers and baggage.
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat
will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no
one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in
exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny
boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from the air carrier,
persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding
locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries,
although other consumer protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © {0} United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the " reply " address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.2016























Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Fees 10/06/2016 - Communications - phone calls & e-mails: w/C. 
Cole, K Evans re quality reviews of IA cases, template, and 
questions to cover w/CDP; setting up conf calls re same (0.6 pro 
bono hrs)

0.00 $300.00 $0.00

Fees 10/07/2016 - Conference calls/online meetings: review 
materials and prep work followed by call w/Kelli Evans & Scott 
Sergeant re complaint investigation form & issues to discuss 
with CDP,

1.30 $300.00 $390.00

Fees 10/11/2016 - Consulting meeting: w/Cmdr Heffernan, Lt. 
Goines, K. Evans and C. Cole re IA/complaint process; 
research and provide response/recommendations re 
materials/resources for supervisors testing process.

3.10 $300.00 $930.00

Fees 10/21/2016 - Conference calls/online meetings: weekly MT 
discussion.

0.70 $300.00 $210.00

Fees 10/25/2016 - Documents - review/edit/writing: working 
on review of Uof cases; respond to Matthew's request re 
information about training qualification standards for 
less-lethal weapons (pro bono 3.4 hrs)

0.0 $300.00 $0.00

Fees 10/27/2016 - Report writing: Reviewing complaint investigations 
& developing comments/feedback on review form for 
discussions w/MT; travel to Cleveland (+ an additional 3 hrs pro 
bono)

8.00 $300.00 $2,400.00

Fees 10/28/2016 - Consulting: prep discussion w/MT; w/CPD, DOJ, 
City staff & MT members re Internal Investigations, UoF policy 
governing less lethal weapons; site visit and mtg w/District 2 
Commander; w/Community Policing staff re status of work/
progress; w/MT re Crisis Intervention Outcome Measures; 
discussion re Qualitative Assessment of IA investigations; 
debriefing and team dinner (+ an additional 3hr pro bono)

8.00 $300.00 $2,400.00

Fees 10/29/2016 - Consulting: MT meeting; return travel to 
LA ( + an additional pro bono - 5.3 hrs)

8.00 $300.00 $2,400.00

Expenses 10/28/2016 - Transportation: Uber 1.00 $11.39 $11.39

Expenses 10/28/2016 - Transportation: Uber 1.00 $8.77 $8.77

INVOICE From Joseph Brann & Associates

Invo ce For PARCInvo ce ID 2016-10 Cleveland2

Issue Date 11/08/2016

Due Date 12/08/2016 (Net 30)

Page 1 of 2



Expenses 10/29/2016 - Airfare 1.00 $935.20 $935.20

Expenses 10/29/2016 - Lodging 1.00 $503.04 $503.04

Expenses 10/29/2016 - Mileage: to/from LAX 28.00 $0.54 $15.12

Expenses 10/29/2016 - Parking: at LAX 1.00 $90.00 $90.00

Amount Due $10,293.52

Notes

October Fees: $8,730.00 
October Pro Bono Hours: 13.8 (87.2 YTD) 
October Expenses: $1563.52

Page 2 of 2



















BRIAN D. CENTER 
 

TO:  Matthew Barge 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 
 
FROM: Brian Center 
 
DATE:  November 2, 2016 

 
OCTOBER 2016 INVOICE 

 
BILLABLE HOURS 

 
Date Activity Hours 
10-5-16 Participate in MT call to discuss CPC and providing 

technical assistance  
0.5 

10-9 Research needs of CPC for management consultant 
(0.1); prep. portion of semi-annual report related to 
community policing 

0.5 

10-11 Tc to CPC about technical assistance with finding 
organizational manager (0.1); Prep. portion of semi-
annual report regarding community policing, 
including review of monitoring plan, efforts of CDP 
and CPC 

1.0 

10-16 More prep. of report on status of efforts related to 
community policing 

2.1 

10-17 More prep. of report on status of efforts related to 
community policing 

0.8 

10-18 Tc with CPC about contracting with organizational 
management consultant 

0.1 

10-21 Participate in MT call re updates on entire project 0.3 
10-24 Begin prep. of technical assistance to CPD to draft 

RFQ (0.2); review use of force policies, edits to 
policies, begin prep. of motion to court to seek 
approval of policy revisions, tc with MT re same –
 

1.1 

10-25 More tcs regarding help to CPC; edits to Motion to 
court regarding use of force policies  

1.8 

10-26 More tcs and research regarding help to CPC; edits 
to Motion to court regarding use of force policies 

0.9 

10-27 Continue prep. of Motion regarding use of force 
policies, includes review of revisions to use of force 
policies, review of best practice; review consent 
decree, revised monitoring plan and community 
policing materials to prep. for meetings in 
Cleveland; more research of city procedures for 

3.3 



CPC’s RFQ 

10-28 Attend various meetings all day with SPD, MT, 
community stakeholders, regarding update on 
policing on the ground, community policing efforts, 
CIT efforts and data collection 

8.0 

10-29 Attend MT meeting 8.0 
10-31 Continue prep. of Motion for approval of use of 

force policies 
1.0 

Total Billed Hours 
              Rate: $250/hour 29.4 
TOTAL BILLED 17 ($4,250) 
Pro Bono Hours 12.4 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 
Per Diem (10-28) $69 $69 
Transportation 
10-29-16 Airport Parking $46.05 
10-27-16 Airfare (AA)) $423.44 
10-28 Cab $42.00 
10-28 Uber $9.80 
10-28 Uber $5.70 
10-28 (invoice
erroneously says 10-27)

Cab $11.00 

Accommodations 
10-29-16 Hotel (2 nights) $291.26 

TOTAL $898.25 































We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.
You may contact us using our Customer Care form 

Hazardous materials
Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A 
violation can result in five years' imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).
Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons, 
corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods
include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and 
corrosive materials. 
Additional information can be found on:
united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES 

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States 
(except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in 
delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is 
declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices). 
For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items; 
excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained 
from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic portions of 
the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per 
passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the 
domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or 
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that 
customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was 
to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in 
connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal 
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged 
baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within 
21 days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of 
United’s Contract of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability. 
Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United’s Contract of 
Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1. 
Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and 
baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including 
time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the 
carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and 
refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including 
schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United’s 
Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter. 
Passengers have the right, upon request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States, 
to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage. 
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the 
fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the 
ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the 
rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for 
changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum 
and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has 
acquired a ticket in violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national, 
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a 
full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure within 24 hours of purchase. 
Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes 
prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30 
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time 
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit 
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive 
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these 
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the 
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of 
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and 
boarding pass. 
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey 
involving an ultimate destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure 
are advised that international treaties known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, 
the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may apply to the entire journey, 
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including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty, including 
contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the 
Carrier in respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage 
to, baggage, and for delay of passengers and baggage. 
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and 
there is a slight chance that a seat will not be available on a flight for which a 
person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no one will 
be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give 
up their reservation in exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If 
there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny boarding to other 
persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few 
exceptions, including failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, 
which are available upon request from the air carrier, persons, denied 
boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for 
the payment of compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are 
available at all airport ticket counters and boarding locations. Some airlines 
do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign 
countries, although other consumer protections may be available. Check with 
your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © 2016 United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the "reply" address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.
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02

Business Information

Americab Transportation, Inc 
Merchant ID: N4XPZATBMPQZ8 

3380 West 137th St 
Cleveland OH 44111, US 

JPieciak@americabs.com

Purchase Location

Location set by seller's device, may not be 
accurate.

PayPal collects and uses your personal information in accordance with our Privacy Policy, which is available at 
www.paypal.com. 

Please retain your receipt as proof of transaction. 

Leave your wallet at home, pay with the PayPal app.

Page 2 of 2PayPal
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$8.86 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Christine

October 28, 2016 | uberX 

05:50pm | 4515 US-6, Cleveland, OH 

06:07pm | 13127 Shaker Square, Cleveland, OH 

Your Friday evening trip with Uber 

ReceiptsUber 
Fri 10/28/2016 6:08 PM 

Inbox 

To  

Page 1 of 3Your Friday evening trip with Uber 

10/31/2016https://outlook.live.com/owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessageItem&ItemID=AQMkADAwAT...





Invite your friends and family. Get 
a free ride worth up to $15 when 
you refer a friend to try Uber. 

Share code: 3e68z 

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with 
questions about your trip. 

Leave something behind? Track it down.

Page 3 of 3Your Friday evening trip with Uber -
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$9.76 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Christine

October 28, 2016 | uberX 

08:47pm | 13101 Shaker Square, Cleveland, OH 

09:06pm | 1316-1354 W Mall Dr, Cleveland, OH 

Your Friday evening trip with Uber 

ReceiptsUber 
Fri 10/28/2016 9:08 PM 

Inbox 

 

Page 1 of 3Your Friday evening trip with Uber 

10/31/2016https://outlook.live.com/owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessageItem&ItemID=AQMkADAwAT...





Invite your friends and family. Get 
a free ride worth up to $15 when 
you refer a friend to try Uber. 

Share code: 3e68z 

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with 
questions about your trip. 

Leave something behind? Track it down.

Page 3 of 3Your Friday evening trip with Uber - Christine M Cole
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Randolph Dupont 

TO: Matthew Barge, Monitor, Police Assessment Resource Center 
FROM: Randolph Dupont 
DATE:  November 2, 2016 

October 2016 Invoice 
Billable Hours 

Date Activity Hours 

10-03-16 Community Outreach Meeting Discussion   0.2 
10-07-16 Monitoring Team Community Engagement Group Meeting, 

Discussion of CPD CIT Policy Revisions 
  2.1 

10-09-16 Review of CIT Progress, review of correspondence, Planning for 
community engagement 

  2.0 

10-11-16 Discussion of CIT Policy Document   0.6 
10-12-16 Planning with Monitoring Community Engagement Team, 

Discussion with parties re: Policy Issues  
  1.1 

10-13-16 On-Site MHRAC Community Engagement meeting, ADAMHS 
meetings, On-site review of intervention programs, CPD CIT 
Staff meeting, site visit to CPD District 

  2.7 

10-14-16 Discussion of CIT Policy issues with parties   1.1 
10-15-16 Technical Writing, Monitoring Report   2.0 
10-16-16 Discussion of Monitoring Report, Technical Writing   1.0 
10-17-16 Review of correspondence, Discussion with ADAMHS re: 

community outreach meeting, meeting with Monitoring team 
  1.7 

10-18-16 Monitoring Report review, Policy review and discussion   2.5 
10-20-16 Policy review with Monitoring Team   0.8 
10-21-16 Discussion of ADAMHS provider meeting, Monitoring Team 

discussion of CIT strategy  
  1.6 

10-24-16 MHRAC Training Committee meeting, Discussion with parties   1.4 
10-25-16 Policy discussion, review of materials for Cleveland trip   1.9 
10-26-16 Policy Committee discussion, trip preparation   1.5 
10-27-16 On site visit, MHRAC Training Mtg, Community Outreach Mtg, 

Policy mtg with parties, CIT CPD update, on-site visit CPD div. 
  9.5 

10-28-16 On site visit, ADAMHS provider mtg, Monitoring Team 
presentation, CPD Training Div mtg, CIT Outcomes mtg 

  5.5 

10-29-16 Monitoring Team Meeting   8.0 
10-31-16 CIT policy meeting   3.2 

Total Hours Worked 50.4 
Total Billed Hours 30 
              Rate: $250/hour 
TOTAL BILLED $7500.00 
Pro Bono Hours  20.4 

Travel Time (not billed)  13.0 



 
 
 
 

Randolph Dupont 
 
 

October 2016 Invoice 
 

Reimbursable Expenses 
 
 

Date   #     Expense  Amount 
 
10-26-16 
 
10-26-16 
10-27-16 
10-27-16 
10-28-16 
10-29-16                 

       Transportation 
#1    Airfare: Memphis to Cleveland, round-trip           $359.70 
        Local Transportation: Taxicab 
#2    Airport to Marriott Key Hotel                                 $36.00 
#3    Marriott  to Dev. Disabilities Board                        $7.43 
#4    Marriott to CPD Division 1                                     $25.00 
#5    Marriott to ADAMHS                                             $10.00 
        Mileage to/from airport   20.0 x $0.54 =                $10.80         
Total                                                                              $448.93 

$448.93 
 
 

 
10-29-16 

        Accommodations  
#6    Marriot Hotel – three nights lodging                    $436.89 

 $436.89 
 

 
10-26-16 
10-27-16 
10-28-16 
10-29-16     

        Per Diem  
        Start time: 02:00 PM        0.5 days x $69.00=      $34.50 
        Entire day in Cleveland    1.0 days x $69.00=      $69.00 
        Entire day on Trip             1.0 days x $69.00=      $69.00 
        Arrived 10:30 PM             1.0 days x $69.00=      $69.00 
        Total                                3.50 days x $69.00=    $241.50      

 $241.50 

    
 Total Reimbursable Expenses         

 
 $1127.32            

 

















Cleveland	Police	Department	Monitoring
October 1-31, 2016

Matthew Barge
PARC

Date	&	Description Time

10/5/2016  review and edit IA review tool 0.90

10/6/2016  review and edit IA review tool; email team re: same 1.70

10/7/2016  t/c team re: IA review; email team re: same 1 20

10/11/2016  t/c team, Dept. re: IA investigations; review notes re: same 1 30

10/14/2016 revise IA evaluation tool; email team re: same 0 80

10/21/2016 t/c team re: status, next steps 0.60

10/25/2016  t/c and email team re: IA review tool 0 30

10/27/2016  travel to CLE; review IA cases 6.50

10/28/2016  review IA cases; meet w/ team; meet w/ district commander; meet 12.30

10/29/2016  meet w/ team; travel to OAK 15.00

10/1/2016-10/31/2016  Review articles and daily CPD updates 1.30

Rate:   $250/hour $250.00

Total Hours Worked 41.90

Pro	Bono Hours 13.00

TOTAL HOURS BILLED 28.90

TOTAL	DUE	FOR	HOURS	BILLED $7,225.00

EXPENSES
R/T AIRFARE (SFO-CLE) (SEE ATTACHED RECEIPT) $541.70
GROUND TRANSPORTATION (SEE ATTACHED RECEIPTS)
(CLE airport to hotel) $15.03
(Hotel to meeting) $5.70
(SFO airport to home) $62.53

TOTAL	EXPENSES $624.96

TOTAL	BILLED $7,849.96
Make check payable to Kelli Evans
Total due in 30 days. 

Kelli	M.	Evans	 	INVOICE

Thank	you



Cleveland
Oct 27, 2016 ­ Oct 29, 2016   |   Itinerary # 7207782263490

  
Important Information

Remember to bring your itinerary and government­issued photo ID for airport check­in and security.

 

San Francisco (SFO) → Cleveland (CLE)
Oct 27, 2016 ­ Oct 29, 2016 , 1 round trip ticket

  COMPLETED
United

We hope you had a great trip. Thank you for choosing Expedia for
your travel reservations.

Traveler Information

Kelli Evans 
Adult

United Mileage Plus Ticket #

* Seat assignments, special meals, frequent flyer point awards and special
assistance requests should be confirmed directly with the airline.

Oct 27, 2016 ­ Departure Nonstop Total travel time: 4 h 40 m

San Francisco Cleveland 4 h 40 m 
SFO  2:20pm
Terminal 3

CLE  10:00pm  
 

United  1950
Economy / Coach (W) | Seat 25F | Confirm or change seats with
the airline*

Oct 29, 2016 ­ Return 1 stop Total travel time: 6 h 51 m

Cleveland Chicago 1 h 29 m 
CLE  6:00pm ORD  6:29pm  

Terminal 1
 

United  1678
Economy / Coach (T) | Seat 12F | Confirm or change seats with
the airline*

Layover: 0 h 51 m

 

Price Summary

Traveler 1: Adult   $541.70

Flight   $469.77

Taxes & Fees   $71.93

Total:  $541.70

All prices quoted in US dollars.

 

Additional Flight Services

The airline may charge additional
fees for checked baggage or other
optional services.

108 points
For this trip



Chicago San Francisco 4 h 31 m 
ORD  7:20pm
Terminal 1

SFO  9:51pm  
Terminal 3

 
United  1742
Economy / Coach (T) | Seat 22A | Confirm or change seats with
the airline*

Airline Rules & Regulations

We understand that sometimes plans change. We do not charge a
cancel or change fee. When the airline charges such fees in
accordance with its own policies, the cost will be passed on to you.

Tickets are nonrefundable, nontransferable and name changes are not
allowed.

Please read the complete penalty rules for changes and cancellations
applicable to this fare.

Please read important information regarding airline liability limitations.

Need help with your reservation?

Visit our Customer Support page.

Call Expedia+ blue Customer Care at 1-877-787-3117.

For faster service, mention itinerary #7207782263490

 



From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: Your Thursday even ng tr p w th Uber

Date: October 27, 2016 at 7:39 PM
To:

$15.03
Thanks for choosing Uber, Kelli

October 27, 2016 | uberX

10:17pm | 6 Lower Dr, Cleveland, OH

10:36pm | 655-777 St Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH

You rode with CURTIS
13.09
miles

00:18:46
Trip time

uberX
Car



 

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Base Fare 1.00

Distance 10.08

Time 2.25

Subtotal $13.33

Booking Fee (?) 1.70

$15.03

Invite your friends and family. Get a
free ride worth up to $20 when you
refer a friend to try Uber.

  



Share code: kdwww

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.



From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: Your Fr day afternoon tr p w th Uber

Date: October 28, 2016 at 1:34 PM
To:

$5.70
Thanks for choosing Uber, Kelli

October 28, 2016 | uberX

04:23pm | 777-831 St Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH

04:30pm | 1435-1499 E 45th St, Cleveland, OH

You rode with Lawrence
2.06
miles

00:06:51
Trip time

uberX
Car



 

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Base Fare 1.00

Distance 1.59

Time 0.82

$5.70 Minimum 0.59

Subtotal $4.00

Booking Fee (?) 1.70

$5.70

Invite your friends and family. Get a



free ride worth up to $20 when you
refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: kdwww



From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: Your Saturday even ng tr p w th Uber

Date: October 29, 2016 at 11:00 PM
To:

$62.53 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Kelli

October 29, 2016 | uberX | Surge x1.4

10:11pm | Terminal 3, San Francisco, CA

10:42pm |  Oakland, CA

You rode with WERKLUEL
24.89
miles

00:30:11
Trip time

uberX
Car



 

Rate Your Driver

Ride uberPOOL and save up to 70% off uberX fares on your next ride. Try it today using
POOLRECEIPT for $5 off your first uberPOOL!

Your Fare

Base Fare 2.00

Distance 28.63

Time 6.64

Normal Fare $37.27

Surge x1.4 14.91

Subtotal $52.18

Bay Bridge Eastbound Surcharge (?) 5.00

Booking Fee (?) 1.55

SFO Airport Surcharge (?) 3.80



$62.53

Transportation Network Company: Rasier-CA, LLC.

Invite your friends and family. Get a
free ride worth up to $20 when you
refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: kdwww

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.

Read about our zero tolerance policy. Report a
zero tolerance complaint by visiting
help.uber.com.





INVOICE 

 

From: Ayesha Bell Hardaway  To:  Police Assessment Resource Center 
                    
                    
 
 

Billable Hours and Expenses for October 2016 
 

DATE  DESCRIPTION          HOURS 

10/3/16 Prepare for and participate in meetings 5.9 

10/4/16 Prepare for and participate in meetings 3.2 

10/5/16 Email correspondence, prepare for and participate in 
conference calls 

5.8 

10/6/16 Email correspondence and participate in conference calls 1.7 

10/7/16 Participate in conference call       .9 

10/9/16 Email correspondence and document revisions 2.7 

10/10/16 Email correspondence and participate in conference calls 1.7 

10/12/16 Document revisions, research, prepare for and participate in 
conference calls  

8.0 

10/14/16 Prepare for and participate in conference call  .6 

10/17/16 Prepare for and participate in meetings, email correspondence, 
and document revisions 

4.7 

10/18/16 Prepare for and participate in meeting 1.5 

10/19/16 Prepare for and participate in meetings 3.3 

10/20/16 Email correspondence and phone calls 1.8 

10/21/16 Email correspondence and participate in conference calls 2.8 

10/24/16 Prepare for and  participate in meetings; prepare for and 
participate in conference call 

2.0 

10/25/16 Prepare for and participate in conference call .9 

10/26/16 Email correspondence and prepare for meeting 2.7 

10/27/16 Email correspondence and participate in meeting 3.8 

10/29/16 Participate in team meeting 4.5 

10/30/16 Draft filing 2.1 

10/31/16 Draft and revise filing, email correspondence, and participate in 
conference calls  

6.1 

 



Total Hours Worked  66.7 

 16.7 Pro Bono Hours    
Travel Hours      
Total Hours Billed   (50)     x   Rate $250.00/hour 

      8.0 
$12,500.00 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
10/4/16 Parking 10.00 

10/19/16 Parking 10.00 

10/27/16 Parking 10.00 

Total Expense Amount Due (Transportation)  $30.00 





TIMOTHY J. LONGO, SR. 
 

TO:  Matthew Barge 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 
 
FROM: Timothy J. Longo, Sr. 
 
DATE:  November 1, 2016 
 

OCTOBER 2016 INVOICE 
 

BILLABLE HOURS 
 
Date Activity Hours 
10/3/2016 OPS Conference Call 1.0 
10/4/2016 Travel to CLE 4.0 
 Meeting w/DOJ and City  3.0 
 Meeting w/ACLU 1.0 
 Preparation for CPRB Meeting 1.0 
10/5/2016 
 
 
 
10/6/2016 
 
 
 
 
10/7/2016 
10/11/2016 
10/12/2016 
 
 
10/17/2016 
 
 
 

Preparation for CPRB Meeting 
CPRB Meeting 
Preparation for Training Meeting 
Meeting w/ Commander Fay et al 
Prep for IA Pro Meeting  
IA Meeting and Meeting w/Judge White 
Phone Conference w/Matthew, Ayesha, and 
Christine 
 
Travel from CLE to Charlottesville 
Preparation and participation  in OPS Call w/Parties 
Call w/Parties RE: CPRB Manual  
Review DOJ’s comments to OPS Manual and 
prepare final draft for Parties 
Review of Equipment and Technology Report (and 
Preparation for call), and Conference Call 
w/Matthew and Maggie 

1.0 
2.30 
1.0 
1.30 
1.0 
3.0 
1.0 
 
 
4.0 
1.0 
1.0 
2.0 
 
1.30 

10/28/2016 
 

6 month report Draft- OPS/CPRB Section 
Travel from NY to CLE 

2.0 
2.0 

10/29/2016 Monitor Team- ALL Team Meeting (Lutheran 
Missions Building) and Meeting Preparation 

8.0 

10/30/2016 Travel from CLE to Charlottesville 4.0 
   
   
   
   



Total Hours Worked 45.9 
Total Billed Hours 21.9 
              Rate: $250/hour
TOTAL BILLED $5,475.00 
Pro Bono 10 
Pro Bono Travel Hours 14 

TRAVEL/LODGING EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 

10/4-10/7 American Airlines flight to/from $361.20 
10/4-10/7 Taxi Transportation to and from Airport to 

Downtown Cleveland 
$42.00 
$37.03 

10/4-10/7 Holiday Inn Express Downtown CLE $483.13 
10/28-10/30 American Airlines original flight to/from CLE $385.20 
10/28-10/30 Taxi Transportation to and from Airport to 

Downtown Cleveland 
43.20 

10/28-10/30 
10/30 

Marriott Key Center 
Taxi Transport 

312.22 
43.20 

TOTAL REIMBUSEEXPENSES:
   PER DIEM EXPENSES 

10/4-10/7 and 10/28-
10/30 

@69.00 per day $414.00 

$2,121.18 
         TOTAL PER DIEM 

TOTAL INVOICED: $7,597.18 





Carrier Flight # Departing Arriving Fare Code

American Airlines
3110

CHARLOTTESVILLE 
TUE 04OCT
5:00 AM

CHICAGO OHARE 

6:00 AM
N

OPERATED BY SKYWEST AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 5B Economy  

American
3510

CHICAGO OHARE 
TUE 04OCT
7:05 AM

CLEVELAND 

9:19 AM
N

OPERATED BY ENVOY AIR AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 6B Economy  

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.

Record
Locator EFRWGG



American
3851

CLEVELAND 
FRI 07OCT
9:22 AM

PHILADELPHIA 

10:46 AM
N

OPERATED BY AIR WISCONSIN AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 2C Economy  

American
4819

PHILADELPHIA 
FRI 07OCT
1:50 PM

CHARLOTTESVILLE 

3:05 PM
N

OPERATED BY PIEDMONT AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 1C Economy  

Passenger Ticket # Fare-USD Taxes and Carrier-
Imposed Fees Ticket Total

  Timothy Longo 0012393119867 293.96 67.24 361.20

  $ 361.20

Baggage Information

Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -CHOCLE-No free checked bags/ American Airlines BAG
ALLOWANCE -CLECHO-No free checked bags/ American Airlines 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG
AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR
IN/158 LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM
2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM ADDITIONAL
ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCOUNTS MAY APPLY 

You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The itinerary must be canceled before the ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the ticket
has no value. If the fare allows changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply. 

You have 24 hours to cancel your trip for a full refund if you booked at least 7 days prior to departure. You must cancel your trip before requesting a refund. To
cancel your trip, login on aa.com or Contact Reservations. For our refund policy and to request a refund, go to www.aa.com/refunds.

One or more of your flights is a Codeshare flight and is operated by a Partner Airline. If your journey begins with a flight operated by one of American's Partner
Airlines, then please check-in with the Partner Airline for that portion of your journey. Upon check-in, they will check your luggage to its final destination and
provide boarding passes for your connecting flights, if applicable.



Some everyday products, like e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked
baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may result in
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage l ke:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries for most
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette lighters
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on-board
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage entirely.
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please see airport expectations.

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be ticketed
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on file with
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are not
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, and
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the air
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rights of
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the right
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free of
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of each air
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  



If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message contains
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or otherwise
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distribute, or take action in reliance upon this
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from your
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 1546583317172218062155100



Fwd: Receipt from Abc Taxi Co. LLC

---------- Original Message ----------

From: "Abc Taxi Co. LLC via Square" <receipts@messaging.squareup.com>

To: 

Date: October 7, 2016 at 6:06 AM

Subject: Receipt from Abc Taxi Co. LLC

Reply to this email to leave feedback for Abc Taxi Co. LLC

Abc Taxi Co. LLC

How was your experience?

$37.03

Timothy Longo

Tue 11/15/2016 2:19 PM

Inbox

To:Meg Olsen 





Fwd: Receipt from Carol Taxi

---------- Original Message ----------

From: Carol Taxi via Square <receipts@messaging.squareup.com>

To: 

Date: October 4, 2016 at 9:44 AM

Subject: Receipt from Carol Taxi

Reply to this email to leave feedback for Carol Taxi

Carol Taxi

How was your experience?

$42.00

Timothy Longo

Tue 11/15/2016 2:17 PM

Inbox

To:Meg Olsen 





Holiday Inn Express Downtown Cleveland 
629 Euclid AvenueCleveland, OH 44114Telephone:  (216) 443-1000   Fax:  (216) 443-1722www.hiexpress.com/clevelanddtnoh

Independently owned and Operated by 629 EUCLID HOTEL, LLC.

11-14-16

DescriptionDate Charges Credits

Deposit Transfer at Check-In

*Guest Room

Sales Tax  8%

City Tax  3%

County Tax  5.5%

*Guest Room

Sales Tax  8%

City Tax  3%

County Tax  5.5%

*Guest Room

Sales Tax  8%

City Tax  3%

County Tax  5.5%

10-04-16

10-04-16

10-04-16

10-04-16

10-04-16

10-05-16

10-05-16

10-05-16

10-05-16

10-06-16

10-06-16

10-06-16

10-06-16

130.38

10.43

3.91

7.17

130.38

10.43

3.91

7.17

153.94

12.32

4.62

8.47

483.13

Total 483.13 483.13

Balance 0.00

Timothy Longo

United States

10-04-16Arrival
10-07-16Departure

275513Folio No. Room No. 1001
A/R Number

Company Federal Monitor Conf. No.  

:

:
Group Code

:
:
:

:
:
:

Rate Code : IDUVC
63895237

I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown heron. I agree that my liablity for this bill is not waived and agree to be held
personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or associate fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these charges. If 
a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

Page No.  :
Membership No. :
Invoice No.   :

Cashier No.    : 93

1 of 1



Fwd: E'Ticket Confirmation'FAIFUL 28OCT

Meg,

This is the receipt for airfare for the team meeting. This flight had to be changed due to the trial in NYC. I
used this original ticket to change the flight and the costs were absorbed by plaintiff's counsel in that case.

.

Tim

'''''''''' Original Message ''''''''''
From: "American Airlines@aa.com" <notify@aa.globalnotifications.com>
To: "
Date: October 18, 2016 at 12:08 PM
Subject: E'Ticket Confirmation'FAIFUL 28OCT

 

Ticket Issued: Oct 18, 2016

Matthew Barge,
Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at checkin options.   For information
regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please visit  baggage
information.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit

Timothy Longo

Mon 11/14/2016 11:07 AM

Inbox



Carrier Flight # Departing Arriving Fare Code

American
5380

CHARLOTTESVILLE 
FRI 28OCT
7:00 AM

CHARLOTTE 

8:19 AM
G

OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 8C Economy  

American
1780

CHARLOTTE 
FRI 28OCT
9:40 AM

CLEVELAND 

11:24 AM
G

Timothy Longo Seat 9C Economy  

5282
CLEVELAND 
SUN 30OCT

CHARLOTTE 
V

www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA Self-
Service machine. 

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding pass
or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.

 
Record
Locator FAIFUL



American 10:15 AM 12:02 PM

OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 8C Economy  

American
5048

CHARLOTTE 
SUN 30OCT
12:55 PM

CHARLOTTESVILLE 

2:01 PM
V

OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 8C Economy  

Passenger Ticket # Fare-USD Taxes and Carrier-
Imposed Fees Ticket Total

  Timothy Longo 0012396932032 319.07 66.13 385.20

  $ 385.20

Baggage Information

Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -CHOCLE-No free checked bags/ American Airlines BAG
ALLOWANCE -CLECHO-No free checked bags/ American Airlines 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG
AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR
IN/158 LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM
2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM ADDITIONAL
ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCOUNTS MAY APPLY 

You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The itinerary must be canceled before the ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the ticket
has no value. If the fare allows changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply. 

You have 24 hours to cancel your trip for a full refund if you booked at least 7 days prior to departure. You must cancel your trip before requesting a refund. To
cancel your trip, login on aa.com or Contact Reservations. For our refund policy and to request a refund, go to www.aa.com/refunds.

One or more of your flights is a Codeshare flight and is operated by a Partner Airline. If your journey begins with a flight operated by one of American's Partner
Airlines, then please check-in with the Partner Airline for that portion of your journey. Upon check-in, they will check your luggage to its final destination and
provide boarding passes for your connecting flights, if applicable.

Some everyday products, l ke e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked
baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may result in
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage l ke:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Str ke anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries for most
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette lighters
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on-board
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage entirely.



Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit  href="http://www.aa.com/refunds">www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please see airport expectations.

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be ticketed
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on file with
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are not
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, and
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the air
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rights of
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the right
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free of
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of each air
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message contains
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distr buted or otherwise
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distribute, or take action in reliance upon this
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from your
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 4611194631521811072824900





Fwd: Receipt from Taxi and Limo

---------- Original Message ----------

From: Taxi and Limo via Square <receipts@messaging.squareup.com> 

Date: October 30, 2016 at 7:32 AM

Subject: Receipt from Taxi and Limo

Reply to this email to leave feedback for Taxi and Limo

Taxi and Limo

How was your experience?

$43.20
Custom Amount $36.00

Timothy Longo

Mon 11/14/2016 11:17 AM

To:Meg Olsen;



Subtotal $36.00

Tip $7.20

Total $43.20

Taxi and Limo
Last Location

+1 0

TIMOTHY J LONGO SR

Oct 30 2016 at 7:32 AM

#71RQ

Auth code: 006535

© 2016 Square, Inc. All rights reserved.
1455 Market Street, Suite 600, San Francisco, CA 94103

Map data © OpenStreetMap contributors

Square Privacy Policy · Not your receipt?
Manage preferences  for digital receipts





MEG OLSEN 
MONITORING TEAM COORDINATOR - PARC  

 
 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES – ALL TEAM MEETING OCTOBER 2016 
 

 
Date Expense Amount 
28-Oct Flight from BNA to CLE (Southwest) $102.98   

28-Oct Lyft from Airport to Dinner Meeting  $19.99 

28-29 Oct Marriott Key Center (1 Night) $145.63 

29-Oct Flight from CLE to BNA (via IDA) $71.60 

 TOTAL $340.20 

 
 
 
 



Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip.

 Log in | View my itinerary

Check In Online Check Flight Status Change Flight Special Offers Hotel Offers Car Offers

Ready for takeoff!

Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip. You'll find everything you need to know
about your reservation below. Happy travels!

Air itinerary

AIR Confirmation: BMK9YH Confirmation Date: 10/6/2016

Passenger(s) Rapid Rewards # Ticket # Expiration Est. Points
Earned

OLSEN/MEGAN 5262453566202 Oct 6, 2017 496

Rapid Rewards points earned are only estimates. Visit your (MySouthwest, Southwest.com or Rapid Rewards) account for
the most accurate totals - including A-List & A-List Preferred bonus points.

Date Flight Departure/Arrival

Fri Oct 28 618 Depart NASHVILLE, TN (BNA) on Southwest Airlines at 12:55 PM
Arrive in CLEVELAND, OH (CLE) at 3:15 PM
Travel Time 1 hrs 20 mins
Wanna Get Away

Check in for your flight(s): 24 hours before your trip on Southwest.com or
your mobile device to secure your boarding position. You'll be assigned a
boarding position based on your check-in time. The earlier you check in
within 24 hours of your flight, the earlier you get to board.

Bags fly free®: First and second checked bags. Weight and size limits
apply. One small bag and one personal item are permitted as carryon
items, free of charge.

30 minutes before departure: We encourage you to arrive in the gate
area no later than 30 minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure as
we may begin boarding as early as 30 minutes before your flight.

Flight reservation (BMK9YH) | 28OCT16 | BNA-CLE |
Olsen/Megan
October 06, 2016 at 10:31 AM
From Southwest Airlines
To meg olsen
Reply-To Southwest Airlines



10 minutes before departure: You must obtain your boarding pass(es)
and be in the gate area for boarding at least 10 minutes prior to your flight's
scheduled departure time. If not, Southwest may cancel your reserved
space and you will not be eligible for denied boarding compensation.

If you do not plan to travel on your flight: In accordance with
Southwest's No Show Policy, you must notify Southwest at least 10
minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure if you do not plan to travel
on the flight. If not, Southwest will cancel your reservation and all funds will
be forfeited.

Air Cost: 102.98

Fare Rule(s): 5262453566202: NONREF/NONTRANSFERABLE/STANDBY REQ
UPGRADE TO Y. 
Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from this Confirmation
Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused travel funds may only
be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the individual named on the
ticket. Any changes to this itinerary may result in a fare increase. Failure to cancel
reservations for a Wanna Get Away fare segment at least 10 minutes prior to
travel will result in the forfeiture of all remaining unused funds. 

BNA WN CLE82.68SLNUPNR 82.68 END ZPBNA XFBNA4.5 AY5.60$BNA5.60 

Learn about our
boarding process

Learn about inflight
WiFi & entertainment

Cost and Payment Summary

AIR - BMK9YH
Base Fare $ 82.68
Excise Taxes $ 6.20
Segment Fee $ 4.00
Passenger Facility Charge $ 4.50
September 11th Security Fee $ 5.60
Total Air Cost $ 102.98

 

Payment Information
 

Date: Oct 6, 2016 
Payment Amount: $102.98 

Useful Tools

Check In Online

Early Bird Check-In

View/Share Itinerary

Change Air Reservation

Cancel Air Reservation

Check Flight Status

Flight Status Notification

Book a Car

Book a Hotel

Know Before You Go

In the Airport

Baggage Policies

Suggested Airport Arrival Times

Security Procedures

Customers of Size

In the Air

Purchasing and Refunds

Special Travel Needs

Traveling with Children

Traveling with Pets

Unaccompanied Minors

Baby on Board

Customers with Disabilities

Legal Policies & Helpful Information



Privacy Policy

Notice of Incorporated Terms

Customer Service Commitment

FAQs

Contact Us

Book Air | Book Hotel | Book Car | Book Vacation Packages | See Special Offers | Manage My Account

This is a post-only mailing from Southwest Airlines. Please do not attempt to respond to this message. Your
privacy is important to us, Please read our Privacy Policy. 

1 All travel involving funds from this Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date.
2 Security Fee is the government-imposed September 11th Security Fee. 

See Southwest Airlines Co. Notice of Incorporation 
See Southwest Airlines Limit of Liability

Southwest Airlines
P.O. Box 36647-1CR
Dallas, TX 75235 

Contact Us

Copyright 2016 Southwest Airlines Co. All Rights Reserved.







Confir ation: Confirmation: 
C5X 7C5X77H
Check-In >

Airfare: 45.58
USD
U.S. Transportation Tax:

3.42
U.S. Flight Segment Tax:

Receipt for confirmation Receipt for confirmation C5X77HC5X77H

United logo link to home page
Issue e  Oct ber 5, 2016Issue Date: October 05, 2016

Trav l rTraveler
informationinformation
TravelerTraveler

TicketeTicket
umbeNumber

Fr qu ntFrequent
FlyeFlyerNumberNumber aSeats

OLSEN/MEGANE 14D/16D

FLIGHT FORMATIONFLIGHT INFORMATION
Da , a eDay, Date FlightFlight ClassClassDepar ure City andDeparture City and

TimTime
Ar ival ity andArrival City and
TimTime AircraftAircraftM alMeal

Sat,
29OCT16

UA6065G
CLEVELAND, OH 
(CLE) 7: 5 PM7:45 PM

WASHINGTON, DC 
(IAD - DULLES) 9: 29:02
PMPM

CRJ-700

Flight operated by MESA AIRLINES doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.

Sat,
29OCT16

UA6285G WASHINGTON, DC 
(IAD - DULLES) 10:010:00
PMPM

NASHVILLE, TN 
(BNA) 10:46 PM10:46 PM

CRJ-700Purchase

Flight operated by MESA AIRLINES doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.

F RE INFORMATIONFARE INFORMATION
Far  B eakdownFare Breakdown Form of Payment:

eTicket Itinerary and Receipt for Confirmation C5X77H
October 05, 2016 at 4:54 PM
From "United Airlines, Inc."
To meg olsen









at our ticket counters or city ticket offices, or if you
 use MileagePlus® miles to book an award ticket, we will allow
you to cancel the ticketed reservation without penalty and
receive a 100 percent refund of the ticket price
 to the original form of payment if you cancel the reservation
within 24 hours of purchase and if the reservation is made
one week or more prior to scheduled flight departure.

C stomer Care Con ac  In o matioCustomer Care Contact Information

We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints
regarding United or a United travel experience.
You may contact us using our Customer Care form

Hazar o s er alsHazardous materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on
board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A violation
can result in five years imprisonment and penalties of
$250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).
Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases,
flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons, corrosives
and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous
materials/dangerous goods
 include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-
anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and corrosive
materials.
Additional information can be found on:

united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES

Not e o  B ggage Liability LimitationsNotice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points
within the United States (except for domestic portions of international journeys),
United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in delivery of a customer’s checked
baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is declared in
advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other
assistive devices). For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile,
perishable, or otherwise excluded items; excess valuation may not be declared on
certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained from the carrier.
For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic
portions of the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked
baggage, and 400 USD per passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel



governed by the Montreal Convention (including the domestic portions of the trip),
maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel,
United requires that customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of
the flight on which the baggage was or was to be transported and submit a written claim
within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in connection with most
international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows:
(a) for damaged baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged
baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within 21 days from the date the baggage should
have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of United’s Contract of
Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability.
Not e o  Inc rpor ted TermsNotice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and
conditions of United’s Contract of Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference.
Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1. Limits on liability for personal
injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and baggage,
including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims
restrictions, including time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an
action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the carrier to change terms of the contract. 4.
Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and refusal to carry. 5.
Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service,
including schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and
rerouting. The full text of United’s Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you
may request a copy at any United ticket counter. Passengers have the right, upon
request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States, to
receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract
of Carriage.
Not e o  Certa  Te mNotice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on
the rules applicable to the fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited
to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the ticket may not be refundable but can be
exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the rules/restrictions of
the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply
for changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights
and/ or times and a minimum and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves
the right to refuse carriage to any person who has acquired a ticket in violation of any
United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national, federal,
state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you
are entitled to a full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to
departure within 24 hours of purchase.
Not e o  B rd g imesNotice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding
gate at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure. For International flights,
customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30 minutes prior to scheduled
departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to
airport. Please visit united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding
times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive at the airport with enough time to
complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these minimum
time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding
gate and the departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the
required time could result in the loss of your seat without compensation, regardless of
whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and boarding pass.



Ad ice to Int rnat onal ass ngers  Carr er ia ili yAdvice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a
journey involving an ultimate destination or a stop in a country other than the country of
departure are advised that international treaties known as the Montreal Convention, or
its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may apply to the
entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the
treaty, including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may
limit the liability of the Carrier in respect of death or injury to passengers, and for
destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of passengers and
baggage.
Not e - Over o ing of Fli htsNotice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a
slight chance that a seat will not be available on a flight for which a person has a
confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no one will be denied a seat until
airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in exchange
for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline
will deny boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority.
With few exceptions, including failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines,
which are available upon request from the air carrier, persons, denied boarding
involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket
counters and boarding locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer
protections to travel from some foreign countries, although other consumer protections
may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Than  you for hoosing Un ed linesThank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © {0} United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

lease do not rep  to t s e age using the " rep  " addr ss.Please do not reply to this message using the " reply " address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.2016





10/05/2016 NO Review Cleveland local press  .7 
10/05/2016 NO Call with Matthew and externs: prep, call and follow up 1.5 
10/05/2016 NO Call with Community Engagement team re: recent 

events and follow up 
1.5 

10/05/2016 NO Community Policing: review extern questions, continue 
drafting brainstorm document  

3.8 

10/05/2016 NO Admin: email, communications 1.4 
10/06/2016 BF Review of Tramble materials on construction of CPC .3 
10/06/2016 BF Analysis of best way to change CPC charter  .2 
10/06/2016 MP Worked w/ Nonny on Cleveland community policing .3 
10/06/2016 NO Admin: email, communications, review local press 1.4 
10/06/2016 NO Use of Force: review additional comments .4 
10/06/2016 NO Community Policing: review literature and monitoring 

team materials, begin draft of revised CP plan, meet with 
MP, draft assignments for externs  

5.8 

10/07/2016 NO Mental Health Community Engagement: phone call, 
follow up 

3 

10/07/2016 NO Community Policing: review literature  3 
10/09/2016 BF Conference with M. Barge re: CPC bylaws .1 
10/09/2016 BF Review of materials on CPC selection and tensions with 

union endorsement 
.3 

10/09/2016 NO Community Policing: continue to draft engagement plan, 
review externs memos 

2 

10/09/2016 NO CPC By-laws: begin to review by-laws and comments 1.5 
10/09/2016 NO Admin: communications, email .5 
10/10/2016 NO CPC By-laws: continue to review CPC by-laws, 

synthesize group comments, and draft memo 
3.8 

10/10/2016 NO Admin: communications and email .8 
10/10/2016 NO IA Assessment: phone call with Christine Cole .4 
10/10/2016 NO Community Policing: draft memo detailing community 

policing plan 
4.6 

10/11/2016 BF Review of NO plan for Cleveland on community 
policing and notes to Team on same 

.8 

10/11/2016 BF Review of CPC by-laws re: appointing and dismissing 
members 

.3 

10/11/2016 BF Conference with Team about CPC appointing and 
removing members  

.3 

10/11/2016 BF Dictation of letter to CPC team re: provisions of by-laws 
on appointment and removal  

.2 

10/11/2016 BF Team meeting on engagement plan in Cleveland on 
community policing, timing of plan, meshing with 
Monitoring timeline 

1 

10/11/2016 MP Meeting with team to discuss Cleveland 1 
10/11/2016 NO Fellows Meeting: prep, meeting, follow up 5 
10/11/2016 NO Admin: email, communication .5 



10/11/2016 NO Community policing: review extern memos, begin 
providing feedback, communications with engagement 
team 

2.5 

10/12/2016 NO Mental Health Task Force: call with R. Dupont .3 
10/12/2016 NO Mental Health Task Force: review agenda materials .4 
10/12/2016 NO IA Assessment: communications, create and edit test 

case 
3 

10/12/2016 NO Community Policing: communications with externs, 
continue to review literature 

2.5 

10/12/2016 NO CPC By-laws: research and draft revisions and 
recommendations memo 

1.8 

10/13/2016 NO Mental Health Task Force: call and follow up 1.5 
10/13/2016 NO Review Orientation video .8 
10/13/2016 NO Admin: time, schedule, communications .8 
10/13/2016 NO Semi-Annual Report: begin to draft UOF section .5 
10/13/2016 NO Community Policing: continue to review literature and 

best practices, communications with externs 
5.2 

10/14/2016 NO Call with future extern .6 
10/14/2016 NO Semi-Annual Report: Draft UOF engagement section 3.5 
10/14/2016 NO Admin: time, scheduling, email .5 
10/14/2016 NO Community Policing: communications, research, review 

literature 
3.6 

10/15/2016 NO Community Policing: call with Tim, prep and follow up 1 
10/15/2016 NO Community Policing: communications with externs .5 
10/15/2016 NO Semi-Annual Report: continue to draft 2.9 
10/16/2016 BF Review of and editing of memo on by-laws provisions 

for CPC 
.5 

10/16/2016 BF Review of all extern materials on components of 
community policing plan and comments on same 

.9 

10/16/2016 MP Reviewed Cleveland police board memo .2 
10/16/2016 NO Semi-Annual report: Continue to draft  2.5 
10/17/2016 BF Review of extern memos on CP components .7 
10/17/2016 BF Conference with MP re: next steps in Cleveland report 

and best use of NO and extern time 
.4 

10/17/2016 MP Reviewed extern work re: CP and talked with BF 1 
10/17/2016 MP Met w/ NO to discuss Cleveland, reviewed extern 

Cleveland work 
1.1 

10/17/2016 NO Meeting with MP regarding Cleveland work .7 
10/17/2016 NO CPC by-laws: revise memo .8 
10/18/2016 BF Editing by-law memo .2 
10/18/2016 BF Conference with MP re: extern and NO tasks on 

community policing  
.2 

10/18/2016 NO Extern meeting  2 
10/18/2016 NO Bi-monthly City/DOJ meeting 2.3 
10/18/2016 NO Community Policing: continue to review literature and 3.7 



other plans, begin to draft outline of report 
10/18/2016 NO CPC by-laws: revise PP recommendations, 

communications 
.8 

10/18/2016 NO Admin: email, scheduling .3 
10/19/2016 NO Mental health forum: communications, review 

committees list, review comparison document 
1.8 

10/19/2016 NO Mental health forum: call with Charles and Dr. Dupont .8 
10/19/2016 NO Community policing research and continue to draft 

outline, draft model memo on training  
6 

10/20/2016 BF Brief review of materials prepared for CDP crisis 
intervention team policy 

.3 

10/20/2016 MP Call w/ Matthew and Nonny .4 
10/20/2016 MP Reviewed Nonny community policing materials  1.3 
10/20/2016 AB Giving feedback to Nonny re: Cleveland .4 
10/20/2016 NO Review Use of Force CPC recommendations  1 
10/20/2016 NO Community policing: continue to draft training section 

and review outline  
3 

10/20/2016 NO Admin: communications, scheduling .8 
10/20/2016 NO Mental Health Forum: review materials  1.5 
10/21/2016 BF Review of various requests from M. Barge and CW MP 

re: staffing 
.4 

10/21/2016 MP Talk with Barry about staffing .3 
10/21/2016 NO Use of Force policies court filing: call with Matthew .3 
10/21/2016 NO All team call .7 
10/21/2016 NO Community Engagement call .5 
10/21/2016 NO Review Use of Force CPC recommendations 2.5 
10/21/2016 NO Community Policing: review MP’s edits, review other 

community engagement plans, edit outline 
3.4 

10/21/2016 NO Admin: email, time, scheduling .8 
10/23/2016 NO Review revised monitoring plan and prepare summary 2.5 
10/23/2016 NO CPC Recommendations: Review comments .4 
10/23/2016 NO Review Use of Force Cleveland court filing documents  .6 
10/23/2016 NO Admin: email, scheduling .8 
10/24/2016 BF Review of monitoring plan change summary by NO .3 
10/24/2016 BF Conference with team re: Cleveland Tasks and best way 

to allocate work 
.3 

10/24/2016 BF Conference with Team re: fundraising  .1 
10/24/2016 NO Revise updated plan memo .5 
10/24/2016 NO Court filing: call with Brian and Ayesha .4 
10/24/2016 NO Admin: email, time, scheduling .9 
10/24/2016 NO Meeting with interested future extern .4 
10/24/2016 NO Fellows meeting 1.5 
10/24/2016 NO Court filing: review best practices and perf guidelines 5.5 
10/25/2016 BF Work on memo to M. Barge re: Cleveland work .3 
10/25/2016 NO Court filing: review best practices and perf guidelines 9 



10/25/2016 NO Review Mental Health Community forum fact sheet .3 
10/25/2016 NO Admin: email, time .4 
10/26/2016 BF Editing of and transmission of letter to M. Barge re: 

tasks, help, funds for America Speaks 
.3 

10/26/2016 NO Court filing: draft document 10 
10/27/2016 BF Letter to M. Barge re: staffing and projects .2 
10/27/2016 MP Revised Nonny Community Policing Materials 2.8 
10/27/2016 NO Travel to Cleveland 4 
10/27/2016 NO Meeting with K. Moore 2 
10/27/2016 NO Internal affairs discussion and debrief with C. Cole and 

M. Barge 
1.2 

10/27/2016 NO Crisis Intervention MHAC Community Planning 
Meeting 

1.4 

10/27/2016 NO Cle draft continue drafting  4 
10/28/2016 BF Conference with MP re: Cleveland trip .2 
10/28/2016 NO All-team meeting  10 
10/29/2016 NO All team meeting 8.2 
10/29/2016 NO Travel to NY 4 
10/29/2016 NO Admin: emails, scheduling .2 
10/29/2016 NO Community policing: revise plan and model memo .6 
10/30/2016 NO Admin: scheduling, time, emails .5 
10/31/2016 BF Email to M. Barge re: various .1 
10/31/2016 NO Qualtrics: communications with sales department .8 
10/31/2016 NO Community policing: revise model memo on training 1.4 
10/31/2016 NO Fellows meeting .5 
10/31/2016 NO IA Assessment: begin to review test cases 4.2 
10/31/2016 NO Admin: communications, email 1 
10/31/2016 NO Court filing: review memo .6 
 Total Hours:  230.6 
 Total Hours Billed (Rate: $250/hour):  35 
 Total Billed:  $8,750.00 
 Pro Bono Hours:  195.6 

Policing Project Extern Hours
 
Date Biller Description of Work Performed Time  
10/01/2016 Jordan P. Cleveland community policing practices memo 4 
10/01/2016 Katrina F. Cleveland memo research 2 
10/01/2016 Scott G.   Find examples of centralization and decentralization 

strategies in peer jurisdictions 
5.1 

10/03/2016 Scott G.  Prep for call with Tim Tramble .5 
10/03/2016 Scott G.  Call with Tim Tramble, meeting with Nonny post-call 

to discuss 
1 

10/03/2016 Katrina F.  CPOP practices memo 1 



10/04/2016 Allyson S.  Research: Community and Problem-Oriented Policing 
Strategy 

1.5 

10/04/2016 Katrina F.  Cleveland CPOP memo 1.7 
10/05/2016 Scott G.  Call prep & call with Matthew Barge 1.6 
10/05/2016 Katrina F.  Call with Matthew Barge  1 
10/06/2016 Katrina F.  Notes from call with Matthew  .7 
10/07/2016 Allyson S.  Cleveland: Community and Problem-Oriented 

Policing Strategy-- Memos 
2.5 

10/08/2016 Allyson S.  Cleveland: Community and Problem-Oriented 
Policing Strategy Memo 

1 

10/08/2016 Jordan P. Community policing outline 1.7 
10/08/2016 Jordan P.  Community policing components and practices 2 
10/09/2016 Scott G.  Research and create outlines for CP strategy memos 6 
10/09/2016 Allyson S.  Cleveland: Community and Problem-Oriented 

Policing Strategy-- Memos 
3 

10/09/2016 Katrina F.  CPOP Outline 5.7 
10/13/2016 Scott G.  Component memo rough drafts  4 
10/14/2016 Scott G.  Finalizing CE/POP component memo drafts .7 
10/14/2016 Allyson S. Cleveland Strategy Memo: Community partnerships 2.5 
10/14/2016 Jordan P.  MT outline 1.6 
10/15/2016 Allyson S.  Call w/ Tim re: community engagement  1 
10/16/2016 Allyson S.  Memo re: Community and Problem-Oriented Policing 

Strategy: Alternatives to Motorized Patrol 
2.5 

10/16/2016 Scott G.  CP POP component memo draft .5 
10/16/2106 Katrina F.  Cleveland CPOP Metrics Memo 2.5 
10/16/2016 Jordan P.  Community policing principles rough draft 4.5 
10/17/2016 Katrina F.  Cleveland CPOP memos 2 
10/18/2016 Scott G.  Team meeting, call with Maggie from Monitoring 

Team 
.5 

10/18/2016 Allyson S.  Phone call with Maggie/discussion with Nonny .5 
Total Hours (all Pro Bono):  64.8 
 





The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Ms. Nonny Onyekweli

United States

Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 310183
Guest Number  : 262994
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

27-OCT-16 09:12
29-OCT-16 09:50
1
1436

Tax ID :
The Westin Cleveland  29-OCT-16  10:00  DESIMOR
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
27-OCT-16 RT1436 Room Charge 125.00
27-OCT-16 RT1436 State Sales Tax 10.00
27-OCT-16 RT1436 City Tax 3.75
27-OCT-16 RT1436 County Tax 6.88
28-OCT-16 RT1436 Room Charge 125.00
28-OCT-16 RT1436 State Sales Tax 10.00
28-OCT-16 RT1436 City Tax 3.75
28-OCT-16 RT1436 County Tax 6.88
29-OCT-16 -291.26

Date        Code         Authorized DCC
27-OCT-16 04796C 325

** Total  291.26 -291.26
*** Balance     0.00

Continued on the next page



 
Flight Confirmation # 
HCVP6B 
 
Agency Reference # 
MLOIPI 

Departing Flight 
1 Ticket(s) | Thu, Oct 27 
To cancel or modify your reservation, please call us at 1-866-951-6592 

 

Delta Air Lines 
DL 5258 *  
CANADAIR REGIONAL JET 700 | Economy Class  
*Operated by EXPRESSJET DBA DELTA CONNECTION  

New York 
6:48 AM 

LGA 
Thu, Oct 27 

    1hr 42min     
Non-stop 

Cleveland 
8:30 AM 

CLE 
Thu, Oct 27 

  
Additional Baggage Fees may apply. 

 

 

Passenger Information Request a Seat   
  
Passenger Flight  
NONNEY ONYEKWELI Delta Air Lines 5258   

 
 

Rules and Policies  
Cancellation: 

• If your reservation was made more than 7 days prior to your travel date:Cancellation is allowed in 
most cases before 9pm Mountain Time the day after you book your ticket for a full refund of the 
base fare and taxes, with no airline-imposed cancellation fee. A few airlines, such as Spirit, 
Frontier, Allegiant and Southwest Airlines, may have different timelines for cancellations. Call us 
for details at 1-866-951-6592. 

• If your reservation was made 7 days or less prior to your travel date: Only certain airlines permit 
free cancellation and a refund of the base fare and taxes, with no airline-imposed cancellation 
fee, until 9pm Mountain Time the day after your ticket is booked. A few airlines, such as Spirit, 
Frontier, Allegiant and Southwest Airlines, may have different timelines for cancellations. Airline 
Fare Rules can be viewed online on your Trip Details page. 





Flights 
 
Flight Confirmation # 
HPORRY 
 
Agency Reference # 
4JDRUG 

Departing Flight 
1 Ticket(s) | Tue, Nov 01 
To cancel or modify your reservation, please call us at 1-866-951-6592 

 

Delta Air Lines 
DL 3653 *  
CANADAIR REGIONAL JET 900 | Economy Class  
*Operated by ENDEAVOR AIR DBA DELTA CONNECTION  

Cleveland 
6:03 AM 

CLE 
Tue, Nov 01 

    1hr 47min     
Non-stop 

New York 
7:50 AM 

JFK 
Tue, Nov 01 

  
Additional Baggage Fees may apply. 

 

 

Passenger Information Request a Seat   
  
Passenger Flight  
NONNEY ONYEKWELI Delta Air Lines 3653   

 
 

Rules and Policies  
Cancellation: 

• If your reservation was made more than 7 days prior to your travel date:Cancellation is allowed in 
most cases before 9pm Mountain Time the day after you book your ticket for a full refund of the 
base fare and taxes, with no airline-imposed cancellation fee. A few airlines, such as Spirit, 
Frontier, Allegiant and Southwest Airlines, may have different timelines for cancellations. Call us 
for details at 1-866-951-6592. 

• If your reservation was made 7 days or less prior to your travel date: Only certain airlines permit 
free cancellation and a refund of the base fare and taxes, with no airline-imposed cancellation 
fee, until 9pm Mountain Time the day after your ticket is booked. A few airlines, such as Spirit, 
Frontier, Allegiant and Southwest Airlines, may have different timelines for cancellations. Airline 



  

Payment Summary 

Total $230.10 USD 
Points Redeemed: 0 
Points Value Redeemed: $0.00 USD 
Amount Billed to Card: $230.10 USD 

 
 

 

Please note that you will see CL * Chase Travel on your card billing statement for any amount of 
your transaction that is charged to your credit card. 

Flights 

Fare Rules can be viewed online on your Trip Details page. 
• For changes or cancellations outside of the free cancellation period see the Refunds section below. 

Refunds: 
• This ticket is non-refundable. 
• Some non-refundable tickets do not allow any changes. Some non-refundable tickets can be 

applied (for a limited time) toward future travel, but all changes to your itinerary may result in a 
fare adjustment and will incur a per ticket airline change fee. Airline Fare Rules can be viewed 
online on your Trip Details page. Changes or cancellations must be made by calling us at 1-866-
951-6592. 

General: 
• All tickets are non-transferable. 
• Carry-on baggage restrictions will apply. Your selected airline's baggage fees will apply. Airlines 

may charge additional fees for miscellaneous services such as advance seat selection, food and 
beverage. Fees vary by airline so you must contact the airline directly or check their website for 
up to date information and pricing details. 

• A small number of air carriers may require us to confirm flight availability when booking. If there is 
any issue with availability, a travel representative will contact you within 24 hours to make 
alternate flight arrangements at no additional cost. 

• Government-issued photo identification is required at check-in and must match the name on the 
reservation. If this is an international flight, this reservation requires a passport and may require 
a visa and satisfaction of health requirements. Please contact the consulate of the destination 
country for current visa/passport and other entry requirements. 

• Please refer to the Travel Disclosures for more information. 

































Date 

10/25/16 

10/27/16 

10/27/16 

Rate $250/hour. 

Date 

10/12/16 

10/26/16 

10/26/16 

10/27/16 

10/27/16 

10/27/16 

10/27/16 

10/27/16 

Activity 

RICHARD ROSENTHAL 

OCTOBER 2016 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Review of Public Reports 

Meeting with DOJ 

OPS/DOJ Meetings 

Total Hours Worked/Billed 

TOTAL BILLED: $2,000 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Expense 

Airfare (10/26-10/27) 

Mileage to Airport (44.6 miles) 

Hotel (Chicago) Delayed Flight - Layover 

Per Diem (All Day) 

Taxi 

Taxi 

Airport Parking (YVR) 

Mileage from Airport (44.6 miles) 

TOTAL: 

*$671.41 Canadian Dollars 

**$25.10 Canadian Dollars  

Hours 

5.0 

1.0 

2.0 

8.0 

Amount 

$508.45* 

$24.08 

$203.23 

$69.00 

$35.59 

$40.00 

$18.71 ** 

$24.08 

 

$923.14 





Student
Highlight















TO: 

FROM: 

DATE: 

Date 

Worked 

10/21/2016 

10/21/2016 

10/23/2016 

10/27/2016 

10/28/2016 

10/29/2016 

Date 

Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 
Victor A. Ruiz 

Matthew Barge 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

Victor A. Ruiz 

11/09/16 
October 2016 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Work Description Hours 

Weekly Team Call 0.5 

Weekly Team Call 0.75 

Review of use of force training materials 

and policy 1.5 

CPC Meeting 2 

Use of Force Training Meeting 1 

All Team Meeting 5.75 

Total Hours Worked 11.5 

Total Billed Hours 7 

Rate: $000/hour $250 

TOT AL BILLED $1,750.00 

Pro Bono Hours 4.5 

Travel Hours 1.5 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Expense Amount 
Parking $0 

Transportation $0 

Accommodations $0 

Per Diem {I day) $0 

TOT AL EXPENSES $0 

REF 



2016 10 Cleveland Project Bill - Scott Sargent 

DATE OCT 2016 

To: Matthew Barge 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

Invoice* 

Date Activity Hours 

Billed 

10/14/2016 Prepare promotional materials 3.50 

10/16/2016 Review IA Cases 3.00 

10/16/2016 Review IA Cases 3.50 

10/27/2016 Cle-ride along and officer roll calls 6.00 

10/28/2016 Eap Meeting 1.00 

10/28/2016 Club ccmmunity luncheon 1.50 

10/28/2016 UOF Meeting 1.50 

10/28/2016 QA of IA Cases meeting 1.50 

10/29/2016 Team meeting 3.00 

Total 24.50 

Pro-Bono 

Oct (all) Conf Calls/Research/Doc review/Emails 5.00 

Total hours worked 33.50 

Worked $250x24.5 

Billed $6,125.00 

4.00

(4 Pro bono)

Team meeting 





American Airlines"�-
Refunds -Slart Over 

� Slarl I fJocumonl I ookup � Refund Eligibility 

<1) Pleam oonlnct Rese.vatto11s at 1-600-433-7300, lo l>aw yow 111lles, e-lr1slale<f. 

Passenger Information 
Passenger Name Document Ntmber Issue Dale 
SARGENT, scorr 00123)3283400 00/2312016 

Payment Information 
Sale Form or Payment 

czr:ertr .... CreditCaid 
Corlificale 

Passenger Itinerary 
Status- Coupon 

1 
2 

'Hover over text ror mo,-e ,nronnauoo. 

More About American 

About Us 

Coipo,ate Information 

Investor Relalions 

Corporate Responslbll�y 

Jo.nus 

Em.tronmental Foolp/lnl 

Diversity & Inclusion 

Newsroom 

Airtine Museum 

Careers 

Departure Dalo 
10/2612016 

10/26'2016 

Products & Services 

Travel fnsurance 

Email Subs:liplions 

Enhanoo Your Travel 

Low P�oa Guarantee 

Group & Meeting Travel 

BuSlness Programs 

Cargo 

Amencan Ai�ines Credit Card 

Gin Cards 

DeaFinder 

RSS 

Five Star Se,vice 

Timetables & Downbads 

Last Mt11utePad<agas 

Aighl�mbar 
2503 

3467 

Contact lnforma�on Rev1e111 and Submit 

Total Sale Am>unt 
) 30060 USO 

Sale Dae 
09f.1312016 
09/2312016 

Depar1ure0t)I 
LAX 

ORD 

Customer Service 

C0<1act American 

C0<1act Rolunds 

FAQs 

Ref\Jnds 

Agency Reference 

Amerlcan Trawl Cenws 

Sale Arrounl 
300.60 USO 
300.60 USO 

Bagga;ie & �honal Seivice Chargss 

Customer Savice Plan & Flight 
l1regula1llles 

Pnvacy Poicy 

Lega 

CopyngM 

Sile Map 

Bra.vser �Ullrhly 

Arri"'11Clty 
ORO 
ClE 

Searchaa com 

Fmi<h 

Document Dasaiption 
TRANSPORT 
TRANSPORT 

Description 
Transport 
Transport 

tencel 

Pl 

Help 

FEEOBJCK [+] 



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Mr. Scott Sargent Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 310505
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

26-OCT-16 22:09
30-OCT-16 15:17
1
1717
SPG

Tax ID :
The Westin Cleveland  28-NOV-16  17:15  MCKENNA
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
26-OCT-16 6022 In Room Dining 29.52
26-OCT-16 RT1717 Room Charge 125.00
26-OCT-16 RT1717 State Sales Tax 10.00
26-OCT-16 RT1717 City Tax 3.75
26-OCT-16 RT1717 County Tax 6.88
27-OCT-16 301 In Room Dining 44.36
27-OCT-16 halls Gift Shop 3.00
27-OCT-16 halls State Tax 0.24
27-OCT-16 6008 In Room Dining 66.40
27-OCT-16 gift shop Gift Shop 4.63
27-OCT-16 gift shop State Tax 0.37
27-OCT-16 RT1717 Room Charge 125.00
27-OCT-16 RT1717 State Sales Tax 10.00
27-OCT-16 RT1717 City Tax 3.75
27-OCT-16 RT1717 County Tax 6.88
28-OCT-16 RT1717 Room Charge 125.00
28-OCT-16 RT1717 State Sales Tax 10.00
28-OCT-16 RT1717 City Tax 3.75
28-OCT-16 RT1717 County Tax 6.88

Continued on the next page

- omit

- omit
-omit

-omit

-omit
- omit

- omit

#2



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Mr. Scott Sargent Page Number  : 2 Invoice Nbr  : 310505
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

26-OCT-16 22:09
30-OCT-16 15:17
1
1717
SPG -

Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
29-OCT-16 303 In Room Dining 26.22
29-OCT-16 RT1717 Room Charge 125.00
29-OCT-16 RT1717 State Sales Tax 10.00
29-OCT-16 RT1717 City Tax 3.75
29-OCT-16 RT1717 County Tax 6.88
30-OCT-16 -757.26

Date        Code         Authorized DCC
26-OCT-16 87102P 650
26-OCT-16 99629P 100
27-OCT-16 91308P 100

** Total  757.26 -757.26
*** Balance     0.00

BETTER BALANCE - The soothing scent of White Tea revitalizes and uplifts from the moment you step through our doors. Enhance any environment by 
taking our signature scent home with you. Learn more at westin.com/store

Continued on the next page

- omit

= $582.52



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Mr. Scott Sargent Page Number  : 3 Invoice Nbr  : 310505
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

26-OCT-16 22:09
30-OCT-16 15:17
1
1717
SPG 

Tell us about your stay. www.westin.com/reviews

Signature_____________________









Ellen Scrivner, Ph.D., ABPP   
         

 
 
 
 
TO:  Matthew Barge 
   Meg Olsen 
   Police Assessment Resource Center 
 
FROM: Ellen Scrivner 
 
DATE: November 15, 2016 
  

   OCTOBER 2016 INVOICE 
    BILLABLE HOURS 
 
DATE   ACTIVITY     HOURS 
10-21-16  Monitoring Team Call on UOF   1.0 

 
10-27-16  Arrival in Cleveland    0.0 
10-27-16  Crisis Intervention MHAC Community 
   Planning Meeting/with Randy DuPont  2.0 
10-27-16  Meeting with CPD CIT Staff/DC O’Neill 
   & Capt. Purcell     1.5 

 
10/28/16  Meeting with Training Academy Staff 
   Re Evaluations/C. Cole & M. Akinola  1.0 
10-28-16  Meeting with EAP/DC O’Neill/Sgt. Dawson  1.0 
10-28-16  Cleveland City Club Presentation  0.0 
10-28-16  Meeting Re Training/UOF Training  1.5 
10-28-16  CIT Outcome Measures/Internal Discussion 1.0 
10-28-16  All Team Dinner     0.0 

     
 
10-29-16  All Team Meeting in Cleveland   8.0 
  Use of Force; Evaluation Tools; Equipment & 
  Resources; Community Policing; Training; 
  Crisis Intervention. 
10-30-16 Depart Cleveland      0.0 
   



Total Hours…………………………………………………….. 22.0 
Total Billed Hours 17.0 
Rate: $250/hour 
TOTAL BILLED     $4250.00.
Pro Bono Hours  5.0 
Travel Time Not Billed 5.0 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Transportation Expenses Amount 
10-27-16 Air Fare Ticket/Chicago to Cleveland $103.98 
10-30-16 Air Fare Ticket/Cleveland to Florida $356.05 
10/27/16 Taxi to Chicago Airport  $44.00 
10-27-16 Taxi from Cleveland Airport   $36.00 
10-27-16 Taxi to Meeting at 4500 Euclid   $14.00 
10-30-16 Taxi to Cleveland Airport   $39.00 

TOTAL TRANSPORTATION $593.03 

10-27/30-16 ACCOMMODATIONS EXPENSES $436.89 

PER DIEM 
10-27-16 ½ Day  $34.50 
10-28-16 Full Day Per Diem   $69.00 
10-29-16 Full Day Per Diem   $69.00 
10-30-16   ¼ Day Per Diem   $17.25 

TOTAL PER DIEM $189.75 

TOTAL REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES $1219.67 
TOTAL BILLED HOURS $4250.00 

______________________________________________________________ 
  TOTAL      $5469.67



Fw: CheapOair.com 1 Ellen m scrivner 1 Booking receipt 1 Booking #
37980773

Here is one of my flight receipts, the return trip from Cleveland to Ft. Myers, Florida..

Ellen

From: cheapoair@cheapoair.com <cheapoair@cheapoair.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2016 3:12 PM
To:
Subject: CheapOair.com LEllen m scrivner LBooking receipt LBooking # 37980773

CheapOair For changes to this itinerary,

please call us 24/7 at 1- 800-525-0400

View on website 
 Print Itinerary

Booking Confirmation Terms and Conditions

CheapOair Booking: 37980773  | | Booked on Wed, Oct 5, 2016

Flight Details  Status: Check now

Departing Flight Travel Time: 
2h 49m

Frontier Airlines 
Flight 1393
Aircraft: 320

Airbus Industries A320 120-180
STD SEATS

Nonstop | Coach 
Baggage Fees | Visa & Passport
Info 

Sun, Oct 30, 2016
Cleveland, OH

CLE - 04:55 pm

Fort Myers, FL

RSW - 07:44 pm

Airline Confirmation:
DCMEWX

Seats Selected:

15D - Confirmed

ellen scrivner

Tue 11/15/2016 10:18 PM

To



Check airline Fare Rules . Most airlines charge baggage fees, check the Baggage Fees for complete details.

Traveler Information

E-Ticket Number Traveler Name Requests Gender

1 F9-DCMEWX,
F9DCMEWX

Ellen M Scrivner Female

Special Service

Disclaimer: Special requests are not guaranteed. Contact your airline to confirm they have received and confirmed
your requests.

 

Your flight is insured! View Details or add the Optional Upgrade below.

Travel Protection
Plan
 

 

Optional Travel Protection Plan Upgrade $9 .99

Increase your coverage by adding the Optional Upgrade:
Additional Benefits Include: 

$250,000 Flight Accidental Death and Dismemberment

Emergency Medical Evacuation up to $10,000

View Plan Summary for terms and conditions.

Click above to confirm the purchase of Optional Upgrade. If you do not want the Optional Upgrade, no action is
required.

Flight Watcher Flight Monitoring and Notification Service

Flight Watcher gathers all the information about your flight
including delays, cancellations and gate or terminal changes, and
sends them directly to you!

Mobile:



Please add noreply@CheapOair.com in your address book to ensure that you get our emails.

Baggage
Protection

Blue Ribbon Bags Will: $5 .00

Pay you $1000, minimum, per bag, if your bags are not returned

to you within 96 hours.

Find and return all of your delayed baggage right to you.

By clicking ‘Add Baggage Protection’, I agree I have read and accepted the
Terms and Conditions .

Billing Details (USD)

Charged on Wed, Oct 5, 2016

Method:  

Flight Price Details

1 Senior Tickets $317 .00

Travel Protection Plan Cost $24 .95

Post Booking Charges $12 .00

Subtotal $353 .95

Taxes and Fees $14 .10

Flight Total $368 .05

Total Charge: $368 .05

- omit

Student
Highlight



 

Please Note: 

All fares are quoted in USD 

Your credit card may be billed in multiple charges totaling the above amount. 

Some airlines may charge Baggage Fees.

   Customer Support    My Bookings    FAQs

CheapOair 
Rewards

Connect with Us Get the CheapOair App 



Privacy Policy 
We're committed to protecting your privacy. See our Privacy Policy for details.

Contact Us 
if you have any questions please email us at feedback@cheapoair.com . Or write to us at: CheapOair, 135 W 50th Street,
Suite 500, New York, NY 10020 

© 2006-2016 Fareportal, Inc. All right reserved.



Fw: Flight reservation 1BQMHGS8 | 27OCT16 | MDWCCLE |
Scrivner/Ellen M

Airline Receipt for 10/27 Chicago to Cleveland trip.

Ellen

From: Southwest Airlines <SouthwestAirlines@luv.southwest.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 5, 2016 10:35 PM
To:
Subject: Flight reservaQon(BQMHGS) | 27OCT16 | MDW[CLE | Scrivner/Ellen M

Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip.

 Log in | View my itinerary

Check In Online Check Flight Status Change Flight Special Offers Hotel Offers Car Offers

Ready for takeoff!

Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip. You'll find everything you need to know
about your reservation below. Happy travels!

Air itinerary

AIR Confirmation: BQMHGS Confirmation Date: 10/5/2016

Passenger(s) Rapid Rewards # Ticket # Expiration Est. Points
Earned

SCRIVNER/ELLEN 
M

5262453368991 Oct 5, 2017 502

Rapid Rewards points earned are only estimates. Visit your (MySouthwest, Southwest.com or Rapid Rewards) account for
the most accurate totals - including A-List & A-List Preferred bonus points.

Date Flight Departure/Arrival

ellen scrivner

Tue 11/15/2016 10:48 PM



Thu Oct 27 1031 Depart CHICAGO (MIDWAY), IL (MDW) on Southwest Airlines
at 09:05 AM
Arrive in CLEVELAND, OH (CLE) at 11:20 AM
Travel Time 1 hrs 15 mins
Wanna Get Away

Check in for your flight(s): 24 hours before your trip on Southwest.com or
your mobile device to secure your boarding position. You'll be assigned a
boarding position based on your check-in time. The earlier you check in
within 24 hours of your flight, the earlier you get to board.

Bags fly free®: First and second checked bags. Weight and size limits
apply. One small bag and one personal item are permitted as carryon
items, free of charge.

30 minutes before departure: We encourage you to arrive in the gate
area no later than 30 minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure as
we may begin boarding as early as 30 minutes before your flight.

10 minutes before departure: You must obtain your boarding pass(es)
and be in the gate area for boarding at least 10 minutes prior to your flight's
scheduled departure time. If not, Southwest may cancel your reserved
space and you will not be eligible for denied boarding compensation.

If you do not plan to travel on your flight: In accordance with
Southwest's No Show Policy, you must notify Southwest at least 10
minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure if you do not plan to travel
on the flight. If not, Southwest will cancel your reservation and all funds will
be forfeited.

Air Cost: 103.98

Fare Rule(s): 5262453368991: NONREF/NONTRANSFERABLE/STANDBY REQ
UPGRADE TO Y. 
Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from this Confirmation
Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused travel funds may only
be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the individual named on the
ticket. Any changes to this itinerary may result in a fare increase. Failure to cancel
reservations for a Wanna Get Away fare segment at least 10 minutes prior to
travel will result in the forfeiture of all remaining unused funds. 

CHI WN CLE83.61NZNUNNR 83.61 END ZPMDW XFMDW4.5
AY5.60$MDW5.60 

Learn about our
boarding process

Learn about inflight
WiFi & entertainment

Cost and Payment Summary

AIR - BQMHGS
Base Fare $ 83.61
Excise Taxes $ 6.27
Segment Fee $ 4.00
Passenger Facility Charge $ 4.50
September 11th Security Fee $ 5.60

Payment Information
 

Date: Oct 5, 2016 
Payment Amount: $103.98 



Total Air Cost $ 103.98

Useful Tools

Check In Online

Early Bird Check-In

View/Share Itinerary

Change Air Reservation

Cancel Air Reservation

Check Flight Status

Flight Status Notification

Book a Car

Book a Hotel

Know Before You Go

In the Airport

Baggage Policies

Suggested Airport Arrival Times

Security Procedures

Customers of Size

In the Air

Purchasing and Refunds

Special Travel Needs

Traveling with Children

Traveling with Pets

Unaccompanied Minors

Baby on Board

Customers with Disabilities

Legal Policies & Helpful Information

Privacy Policy

Notice of Incorporated Terms

Customer Service Commitment

FAQs

Contact Us

Book Air | Book Hotel | Book Car | Book Vacation Packages | See Special Offers | Manage My Account

This is a post-only mailing from Southwest Airlines. Please do not attempt to respond to this message. Your
privacy is important to us, Please read our Privacy Policy. 

1 All travel involving funds from this Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date.
2 Security Fee is the government-imposed September 11th Security Fee. 

See Southwest Airlines Co. Notice of Incorporation 
See Southwest Airlines Limit of Liability

Southwest Airlines
P.O. Box 36647-1CR
Dallas, TX 75235 

Contact Us

Copyright 2016 Southwest Airlines Co. All Rights Reserved.
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Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement
2016 10 Cleveland Project Bill – Charles R. See

TO: Matthew Barge

Meg Olsen

Police Assessment Resource Center

FROM: Charles R. See

DATE: 11/05, 2016
2016 INVOICE

BILLABLE HOURS

Date Activity Hours__
 __

10/07/16______Phone conference call re: Crises Team outreach 1 hr.___
10/11/16______Meeting with Stakeholders 1 hr.___
10/13/16 Meeting with CIT Outreach Chairperson 1 hr.
10/13/16______Meeting with Metal Health Advisory Committee 1.5 hrs._
10/13/16 Meeting with Black Shield members and community 1.3 hrs.
10/14/16 Engagement Team conference call 1 hr.
10/14/16______Conference call with MHAC re: event planning for venue . 8 hrs._
10/17/16 Meeting with MHAC committee member re: planning public event 1.5 hrs.
10/19/16 Team conference call re: CIT public event .8 hrs.

10/21/16 Staff conference call .5 hrs.
10/24/16 Meeting with Office of Professional Standards 1.5 hrs.
10/27/16______Meeting with CPCP 1.5 hrs.
10/28/16 Meeting with Community Policing staff 1.5 hrs.
10/29/16______All Monitoring Team meeting; review, planning and coordinating 9.5 hrs. __ 

Total Billed Hours: 24.4

Rate: $250 Per hour_________ 

Total Billed: $ 6,100

Total hours Worked: 39.4 
Pro Bono Hours: 15



Pro Bono hours consisted of: travel, phone calls, meetings, correspondence, mileage expense,
planning and various document review, and e-­‐mails.

Please make check payable to Charles R. See and forward it to:

Charles R. See,

Charles R. See

Director of Community Engagement
Cleveland Monitoring Team



Sean M. Smoot 

TO: Matthew Barge 
PARC – CLE Monitor 

FROM: Sean M. Smoot 

DATE:  October 30, 2016 

OCTOBER 2016 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 
10/6/16 Review CPS DN & Various Disciplinary files  3.0 
10/17/16 CPPA CPL PRB Review & Correspondence  1.0 
10/20/16 Travel SPD to CLE pro bono (4.0) 
10/20/16 Meeting CPPA (Loomis)  3.5 
10/21/16 Panel 8th Circuit Judicial Conf pro bono (3.5) 
10/21/16 Prep & Conf Call - All Team  1.0 
10/21/16 Travel CLE to SPD pro bono (4.0) 
10/25/16 Travel SPD to CLE pro bono (4.0) 
10/25/16 3d District Observation  2.5 
10/26/16 Attend/Observe CDP In-Service OPATA Trng  4.5 
10/26/16 3d District Observation  1.5 
10/27/16 Meeting w Team Membets  (3.0) 
10/28/16 Prep for All Team Mtg  (1.0) 
10/29/16 All Team Mtg.  8.0 
10/30/16 Travel CLE to SPD pro bono (4.0) 
10/1-30/16 Misc. Pro Bono emails, calls, research, etc.  (7.0) 

Total Hours Worked (non-travel)  25.0 
Total Billed Hours 
Rate: $250/hour 

Non-Billed Travel hours  16.0 

Additional Pro Bono Hours  14.5 

TOTAL FOR HOURS BILLED $6,250.00 



REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 

10/20-21/16 Airfare (R/T STL-CLE) $ 602.96 
Mileage (R/T - SPI-STL 212 miles/.54) $ 114.48 

10/21/16 UBER (Marriott – Landerhaven $84.92 + CLE – 
Airport $25.99) 

$ 110.91 

10/20-21/16 Hotel - Marriott $ 145.63 
10/20-21/16 Per Diem (.5 x $69) $  34.50 
10/20-21/16 Parking - STL $  46.00 
10/25-30/16 Airfare (R/T STL-CLE) $ 168.96 

Mileage (R/T - SPI-STL 212 miles/.54) $ 114.48 
10/25/16 UBER (CLE – Renaissance) $  42.66 
10/25-30/16 Per Diem (4 x $69) $ 276.00 
10/25-30/16 Hotel – Renaissance $ 728.15 
10/25-30/16 Parking – STL $ 100.00 
10/30 UBER (Renaissance – CLE) $  48.57 

TOTALS 
Airfare $ 771.92 
Lodging $ 873.78 
Parking $ 146.00 
Ground Trans/Car Rental/Mileage $ 431.10 
M&E Per Diem $ 310.50 

TOTAL EXPENSES SUBMITTED FOR 
REIMBURSEMENT 

$ 2,533.30 

TOTAL DUE $ 8,783.30 



































Southwest Airlines
P.O. Box 36647-1CR
Dallas, TX 75235 

Contact Us

Copyright 2016 Southwest Airlines Co. All Rights Reserved.







1 All travel involving funds from this Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date.
2 Security Fee is the government-imposed September 11th Security Fee. 

See Sou hwest Airlines Co. Notice of Incorporation 
See Sou hwest Airlines Limit of Liability

Southwest Airlines
P.O. Box 36647-1CR
Dallas, TX 75235 

Contact Us

Copyright 2016 Southwest Airlines Co. All Rights Reserved.













page 1 of 2

Matthew Barge Invoice # 16-010

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC)

Date Service Hrs.

10/03/16 Call w/Nonny to discuss District Policing Committee 0.65

10/03/16 Monitor meeting w/ CPC 1.8

10/07/16 Community engagement team conference call 0.5

10/10/16 Discussion w/ Aeyshia about Semi-Annual Report 0.25

10/11/16 Meeting of the Parties 0.75

10/14/16 Community engagement team meeting 0.7

10/15/16 Call w/Nonny to discuss District Policing Committee 1

10/21/16 Community engagement team conference call & Charles See 0.65

10/27/16 Commission meeting 2.5

10/28/16 Call w/ Blaine Griffin about District Policing Committees 1

10/28/16 Monitor City Club presentation 1

10/29/16 All team meeting 8

Total Hours Worked (excluding travel) 18.8

Pro Bono Work Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $1950.00 7.8

Pro Bono Travel Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $625.00 2.5

Pro Bono Mileage Rate: 0.54 /mile $20.52

Total Billed Rate: $250.00 /hour $2,750.00 11.00

Date Reimbursable Expense REF

Transportation

October 2016 EXPENSES

SUMMARY OF HOURS WORKED

SUMMARY OF REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

2016 10 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE

November 1, 2016

2016 10 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE

Amount Paid



page 2 of 2

Parking for meeting of the parties 1

City Club parking for Monitor presentation 2

Total Transportation

Accommodations

None this month

Total Accommodations

Per Diem

None this month

Total Per Diem

Other Expense

 3

Total Other Expense

Total Billed Reimbursable Expenses

Pro Bono Contributions $1,595.52

Billed Hours $3,750.00

Billed Reimbursable Exp $18.00

Total Amount Due $3,768.00

$10.00

$8.00

$18.00

$0.00

$18.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00






