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T A G                                                                  
The Aden Group, LLC.                                                   
 
8022 Fairfax Road   
Alexandria, VA 22308 
(571) 274-7821 
www.theadengroup.com 
 
By email 
 
April 12, 2022 (revised April 18, 2022) 
 
Michelle Heyer 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 
 
Tim Mygatt 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 
 
Barbara A. Langhenry 
Gary Singletary 
Sharon Dumas 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 
 
 
 RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team —March 2022 Invoice 
 
 
I. INTRODUCTION 
 
This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 
 
The Team’s invoice for services rendered in March 2022 was $92,972.65. The bill accounts for 
473.7 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from March 1, 2022 through 
March 31, 2022.  Of this time 60.8 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of 
Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of over 15 percent of its time for March 2022 as pro bono time 
saved  $15,200.00. 
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Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total budget for year seven of $1,104,670.40, which the monitoring team 
invoicing is well within. 

Activities, work, and tasks conducted during March 2022 included but were not limited to: 

•Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing
training addressing:   (In-person audits resumed) 

• Force Review Board;
•Crisis intervention;
•Bias-Free policing; and
• Supervision.

•Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and editing policies, processes,
procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to: 

• Supervisory response to use of force incidents;
• Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command;
•Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”);
• Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs (“IA”);
•Chain of command misconduct review process;
•Discipline process and
•Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”).
•Officer Intervention Program (OIP)

•Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding
implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to: 

•Crisis intervention;
•Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”);
•District Policing Committees (“DPC”s);
• Staffing;
•Recruitment and hiring; and

•Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system.
•Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and

Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting 
regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and 
functions; 

•Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome
measurements; 

•Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”),
including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian 
complaint investigations; 

•Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and 
development; provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB 
Manual, and regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and 
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•Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer
organizations, and community organizations. 

• Preparation of the rolling Use of Force Assessment methodology that is set to begin in
April 2022. 

•Ongoing project management and coordination for deliverables (internal and with the
City and DOJ) 

• Preparation for and coordination for hearings with the Court and the March in-person Site
Visit. 

•Discussions and preparation of filing on the 2021 extensive OPS assessment report.
•Meetings with the Mayor’s cabinet members to establish a working relationship moving

forward. 
•The Monitoring Team completed an in-person site visit and Status Conference in

Cleveland.  This was the first full-sclae site visit since the pandemic started. 

II. INVOICE SUMMARY

March 2022 

Billable Hours $85,921.00 

Overhead/Expenses $7,051.65 

TOTAL $92,972.65 

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

Total 
Hours 

Billed 
Hours 

Pro 
Bono 

Hours 

Total 
Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 70.9 66.9 4.0 $16,725.00 $657.00 

Modupe Akinola 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 27.2 23.1 4.1 $5,775.00 $517.88 
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Ronnie Dunn 28.2 27.2 1.0 $6,800.00 $10.00 

Randy Dupont 19.10 15.60 3.5 $3,900.00 $1,119.56 

Lisa Fink 47.2 36.7 10.5 $9,175.00 $1,346.74 

Ayesha Hardaway 41.5 34.1 7.4 $8,525.00 $16.00 

Brian Maxey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Megan McDonough 44.1 37.4 6.7 $9,350.00 $846.70 

Rick Myers 27.8 20.3 7.5 $5,075.00 $821.36 

Charles Ramsey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 52.6 42.1 10.5 $10,525.00 $1,716.41 

Victor Ruiz 2.6 2.6 0 $650.00 $0.00 

Scott Sargent 4.0 3.0 1.0 $750.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Charles See 22.1 17.5 4.6 $4,375.00 $0.00 

Sean Smoot 4.0 4.0 0 $1,000.00 $0.00 

Tim Tramble 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 82.4 82.4 0 $3,296.00 $0.00 

TOTAL 473.7 412.9 60.8 $85,921.00 $7,051.65 

* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland
project.

III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 
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The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 
so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 
for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 
compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 
or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 
constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 
 
Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 
the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 
redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 
charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 
 
IV. CONCLUSION 
 
We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 
 
Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 
 
       Sincerely, 

                                                                                     
cc: Michelle Heyer 



Detailed time report

Timeframe 03/01/2022 – 03/31/2022

Total 473.70 Hours
412.90 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client City of Cleveland

1
Project

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Tasks All tasks

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Aden Hassan 70.90

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

Weekly update call with the DOJ. Call with MT members for follow ups and assignments. Call with L. Fink re: 2022
MY Plan. Email and correspondence. Edits to documents destined for the CDP and for notices to the Court. Call
with A. Hardaway re: CD related priority matters. Edits to the 2022 MT.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

Review of recent motions/notices filed with the Court. Call with A. Hardaway re: CIT and Section 115. Call with M.
Bretz re: schedule and agendas for the upcoming site visit (March 16-18). Call with C. Cole re: Compstat and data.
Email and correspondence.

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

Work session(s) with the City and DOJ re: Section 115 and necessary CD Amendments. Review of site visit
agenda. Email and correspondence.

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

CAll with Charles See re: community matters. Review of recent discipline letters. Review and work on the agenda
for the March 16-18 site visit. Email and correspondence re: several disciplinary matters and arbitrations. Review
of a recent arbitration.

03/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.80

review of Stops Form submitted by the CDP. Email and correspondence.

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

MHRAC Full Committee meeting for March. Weekly MT leadership logistics call. Review of CIT Response policies
(side by side). Call with M. Bretz to finalize the agenda for our upcoming site visit. Review and approval of final MT
draft the 2022 Monitoring Plan. Email and correspondence.

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.50

Total 473.70
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Email and correspondence. Review of documents and motions.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 2.00

Review of District Neighborhood Awareness Trainings and associated email and correspondence. Call with M.
Bret’s re deliverables and next week’s MT site visit. Review of recent DNS.

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

Email and correspondence re: upcoming site visit and upcoming Recruit Background audit. Review of several
documents. Call with C. Cole re: several MT related matters. Review of filings (City and DOJ) re: Section 115.
General email and correspondence.

03/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

Email and correspondence re: upcoming audit of recruit files, including team logistics and members needed for the
audit. General email and correspondence.

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

MT Weekly logistics call. CIT call regarding recent policy matters. Email and correspondence. Review of final UF
Assessment report draft. Email and correspondence.

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.80

Call with M. Bretz re: meetings, deliverables and assignments. Weekly update call with DOJ. Court preparation and
assignments for MT members with a speaking role. Email and correspondence.

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 6.00

Cleveland site visit. Continued review and preparation for the Status Conference hearing on 3/17/22, to include
finishing the review of the proposed language to be modified in the CD (Exhibit A 3/11/2022). Meeting with MT
members onsite to prepare for upcoming meetings over the next two days. Participated in the Monthly CompStat
meeting. Email and correspondence.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 8.00

Cleveland site visit: Internal MT meetings, meetings with DOJ and a Zoom with the new CPC co-chairs ahead of
the Status Conference. Status Conference and post conference debrief with DOJ and MT members. MT debrief
and follow up actions. Email and correspondence.

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

Onsite follow up meeting with MT members. Call with M. Bretz re: general follow up assignments post Status
Conference. Email and correspondence.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

Weekly MT logistics meeting. Finalizing the UF assessment memorandum. Review and feedback of the Pursuit
Investigations Team policy. Email and correspondence re multiple CD related matters.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

Weekly update call with the DOJ. Bi-weekly update call with the City/DOJ and the MT. Call with M. Bretz re: follow
ups and deliverables. Email and correspondence.

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.30

Arbitration decision call with City Law. Promotional Process collaboration kickoff call with DOJ and the City.
Review of two arbitrations provided by City Law. Email and correspondence and review of the CD in preparation
for the calls on this date.

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.00

Review of documents in BOX. Distributed the final version of the 2020-21 UF Review. prepared for the filing of UF
Review. Email and correspondence.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 2.00

Review of notices for a Court filings. Email and correspondence. Call with City Law re: some upcoming meetings.

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

Call with MT members re updating our website and public facing data. MT weekly update logistics call. Review of
PIT policy and email to CDP regarding our review. Review of disciplinary cases (Chief's and DPS). Email and
correspondence.

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

Weekly update call with DOJ. Call with M. Bretz. Review of several pending assessment methodologies. Box
review of documents in transition between parties. Email and correspondence.

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

Met with C. Cole and S. Smoot re: upcoming visits and assessments. Reviewed and approved methodology for
the Hiring/Background assessment to be distributed to the parties. Email and correspondence.

03/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

Email and correspondence. Review of several documents and other deliverables.

Charles See 22.10

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

phone calls

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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Team member conference

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

Engagement Team meeting, Team member conference call

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.00

MHRAC full and sub-committee meeting; conference call with committee member

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

Stakeholders' meeting and loglogistic meeting (DOJ, City, CDP, MT

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

Stakeholder's meeting and Logistic team meeting.

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

Phone calls with community members re: issues 24

03/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

Review city filing re: issue 25

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

Phone conversations with community re: Upcoming Court Hearing

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

Review District Training curriculums

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

5.00

Court Hearing/Debrief with DOJ and MT/ Team meeting

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

District Curriculum review

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

DOJ/City/MT/CDP meeting

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

Phone calls, document review

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

Phone calls

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

Phone conference

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

Document review

CJI - Cole Christine 27.20

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

laptop access logistics, strategy conversation with HA

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.30

working on laptop access, old case reviews

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Senior Advisor 1.20

planning logistics and discussion on tool with MCM, RD, RD. Revisions to tool

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Senior Advisor 0.50

planning and logistics, discussion with CDP staff, MCM, RD

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.30

review of RR memo

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.30

 MT Weekly Logistics Team Meeting; scheduling recruitment reviews; reviewing UOF issues

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.30

 Comms with CDP on recruit background checks, liaising with SS on UOF issue, news, emails

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.30

 UOF Review Final Memo Draft

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 Meeting with MCM, RD, RR on assessments.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 conversation on UOF and other assessments

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 UOF memo, CIT review

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 MT weekly call

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.30

 prep notes for hearing on lateral background review memo

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 8.00

 In person meetings, court hearing, team dinner

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 weekly MT Meeting

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 MT/DOJ/City call; review of training materials; work on UOF memo

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.70

 work on laptop access, work on UOF plans, agenda for internal assessment meeting, review methodologies

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 weekly internal assessment team meeting

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.70

 Review and comment on SSA training materials

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 review of Box materials

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

 DOJ/MT weekly meeting. Work on methodologies for UOF and Background Reviews. Organizing team members
for April visit

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 work on setting up assessments, laptops, and doc reviews

03/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.30

 review of assessment methodology docs, tools, emails, news

Hardaway Ayesha 41.50

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.70

 Participate in meeting with DOJ; phone calls regarding upcoming status conference; file revised CPOP policy with
Court; and begin to draft filing regarding CIT.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Prepare and file Notice with the Court regarding CIT policy.

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Monitor parties' discussion regarding proposed consent decree amendments.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Participate in MT logistics meeting.

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Review and analyze training plan, needs assessment and district neighborhood awareness plans.

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Attend meeting with CDP Training Section and DOJ.

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Participate in meetings with the Parties and CPC; discussions with the Court.

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.40

 Review and analyze 2022 Monitoring Plan; draft and file Notice to Court regarding 2022 Monitoring Plan.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Participate in meeting with OPS and PRB leadership.

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Participate in MT logistics call.

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Participate in conference call with CDP and City Law.

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Participate in meeting with DOJ.

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email correspondence.

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.80

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 Participate in meetings with City Law and DOJ in preparation for Status Conference.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp)
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Prepare for and participate in meetings with OPS.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Prepare for and participate in meetings with City Law, CPC, and DOJ.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Prepare for and participate in Status Conference.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Review and analyze District Neighborhood Awareness training curriculum and Mobile Citizen Academy
Powerpoint.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Participate in MT logistics meeting.

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Participate in meetings with DOJ, CDP and City Law.

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Prepare for and participate in meeting with City Law and DOJ regarding arbitrations.

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Develop and draft Notice submitting CDP's District Neighborhood Awareness Training curriculums for the Court.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Revise Notice to Court and prepare training materials for filing.

03/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review and analyze In-Service Search and Seizure/Use of Force training materials.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review and analyze In-Service Search and Seizure/Use of Force training materials.

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Participate in MT Logistics meeting

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Prepare for and participate in Training Section meeting.

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Prepare for and participate in Training Section meeting.

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp)
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Participate in meeting with DOJ.

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Participate in meeting with DOJ.

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp)
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Participate in meeting with City Law and DOJ.

Lisa Fink 47.20

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.70

 DOJ/MT Meeting; follow-ups on document status; Document tracking and emails; Reviewed Section 115.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Edits to Monitoring Plan and sent back to CDP.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Emails

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Skim Monitoring Plan & follow-ups with CDP; emails; assign S&S Report outline to MT members.

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.90

 Prep for MT Logistics and participate in MT Logistics call; Monitoring Plan finalizing and assigning document
review to MT members; Review and MT follow-ups re: Training Plan, Needs Assessment & District Neighborhood
Awareness Trainings; document tracking; finalize Monitoring Plan and sent to CDP.

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.60

 DOJ/MT Meeting; Stakeholders Meeting; document follow-ups; MP organization/deadline tracking.

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.10

 City/CDP/MT/DOJ meeting; communications re: MP and District awareness trainings; edits to District
Neighborhood Trainings and sent to CDP.

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MP organization/deadline tracking; emails; search & seizure report outline review.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Readying 2022 Training Plan and Training Needs Assessment for return to CDP; Correspondence & returned
training plan and needs assessment.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Reviewed MT's UOF review memo

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Drafting MP highlights document for court presentation; tracking MP deadlines, emails.

03/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Drafting MP highlights document for court presentation; document tracking

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.60

 MT logistics pre-meeting and meeting; follow-ups re District Awareness, court filings, S&S data outline; Prep/sent
S&S report outline to DOJ and sent MP weekly deadlines email to CDP/City; UOF report finalizing, emails and
document tracking.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 District Neighborhood Awareness Trainings review/sent to MT members

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 DOJ/MT Call

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Reviewing Section 115; document tracking and status checks; skimming documents CDP sent, reviewing search &
seizure outline, tracking Monitoring Plan deadlines.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

7.00

 Site Visit - MT meeting; DOJ/MT meeting; status conference; debrief with DOJ; follow-ups on assigned
documents.

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.30

 Reviewed Joint Filing to Amend CD and appendices; S&S Outline finalize and return to CDP; other document
tracking; email follow-ups re: training and UOF report;

03/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Preparing for the week; needs assessment and training plan review; emails re UOF memo, mobile citizens
academy; document tracking and assignments.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 MT logistics meeting; emails.

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.80

 MT/DOJ meeting; MT/DOJ/City/CDP meeting; Email follow-ups re promotions and discipline audit; UOF memo
formatting, follow-ups re: MP deliverables & website meeting.

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Prep for promotions call; facilitated promotions call; follow-up emails.

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Call w Sgt. Ryan; finalizing District Awareness Trainings; emails.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 Emails & review district neighborhood training notice.

03/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Updating document and task trackers, followed up on emails.

03/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Reviewed CoP Discipline methodology

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Prep weekly email of deadlines

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.20

 Website meeting; MT Logistics call; edits to IST pre-load & scenario #1; emails and document tracking.

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.70

 Edits to IST scenarios 2 & 3; IST lesson plans and exam editing; website follow-ups.

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 DOJ/MT Call; IST edits; agenda for Wed call; Reviewing IST materials to send back to CDP; emails and follow-ups;
document tracking.

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Review CoP Discipline methodology, drafting communication re CoP Discipline assessment.

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Biweekly meeting with City law; follow-up emails re: search firm recommendations and sending IST materials back
to CDP.

McDonough Megan 44.10

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Assessment emails

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 DOJ/MT weekly call

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70

Page 13 of 29



03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

DPS Discipline
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Revise methodology

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Email correspondence re: tech setup

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review edits to Chief Discipline assessment

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

DPS Discipline
Assessment

Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Finish methodology for circulation to parties

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Weekly Assessment Check-In Call and follow up

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Last review of DoC Discipline methodology

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Cleveland assessment correspondence; convert handcuffing methodology to Alchemer

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.10

 DOJ/MT weekly meeting

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review Search and Seizure methodology

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Convert handcuffing instrument into Alchemer

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.60

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 Determining status of paragraphs for assessment

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Review draft from Christine; weekly assessment call; follow up items

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.60

 review UoF draft

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Assessment correspondence

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Weekly Logistics Meeting and assessment emails

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 MT/DOJ Call

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Emails re: assessments

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 CDP Stat

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lateral Hires Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review hiring assessment instrument

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

4.50

 Cleveland on site, status hearing, internal meetings

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 City IT

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review UoF memo

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Weekly logistics meeting

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 DOJ/MT weekly meeting

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 CDP/DOJ/MT call

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Assessment coordination call; survey and methodology development

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.10

 Review discipline assessment methodology feedback; write up handcuffing methodology

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Weekly logistics meeting

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Discipline assessment sample selection

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Weekly DOJ/MT Meeting

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.40

 Assessment emails; hiring methodology

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.60

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 Hiring methodology and Handcuffing methodology

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Rolling review methodology

03/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Assessment correspondence

Melissa Bretz 82.40

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding agendas,
meeting information, travel, reports, and other information.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.90

 Emails to parties regarding Letters of Engagement, documents, confirmations, status updated, cancellations,
deadlines, and other information.

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call. Emails to parties regarding cancellations, meeting information, status
updates, and other information.

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

7.00

 MT Logistics Meetings. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding
meeting information, scheduling, travel information, rescheduling, status conference, agendas, and other
information.

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

6.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting, Stakeholders Meeting, and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Emails to parties regarding agendas,
meeting information, status conference information, documents, deadlines, travel information, and other
information.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.50

 Work on Travel Agenda. Emails to parties regarding travel information, agendas, documents, status updates, and
other information.

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Work on Travel Agenda, Tracking Sheet, and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding documents, travel
information, scheduling, and other information.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

8.00

 MT Logistic Meetings and CIT Policy Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to
parties regarding meeting information, agendas, documents, deadlines, status updates, scheduling, travel
information, and other information.

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting. Emails to parties regarding travel information, agendas, site visit information, scheduling, status
updates, and other information.

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Compstat Meeting. Emails to parties regarding agendas, travel information, documents, deadlines, status updates,
and other information.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

5.00

 Emails to parties regarding site visit information, travel information, agendas, reports, documents, deadlines, status
updates, meeting information, and other information.

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Emails to parties regarding documents, scheduling, meeting information, deadlines, and status updates.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

6.50

 MT Logistics Meetings. Work on Tracking sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding
status updates, documents, deadlines, scheduling, agendas, and other information.

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

8.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists.
Emails to parties regarding agendas, meeting information, scheduling, status updates, invoice questions,
documents, deadlines, task lists, rescheduling, and other information.

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

5.00

 Arbitration Decision Discussion and Promotions Start-up Discussion. Emails to parties regarding status updates,
scheduling, cancelling meetings, laptops, and other information.

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Emails to parties regarding documents, deadlines, status updates, and other information.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Emails to parties regarding status updates, documents, deadlines, and other information.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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Randolph Dupont 19.10

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Meeting with Parties regarding CIT Policy issues, development of memorandum regarding CIT policy issue

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Discussion of CIT Policy Issue with MHRAC Leadership, meeting with Monitoring Team to review CPD outcome
data

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Discussion with Monitoring Team Member (C. See) on CIT Policy issue

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.60

 MHRAC Bimonthly Meeting

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Meeting with Monitoring Team for planning, preparation time to discuss CIT deadlines, discussion with Monitoring
Team Member C. See

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 MHRAC Quality Assurance Subcommittee Meeting, including meeting preparation time

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Discussion on CPD Annual Inservice with CPD Leadership, preparation for status conference

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

4.50

 Planning meeting with Monitoring Team for Status Conference, discussion with parties, Court Status Conference

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Monitoring Team Meeting to discuss upcoming status conference, post status conference discussion

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Discussion with Consent Decree parties on recent status conference CIT issues

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Monitoring Planning Meeting and preparation time

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Discussion with Consent Decree Parties regarding CPD in-service curriculum

Richard Rosenthal 52.60

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.80

 0800-0853: DOJ/MT meeting; Correspondence review and correspondence re: OPS-IA manual amendments;
Review of Issue 12 and CD comparison – recommendations for CD amendments & follow up correspondence;
Review of OPS bi-weekly report & IA status reports for cases initiated 2019, 2020, 2021).

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review and edits to assessment methodology and instrument.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Correspondence review, including documentation and review of DPS charge letters.

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

4.50

 call re: assessment methodology; Data cleaning/updates to spreadsheet for assessment; follow up
correspondence.

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 OPS Biweekly meeting and follow-up correspondence.

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Correspondence re: assessment case population and review of cases; Review of final draft assessment memo.

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.20

 Correspondence review, including charge letters and discipline letters and IA Pro review of OPS case & follow-up
correspondence & Monitoring Team call; Review of arbitration decision & follow up correspondence; Weekly
upload of discipline letters to BOX.

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review of assessment methodology memo and finalization.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70

Page 20 of 29



03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.40

 MT weekly Logistics meeting; Logistics meeting follow up correspondence to DOJ & OPS, including review and
documentation of 1 DPS termination letter; Correspondence review; scheduling of OPS site visit.

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 DOJ/MT weekly meeting; Monitoring Team/DOJ/City/CDP bi-weekly meeting.

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Call re: 2022 monitoring plan; Correspondence review, including correspondence to OPS, meeting scheduling,
OPS annual report.

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Review and comment on monitoring plan regarding assessment methodology; call re: assessment methodology.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Preparation for OPS meeting; Meeting with OPS.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Updates to assessment methodology and instrument. Assessment Team Meeting.

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Assessment Team Meeting.

03/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 correspondence review (OPS related issues), download and review of 1 COP departure letter; OPS meeting
registration; Weekly discipline upload to BOX.

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.40

 Monitoring Team Logistics Team meeting; Review of special PRB meeting; Calls/Technical Advice re: OPS/PRB;
Correspondence review, including charge letters, DN’s & court motions re: Issue 24.

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Monitoring Team/DOJ weekly meeting.

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.30

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Review of Issue 24 court filings; Review of OPS annual report; Court hearing preparation.

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.00

 On site visit; Court hearing preparation; OPS-DOJ meeting; Attendance/presentation at federal court hearing;
MT/DOJ debrief.

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

6.50

 Monitoring of quarterly FRB meeting; Documentation – FRB notes; Documentation – FRB notes.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Monitoring team logistics meeting; Correspondence review, including charge and discipline letters and inquiry in IA
Pro.

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.70

 DOJ/Monitoring Team weekly meeting; Monitoring Team/City/CDP/DOJ bi-weekly meeting; Correspondence
review and response (OPS annual report; OPS manual); Review and edits to IA/OPS manual re: critical incident
complaints.

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Assessment methodology review.

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.60

 FRB online tool documentation.

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Call with City Law re: arbitration decisions;; Call with DOJ re: IA/OPS manual revisions; Correspondence with OPS;
correspondence with CDP; correspondence review.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Correspondence review, including review of historical arbitration decision (discipline matrix), two DPS discipline
letters; Review of OPS annual report and forwarding to DOJ; Review and edits to OPS/IA manuals; 
Weekly upload of discipline cases to BOX.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review of UOF assessment findings.

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Edits to assessment.

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Weekly Monitoring Team logistics call. (36 minutes).

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Weekly DOJ call; Correspondence review, including review of Case Prep Case Spreadsheets, Charter Section
Implementation memo.

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Final edits to and correspondence re: assessment; uploads to BOX.

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 DOJ/City Law/Monitoring Team & follow-up call.

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Research & correspondence re: executive search firms for OPS Admin & IG.

03/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 OPS bi-weekly call.

Rick Myers 27.80

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 weekly MT, DOJ meeting

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 weekly MT, DOJ meeting

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 weekly Logistics meeting

03/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 bi weekly training meeting

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 DOJ/MT weekly meeting

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 stakeholder meeting

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 stakeholder meeting

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 DOJ/MT/CDP meeting

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 review PPT's per box assignment

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 review mobile citizens academy PPT's, comment

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 on phone with IT to get laptop working again

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 On phone with IT to get laptop working again

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Review cases for upcoming FRB

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review cases for upcoming FRB

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 weekly logistics meeting

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 weekly logistics meeting

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 weekly MT/DOJ meeting

03/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 weekly MT, DOJ meeting

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.50

 Internal MT meeting(2), meet with DOJ (2.5), Status Hearing (2)

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.00

 fRB meeting

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.50

 FRB Meeting

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 weekly MT logistics meeting

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 review all Box assignments

03/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 complete Box assignments

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 weekly logistics meeting

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 bi weekly training meeting

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 weekly logistics

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 bi weekly training

Ronnie Dunn 28.20

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 MT/DOJ Mtg

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 CIT BWC Protocol & Review

03/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Chief Discipline Decision 
& CIT memo Review

03/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.80

 Development of CIT BWC Review Protocol & Methodology

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Assessment/ CIT BWC meeting

03/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Revision of CIT Juvenile BWC Review Protocol

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Juvenile BWC Protocol Review

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 CPC & All Team Meeting

03/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 CIT BWC form review

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Weekly Assessors Meeting

03/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MT Logistics meeting

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 CDP Stats Mtg

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MT Logistics Mtg

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 DOJ/MT & Parties Mtg

03/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Juvenile BWC cuffing review

03/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Assessment Team Meeting

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force
Assessement

Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Review of UOF Assessment Instrument

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 MT Logistics Meeting

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Administrative tasks and document reviews

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 DOJ/MT meeting

03/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.80

 Review of Female Juvenile CIT BWC footage

Scott Sargent 4.00

03/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Review of S&S training agenda, scenarios and training materials.

03/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Correspondence/emails, policy research

Smoot Sean 4.00

03/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 1.00

 Conf call w team member re blue team and IA Pro usage issues and monitoring issues.

03/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 1.50

 Meeting w MT members re CD implementation and engagement with the parties.

03/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 1.50

 Meeting w Monitor and MT members re CD implementation and engagement with rank and file CDP members.

Victor Ruiz 2.60

03/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 473.70
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 CPC, DOJ, MT Meeting

03/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.30

 DOJ, CDP, MT Meeting

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Website Edits

Total 473.70

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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Expense report

Timeframe 03/01/2022 – 03/31/2022

Total $7,051.65

1 Client City of Cleveland

1 Project Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Categories All categories

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Aden Hassan $657.00

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $217.20

RT Airfare DCA/CLE

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $56.00

Parking at DCA

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $24.71

Uber from CLE Hopkins to Hotel

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $27.73

Lyft from Hotel to Cle Hopkins

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Senior Advisor $331.36

Hotel during site visit

CJI - Cole Christine $517.88

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $49.20

cab from CLE to Marriott Key Center

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $27.00

Uber from Marriott Key Center to CLE

Total $7,051.65
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03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Senior Advisor $165.68

Marriott Key Center

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $76.00

parking at Logan Airport (partial on this receipt) 2 full days

03/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $200.00

the trip to CLE was an add on to an already scheduled trip to SFO. I attach the full folio as a receipt. Costs of
round trip flights Boston/Cleveland range in costs from $268-$514. With the data reference of current costs, I
request $200. for this expense be reimbursed. The original flight to SFO/BOS was about $640 before I added the
CLE leg.

Hardaway Ayesha $16.00

03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Other Associate
Consultant

$16.00

Status Conference Parking 3/17/22

Lisa Fink $1,346.74

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$732.09

Roundtrip airfare from Eugene, OR to Cleveland, OH for March 16-18, 2022 for site visit.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$537.31

Two night stay at Marriott Downtown for site visit - March 16-18, 2022.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$52.34

Transportation from CLE Airport to Marriott Downtown on March 16, 2022.

03/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$25.00

Transportation from Downtown Marriott to CLE Airport on March 18, 2022.

McDonough Megan $846.70

03/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$116.99

Transport (UberX) to Laguardia

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $7,051.65
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03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$292.58

Hotel for March 2022 Status Conference

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$217.29

Airfare for March 2022 Status Conference

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$45.60

Transport (cab) from CLE to Federal Courthouse

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$27.14

Transport (UberX) from CIty IT to CLE

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$147.10

Transport (UberX) from LGA to home

Randolph Dupont $1,119.56

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$788.20

Airfare

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$331.36

Please only submit the discounted rate of two days for $331.36 instead of the larger amount shown on the receipt.

Richard Rosenthal $1,716.41

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$537.31

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Phone, Internet, Website
Expenses

Associate
Consultant

$23.51

"Roam Like Home" cellular expense for cell phone usage in Cleveland. $30 CAD = $23.51 USD

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$73.48

Airport parking at Vancouver International Airport $93.75 CAD = $73.48 USD

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $7,051.65
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03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$69.35

 Covid Test purchase (2 tests) for travel between Vancouver, BC and CLE. $88.48 CAD = $69.35 USD

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$858.68

 United Airlines flight between Vancouver BC and CLE. $1,095.51 CAD = $858.68 USD.

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$49.06

 Round trip from home to Vancouver International Airport. [87.6 miles]

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$36.02

 Uber to CLE airport from downtown hotel.

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$36.00

 Taxi from airport to downtown hotel.

03/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Other Associate
Consultant

$33.00

 1/2 day per diem for extra expenses.

Rick Myers $821.36

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$432.20

 airfare to cleveland

03/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$28.90

 home to DIA; [51.6 miles]

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$331.36

 2 nights at Marriott downtown Cleveland

03/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$28.90

 DIA to home [51.6 miles]

Ronnie Dunn $10.00

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $7,051.65
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03/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$10.00

Parking fee for picking up laptop at W. 205 & St. Clair

Total $7,051.65

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount
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$217.2003/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

RT Airfare DCA/CLE
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$56.0003/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Parking at DCA
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$24.7103/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from CLE Hopkins to Hotel
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$27.7303/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Lyft from Hotel to Cle Hopkins
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$331.3603/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person Aden Hassan

Hotel during site visit
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$49.2003/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

cab from CLE to Marriott Key Center
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$27.0003/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

Uber from Marriott Key Center to CLE
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$165.6803/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person CJI - Cole Christine

Marriott Key Center
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$76.0003/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person CJI - Cole Christine

parking at Logan Airport (partial on this receipt) 2 full
days
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$200.0003/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

the trip to CLE was an add on to an already
scheduled trip to SFO. I attach the full folio as a
receipt. Costs of round trip flights Boston/Cleveland
range in costs from $268-$514. With the data
reference of current costs, I request $200. for this
expense be reimbursed. The original flight to
SFO/BOS was about $640 before I added the CLE
leg.
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$16.0003/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Other

Person Hardaway Ayesha

Status Conference Parking 3/17/22
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$732.0903/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Lisa Fink

Roundtrip airfare from Eugene, OR to Cleveland, OH
for March 16-18, 2022 for site visit.
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$537.3103/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person Lisa Fink

Two night stay at Marriott Downtown for site visit -
March 16-18, 2022.
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$52.3403/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Lisa Fink

Transportation from CLE Airport to Marriott
Downtown on March 16, 2022.
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$25.0003/21/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Lisa Fink

Transportation from Downtown Marriott to CLE
Airport on March 18, 2022.
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$116.9903/17/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person McDonough Megan

Transport (UberX) to Laguardia
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$292.5803/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person McDonough Megan

Hotel for March 2022 Status Conference
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$217.2903/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person McDonough Megan

Airfare for March 2022 Status Conference
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$45.6003/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person McDonough Megan

Transport (cab) from CLE to Federal Courthouse
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$27.1403/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person McDonough Megan

Transport (UberX) from CIty IT to CLE
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$147.1003/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person McDonough Megan

Transport (UberX) from LGA to home
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$788.2003/16/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Randolph Dupont

Airfare
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$331.3603/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person Randolph Dupont

Please only submit the discounted rate of two days
for $331.36 instead of the larger amount shown on
the receipt.
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$537.3103/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging
Person Richard Rosenthal
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$23.5103/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Richard Rosenthal

"Roam Like Home" cellular expense for cell phone
usage in Cleveland. $30 CAD = $23.51 USD
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$73.4803/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Airport parking at Vancouver International Airport
$93.75 CAD = $73.48 USD
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$69.3503/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Covid Test purchase (2 tests) for travel between
Vancouver, BC and CLE. $88.48 CAD = $69.35 USD
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$858.6803/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

United Airlines flight between Vancouver BC and
CLE. $1,095.51 CAD = $858.68 USD.
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$49.0603/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Mileage
Person Richard Rosenthal

Round trip from home to Vancouver International
Airport. [87.6 miles]
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$36.0203/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Richard Rosenthal

Uber to CLE airport from downtown hotel.
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$36.0003/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Taxi from airport to downtown hotel.
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$33.0003/27/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Other

Person Richard Rosenthal

1/2 day per diem for extra expenses.

$432.2003/16/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person Rick Myers

airfare to cleveland
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$28.9003/16/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Mileage
Person Rick Myers

home to DIA; [51.6 miles]

$331.3603/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person Rick Myers

2 nights at Marriott downtown Cleveland
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$28.9003/18/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Mileage

Person Rick Myers

DIA to home [51.6 miles]

$10.0003/28/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation
Person Ronnie Dunn

Parking fee for picking up laptop at W. 205 & St.
Clair
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