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Monica Madej 
Kevin Preslan 
Heather Tonsing Volosin 



Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 
Modupe Akinola 

 
TO:  Matthew Barge 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 
 
FROM: Modupe Akinola 
 
DATE:  April 5, 2016 

 
March 2016 INVOICE 
BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 
3-4-16 Meetings in Cleveland 13.0 
3-5-16 Meetings in Cleveland 12.0 
3-9-16 Conference Call with Todd Wiles   0.75 
3-10-16 Conference Call with Capt. Purcell   0.5 
3-11-16 Conference Call with Lt. Goines   0.5 
 Total Hours Worked 26.75 

Total Billed Hours 14.5 
              Rate: $250/hour  
TOTAL BILLED $3,625 
Pro Bono Hours 12.25 
Travel Hours   8.0 

 
REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Ref # Expense Amount 
2-24-16 1 Airfare (NYC to Cleveland, round-trip) $264.20 
3-3-16 2 Taxi to Airport (NYC)   $38.51 
3-3-16 3 Taxi to Hotel (Cleveland)   $40.83 
3-4-16 4 Taxi to Lutheran Ministries Meeting     $5.60 
3-4-16 5 Taxi to District Meeting   $10.24 
3-4-16 6 Taxi from District Meeting to Hotel     $9.23 
3-4-16 7 Taxi from Dinner to Hotel     $9.61 
3-6-16 8 Hotel $436.89 
3-6-16 9 Taxi to Airport (Cleveland)   $42.48 
3-6-16 10 Taxi from Airport (NYC)   $35.81 
  Transportation $456.51 

 Accommodations $436.89 
 Per Diem (1 night)    $69.00 
 TOTAL EXPENSES $962.40 

 























MATTHEW BARGE 
 

MARCH 2016 INVOICE 
 

BILLABLE HOURS 
 
Date Activity Hours 
03-01-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 

email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

11.3 

03-02-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

10.6 

03-03-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

10.5 

03-04-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

10.8 

03-05-16 Attend internal meetings (all-team, in-person 
meeting at Community Monitoring Office).  
Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.   

9.5 

03-06-16 Attend stakeholder meeting. 2.0 
03-07-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 

email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

7.7 

03-08-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

6.5 

03-09-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

6.1 

03-10-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

5.0 

03-11-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.   

1.3 

03-12-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Review documents. 

2.1 

03-13-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.   0.4 
03-14-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 

monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 
2.1 

03-15-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  
Review documents.  Draft and review documents. 

3.7 

03-16-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  
Review documents. 

5.5 



03-17-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  
Review documents.  Draft and review documents 

9.5 

03-18-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues. Draft and review documents.   

9.4 

03-19-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  0.5 
03-20-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.   1.0 
03-21-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. Draft 

and review documents.   
5.8 

03-22-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

10.0 

03-23-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

7.1 

03-24-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate via 
email and telephone re: various monitoring issues.  
Draft and review documents. 

5.0 

03-25-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

7.5 

03-26-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. Draft 
and review documents.   

0.4 

03-27-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.   

2.1 

03-28-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.   

7.6 

03-29-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

8.6 

03-30-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

9.4 

03-31-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

5.9 

 Total Hours Worked 184.9 
Total Billed Hours   37.0  
              Rate: $250/hour  
TOTAL BILLED $9,250.00 
Pro Bono Hours 147.9 

 
REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

 
Date Expense Amount 
1-Mar Dial7 (Residence to LGA) $  48.80 
1-Mar United Airlines (3/1) † $546.10 
4-Mar Uber $    5.62 
4-Mar Uber $  10.40 
4-Mar Taxi (Downtown to Third District) $  10.00 



10-Mar Marriott (3/1 – 3/9) $1,173.04 
10-Mar Taxi (Downtown to CLE) $  42.60 
21-Mar New Jersey Transit (Train, Residence to EWR) $  13.00 
21-Mar United Airlines (3/21)†* $566.10 
24-Mar Westin Cleveland (3/21 – 3/24) $436.89 
24-Mar Uber $  14.69 

TOTAL $2,867.24 

Notes: 

†  Because Mr. Barge needed to travel to other jurisdictions on the back end of this itinerary, no 
“return” trip is provided here for reimbursement. 

* Original flight from LGA to CLE was delayed significantly on day of travel.  Airline permitted
switch, with no charge, to flight departing from EWR to CLE.

Mr. Barge does not bill for meals or miscellaneous personal expenses.  Whenever feasible to do 
so, he coordinates ground transportation with other Monitoring Team members. 





Friday,	March	25,	2016	at	12:05:56	PM	Eastern	Daylight	Time
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Subject: eTicket	I)nerary	and	Receipt	for	Confirma)on	HFJ64Y
Date: Saturday,	February	27,	2016	at	7:12:10	AM	Eastern	Standard	Time
From: United	Airlines,	Inc.
To: MaLhew	Barge

Confirmation: 

HFJ64Y

Receipt for confirmation HFJ64Y

Issue Date: February 27, 2016
Traveler eTicket Number Frequent Flyer Seats
BARGE/MATTHEW 10C
FLIGHT INFORMATION
Day, Date Flight Class Departure City and Time Arrival City and Time Aircraft Meal
Mon, 21MAR16 UA4247 M NEW YORK, NY 

(LGA - LAGUARDIA) 8:32 PM
CLEVELAND, OH 
(CLE) 10:20 PM

ERJ-145

Flight operated by EXPRESSJET AIRLINES INC. doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.

FARE INFORMATION

Fare Breakdown
Airfare: 513.48U

S
D

U.S. Transportation Tax: 38.52
U.S. Flight Segment Tax: 4.00
September 11th Security Fee: 5.60
U.S. Passenger Facility Charge: 4.50
Per Person Total: 566.10U

S
D

eTicket Total: 566.10U
S
D

The airfare you paid on this itinerary totals: 513.48 USD

The taxes, fees, and surcharges paid total: 52.62 USD

Fare Rules:
Additional charges may apply for changes in addition to any fare rules listed.

NONREF/0VALUAFTDPT/CHGFEE
Cancel reservations before the scheduled departure time or TICKET HAS NO VALUE.

Baggage allowance and charges for this itinerary.
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Baggage fees are per traveler

Origin and destination for checked baggage 1st bag 2nd bag Max wt / dim per piece
3/21/2016 New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia) to Cleveland, OH

(CLE)
25.00
USD

35.00
USD

50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in
(157.0cm)

MileagePlus Accrual Details

 
BARGE/MATTHEW
Date Flight From/To Award Miles PQM PQS PQD
3/21/2016 4247 New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia)-Cleveland, OH (CLE)
 

418 1 514

Important Information about MileagePlus Earning
Accruals vary based on the terms and conditions of the traveler’s frequent flyer program, the traveler’s
frequent flyer status and the itinerary selected. United MileagePlus® mileage accrual is subject to the rules of
the MileagePlus program
Once travel has started, accruals will no longer display. You can view your MileagePlus account for posted
accrual
You can earn up to 75,000 award miles per ticket. The 75,000 award miles cap may be applied to your posted
flight activity in an order different than shown
PQD are a Premier status requirement for members in the U.S. only.

Accrual is only displayed for MileagePlus members who choose to accrue to their MileagePlus account.
Additional Baggage Information

The above amounts represent an estimate of the first and second checked baggage
service charges that may apply to your itinerary.

If your itinerary contains multiple travelers, the service charges may vary by
traveler, depending on status or memberships.

Carry-on baggage information

United accepts one carry-on item with maximum dimensions of 9"x14"x22" (22 cm + 35 cm + 56 cm) in the
aircraft cabin, along with one personal item such as a laptop bag with maximum dimensions of 9"x10"x17" (22
cm + 25 cm + 43 cm).

Due to FAA regulations, operating carriers may have different carry-on requirements.

Please check with the operating carrier for more information or go to united.com.

General Baggage Information

First and second bag service charges do not apply to active-duty members of the U.S. military and their
accompanying dependents. For additional information regarding baggage charges

allowances, weight/size restrictions, exceptions or embargoes, or charges for overweight, oversized, excess,
odd-sized baggage, special items
or sporting equipment, visit united.com/baggage.

eTicket Reminders
Check-in Requirement - Bags must be checked and boarding passes obtained at least 30 minutes prior to
scheduled departure. Baggage will not be accepted and advance seat assignments may be cancelled if this
condition is not met.
EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Chicago, Cincinnati, Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth,
Denver, Fort Lauderdale, Honolulu, Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville, Kahului, Kona, Las Vegas, Los Angeles,
Maui, Miami, Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando, Philadelphia, Phoenix, Reno, San Francisco, San Juan,
PR, St. Louis, Seattle, Tampa or Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA), the check in requirement time for
Passengers and Bags is 45 minutes.
Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding
pass at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure.
Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding,
removal of checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation.
Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport.

The FAA now restricts carry on baggage to one bag pl s one personal item (p rse  briefcase  laptop
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The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop
computer, etc.) per passenger.

For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in
Spanish 1-800-426-5561.
If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to the
fare rules governing your ticket.
For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page.

Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare
rules above.

Customer Care Contact Information

We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.

You may contact us using our Customer Care form

Hazardous materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A
violation can result in five years imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).

Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons,
corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods

include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and
corrosive materials.

Additional information can be found on:

united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

Proud Member of Star Alliance
We are making connections so you make yours. You can earn and redeem miles on 28 member airlines
offering over 18,000 daily flights to more than 1,300 destinations worldwide.
Go to www.staralliance.com to find out more. You’ve earned it.

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States
(except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in
delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is
declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices).
For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items;
excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained
from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic portions of
the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per
passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the
domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that
customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was
to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in
connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged
baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within
21 days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of
United’s Contract of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability.
Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United’s Contract of
Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1.
Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and
baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including
time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the
carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and
refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including
schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United’s
Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter.
Passengers have the right, upon request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States,
to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage.
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the
fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the
ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the
rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for
changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum
and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has
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acquired a ticket in violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national,
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a
full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure within 24 hours of purchase.
Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes
prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and
boarding pass.
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate
destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties
known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may
apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty,
including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier in
respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of
passengers and baggage.
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat
will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no
one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in
exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny
boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from the air carrier,
persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding
locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries,
although other consumer protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © {0} United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the " reply " address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.2016
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Baggage allowance and charges for this itinerary.

Baggage fees are per traveler

Origin and destination for checked baggage 1st bag 2nd bag Max wt / dim per piece
3/1/2016 New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia) to Cleveland, OH

(CLE)
25.00
USD

35.00
USD

50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in
(157.0cm)

MileagePlus Accrual Details

 
BARGE/MATTHEWMR
Date Flight From/To Award Miles PQM PQS PQD
3/1/2016 3652 New York, NY (LGA - LaGuardia)-Cleveland, OH (CLE)
 

Important Information about MileagePlus Earning
Accruals vary based on the terms and conditions of the traveler’s frequent flyer program, the traveler’s
frequent flyer status and the itinerary selected. United MileagePlus® mileage accrual is subject to the rules of
the MileagePlus program
Once travel has started, accruals will no longer display. You can view your MileagePlus account for posted
accrual
You can earn up to 75,000 award miles per ticket. The 75,000 award miles cap may be applied to your posted
flight activity in an order different than shown
PQD are a Premier status requirement for members in the U.S. only.

Accrual is only displayed for MileagePlus members who choose to accrue to their MileagePlus account.
Additional Baggage Information

The above amounts represent an estimate of the first and second checked baggage
service charges that may apply to your itinerary.

If your itinerary contains multiple travelers, the service charges may vary by
traveler, depending on status or memberships.

Carry-on baggage information

United accepts one carry-on item with maximum dimensions of 9"x14"x22" (22 cm + 35 cm + 56 cm) in the
aircraft cabin, along with one personal item such as a laptop bag with maximum dimensions of 9"x10"x17" (22
cm + 25 cm + 43 cm).

Due to FAA regulations, operating carriers may have different carry-on requirements.

Please check with the operating carrier for more information or go to united.com.

General Baggage Information

First and second bag service charges do not apply to active-duty members of the U.S. military and their
accompanying dependents. For additional information regarding baggage charges

allowances, weight/size restrictions, exceptions or embargoes, or charges for overweight, oversized, excess,
odd-sized baggage, special items
or sporting equipment, visit united.com/baggage.
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eTicket Reminders
Check-in Requirement - Bags must be checked and boarding passes obtained at least 30 minutes prior to
scheduled departure. Baggage will not be accepted and advance seat assignments may be cancelled if this
condition is not met.
EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Chicago, Cincinnati, Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth,
Denver, Fort Lauderdale, Honolulu, Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville, Kahului, Kona, Las Vegas, Los Angeles,
Maui, Miami, Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando, Philadelphia, Phoenix, Reno, San Francisco, San Juan,
PR, St. Louis, Seattle, Tampa or Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA), the check in requirement time for
Passengers and Bags is 45 minutes.
Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding
pass at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure.
Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding,
removal of checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation.
Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport.

The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop
computer, etc.) per passenger.

For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in
Spanish 1-800-426-5561.
If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to the
fare rules governing your ticket.
For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page.

Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare
rules above.

Customer Care Contact Information

We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.

You may contact us using our Customer Care form

Hazardous materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A
violation can result in five years imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).

Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons,
corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods

include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and
corrosive materials.

Additional information can be found on:

united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

Proud Member of Star Alliance
We are making connections so you make yours. You can earn and redeem miles on 28 member airlines
offering over 18,000 daily flights to more than 1,300 destinations worldwide.
Go to www.staralliance.com to find out more. You’ve earned it.

IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States
(except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in
delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is
declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices).
For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items;
excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained
from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic portions of
the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per
passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the
domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that
customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was
to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in
connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged
baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within
21 days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of
United’s Contract of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability.
Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United’s Contract of
Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1.
Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and
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baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including
time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the
carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and
refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including
schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United’s
Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter.
Passengers have the right, upon request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States,
to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage.
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the
fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the
ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the
rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for
changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum
and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has
acquired a ticket in violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national,
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a
full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure within 24 hours of purchase.
Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes
prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and
boarding pass.
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate
destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties
known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may
apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty,
including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier in
respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of
passengers and baggage.
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat
will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no
one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in
exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny
boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from the air carrier,
persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding
locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries,
although other consumer protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © {0} United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the " reply " address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.2016



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Matthew Barge
Police Assessment Resource Cen

Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 247868
Guest Number  
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

21-MAR-16 22:29
24-MAR-16 10:00
1

Tax ID :
The Westin Cleveland  24-MAR-16  10:10  HAIRSTO
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
21-MAR-16 RT824 Room Charge 125.00
21-MAR-16 RT824 State Sales Tax 10.00
21-MAR-16 RT824 City Tax 3.75
21-MAR-16 RT824 County Tax 6.88
22-MAR-16 RT824 Room Charge 125.00
22-MAR-16 RT824 State Sales Tax 10.00
22-MAR-16 RT824 City Tax 3.75
22-MAR-16 RT824 County Tax 6.88
23-MAR-16 RT824 Room Charge 125.00
23-MAR-16 RT824 State Sales Tax 10.00
23-MAR-16 RT824 City Tax 3.75
23-MAR-16 RT824 County Tax 6.88
24-MAR-16 -436.89

Date        Code         Authorized DCC

** Total  436.89 -436.89
Continued on the next page



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Matthew Barge
Police Assessment Resource Cen

Page Number  : 2 Invoice Nbr  : 247868
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

21-MAR-16 22:29
24-MAR-16 10:00
1

*** Balance     0.00

KIDS EAT WELL AT WESTIN - Discover kids' meals that are as delicious as they are nutritious with the Westin Eat Well Menu for Kids, developed with Sup
erchefs(TM) to make kids and parents happy. Learn more at westin.com/eatwell 

As a Starwood Preferred Guest, you could have earned 783 Starpoints for this visit. Please provide your member number or enroll today.

Tell us about your stay. www.westin.com/reviews 

Signature_____________________





























BRIAN D. CENTER 
 

TO:  Matthew Barge 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 
 
FROM: Brian Center 
 
DATE:  March 6, 2016 

 
FEBRUARY 2016 INVOICE 

 
BILLABLE HOURS 

 
Date Activity Hours 
3-2-16 Prep. for meetings in Cleveland, including review of 

materials such as monitoring plan, consent decree, 
CPC materials 

2.0 

3-3 All day meetings with community members, CPC, 
MT 

8.0 (*1.75 pro 
bono) 

3-4 All day meetings with CPC members, CPD 
members, MT 

8.0 (*1.75 pro 
bono) 

3-5 All day MT meeting in Cleveland 8.0 (*1.75 pro 
bono) 

3-9 Help draft description of community engagement for 
community; develop strategy for community 
engagement 

1.0 

3-11 Tc with MT re community engagement strategy 1.5 
3-18 Tcs with MT re community engagement strategy 1.0 
3-25 Tc with MT re status of activity, strategy 0.5 
3-27 Begin outline of report re status of community 

policing efforts of CPD 
0.3 

 Total Hours Worked 30.3 
Total Billed Hours 16.25 
              Rate: $200/hour; $1250 per day on site  
TOTAL BILLED $3,250.00 
Pro Bono Hours 14.05 

   
 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
 

Date Expense Amount 
Per Diem $69 (3 days) $207 
Transportation   
3-5-16 Airport Parking $71.99 
3-2-16 Airfare (Delta and AA) $493.20 
3-3 Cab $42.60 



3-3 Cab $20.77 
3-5 Cab $41.27 
Accommodations   
3-5-16 Hotel $436.88 
 TOTAL $1,313.71 

 
 































Uber Support
Contact us with questions about your trip.
Leave something behind? Track it down.





Uber Support
Contact us with questions about your trip.
Leave something behind? Track it down.





Uber Support
Contact us with questions about your trip.
Leave something behind? Track it down.





Accruals vary based on the terms and conditions of the traveler’s frequent flyer program, the traveler’s 
frequent flyer status and the itinerary selected. United MileagePlus® mileage accrual is subject to the rules of 
the MileagePlus program 
Once travel has started, accruals will no longer display. You can view your MileagePlus account for posted 
accrual 
You can earn up to 75,000 award miles per ticket. The 75,000 award miles cap may be applied to your posted 
flight activity in an order different than shown 
PQD are a Premier status requirement for members in the U.S. only. 
Accrual is only displayed for MileagePlus members who choose to accrue to their MileagePlus account. 

Additional Baggage Information
The above amounts represent an estimate of the first and second checked baggage service charges 
that may apply to your itinerary.
If your itinerary contains multiple travelers, the service charges may vary by traveler, depending 
on status or memberships.
Carry-on baggage information
United accepts one carry-on item with maximum dimensions of 9"x14"x22" (22 cm + 35 cm + 56 cm) in the 
aircraft cabin, along with one personal item such as a laptop bag with maximum dimensions of 9"x10"x17" (22 
cm + 25 cm + 43 cm).
Due to FAA regulations, operating carriers may have different carry-on requirements.
Please check with the operating carrier for more information or go to united.com.
General Baggage Information
First and second bag service charges do not apply to active-duty members of the U.S. military and their 
accompanying dependents. For additional information regarding baggage charges 
allowances, weight/size restrictions, exceptions or embargoes, or charges for overweight, oversized, excess, 
odd-sized baggage, special items 
or sporting equipment, visit united.com/baggage.

eTicket Reminders
Check-in Requirement - Bags must be checked and boarding passes obtained at least 30 minutes prior to 
scheduled departure. Baggage will not be accepted and advance seat assignments may be cancelled if this 
condition is not met. 
EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Chicago, Cincinnati, Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth, 
Denver, Fort Lauderdale, Honolulu, Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville, Kahului, Kona, Las Vegas, Los Angeles, 
Maui, Miami, Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando, Philadelphia, Phoenix, Reno, San Francisco, San Juan, 
PR, St. Louis, Seattle, Tampa or Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA), the check in requirement time for 
Passengers and Bags is 45 minutes. 
Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding 
pass at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure. 
Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding, 
removal of checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation. 
Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport. 
The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop computer, 
etc.) per passenger. 
For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in 
Spanish 1-800-426-5561. 
If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to the 
fare rules governing your ticket. 
For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page. 
Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare 
rules above. 

Customer Care Contact Information
We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.
You may contact us using our Customer Care form 

Hazardous materials
Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A 
violation can result in five years' imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).
Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers, poisons, 
corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods
include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach and 
corrosive materials. 
Additional information can be found on:
united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

Proud Member of Star Alliance
We are making connections so you make yours. You can earn and redeem miles on 28 member airlines 
offering over 18,000 daily flights to more than 1,300 destinations worldwide. 

Page 2 of 4eTicket Itinerary and Receipt
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Go to www.staralliance.com to find out more. You’ve earned it. 
IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES 

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the United States 
(except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss of, damage to, or delay in 
delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per ticketed customer unless a higher value is 
declared in advance and additional charges are paid (not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices). 
For such travel, United assumes no liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items; 
excess valuation may not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained 
from the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic portions of 
the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked baggage, and 400 USD per 
passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed by the Montreal Convention (including the 
domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is 1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or 
unchecked. For baggage lost, delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that 
customers provide preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was 
to be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or delayed in 
connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of international journeys), the Montreal 
Convention and United require customers to provide carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged 
baggage, within seven days from the date of receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within 
21 days from the date the baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of 
United’s Contract of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability. 
Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of United’s Contract of 
Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms may include, but are not limited to: 1. 
Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and 
baggage, including high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including 
time periods within which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the 
carrier to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times, and 
refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including 
schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and rerouting. The full text of United’s 
Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may request a copy at any United ticket counter. 
Passengers have the right, upon request at any location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States, 
to receive free of charge by mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage. 
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules applicable to the 
fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following may apply to your travel: (1) the 
ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for another restricted fare ticket meeting all the 
rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for 
changing/canceling reservations; or (3) travel may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum 
and/or maximum stay may be required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has 
acquired a ticket in violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national, 
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you are entitled to a 
full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure within 24 hours of purchase. 
Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 15 minutes 
prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30 
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time 
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit 
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive 
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these 
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the 
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of 
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and 
boarding pass. 
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate 
destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties 
known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may 
apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty, 
including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier in 
respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of 
passengers and baggage. 
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat 
will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no 
one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in 
exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny 
boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including 
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from the air carrier, 
persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of 
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding 
locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries, 
although other consumer protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.
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Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © 2016 United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the "reply" address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.
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03/04/16 TELECOMM BASEHSIA 0.00

03/04/16 ROOM 1080, 1 125.00

03/04/16 ROOM TAX 1080, 1 10.00

03/04/16 CITY TAX 1080, 1 3.75

03/04/16 CNTY TAX 1080, 1 6.88

03/05/16 TELECOMM BASEHSIA 0.00

03/05/16 ROOM 1080, 1 125.00

03/05/16 ROOM TAX 1080, 1 10.00

03/05/16 CITY TAX 1080, 1 3.75

03/05/16 CNTY TAX 1080, 1 6.88

03/06/16 582.52

Total balance 0.00 USD

Was that the best night's sleep you've ever had? How about a repeat performance at your place!

Important Information

Do Not Reply to this Email
This email is an auto-generated message. Replies to automated messages are not monitored. If you 
have any questions please contact the hotel directly at (216) 696-5600. 

Why Have I Received this Email?
You received this email because you subscribed to eFolio, a feature enabling you to receive an 
electronic version of your hotel bill by email after every stay. Modify your email preferences >>

Availability
Electronic versions of your hotel bill, available by email from our over 2,300 participating properties 
in the Marriott family of hotels in the USA and Canada, are emailed to you within 72 hours of check-
out. These email messages reflect changes made to your bill up to 11pm on your day of departure. 
Any adjustments after that time may not be shown. 

If you have received this email in error, please notify us. 

Learn more about eFolio, receiving your hotel bills by email. 

Authenticity of Bills
Marriott retains official records of all charges and credits to your account and will honor only those 
records. 

Privacy
Your privacy is important to Marriott. For full details of our privacy policy, please visit our Privacy 
Statement. 

Credit of Ritz-Carlton Rewards Points
After a stay, it may take up to 7 days for Ritz-Carlton Rewards points to be credited to your 
account. 
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Terms of Use::Privacy Statement(c)1996-2012 Marriott International, Inc. All rights reserved. Marriott proprietary information. 
Operated by Aimbridge Hospitality under license from Marriott International, Inc. or one of its affiliates. 
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Randolph Dupont 
 

TO:  Matthew Barge, Monitor, Police Assessment Resource Center 
FROM: Randolph Dupont 
DATE:  April 6, 2016 

March 2016 Invoice 
Billable Hours 

Date Activity Hours 

03-01-16 Public Survey Review, Meeting Scheduling/Preparation   1.2 
03-02-16 Review of Progress/Policy Documents, Use of Force Discussion, 

ADAMHS Public Meeting Review, Phone conf. on Public 
Meeting Agenda, Review for Meetings, Trip Planning 

  6.5 

03-03-16 Review of Documents for Cleveland Trip, Discussion of Policy 
Subcommittee Issues, Policy Subcommittee Phone Meeting  

  4.9 

03-04-16 CIT Outcomes Meeting, Cleveland Media Reports Review, 
Review of Public Meeting Material, CPD Dispatch Policy 

  4.3 

03-05-16 On-Site Monitor Team Meeting, On-site CPD night Field 
Meetings: District 5, Review of MHRAC CIT Report/Timetable  

11.8 

03-06-16 On-Site Community Meetings, Meeting Scheduling   2.0 
03-07-16 On-Site MHRAC Community Engagement meeting, CPD 

Compliance and Public Safety Meetings, Discussion of Progress 
  4.5 

03-08-16 Review of MHRAC Work Plan, Phone Conference re: MHRAC 
Work Plan, CIT Work Group Information Sharing 

  3.0 

03-09-16 CPD Officer On-line Survey: Review and Feedback, Discussion 
of MHRAC key planning document: Work Plan 

  4.8 

03-10-16 CPD Officer On-line Survey Discussion, Review of ADAMHS 
activities, phone conference: key elements - MHRAC Work Plan 

  2.7 

03-13-16 Discussion of MHRAC Public Meetings, ADAMHS Monthly 
Meetings, review of correspondence related to both topics 

  1.2 

03-15-16 Correspondence related to CPD Crisis Training Hours, CPD 
Officer Survey discussion, Review of Mental Health Initiatives 

  1.8 

03-17-16 ADAMHS Monthly Meeting: f/u discussion, Feedback: MHRAC 
Public Meetings, Phone Conf. - Crisis Training/Consent Decree 

  3.0 

03-21-16 Monitoring Team Duties discussion, Cleveland Social Services 
information, Correspondence re: MHRAC Work Plan revision 

  1.1 

03-24-16 Conference call: MHRAC Work Plan revision, Policy Subcmte 
Information, Information on Mental Health activities - Cleveland. 

  2.1 

03-28-16  Monitoring Team Meeting, Phone Conf. on Crisis Training   1.7 
03-30-16 Phone Conf-MHRAC Work Plan, Review: Crisis Training Issues   1.5 
 Total Hours Worked 58.1 
 Total Billed Hours 31.6 

              Rate: $250/hour  
TOTAL BILLED $7900.00 
Pro Bono Hours  26.5 

  Travel Time (not billed)                                           11.5 













































prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at least 30
minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by United in this Notice are minimum time
requirements. Customer and baggage processing times may differ from airport to airport. Please visit
united.com for information regarding airport-specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive
at the airport with enough time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these
minimum time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and the
departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could result in the loss of
your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already checked in or have a confirmed seat and
boarding pass.
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving an ultimate
destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that international treaties
known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw Convention, including its amendments, may
apply to the entire journey, including any portion thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty,
including contracts of carriage embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier i
respect of death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for delay of
passengers and baggage.
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight chance that a seat
will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no
one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in
exchange for compensation of the airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny
boarding to other persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from the air carrier,
persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The complete rules for the payment of
compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are available at all airport ticket counters and boarding
locations. Some airlines do not apply these consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries,
although other consumer protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © {0} United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Please do not reply to this message using the " reply " address.
For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail 2016







INVOICE 

From: Ayesha Bell Hardaway To:  Police Assessment Resource Center 
              
           

Billable Hours and Expenses for March 2016 

DATE DESCRIPTION   HOURS 

3/1/16 Meeting with B. Griffin 1.3 
3/1/16 Telephone Conference with C. Boise .8 
3/2/16 Meeting with K. Clegg 1.0 
3/2/16 Meeting at CPD 1.5 
3/3/16 Community Engagement Team Meeting 1.4 
3/3/16 Attend CPC PRB Work Group Meeting 1.5 
3/3/16 Meeting with Y. Conner 1.0 
3/4/16 Meeting with B. Heffernan and P. Chism 1.0 
3/4/16 Stakeholder Meeting at 3rd District 1.3 
3/4/16 Meeting with L. Fisher 1.0 
3/4/16 Meeting with D. Hill – 5th District 1.5 
3/4/16 Meeting with R. Williams 1.4 
3/5/16 Monitoring Team Meeting 8.0 
3/7/16 Participated in Ride-along with Sgt. Higgins 3.1 
3/8/16 Meeting with OPS Investigators 1.0 
3/8/16 Revise Community Engagement Document .4 
3/9/16 Attend CPC Town Hall Meeting 1.5 
3/11/16 Community Engagement Team Meeting 2.4 
3/12/16 Participate in Greater Cleveland Caucus Town Hall Meeting 1.5 
3/13/16 Review proposed CPD body camera policy and draft community 

survey 
1.8 

3/14/16 Participate in Team Conference call re: draft OPS Manual .8 
3/16/16 Conference call and email correspondence re: body camera survey .6 
3/16/16 Draft memorandum re: OPS/PRB Manual 4.3 
3/18/16 Email and telephone correspondence re: surveys .8 
3/18/16 Community Engagement Team Meeting 1.4 
3/18/16 Conference Call with M. Barge and DOJ 1.9 
3/18/16 Monitoring Team Conference Call .8 
3/19/16 Presentation to Mayor’s 110 1.2 



3/19/16 Conference Call with B. Griffin .2 
3/22/16 Attend Monthly Stakeholder Meeting 2.0 
3/22/16 Meeting re: CPC 1.0 
3/23/16 Community Engagement Conference Call 1.5 
3/25/16 Monitoring Team Conference Call .8 
3/27/16 Email correspondence re: CPD Mission Statement .5 
3/28/16 Conference call w/ Parties and OPS re: OPS Manual .6 
3/28/16 Conference call w/ M. Barge and R. Williams 1.0 
3/29/16 Conference calls re: potential grant application .9 
3/30/16 Community Police Commission Meeting 3.0 
3/31/16 Email Correspondence and Phone Call re: CPD Mission Statement .8 

Total Hours Worked          58.5 

    22.3 
 10.7 

Pro Bono Hours    
Travel Hours       
Total Hours Billed   (36.2)     x   Rate $250.00/hour  $9,050.00 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
3/1/16 Parking 6.25 
3/12/16 Parking 10.00 
3/22/16 Parking 9.00 
Total Expense Amount Due (Transportation) $25.25 







TRAVEL/LODGING EXPENSES 

Date 
3/3-3/6/2016 

Expense 
American Airline Flight to Cleveland (R/T) 

Amount 
269.70 

3/3-3/6/2016 Marriott Key Center 436.89 

TOTAL REIMBUSEEXPENSES: $706.59 
   PER DIEM EXPENSES 

3/3-3/6/2016 @$69.00 per day 207.00 

         TOTAL PER DIEM $207.00 

TOTAL INVOICED: $3413.59 



Fwd: E'Ticket Confirmation'PZYRMH 03MAR

Airfare receipt.

From: "American Airlines@aa.com" <notify@aa.globalnotifications.com>
To: 
Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2016 6:54:04 PM
Subject: E-Ticket Confirmation-PZYRMH  03MAR

The message has no text content.

Ticket Issued: Feb 2, 2016

Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your
trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at  www.aa.com/options.   For
information regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please
visit www.aa.com/baggageinfo.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit
www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA
Self-Service machine. 

Fri 4/1/2016 1:55 PM



Carrier Flight # Departing Arriving Fare Code

American
4891

CHARLOTTESVILLE 
THU 03MAR
5:40 AM

PHILADELPHIA 

6:59 AM
O

OPERATED BY PIEDMONT AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 5D Economy  

American
4045

PHILADELPHIA 
THU 03MAR
9:29 AM

CLEVELAND 

11:02 AM
O

OPERATED BY AIR WISCONSIN AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.

Record
Locator PZYRMH



Timothy Longo Seat 1D Economy  

American
5133

CLEVELAND 
SUN 06MAR
6:55 AM

CHARLOTTE 

8:41 AM
Q

OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 9D Economy  

American
5152

CHARLOTTE 
SUN 06MAR
9:19 AM

CHARLOTTESVILLE 

10:22 AM
Q

OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

Timothy Longo Seat 10D Economy  

Ticket Total

  59.47 269.70

Baggage Information

Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -CHOCLE-No free checked bags/ American Airlines BAG
ALLOWANCE -CLECHO-No free checked bags/ American Airlines 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG
AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR
IN/158 LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD35.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM
2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD35.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM ADDITIONAL
ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCOUNTS MAY APPLY 

You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The itinerary must be canceled before the ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the ticket
has no value. If the fare allows changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply.

One or more of your flights is a Codeshare flight and is operated by a Partner Airline. If your journey begins with a flight operated by one of American's Partner
Airlines, then please check-in with the Partner Airline for that portion of your journey. Upon check-in, they will check your luggage to its final destination and
provide boarding passes for your connecting flights, if applicable.

Some everyday products, like e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked
baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may result in
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage like:



Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries for most
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette lighters
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on-board
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage entirely.
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please visit www.aa.com/airportexpectations.

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be ticketed
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on file with
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are not
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, and
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the air
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rights of
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the right
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free of
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of each air
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message contains
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or otherwise
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distribute, or take action in reliance upon this
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from your
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 5666355823480217534624300





FROM: Meg Olsen – Monitoring Team Coordinator  
 
TO:  Matthew Barge, Monitor, Police Assessment Resource Center 
DATE:  April 1, 2016 
 

 
March 2016 Invoice 

Reimbursable Expenses – Cleveland Project 
 
 

Date   #     Expense  Amount 
 
03-04-16 
03-04-16 
03-04-16 
03-04-16 
03-06-16 
03-06-16                

 
#1    Airfare: Nashville to Cleveland, round-trip    $163.96 
#2    Taxi Airport to Marriott Hotel                          $35.50 
#3    Uber Third District to Marriott                           $5.61 
#4    Uber Marriott Ave to Monitor Office                 $5.66 
#5    Taxi Marriott to Airport                                    $34.31 
#6    Marriott Hotel – 03/03- 03/06 (3 nights)        $436.89 
                                                                                        total        

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
$681.93 

    
 Total Reimbursable Expenses         

 
 $681.93 
 

 

















Policing Project
NYU School of Law

40Washington Square South
New York, NY 10012

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC) Invoice Date: April 5, 2016
Attention: Matthew Barge

March 2016 Invoice

Policing Project Staff Hours

Date Biller Description of Work Performed Time
3/5/2016 MP Attended Monitor All-­‐TeamMeeting 8.5
3/5/2016 BF Review of material on Bias Free Policing policy 0.5
3/5/2016 BF Analysis of issues in Bias Free Policing policy 0.7
3/5/2016 BF Communication with externs and team on

research issues
0.5

3/5/2016 BF Editing of CPD policy on Bias Free Policing 0.5
3/5/2016 BF Drafting of memo on CPD policy on Bias Free

Policing
0.5

3/5/2016 BF Editing of memo on CPD policy resources on
Bias Free Policing

0.5

3/6/2016 MP Reviewed PP materials to submit to CPC 0.7
3/14/2016 MP Reviewed BWC policy, started draft executive

summary
1.4

3/15/2016 MP Prepared Draft Executive Summary re: BWCs 5.5
3/16/2016 MP Revised Executive Summary re: BWCs 0.5
3/16/2016 MP Reviewed draft of BWC survey, suggested edits,

finalized in Qualtrics
0.5

3/18/2016 MP Weekly community engagement call 1
3/23/2016 MP Call w/Victor to discuss community

engagement plan
1.2

3/23/2016 MP Prepared sketch of engagement plan for team to
review

1.5

3/23/2016 MP Call with community engagement team to
discuss milestone engagement process

1.7

3/24/2016 MP Call w/Victor and Tim to discuss community
engagement plan

0.5

3/24/2016 MP Met w/externs to get them working on
community engagement plan

1.3

3/24/2016 MP Reviewed community engagement plan,
prepped for call

0.3



Policing Project Extern Hours

Date Biller Description of work performed Time
3/2/2016 Nonny O. Prepare Cleveland Materials with Maria 4
3/3/2016 Nonny O. Review Decree materials; review monitoring

team bios
2

3/4/2016 Nonny O. Cleveland Monitoring TeamMeetings 12
3/5/2016 Nonny O. Cleveland Monitoring TeamMeetings 12
3/5/2016 Claire G. Bias-­‐Free Policing Recommendations for

Cleveland
3.75

3/5/2016 Katrina F. Bias-­‐Free Policing Recommendations Research 6
3/5/2016 David C. Working on Cleveland Memo 1
3/23/2016 Nonny O. Cleveland call with MP and Victor re: day to

day plan
1

3/24/2016 Nonny O. Cleveland Community Engagement phone call 1.5
3/24/2016 Nonny O. Meeting with MP and Team Cleveland to

discuss day to day plan; work on day to day
plan with David and Claire

2.25

3/24/2016 Claire G. Prep for phone meeting with Cleveland CDM
Team

.25

3/24/2016 Claire G. Phone meeting with Cleveland CDM Team .5
3/24/2016 David C. Phone call with Cleveland Community

Engagement Team
.5

3/24/2016 Claire G. Meeting with Maria, David and Nonny re:
Cleveland

.75

3/24/2016 Claire G. Meeting with David and Nonny re: Cleveland
engagement plan drafting

1.5

3/24/2016 David C. Meeting/work to discuss Cleveland
Community Engagement plan

2

3/24/2016 Nonny O. Discuss engagement plan with Team
Cleveland, edit plan

.5

3/26/2016 Claire G. Meeting with David to draft community
engagement plan and accompanying materials

3.5

3/26/2016 David C. Work on Cleveland Community Engagement
Plan

3.5

3/29/2016 Claire G. Cleveland Bias-­‐Free Policing Report— 1

3/24/2016 BF Review of draft community engagement plan 0.3
3/24/2016 CD Loading Qualtrics survey 0.5
3/28/2016 MP Reviewed and finalized draft of community

engagement plan
2

Total Hours: 30.6
Total Hours Billed (Rate: $250/hour): 8
Total Billed: $2,000
Pro Bono Hours: 22.6



Feedback Project
3/30/2016 David C. Work on research for Cleveland Bias-­‐Free

policing issue
2

3/30/2016 David C. Research/memo for Cleveland bias free
policing issue

2

3/30/2016 Katrina F. Cleveland Bias-­‐Free Policing
Recommendations

2

3/31/2016 Katrina F. Cleveland Bias-­‐Free Policing
Recommendations

1

3/31/2016 Claire G. Cleveland Bias-­‐Free Policing Report—
Feedback Project

4.5

Total hours (all Pro Bono): 71





 

 

Nonny Onyekweli
Policing Project
NYU School of Law

40Washington Square South
New York, NY 10012

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC) Invoice Date: April 5, 2016
Attention: Matthew Barge

March 2016 Invoice

Expenses

Date Biller Description of Expense Cost
3/3/2016 NO Uber from home to Newark Airport $47.80
3/3/2016 NO Round trip flight to Cleveland $859.20
3/5/2016 NO Uber trip from Cleveland Airport to Hotel $15.48
3/5/2016 NO Taxi home from Newark Airport $95.50
Total: $1,017.98





















































3/30/2016 Team call 0.5 Phone Call 

Total Hours Worked 39.75
Total Billed Hours 27.75

 Rate: $000/hour $250 

TOTAL BILLED $6,937.50

Pro Bono Hours 12 

Travel Hours 4 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount REF 

Transportation $0 

Accommodations    $0 

Per Diem (1 day)      $0 

TOTAL EXPENSES $0 













ELLEN SCRIVNER, Ph.D., ABPP 

TO: Matthew Barge 
Meg Olsen 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Ellen Scrivner 

DATE: March 31, 2016 

MARCH 2016 INVOICE 
             BILLABLE HOURS 

_______________________________________________________________ 
DATE  ACTIVITY HOURS 
_______________________________________________________________
3-2-16 Arrival in Cleveland           0.0 
_______________________________________ 
3-3-16 Meeting with CPC Internal Meeting/Work Groups/Selected 

Individual Members including Co-chair. 6.0 

3-4-16 Meeting with CDP Compliance Bureau Staff;  8.0 
All Team Meeting with Division,City/DOJ; CPC 
Meeting with CPC Member; Introduction to First District 
Meeting; Crisis Intervention Meeting. 

3-4-16 Dinner Meeting (Pro Bono). 2.0 

3-5-16 All-Team Internal Meeting; Mission Statement;  8.0 
Use of Force Policies; Training; Recruitment & Hiring; Team 
Work Flow and Logistics/Slack; Crisis Intervention; 
Accountability; Equipment & Resources; Staffing/Relationship 
to Community & Problem Oriented Policing Model; Body Worn 
Cameras & Bias Free Policing; Complex of Strategic Issues; 
Monitoring Team Community Survey/Baseline Assessments; 
Semi-Annual Monitoring Report; Community Engagement- 
America Speaks. 

3-6-16 Depart Cleveland       0.0 
____________________________________________________________ 





















Sean M. Smoot 

TO: Matthew Barge 
PARC – CLE Monitor 

FROM: Sean M. Smoot 

DATE:  April 14, 2016 

MARCH 2016 INVOICE  
REVISED & RESUBMITTED 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 
3-3-16 TRAVEL (Springfield-Chicago-Cleveland) 5.0 

Meetings w/ monitor team members and FOP #8 
Membership 

6.0 

3-4-16 All Stakeholder Meeting 2.25 
CPD Policy Team Meeting 1.25 
Police Practices Meeting 1.5 
City Legal/Labor Counsel Meeting 1.75 
Meeting with Monitor 0.75 
CIT Working Group Meeting 1.5 
All Team Working Dinner 3.5 

3-5-16 All Team Meeting 7.5 
TRAVEL (Cleveland-Chicago-Springfield) 5.0 

3-7-16 Review CPD Use of Force Docs 0.5 
3-8-16 DOJ Conf. Call 1.0 
3-11-16 CPPA Conf. Call 1.0 
3-14-16 Review and comment COD Recruiting Plan 1.0 
3-15-16 CPD Use Of Force Mtg. (by CC) 1.0 
3-16-16 CPPA Atty. Conf. Call 0.5 
3-17-16 Monitor Conf. Call .75 

Review Revised Use of Force Docs 0.5 
3-18-16 RNC Sub-Group Conf. Call 1.0 

DOJ Conf. Call 1.5 
All Team Conf. Call 0.5 

Total Hours Worked (non-travel) 31.25 
Total Billed Hours 20 
              Rate: $250/hour 

TOTAL HOURS BILLED $5,000 



   
 Pro Bono Hours 11.25 
 TRAVEL Hours 10 
   
 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
 

Date Expense Amount 
3/3-5/16 Airfare (R/T – Chicago MDW – CLE) $219.96 
 Marriott Hotel (Lodging 3/3-3/5) $291.26 
 Mileage (R/T - SPI-MDW 403miles/.54) $217.62 
3/4/16 Per Diem $ 69.00 
3/3/16 Uber Ride (CLE – Downtown Cleveland) $ 52.48 
 Uber Ride (Downtown Cleveland) $17.33 
3/4/16 Uber Ride (Downtown Cleveland) $27.11 
3/5/16 Parking MDW $78.00 
   
TOTALS   
 Airfare $ 219.96 
 Lodging $ 291.26 
 Parking $  78.00 
 Ground Trans/Car Rental $ 314.54 
 M&E Per Diem $  69.00 
   
TOTAL  SUBMITTED FOR REIMBURSEMENT $ 972.76 
   
   
TOTAL HOURS + EXPENSES $5,972.76 
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Matthew Barge Invoice # 16-003

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC)

Date Service Hrs.

03/01/16 Meeting w/Neighborhood Connections 1.8
03/01/16 Meeting w/ President Council 1
03/04/16 All Team Meeting City/DOJ 1.5
03/04/16 Meeting w/Dr. Rhonda 1.6
03/04/16 Community Survey RFP proposal review 1.25
03/04/16 Fourth District Site Visit 2.1
03/05/16 Full Monitoring Team Meeting 8
03/07/16 Community Survey RFP proposal review 0.5
03/10/16 Community Survey Firm Selection Meeting 0.5
03/10/16 100 Black Men Presentation 1
03/11/16 Community Outreach Strategy Meeting 2
03/12/16 Greater Cleveland Caucus 4
03/13/16 Reformat Contact List & Add New Contacts for Constant Contact 1.5
03/14/16 Create Groups in Constant Contact 1
03/15/16 Create & Send Intro Email in Constant Contact 0.5
03/16/16 Modify Links & Send Second Letter in Constant Contact 0.25
03/18/16 Community Outreach Team Meeting 1.5
03/18/16 All Team Conference Call 0.75
03/19/16 Cleveland Youth Leadership Presentation 1
03/23/16 Community Outreach Team Meeting 1.25
03/24/16 Comm. Forum Planning 0.5
03/24/16 Meeting w/Society for Non-Violent Change 2
03/26/16 Cleveland Youth Congress 2.5

Total Hours Worked (excluding travel) 38

Pro Bono Work Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $6,500.00 26

Pro Bono Travel Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $1,300.00 5.2

Pro Bono Mileage Rate: 0.54 /mile $48.60

Total Billed Rate: $250.00 /hour $3,000.00 12.00

MARCH 2016 EXPENSES

SUMMARY OF HOURS WORKED

April 2, 2016

2016 4 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE



page 2 of 2

Date Reimbursable Expense REF

Transportation

03/01/16 Parking for Presidents Council Meeting 1
03/04/16 Parking for Dr. Rhonda Meeting (CPC) 2 $6.00
03/12/16 Parking for Greater Cleveland Caucus 3 $10.00
03/26/16 Parking for Cleveland Youth Congress 4

Total Transportation

Accommodations

None this month

Total Accommodations

Per Diem

None this month

Total Per Diem

Total Billed Reimbursable Expenses

Pro Bono Contributions $7,848.60
Billed Hours $3,000.00
Billed Reimbursable Exp $34.75
Total Amount Due $3,034.75

$34.75

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$12.75

$6.00

Amount Paid

$34.75

SUMMARY OF REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

2016 4 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE






