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T A G       
The Aden Group, LLC. 

8022 Fairfax Road   
Alexandria, VA 22308 
(571) 274-7821
www.theadengroup.com

By email 

July 22, 2021 (Revised July 27, 2021) 

Michelle Heyer 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 

Tim Mygatt 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 

Barbara A. Langhenry 
Gary Singletary 
Sharon Dumas 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 

RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team — June 2021 Invoice 

I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 

The Team’s invoice for services rendered in June 2021 was $64,188.08 The bill accounts for 388.5 
hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from June 1, 2021 through June 30, 
2021.  Of this time 56.7 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of Cleveland.  
The Team’s billing of over 19 percent of its time for June 2021 as pro bono time saved $14,175.00. 
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Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total, five-year budget cap of $4.95 million to which the City, 
Department of Justice, and Court agreed in October 2015. The budget for year six is $794,000.00, 
which the monitoring team invoicing is well within. 
 
**All work in June was conducted remotely due to COVID-19 precautions and all local meetings 
contemplated to be in-person, were suspended and replaced by teleconference or 
videoconference. 
 
Activities, work, and tasks conducted during May 2021 included but were not limited to: 
 

• Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing 
training addressing:   (Audits were suspended) 

 

o Force Review Board; 

o Crisis intervention; 

o Bias-Free policing; and 

o Supervision. 
 

• Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and drafting of new policies, processes, 
procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to: 

o Supervisory response to use of force incidents; 

o Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command; 

o Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”); 

o Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs (“IA”); 

o Chain of command misconduct review process; 

o Discipline process and discipline matrix; and 

o Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”). 

o Officer Intervention Program (OIP) 
 

• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding 
implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to: 

o Crisis intervention; 

o Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”); 
o District Policing Committees (“DPC”s); 

o Staffing; 



3 

o Recruitment and hiring; and 
 

• Ongoing meetings and discussions with the CPC regarding proposed meetings and ways 
to better collaborate on deliverables. 

• Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system and drafting several memorandums 
regarding probationary officers, Brady/Giglio issues of concern as well other identified 
matters regarding discipline; 

• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and 
Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting 
regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and functions; 

• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome 
measurements; 

• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”), 
including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian complaint 
investigations; 

• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and 
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and development; 
provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB Manual, and 
regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and 

• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer organizations, 
and community organizations. 

• Ongoing Use of Force outcome assessment, including reconciliation meetings and updates 
to assessors and the monitor. 

• Ongoing project management and coordination for deliverables (internal and with the City 
and DOJ) 

• Ongoing development and discussions of the consent decree timeline for the Court.   
• Ongoing discussions regarding training and methods of delivery during Covid-19 

limitations. 
• Significant drafting assignments regarding the 9th Semiannual Report (focusing on the 

May-June response to 2020 protests) 
• Project management and planning for the next monitoring period and anticipated costs, 

resources and personnel needed to achieve the Court’s Consent Decree mandates.  Planning 
for monthly status conferences with the Court to address specific topic areas on a monthly 
basis. 

• Project management regarding priorities in the upcoming year. 
• Coordination with the United Way and the NAACP regarding the monthly public sessions 

on key areas of the Consent Decree 
• Correspondence with the Court regarding a change in frequency for Court hearings and 

logistics for Public Hearings to keep the public informed of the progress of the Consent 
Decree. 
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• Preparation for and coordination for hearings with the Court and the May “Virtual Site
Visit” for the Monitoring Team and the parties to replicate the efficiency of site visits that
were conducted in person prior to Covid 19.

• Preparation meetings for the launch of the June 2021 OPS assessment.

II. INVOICE SUMMARY

June 2021 

Billable Hours $63,525.00 

Overhead/Expenses $663.08 

TOTAL $64,188.08 

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

Total Billed 
Hours 

Pro Bono 
Hours Total Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 74 62.50 11.50 $15,625.00 $633.74 

Modupe Akinola 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 0.90 0.50 0.40 $125.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 9.90 6.80 3.10 $1,700.00 $0.00 

Randy Dupont 16.30 12.20 4.10 $3,050.00 $0.00 

Lisa Fink 28.30 21.70 6.60 $5,425.00 $0.00 

Ayesha Hardaway 6.20 6.20 0 $1,550.00 $0.00 

Brian Maxey 25.40 23.40 2.00 $5,850.00 $0.00 

Hours
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Megan McDonough 10.30 8.30 2.00 $2,075.00 $0.00 

Rick Myers 30.80 23.70 7.10 $5,925.00 $0.00 

Charles Ramsey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 23.20 20.70 2.50 $5,175.00 $29.34 

Victor Ruiz 6.00 6.00 0 $1,500.00 $0.00 

Scott Sargent 17.50 11.00 6.50 $2750.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 17.10 12.40 4.70 $3,100.00 $0.00 

Charles See 21.80 18.60 3.20 $4,650.00 $0.00 

Sean Smoot 8.30 5.30 3.00 $1,325.00 $0.00 

Tim Tramble 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 92.50 92.50 0 $3,700.00 $0.00 

TOTAL 388.5 331.8 56.7 $63,525.00 $663.08 

* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland
project.

III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 
so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 
for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 
compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 
or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 
constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 
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Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 
the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 
redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 
charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 

IV. CONCLUSION

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 

Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 

Sincerely, 

cc: Michelle Heyer 



7/22/2021

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_date… 1/16

Detailed Time Report:
06/01/2021 — 06/30/2021

Total Hours

388.50
331.80 Uninvoiced Billable

1 Client City of Cleveland

1 Project Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021

Tasks All Tasks

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Aden Hassan 74.00

06/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.00

Email, correspondence and review of documents and training curriculum.

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

Planning meeting with MT leadership. Email and correspondence and review of additional documents and memoranda.

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

Call with C. See re: several community matters and upcoming events. Call with A. Hardaway re: CD related matters. Project
management. Email and correspondence with G. White and MT workgroups re: ongoing assessments and priorities for the week.
Review of several documents communicating MT views and concerns in areas under review.

06/04/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

call and correspondence with DOJ re: IA and accountability matters. Call with PSD Director K. Howard re: CD related matters. Call
with G. White re: CD related matters. Review of several MT documents, filings and deliverables.

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

Weekly MT leadership logistics call. Review and delivery of IA memo to DOJ. Review of several pending documents and curricula.
Planning meeting for upcoming 10th Semiannual Report.

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.50

Call with M. Bretz, L. Fink and B. Maxey re: workflow and filing, 10th Semiannual Report, memo to the Court regarding status of
compliance. DOJ weekly call. Stakeholders meeting. City/DOJ/MT biweekly meeting. Call with B. Maxey re: MT staffing and
assignments. 
Call with G. White re: CD related matters and an upcoming in-person meeting. Document review, project management and email
and correspondence.

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

District Neighborhood Awareness Zoom with CDP and DOJ. Review and approval of several deliverables. Email and
correspondence.

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.50

Email and correspondence. Project management.

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.00

Meeting in Cleveland with PSD Howard, G. White, B. Langhenry and DOJ representatives re: CD related matters. Email and
correspondence re: several filings and deliverables. Call with M. Bretz re: deliverables and planning for upcoming site visits by MT.
members. Correspondence with the Court re: June/July Global Six meeting. Call with B. Maxey re: filing motions and IA/discipline
matters.

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

UF Assessment review of case 9-200304243 (partial). Call with DOJ re: Expungements and NDCA cases. Follow up call with B.
Maxey re: PIB matters. Project management and email and correspondence re: Outcome assessments workgroup.

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

MT logistics meeting re: deliverables, ongoing assessments and upcoming meetings for the week. Call with M. McDonough re:
assignments and meeting priorities. Email and correspondence.

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/1/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1516650944
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1516654805
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1518259139
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/4/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1518896067
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1519942766
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1521001463
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1521949059
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/10/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1523838463
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1523842748
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1524231530
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1525194821


7/22/2021

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_date… 2/16

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.00

Call with R. Rosenthal re: OPS matters. Weekly update call with DOJ. Call with Community Engagement workgroup. Call with G.
White re: CD relayed matters. Call with CRT/DOJ re: CD related matters. Call with S. Smoot re: matters pertaining to the CD. Email
and correspondence.

06/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

Call with G. White re: CD related matters. Email and correspondence.

06/17/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.50

Email and correspondence. Logistics for next week's All-team meeting. Call with DOJ/USAO re: CD related matters.

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

Call with R. Rosenthal re: OPS assessment, OPS cases and investigations. Chapman Pursuit case. Email and correspondence.
Logistics for upcoming All-Team meeting, including agenda. Project management.

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 4.00

MT Logistics call. MT assignments for the 10th Semiannual Report. Logistics for the August Virtual Site visit and the September
in-person site visit. Document review in BOX. Email and correspondence. Call with B. Brenman (USAO) re: CD related matters.

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

Call with T. Mygatt (DOJ/CRT) re: CD related matters. Correspondence with the Court re: upcoming virtual site visits, Global Six
meeting in July, and other CD related matters. Weekly update call with DOJ re: deliverables, site visits, etc..

06/23/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

Call with the Court re: various CD related matters. Calls with DOJ re: various CD related matters. Email and correspondence re:
City's website redesign and compliance re Transparency. Email and correspondence.

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 3.00

Email and correspondence with stakeholders re: recent events in Cleveland. Project management. Call with DOJ.
Logistics/correspondence for meetings in Cleveland next week.

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 3.00

Call with DOJ/USAO re: CD related matters and meetings next week. Call with M. Bretz re: logistics, deliverables and documents
under review. Project management. Email and correspondence.

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 1.50

Call with DOJ. Logistics and correspondence with CPC and MT members. Call with M. Bretz re: deliverables and deadlines.

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

Weekly update call with DOJ. Review of IG finalists resumes. Call with G. White re: several CD related matters. Call with C. See re:
community engagement matters and upcoming meetings, including the UW Community Conversation. Review of several
documents and approvals of deliverables to go back to the City. Preparation for the All-Team meeting tomorrow. Email and
correspondence.

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.50

Email, correspondence and logistics for the parties to meet with the Judge next week. All-Team meeting to discuss progress,
assessments, ongoing selection process for MT vacancy and upcoming priorities, meetings, site visits and Court meetings. Call
with B. Maxey re: various CD related matters. Call with DOJ.

Charles See 21.80

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

United Way Panel rehearsal and workgroup debriefing.

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

1st. District Policing Committee Meeting

06/04/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1526474429
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/16/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1528861674
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/17/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1528871694
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/18/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1529735124
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1530823373
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1532000644
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/23/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1533517033
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/24/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1533566318
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/25/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1534386884
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1536679230
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1537652694
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3297310#timesheet_day_entry_1538336375
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1517803617
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1517933665
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/4/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1519243062
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https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_date… 3/16

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Phone calls re: Consent Decree status

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.30

Stakeholders' meeting and Logistic meeting

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

2nd District CPC meeting/community and CDP interchange of activities, resources and events; community Q&A

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 4.30

Neighborhood Training Curriculum review: DOJ/MT/CDP/City - Press Conference City Hall re: Safety Director - United
Way/NAACP community conversation

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

CPC call/Call with CPC Commissioner/

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.60

Community Engagement Team call re: Team's status.

06/17/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

phone calls

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.30

06/23/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.40

DCP conversation with CPC - Press conference (Black Shield, Black Lives Matter, NAACP, Norman Minor Bar Association, Citizens
for a Safer Cleveland; general public

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

United Way planning meeting

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.00

Public Forum on safety, policing and the Consent Decree.

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.70

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.70

Phone conversation re: CIT and subcommittees

06/26/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

Engagement Team meeting

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.70

Phone call re: CIT and MHRAC

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

MT/DOJ Decree status update

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.70

MT member conversation re: overall project and CIT progress

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

All Team meeting re: project updates and planning

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1521493697
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1521490008
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1521492025
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1522519842
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1527738332
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1527741853
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/17/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1532308987
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/18/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1532309183
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/23/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1533096973
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/24/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1533943765
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/24/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1534117011
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/25/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1535445091
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/25/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1535445714
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/26/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1535445912
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1542950062
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1542954859
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1542956175
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3424133#timesheet_day_entry_1542958266
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https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_date… 4/16

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

CJI - Cole Christine 9.90

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.00

conversations with SS and HA on general issues

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

MT weekly meeting. discussion of IAPro, UOF Assessments and overall project management

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

DOJ/MT call overall management of items on the list, training, G6

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.60

work on IA Pro Access via emails with CLE and MT, call with GW

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.30

work on UOF Assessment and accessing new laptop for MT member

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.70

Comms via emails to plan and follow up on UOF assessments update, evidence.com access, laptop issues

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.80

Monitoring Weekly Team meeting

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

planning call, reviewing media and emails

06/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

Compstat meeting prep and participation

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

reading and commenting on Box materials for CDP return

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.50

MT/DOJ Weekly call, reviewing Box reports CPOP data and policy, working on 10th report

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

VPN connectivity, emails/texts with MT members and City IT, working with annual data, outcome measures

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

participant in MT All Team Meeting

Django Sibley 17.10

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

Review of case OPS2019-0128

06/13/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.70

Complete review of OPS2019-0128

06/19/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.80

Review OPS investigation 2019-0200

06/20/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 4.40

Review of OPS CASE 2020-0015

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1520261287
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1522902997
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1522903846
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1522904511
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/10/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1522919566
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1524413405
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1527773539
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1527778480
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/16/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1527778922
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1537621207
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1537621663
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1537621670
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3298552#timesheet_day_entry_1538713425
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1524381554
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/13/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1524734809
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/19/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1529907676
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/20/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1530111472
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06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.50

Complete review of OPS 2020-0015

06/27/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.70

Review of OPS case 2019-0187

06/27/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

Review of OPS case 2019-0187

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.50

Monitoring Team meeting

Hardaway Ayesha 6.20

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.20

Participate in Search and Seizure Training discussion with CDP and DOJ.

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.10

Participate in Monitoring Team logistics call.

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.40

Review and file Notice of FIT Training Curriculum with attachments.

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.70

Participate in meeting CPC leadership and DOJ.

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

Participate in meeting with Monitoring Team and Department of Justice.

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.60

Participate in Stakeholders' Meeting with Cleveland Community Police Commission, Cleveland Division of Police, City of Cleveland
and Department of Justice.

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Attend bi-weekly meeting with the City, Cleveland Division of Police and the Department of Justice.

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.90

Prepare for and participate in meeting regarding Neighborhood Awareness Training with Cleveland Division of Police.

Jennifer Albright 0.90

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Review Phase 5 and 6 use of force cases for review to determine level of completion.

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.40

Review Phase 5 and 6 use of force cases for review to determine level of completion.

Lisa Fink 28.30

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.40

Review FIT and probationary officer memos; prep for S&S training call; participate in S&S training call; editing probationary officer
memo.

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.80

Editing Probationary Officer memo; Reviewing IA memo; prepping/sending CPOP GPO to DOJ; updating tracking docs.

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1531239760
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/27/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1535524084
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/27/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1535524264
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3424140#timesheet_day_entry_1539079559
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1516708617
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1520084689
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1520116776
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1520389576
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1521042154
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1521105246
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1521138452
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3332376#timesheet_day_entry_1522006893
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3424119#timesheet_day_entry_1525886830
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3424119#timesheet_day_entry_1525887079
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1519934665
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1519936362
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06/04/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.00

Scheduling Neighborhood Awareness Training call; reviewing and follow ups on Bias-Free Training, FIT Training Filing and cases
memo, and UOF training; review IA memo; read investigatory stops policy

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.70

Prep call for MT logistics call; MT logistics call

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Call with Hassan, Brian and Melissa re: CD timeline document and 10th Semiannual Report; follow-up emails

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.00

DOJ/MT weekly meeting; Neighborhood Awareness & timeline doc follow-ups; stakeholders meeting; City/CDP meeting

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Review emails and call logistics for neighborhood awareness trainings; Reviewed/edited court notice re: final CIT Data Training

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.40

Listened to United Way Consent Decree Community Conversation

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

Reviewed master projected timeline Gantt chart from 2020 and accompanying memo to the court; started going line by line on
Gantt chart with Brian to determine updates to the timeline; prepped and sent CPOP GPO edits to CDP.

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.40

Organized status of documents, follow up emails about CIT data refresher training & UOF review

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

MT Logistics pre-call; reviewing email re: MT status & 10th Semiannual report; MT Logistics call; reviewing emails re:
accountability, training, 10th semiannual report drafting

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.40

Bias-Free LMS sent to DOJ; follow ups re: MT topic assignments and 10th Semiannual drafting

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

Document tracking and sending agenda items to DOJ; checking in with Melissa re: MT assignments; testing USAfx; DOJ/MT
weekly meeting; reviewing follow up emails re: bias-free & IG position

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.30

Reviewing MT assignment charts; sending Bias-Free docs to DOJ

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.30

Review UOF LMS; MT Logistics call and pre-call

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Request to MT members re: 10th Semiannual Report drafting; prepping and sending UOF LMS comments to CDP and updating
trackers.

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.90

10th Semiannual follow-ups, reviewed CPOP training, DOJ/MT meeting, Reviewed modules 1, 2 and 3 of the Search & Seizure
Training.

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.80

Review of Bias-Free policing training

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.20

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/4/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1519937033
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525249986
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525251454
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525252857
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525254248
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525255178
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/10/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525258144
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1525259698
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1530600922
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1530601600
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1530602516
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1530603403
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1535263409
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1535263433
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1535263493
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1535263525
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/25/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1535263542
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catch up with Melissa re: Neighborhood Awareness Trainings and CPOP training

06/26/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Reviewed CPOP policy

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

Review of S&S training status, bias-free training status, follow-up re: district awareness, reviewed summary of proposed charter
initiative

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.50

DOJ/MT weekly meeting; sent MT edits on S&S training to DOJ; follow-up re: 10th semiannual report; call with Melissa re: status
of training reviews

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.90

Reviewed updated memos re: probationary officers, FIT investigations & paragraph 179; skimmed IG resumes; uploaded
semiannual report template to Box; updated document tracker and follow-ups re: CPOP data training and policy

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.30

MT all-team meeting; Search & Seizure Trainings - returned to CDP; CPOP data training approval to CDP; doc trackers updated.

Maxey Brian 25.40

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.40

Review UOF training w/video scripts; Search & Seizure Training discussion

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 4.10

FRB3; review of bias-free training

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.40

MT Logistics meeting

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

Training bi-weekly

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.60

MT timeline/internal updates; DOJ/MT; Stakeholders; DOJ/MT/CDP

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

Consent decree timeline/10th SAR planning

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

Review final FIT training; draft email re: same

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.80

MT logistics meeting; OPS assessment case review; bi-weekly training meeting.

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Communications w/Court re: filing access; pro hac vice

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.90

DOJ/MT weekly; follow-up discussions

06/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

Comstat

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/26/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1535263566
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1542091033
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1542091273
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1542091598
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3481006#timesheet_day_entry_1542091882
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1516544358
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1517473800
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1520068231
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1520301284
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1520980559
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/10/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1523446735
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1524171182
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1526538120
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1526540890
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1526541490
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/16/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1527486536
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06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 1.00

Internal/MT logistics call

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.70

DOT/MT weekly

06/23/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Review website revisions

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.80

Review CPOP/S&S/Bias-free LP

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.70

MT/DOJ meeting; review IG resumes; United Way prep call/discussion w/C.See

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.10

ECF/PACER access to OHND

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

All team meeting

Megan McDonough 10.30

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.30

Onboarding and logistics call

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.90

DOJ/MT call

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.70

Reviewing materials, onboarding

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Logistics meeting

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

Reviewing CD materials in Box

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.60

DOJ/MT Meeting

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.00

Reviewing Monitor Team documents

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.00

DOJ /MT Meeting

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

MT all hands call

Melissa Bretz 92.50

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 2.50

Search & Seizure Meeting. Emails to parties regarding meeting information, agendas, scheduling, and other information.

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1530792981
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1531812313
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/23/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1533343669
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1536402637
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1537599438
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1538471172
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3297452#timesheet_day_entry_1539511851
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1530937707
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1530938427
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/18/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1530939389
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1537799952
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1538543746
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1537799953
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/24/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1537799955
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1536108280
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3811468#timesheet_day_entry_1542772081
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3416276#timesheet_day_entry_1550721019
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06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 4.50

OPS Workgroup Call. Work on BOX documents and tracking sheet.Emails to parties regarding scheduling, cancellations,
documents, deadlines, status updates, and other information.

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 7.00

MT Logistics Pre-Call, MT Logistics Call, and Bi-Weekly Training Call. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List.
Emails to parties regarding meeting information, status updates, scheduling, documents, deadlines, agendas, and other
information.

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 8.00

Update to Court Discussion Re: Timeliness and Deliverables, DOJ/MT Meeting, Monthly Stakeholders Meeting, and
City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Stakeholders Agenda, Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List. Emails to parties
regarding agendas, meeting information, documents, deadlines, status review, and other information.

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 4.00

District Neighborhood Awareness Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding deadlines,
status updates, documents, and other information.

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 2.50

DPS Workgroup Meeting. Emails to parties regarding meeting information, scheduling, and other information.

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 3.00

Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Meeting. Emails to parties regarding agendas, meeting information, and other information.

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 7.50

MT Logistics Pre-Call, MT Logistics Call, and Bi-Weekly Training Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List.
Emails to parties regarding documents, invoices, agendas, meeting information, and other information.

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 6.50

DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding meeting information, agendas, BOX
access, scheduling, and other information.

06/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 8.50

CompStat Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, Letter of Engagement for Megan McDonough, and Task List. Call
with Hassan Aden. Emails to parties regarding calendar access, calendar invitations, status updates, meeting information,
documents, meeting participants, reports, deadlines, and other information.

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 3.00

Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding status updates, documents, deadlines, and other
information.

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 6.00

MT Logistics Pre-Call and MT Logistics Meeting. Work on Tracking Document, BOX documents, MT Assignment Charts, and Task
List. Emails to parties regarding documents, assignments, agendas, and other information.

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 4.50

DOJ/MT Meeting. Emails to parties regarding agendas, meeting information, cancellations, contact information, status updates,
court session dates, and other information.

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 4.50

Work on BOX documents and Tracking sheet. Emails to parties regarding scheduling, meeting information, status updates,
documents, deadlines, and other information.

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 3.50

Work on Tracking Sheet and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding cancellations, scheduling, documents, status updates,
deadlines, and other information.

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 5.00

Total 388.50
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Bi-Weekly Training Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Letter of Engagement for Ronnie Dunn. Emails to
parties regarding cancellations, letters of engagement, status updates, documents, deadlines, and other information.

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 5.50

DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet and MT Assignment charts. Emails to parties regarding scheduling, agendas, meeting
information, MT assignments, documents, and other information.

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Administrative Costs Associate Consultant 6.50

MT All Team Meeting. Work on Tracking Document and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding September site visit,
documents, scheduling, meeting information, agendas, and other information.

Randolph Dupont 16.30

06/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.10

Discussion of CIT Training, Officer Intervention Program, Employee Assistance Unit/Program, ABLE program with CPD Leadership

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Discussion of Training Issues and Mental Health Response Advisory Committee with DOJ and ADAMHS Board

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Discussion of eLearning approval with Department of Justice

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.90

Review of eLearning Curriculum Materials, development of court memo on curriculum, correspondence on court approval with
Monitoring Team Member Lisa Fink

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.70

CIT and Dispatch Curriculum - review of proposed changes, discussion of proposed changes with MHRAC Leadership.

06/17/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.40

Discussion and Review of History, Progress and Structure of Mental Health Advisory Committee with ADAMHS Leadership and the
Department of Justice.

06/17/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.30

Discussion of potential for 911 based diversion.

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.40

Preparation for MHRAC Quality Assurance meeting, MHRAC Quality Assurance Meeting, Review of Evaluation of Paragraphs 153-
159, Correspondence with Monitoring Team on Paragraphs 153-159, review of Monitoring Team previous semi-annual reports.

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

MHRAC Meeting with CPD, DOJ, ADAMHS Leadership to review CIT and Dispatch Training Changes, CPD dispatch protocols,
future CPD training schedule, MHRAC structure.

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Discussion of Community Issues as related to CPD Response to Crisis Events with Monitoring Team Member C. See.

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 3.00

Monitoring Team Meeting to review each area of progress, development work. Development work on Monitoring Team Semi-
Annual Report.

Richard Rosenthal 23.20

06/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

Total 388.50
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Correspondence review and response, including 6 discipline letters (upload and download & documentation); Review of
probationary officer memo; Review of FIT memo draft; Review of IA and FIT status reports and follow-up correspondence to
Monitoring Team.

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 3.20

Correspondence review & response; Edits to Investigation of Probationary Officer memo, FIT Investigation memo & IA memo;
Monitor Logistics call; Request for WCS info from OPS; Review and upload of discipline letters to BOX.

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.80

MT/DOJ meeting; Follow-up work; Correspondence review; Monitoring of PRB monthly meeting; Correspondence to OPS; Follow-
up documentation: Follow-up correspondence review; Review and uploading of IA memo.

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.20

Call with OPS; Correspondence review: Completion of FIT & IA memo edits.

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.20

Correspondence review, including review and documentation of 3 DPS charge letters & review of Discipline DN; OPS bi-weekly
meeting.

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.40

Call with MT Admin; MT logistics call & follow-up documentation; DOJ agenda recommendations; Reassignments of OPS-PRB
assessment cases; Review of OPS evaluation of off-duty WCS; Correspondence review and response; Call with OPS.

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.60

DOJ/Monitoring Team call.

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

Review of OPS-PRB assessments (5); Email review; Review of FRB findings; Download and review of discipline letters (3); Review of
case prep spread sheets; Call with Monitor & follow up documentation; Upload of discipline letters to BOX.

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.70

Calls with OPS

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.60

Review & Summary of police reform initiative; Correspondence review; Review and download of charge letters; review of OPS bi-
weekly report.

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 3.00

DOJ/Monitoring Team call; Edits to review and summary of police reform initiative; Correspondence re: OPS-PRB assessment;
Edits to 10th Semi-Annual Report; Review of DOJ edits to Accountability memos.

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 2.50

Correspondence review and documenation re: OPS/IAPro compliance; All Team meeting; edits to 10th Semi-Annual Report.

Rick Myers 30.80

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 3.00

Quarterly FRB meeting via WebEx

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.80

quarterly FRB meeting via WebEx

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

weekly MT Logistics meeting

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

weekly MT Logistics meeting

Total 388.50
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06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.30

send Cmdr Maguth info on FTO training development SME

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

MT/DOJ bi weekly with CDP training section

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Stakeholders meeting

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

DOJ MT CALL

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

MT/DOJ/CDP meeting

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

Zoom meeting to discuss Neighborhood Awareness Training for Districts

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

United Way forum on Consent Decree

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

United Way community forum

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.80

weekly MT Logistics meeting

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.60

weekly MT and DOJ meeting

06/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

CompStat meeting

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Weekly Logistics call

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.80

Complete review of OPS 2019-0106

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 2.30

Complete reviewing and fill out online assessment for OPS 3019-0163

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

weekly MT and DOJ zoom meeting

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.70

reviewed and commented on latest implicit bias training, both Word version and watched the LMS training program

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.70

Bi weekly training meeting with DOJ, CDP

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

review all Box assignments, review; emails to MT members on coordinating response to DOJ

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1520344150
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1520344563
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1521103044
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1521104253
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1521215808
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1522007180
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1522450985
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1522451227
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1525837504
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1526535778
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/16/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1527832282
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1531182922
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1531183369
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1531276428
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1531823260
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1531861182
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1536504178
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3481010#timesheet_day_entry_1536654224


7/22/2021

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_da… 13/16

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

weekly DOJ/MT meeting

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

weekly MT/DOJ meeting

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.80

attempt to log into VPN for OPS audits, email IT; review District Awareness Training final drafts

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 3.00

Review case OPS2019-0151

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Review case OPS3019-0151

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

All team meeting

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

All Team meeting

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 0.50

Review work on OPS3019-0175

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 3.30

Complete review of OPS 2019-0175

Scott Sargent 17.50

06/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 6.00

Complete review of Box files and IAPro files for OPS 2019-0189 including reports videos, transcripts.

06/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.00

Emails / admin tasks re: case review and and team member call.

06/04/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.00

Emails/ assess IAPro

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.00

Emails, review docs/attachments etc from team

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 5.00

IA/OPS Case review for: 2019-0189 and 2019-0219


Reports, evid, video, survey tool

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 1.50

IA/OPS Case review for: 2019-0189 and 2019-0219


Reports, evid, video, survey tool

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Associate Consultant 2.00

All Team Meeting

Smoot Sean 8.30

06/01/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Total 388.50
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Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Partner 2.50

Planning meeting w MT members. Including prep - review of memos and correspondence

06/02/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/04/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/05/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/06/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/07/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/08/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Partner 2.80

Conf calls w MT, DOJ, CDP, and CPC re various CD issues and compliance including prep time.

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/10/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/12/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/13/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/14/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/15/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/16/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/17/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521149276
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/2/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521162563
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521162898
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/4/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521163176
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/5/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521163413
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/6/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521163667
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/7/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521164000
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521164303
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/8/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521165715
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521166361
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/10/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521166646
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521166899
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/12/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521167127
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/13/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521167674
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/14/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521168548
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/15/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521168803
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/16/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521169203
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/17/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521169498


7/22/2021 Detailed Reports – 21CP Solutions, LLC – Harvest

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_da… 15/16

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/18/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/19/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/20/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/21/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/22/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/23/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/25/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/26/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/27/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/28/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Pro Bono Hours Partner 0.10

Email, PS events, and media reviews

Victor Ruiz 6.00

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

United Way June Community Conversation Rehearsal

06/03/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Consent Decree United Way Workgroup Meeting

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Neighborhood Awareness Training Call

06/09/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.50

United Way Community Conversation -

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/18/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521169762
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/19/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521170049
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/20/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521170348
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/21/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521170637
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/22/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521170866
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/23/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521171135
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/24/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521171445
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/25/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521171708
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/26/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521171967
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/27/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521172278
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/28/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521172578
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521172834
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3292146#timesheet_day_entry_1521173083
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1517647169
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/3/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1517716318
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1521962297
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/9/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1524030279


7/22/2021

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/reports/detailed?clients%5B%5D=9896079&end_date=2021-06-30&group=users&projects%5B%5D=27157032&start_da… 16/16

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

06/11/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

Updated invitation: Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call @ Every 2 weeks from 11am to 12pm on Friday (EDT)

06/24/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Cleveland Consent Decree Workgroup

06/29/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 0.50

Review of DPC Curriculum

06/30/2021 City of
Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CLE MT Member Rate Associate Consultant 1.00

MT All Team Meeting

Total 388.50

https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/11/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1524031156
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/24/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1533898013
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/29/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1537172042
https://21cpsolutionsllc.harvestapp.com/time/day/2021/6/30/3424129#timesheet_day_entry_1538661506


Timeframe 06/01/2021 — 06/30/2021

Total $663.08

1 Client City of Cleveland

Projects All Projects

Categories All Categories

Team Everyone

Date Project Category Roles Person Amount

City of Cleveland $663.08

06/10/2021 Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportation Senior Advisor Aden
Hassan

$44.20

 Uber from CLE Hopkins Airport to Hotel

06/10/2021 Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportation Senior Advisor Aden
Hassan

$324.79

 RT AA Flight to CLE

06/11/2021 Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportation Senior Advisor Aden
Hassan

$55.07

 Uber to CLE Hopkins Airport from Hotel

06/11/2021 Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Transportation Senior Advisor Aden
Hassan

$44.00

 Parking at DCA

06/11/2021 Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Lodging Senior Advisor Aden
Hassan

$165.68

 Marriott Hotel Bill

06/30/2021 Cleveland December 2020 -
November 2021

Shipping and
Postage

Associate
Consultant

Richard
Rosenthal

$29.34

 FedEx charge for shipment of CLE laptop back to IT for repair. $37.58 CAD = $29.34 USD

Total $663.08

Expense Report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Page 1 of 19



$44.2006/10/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from CLE Hopkins Airport to Hotel

Page 2 of 19
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$324.7906/10/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

RT AA Flight to CLE

Page 4 of 19
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$55.0706/11/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber to CLE Hopkins Airport from Hotel

Page 10 of 19
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$44.0006/11/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Parking at DCA

Page 12 of 19
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$165.6806/11/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Lodging

Person Aden Hassan

Marriott Hotel Bill

Page 14 of 19
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$29.3406/30/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2020 - November
2021

Category Shipping and Postage

Person Richard Rosenthal

FedEx charge for shipment of CLE laptop back to IT
for repair. $37.58 CAD = $29.34 USD
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