T A G The Aden Group, LLC.

8022 Fairfax Road Alexandria, VA 22308 (571) 274-7821 www.theadengroup.com

By email

February 12, 2021

Lynne Buck Michelle Heyer Heather Tonsing Volosin U.S. Attorney's Office, Northern District of Ohio 801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 Cleveland, OH 44113

Tim Mygatt
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division
Special Litigation Section
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW
Washington, DC 20530

Barbara A. Langhenry Gary Singletary Sharon Dumas City of Cleveland 601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 Cleveland, OH 44114

RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team — January 2021 Invoice

I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the "Team") invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement Agreement in *U.S. v. City of Cleveland*.

The Team's invoice for services rendered in January 2021 was \$62,620.00. The bill accounts for 414.3 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from January 1, 2021 through January 31, 2021. Of this time 77.3 hours were *pro bono*, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of

Cleveland. The Team's billing of 25 percent of its time for January 2021 as *pro bono* time saved \$19,325.00.

Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates within the confines of the total, five-year budget cap of \$4.95 million to which the City, Department of Justice, and Court agreed in October 2015.

**All work in January was conducted remotely due to COVID-19 precautions and all local meetings contemplated to be in-person, were suspended and replaced by teleconference or videoconference.

Activities, work, and tasks conducted during January 2021 included but were not limited to:

- Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing training addressing: (Audits were suspended)
 - o Force Review Board;
 - o Crisis intervention;
 - o Bias-Free policing; and
 - o Supervision.
- Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and drafting of new policies, processes, procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to:
 - O Supervisory response to use of force incidents;
 - o Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command;
 - o Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board ("FRB");
 - o Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs ("IA");
 - o Chain of command misconduct review process;
 - o Discipline process and discipline matrix; and
 - O Community and Problem-Oriented Policing ("CPOP").
 - o Officer Intervention Program (OIP)
- Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to:
 - o Crisis intervention:
 - o Community and Problem-Oriented Policing ("CPOP");
 - o District Policing Committees ("DPC"s);

- o Staffing;
- o Recruitment and hiring; and
- Ongoing meetings and discussions with the CPC regarding proposed meetings and ways to better collaborate on deliverables.
- Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system;
- Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative "COMPSTAT" meeting regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and functions;
- Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome measurements;
- Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards ("OPS"), including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian complaint investigations;
- Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board ("PRB") regarding review and adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and development; provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB Manual, and regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and
- Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer organizations, and community organizations.
- Ongoing Use of Force outcome assessment.
- Ongoing project management and coordination for deliverables (internal and with the City and DOJ)
- Ongoing development and discussions of the consent decree timeline for the Court.
- Ongoing discussions regarding training and methods of delivery during Covid-19 limitations.
- Significant drafting assignments regarding the 9th Semiannual Report (focusing on the May-June response to 2020 protests)
- Project management and planning for the next monitoring period and anticipated costs, resources and personnel needed to achieve the Court's Consent Decree mandates. Planning for monthly status conferences with the Court to address specific topic areas on a monthly basis.
- Project management regarding priorities in the upcoming year.
- Continued nboarding new Monitoring Team members.
- Correspondence with the Court regarding a change in frequency for Court hearings and logistics for Public Hearings to keep the public informaed of the progress of the Consent Decree.

II. INVOICE SUMMARY

	January 2021
Billable Hours	\$62,620.00
Overhead	\$0.00
TOTAL	\$62,620.00

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses

	Total Hours	Billed Hours	Pro Bono Hours	Total Billed	Expenses
Hassan Aden	46.5	37.5	9	\$9,375.00	\$0.00
Modupe Akinola	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Jennifer Albright	5.6	3.7	1.9	\$925.00	\$0.00
Matthew Barge	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Christine Cole	11	8.1	2.9	\$2,025.00	\$0.00
Randy Dupont	13.8	9.9	3.9	\$2,475.00	\$0.00
Lisa Fink	23.9	17.4	6.5	\$4,350.00	\$0.00
Ayesha Hardaway	23	18.3	4.7	\$4,575.00	\$0.00
Brian Maxey	33	25.7	7.3	\$6,425.00	\$0.00
Rick Myers	32.5	24.2	8.3	\$6,050.00	\$0.00
Charles Ramsey	10.5	10.5	0	\$2,625.00	\$0.00

Richard Rosenthal	26.8	21.7	5.1	\$5,425.00	\$0.00
Victor Ruiz	8.6	6.1	2.5	\$1,525.00	\$0.00
Scott Sargent	28	17	11	\$4,250.00	\$0.00
Django Sibley	8.9	7.3	1.6	\$1,825.00	\$0.00
Charles See	15.7	6.6	9.1	\$1,650.00	\$0.00
Sean Smoot	23.5	20	3.5	\$5,000.00	\$0.00
Tim Tramble	0	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Melissa Bretz*	103	103	0	\$4,120.00	\$0.00
TOTAL	414.3	337	77.3	\$62,620.00	\$0.00

^{*} Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of \$40/hour on the Cleveland project. Please also note that Ms. Bretz's January billing includes some previously unbilled December 2020 hours.

III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations.

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day. (Thus, for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be compensated for the half day of \$34.50.) Some Team members have waived their *per diem* charges or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland. This constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland.

Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City. In some instances, those items have been redacted by the team members. In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed charges are subtracted from the total. In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear.

IV. CONCLUSION

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland. Upon receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and approval.

Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever.

Sincerely,

Hassan Aden Monitor

cc: Michelle Heyer Monica Madej Heather Tonsing Volosin

Detailed Time Report: 01/01/2021 - 01/31/2021

Total Hours 414.30 337.00 Uninvoi	ced Billable		1 Client 1 Project Tasks Team	City of Cleveland Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 All Tasks Everyone	
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
Aden Hassar	1				46.50
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Calls with A. Hardaway re priorities and project management	CLE MT Memb		2.00
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 email and correspondence. Coordination for meeting cov	CLE MT Memb	per Rate Senior Advisor	1.50
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Weekly update call with BPD. Call with B. Maxey re 9th Se	CLE MT Member		2.50 ondence.
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Weekly MT logistics meeting to discuss deliverables, time correspondence.	CLE MT Meml		<u>2.00</u> il and
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT weekly logistics team meeting to discuss deliverables	CLE MT Members and timelines. Email		1.50
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Weekly update meeting with DOJ to discuss numerous CCCDP/CPC/DOJ and MT. Bi-weekly call with the CDP/City. correspondence. Follow up calls and emails related to the	/DOJ and MT to discu	deliverables. Monthly Stakeholder's meeting with the ss global matters related to the CD. Email and	<u>4.50</u>
01/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Call with the parties re: LMS Bias Free Training. Call with MT workgroups.	CLE MT Memb		2.50 h several
01/14/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Call with M. Bretz re deadlines, priorities, policies and train	CLE MT Meml		2.00
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Call with G. White re: ongoing deliverables, reviews and re and correspondence with MT workgroups.	CLE MT Meml eports. Project manag		<u>2.00</u> te). Email
01/18/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Email and correspondence.	Pro Bono Houi	s Senior Advisor	1.00
01/19/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Email and correspondence re: upcoming FRB hearing and logistics. Project management. Meeting with parties and the UW to go over the roles and		ith a specific focus on MT access to cases for review e first of the many community engagement sessions	

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Но
01/20/2021		Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	2.
	City of Cleveland	Email and correspondence re: various CD related matters, de datat access for upcoming reviews, including the first FRB m		tat meeting with the CDP. To	roubleshooting
01/21/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Email and correspondence. Box document approvals and room	CLE MT Member Rate uting.	Senior Advisor	1.
01/22/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Email and correspondence: project management and other of meeting with the parties next week.	CLE MT Member Rate CD related matters. Review of Arr	Senior Advisor rested Person's report in pre	2. eparation for
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Weekly update/logistics call with MT leadership team. Project hearing dates for the first quarter of 2021. Call with a local C integrates into practice.			
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Continued follow ups regarding MT assignments (with M. Br the DOJ. Bi-weekly call with CDP/City/DOJ and MT to discus Preparation for upcoming United Way/NAACP sponsored Correspondence with the Court re: Status Conference and a	ss deliverables, timelines, meetin ommunity Town Hall. Email and c	ig agendas and upcoming C	ourt hearings.
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Call with L. Fink re: deliverables and assessment manageme and remaining work. Email and correspondence re: various it Monitoring Plan.			
01/29/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Email and correspondence, document review (DV GPO, 6th V	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.
Charles See					15.
01/01/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Phone call/Emails	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.
01/06/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 United Way Planning Meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 1st District Community Policing Committee meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Community Engagement meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Team member phone call	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>0.</u>
				-	Гotal 414.

12021		Detailed Reports 2	,		
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		Phone calls			
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00
	0.010.0.10	Stakeholders' Meeting - MT/DOJ/CDP meeting			
01/14/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/11/2021	Cleveland	phone calls	. 10 2010 110410		<u> </u>
	City of				
01/19/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Community Forum planning	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.00</u>
		Community For any planning			
01/20/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>1.00</u>
		Meeting with United Way/NAACP to plan Community Forum	re: Consent Decree		
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
	Olevelaria	Meeting to plan public forum with United Way and NAACP			
01/26/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00
01, 20, 2021	Cleveland	Stakeholders' meeting. Review training schedules , response			2.00
	City of				
01/26/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Stakeholders' meeting. Review training schedules , response	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>1.00</u>
		Stakeholders meeting, keview training schedules , response	to stri Semiarinuai Report, 2021	ріап	
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	3.00
		Planning session with United Way/NAACP work group. Atten	ded United Way/NAACP commu	nity forum.	
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
	Olovolaria	Conversation with community residents regarding United Wa	y/NAACP forum.		
CJI - Cole Cł	nristine				11.00
01/04/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80
	Cleveland	UOF assessment management and comms, recruiting issues	emails,		
04 /05 /0004	City of	Ola da de la companya	OLEMEN AND A DATE	O. C. Alice	4.50
01/05/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ call, recruit f/u, UOF reviews	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	<u>1.50</u>
	0.1 . (
01/06/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.30
		9th report			
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00
		DOJ meeting			
01/08/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00
	Cleveland	Logistics meeting			
04/00/07	City of	01 1 10 1 2222	B B .:	0	0 = -
01/08/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	<u>0.50</u>
				Total	414.30

2021		Detailed Reports 21	CI bolutions, EEC Tim vest		
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		emails, organizing, planning			
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.50
	Cieveiand	UOF reviews			
24 /4 0 /0004	City of	Ola da de Para da 2000. Na cada 2004	D. D H	O. C. Adica	0.00
)1/12/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.30
		general emails, UOF			
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	1.00
	Olovolaria	UOF reviews data and planning discussion			
	City of				
01/19/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.30
		emails and UOF			
01/21/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.40
	Cleveland	calendaring, UOF, emails			
01/22/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.20
		emails, UOF			
01/25/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80
01/25/2021	Cleveland	MT Meeting, memo on UOF review process, scheduling upco		Jenior Advisor	0.00
		with wiceting, memo on oor review process, scheduling upon	Tilling review conversations		
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.70
		Participation in DOJ call, analysis of UOF cases identified by I with MT members and DOJ $$	DOJ and MT that need to be disc	ussed further. Organizing plan for ne	ext steps
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Senior Advisor	0.80
		TC w/GW, Roger (OPS), and MT members to discuss and prol UOF review discussions scheduling	olem solve issue with accessing v	videos for OPS Review. Call with Max	xey on
01/27/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.40
	Cleveland	emails on UOF review scheduling with MT members for interr	nal review and with JG at DOJ for	the DOJ review meetings	
		-			
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Senior Advisor	0.50
		Write and send memos to MT leadership on UOF Reviews stra	ategy and needs, updating Review	w team via memo and emails	
Django Sible	у				8.90
01/04/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
02,01,2021	Cleveland	Complete review of use of force case 2019-265148	Dono Frodro	. Issociate Consultant	0.00
		Complete review of add of notice data 2017 2001 10			
01/14/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
		Review draft memo re discipline review and provide feedback.			
04./40./000	City of	Ole all al Branch a 2000 No. 1 a 2001	OLEMEN L. D.	Acceptable Complete	4.01
01/19/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.90</u>
		Review use of force case 2019-314858			

2021			CP Solutions, LLC – marvest		
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
01/19/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review use of force case 2019-302373	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.40</u>
01/20/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review use of force case 2018-220639	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.40</u>
01/20/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review use of force case 2018-347031	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.60
Hardaway Ay	resha				23.00
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Participate in conference call	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>
01/06/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Document review and analysis; conference call	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Participate in conference calls; document review and analysis	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.70</u>
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Participate in conference calls	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>2.1(</u>
01/10/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Document review and analysis	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Prepare for and participate in conference calls	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>1.40</u>
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Prepare for and participate in meetings	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.10
01/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Prepare for and participate in meeting.	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Document review and analysis	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
01/21/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Prepare for and participate in conference call	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
01/22/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Participate in conference call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/24/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Document review and analysis	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
01/24/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Document review and analysis	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.60
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Participate in Monitoring Team meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Attend CDP Training Review Committee meeting.	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Participate in meeting with DOJ.	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Attend Bi-Weekly meeting with DOJ and City	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Prepare for and participate in community conversation panel	Pro Bono Hours hosted by the United Way and NA	Associate Consultant	2.20
01/31/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review and analyze 2021 Monitoring Plan and draft Bias-Free	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>
Jennifer Albr	ight				5.60
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Check use of force reviews for agreement and completion.	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Phone check in with monitoring team to plan for UOF with DO	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.70
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/17/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.60
01/17/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review use of force survey for agreement and completion ahe	CLE MT Member Rate ead of meeting with DOJ	Associate Consultant	1.20
01/30/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Compile individual use of force survey responses from Phase that are complete to determine in any level 1 case need to be force case reviews to determine in there is any significant disa	discussed with the monitoring te	am and/or DOJ. Review completed us	
01/30/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Compile individual use of force survey responses from Phase that are complete to determine in any level 1 case need to be force case reviews to determine in there is any significant disa	discussed with the monitoring te	am and/or DOJ. Review completed us	

		1	, , ,		
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
_isa Fink					23.90
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 9th Semiannual Report	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT/DOJ Meeting	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 9th Semiannual Report	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.30
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ/MT Meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT Logistics Meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT Logistics Meeting	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT/DOJ Meeting	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Stakeholders' Meeting; City/CDP/MT/DOJ Meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 UOF Review Logistics	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00
01/17/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 UOF Review Follow-Up	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Reviewed DOJ Semiannual Report edits; Skimmed Officer In:	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.20</u> ng projects.
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT-DOJ meeting discussing open issues/CD progress; Cityhearings, planning technical assistance, among other topics.	ě .	Associate Consultant	<u>1.30</u> g court
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 UOF Review logistics email to MT members; close review of Creview of ABLE standards; Reviewed and commented on 202		Associate Consultant le peer intervention policy from E	<u>1.40</u> Baltimore;
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Call with Hassan about role on Monitoring Team; observed U	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	2.50
	City of				

		1	er goldlons, EEe That vest		
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		Calls with Rick and Brian of MT to discuss status of various Cl Force LMS.	DP trainings for review; Reviewed	commented on Bias-Free LMS and	Use of
01/30/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10
		Reviewed and commented on Search and Seizure Introductio	n LMS.		
01/31/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.90</u>
		Reviewed/provided comments on Search and Seizure Traffic S	Stops LMS, SS Tabletop Exercise	#1 and SS Tabletop Exercise #2.	
01/31/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
		${\sf AddedcommentstoBias\text{-}FreeLMSonpresentationinBox}.$			
Maxey Brian					33.00
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.20
	Olevelaria	Review IA assessment memo; UOF Phase 3 case review			
	City of				
01/05/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.20
		MT/DOJ call; revisions to Ninth Semi-annual			
01/06/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Cleveland	Ninth Semiannual			
	0				
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.40
		MT/DOJ call; finalize Ninth Semiannual			
01/08/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.90
01/06/2021	Cleveland	MT Logistics Meeting; IA Review edits	CLE IVIT IVIETIDEI Rate	Associate Consultant	1.90
		Wit Logistics Meeting, IA Review edits			
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.40
	Olevelaria	MT logistics call			
	City of				
01/12/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.50
		Stakeholders; DOJ/MT/CDP meetings			
01/13/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
	Cleveland	Bias free LMS			
01/18/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.70
		OPS instrument review/update			
01/19/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.20
01/10/2021	Cleveland	Discussions w/CDP/MT re: IA Pro Access; update public invoi		ASSOCIATE CONSUITAIL	1.20
		DISCUSSIONS W/SDE/INTLIE. IA FIO ACCESS, update public invol	CCS OII WEDSILE		
01/20/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT logistics call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ/MT weekly meeting; DOJ/MT/CDP bi-weekly meeting;	CLE MT Member Rate UOF reviews - 2018-146063, 269	Associate Consultant	<u>3.40</u>
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review UOF cases 2018-059977, 178788, 2019-010914	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.90
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 IA Pro access meeting; internal discussion re: UOF assessment	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 UOF reviews: 2019-239440; 053771,118701, 2018-389711,	CLE MT Member Rate 254806	Associate Consultant	<u>3.40</u>
01/30/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review discrepancies between UOF 2018-269669 and 2019	Pro Bono Hours -239440	Associate Consultant	0.40
01/31/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review 2021 Monitoring Plan; reconcile team comments; rev	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>2.90</u>
Melissa Bre t	Z				103.00
01/01/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Dec 14: MT Weekly Logistics Meeting. Work on Internal Trac documents, deadlines, scheduling, reports, training, meeting documents, deadlines, meeting info, and other information. I members. Emails to parties regarding scheduling, document parties regarding scheduling, documents, and other informat to parties regarding cancellations, agendas, documents, UO Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, BOX documents,	g info, and other information. Dec Dec 17: Work on Tracking Sheet, is, and Letters of Engagement. Do tion. Dec 21-25: Work on Task Lis F audit cases, scheduling, and ot	15: DOJ/MT Call. Emails to parti Task List, and Letters of Engagen ec 18: Website Workgroup Call. E st, Tracking Sheet, and BOX docu her information. Dec 28: MT Logi	ies regarding nent for MT Emails to
		access, contact information, meeting info, cancellations, and Emails to parties regarding Letters of Engagement to MT me deadlines, and other information.		on Letters of Engagement to MT	duling, BOX members.
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Emails to parties regarding Letters of Engagement to MT me	embers and cancellations. Dec 31 Administrative Costs	on Letters of Engagement to MT : Emails to parties regarding doc Associate Consultant	duling, BOX members. uments,
		Emails to parties regarding Letters of Engagement to MT medeadlines, and other information. Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List. Emails	Administrative Costs ails to parties regarding Letters of	on Letters of Engagement to MT: Emails to parties regarding doc Associate Consultant f Engagement, cancellations, sch Associate Consultant	duling, BOX members. uments,
01/05/2021	Cleveland City of	Emails to parties regarding Letters of Engagement to MT medeadlines, and other information. Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List. Emaother information. Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs alls to parties regarding Letters of Administrative Costs mation, agendas, and other inform Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	duling, BOX members. uments, 5.00 eduling, and 2.00
01/04/2021 01/05/2021 01/06/2021 01/07/2021	City of Cleveland City of	Emails to parties regarding Letters of Engagement to MT medeadlines, and other information. Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task List. Emaother information. Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ/MT Meeting. Emails to parties regarding meeting information. Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs alls to parties regarding Letters or Administrative Costs mation, agendas, and other inforr Administrative Costs alls to parties regarding schedulin Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant mation. Associate Consultant Associate Consultant Associate Consultant mation. Associate Consultant mation. Associate Consultant Massociate Consultant Massociate Consultant Massociate Consultant Massociate Consultant Massociate Consultant Massociate Consultant	5.00 seduling, and 2.00 son.

2021		Detailed Reports 21	Ci Solutions, EEC Tiai vest		
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		MT Logistics Meeting and Bi-weekly Community Engagement parties regarding agendas, task lists, scheduling, documents,	0		mails to
)1/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	<u>8.50</u>
	Giovolana	DOJ/MT Meeting, Stakeholders Meeting, and City/CDP/DOJ/ to parties regarding documents, deadlines, meeting info, ager	_	-	s. Email
)1/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	<u>2.50</u>
		Bias-Free LMS Feedback Discussion. Emails to parties regard	ling meeting information, docun	nents, agendas, and other information	٦.
01/20/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	4.00
		CompStat Meeting. Work on Task List, Tracking Sheet, and BC deadlines, agendas, meeting information, and other information		s regarding, cancellations, documents	5,
01/21/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	3.50
		Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emastatus requests, and other information.	ills to parties regarding cancella	ations, scheduling, admin information	for MT,
01/22/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	3.50
		Bi-Weekly Community Engagement. Emails to parties regardi information.	ng contracts, cancellations, med	eting information, BOX documents, a	nd othe
)1/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	6.50
		MT Logistics Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheet, Task List, and deadlines, BOX access, agendas, and other information.	BOX documents. Emails to part	ties regarding scheduling, documents	·,
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	4.50
		DOJ/MT Meeting and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Emails to information.	parties regarding agendas, mee	iting information, scheduling, and oth	er
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	3.00
		IAPro Access for OPS Call. Emails to parties regarding meeting	g information, scheduling, upda	ate status, and other information.	
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	3.50
	0.000.00.00	OPS Workgroup Call. Emails to parties regarding cancellation	s, OPS/PRB audit cases, sched	uling, and other information.	
01/29/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Administrative Costs	Associate Consultant	7.00
	Oleveland	Work on Task List, Tracking Sheet, and BOX documents. Emai scheduling, agendas, contact information, and other informati	. 0 0	comments, documents, deadlines,	
Ramsey Cha	rles				10.50
01/24/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	2.00
	Cleveland	Review case 2018-374682			
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	2.00
	J.575/dilid	Review Case 2019-225502			
N1 /26/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	2.00
01/26/2021	Cleveland				

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review of use of force case 2019-196091	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	1.00
01/30/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review UoF case 2018-232415	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	<u>1.50</u>
01/31/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review UoF case 2019-389893	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner	2.00
Randolph Du	pont				13.80
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Meeting with MHRAC Leadership to discuss MHRAC Status a	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.90
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Conference call with DOJ to discuss MHRAC meeting, CPD C	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>1.10</u>
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Discussion with DOJ on CPD LMS Learning Module feedback	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Discussion with Monitoring Team Member C. See on MHRAC	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.40
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Mental Health Response Advisory Committee Bimonthly Mee Incidents, Correspondence re: CPD Critical Incidents	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant cuss meeting issues, review	3.10 of CPD Critical
01/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ Conference Call to discuss CPD LMS Training, CPD CIT	Pro Bono Hours Officer Recruitment	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/19/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MHRAC Quality Improvement Subcommittee Meeting, Review LMS Learning Modules on Data Input and Commitment Processing		Associate Consultant	3.20 ussion of CPD
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Mental Health Response Advisory Training Subcommittee Me Diversion Center with Ohio Subject Matter Expert, Follow up of			2.70 to the County
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Discussion of Monitoring Team issues, Cleveland News Media See. Review of CPD Critical Events Log.	Pro Bono Hours a articles, presentation at United	Associate Consultant Way with Monitoring Team r	0.60 nember Charles
Richard Rose	nthal				26.80
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Calls and correspondence to monitoring team members; OPS review (including multiple suspension and charge letters requ		Associate Consultant ulation and correspondence	2.80 Correspondence
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.40</u>
				To	tal 414.30

		1			
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		DOJ/Monitoring Team meeting; Correspondence on IA and F	PRB audit & review of draft 9th Se	mi-annual report.	
01/06/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.40
		Correspondence review (including OPS/PRB transcript upda	te review and documentation & c	hief's letters).	
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	<u>1.80</u>
	Cicrolana	Calls with Monitoring Team members; Correspondence revieweekly meeting; Documentation and follow up correspondence		entation for OPS/PRB assessme	nt); OPS bi
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.60
		Monitoring Team Logistics call; Correspondence review; Aud Case Prep, OPS & Monitoring Team; Review and preliminary assessment report, edits and forwarding to MT members; Ca	editing of draft 9th semi-annual r	report; review of draft of prelimin	
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.30
		Correspondence review (including 10 COP letters); Monitoring report & updates to report; UOF Review, Phase 4 cases (2) response.		ew of edits of IA draft preliminar	y assessment
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.20
		Correspondence review (including Directors decisions requir assessment memo; UOF Review Phase 4 case review and do		y and follow-up): Final edits to IA	A preliminary
01/18/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.00
		Correspondence review; UOF review phase 4 case.			
01/19/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.10
		Call re: OPS/PRB assessment instrument, and OPS/IA status instrument and follow-up correspondence.	s reports and IAPro; UOF review p	phase 4 case; Testing of OPS-PR	B assessment
01/21/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.10
		Review of OPS bi-weekly report; OPS bi-weekly meeting; Colletter, departure letter, suspension letter).	rrespondence review (Chief's Lett	ters, including charge letters, ter	mination
01/21/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	2.60
		Follow-up call with OPS: test copying of OPS case from IAPre Termination letter.	o to BOX; Follow-up corresponde	ence; Review and documentation	of
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>
		MT logistics call; Correspondence review (including review o	f Chief's Letters and documentati	ion of pending items to MT).	
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70
		Calls with Monitoring Team members; Correspondence re: IA notices, status of pending tasks, DOJ/MT agenda, Use of Fo		lence review and response (revie	w of CDP Div.
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
		Call with Monitoring Team admin. re: OPS/PRB assessment to	rasks.		
Rick Myers					32.50
	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.50
01/02/2021	Cleveland				
01/02/2021	Cleveland	complete review of use of force case 2018-265148 and enter	into on line tool.		

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
01/02/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review of 2018-265148	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/02/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review 2018-117448	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/02/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review of 2018-117448 and completion of on line use of force	CLE MT Member Rate review tool	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 weekly DOJ call	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/05/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 weekly DOJ call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/06/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review FRB 1 training	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/07/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ/MT call	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT logistics phone call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.80
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 complete review of FRB Training videos and make comments,	CLE MT Member Rate submit to Box and Melissa	Associate Consultant	3.30
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Viewing FRB Training Videos	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/10/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review 2019-233648 use of force report and enter onto on line	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	2.50
01/10/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review 2019-233648 and enter into on line tool	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Weekly logistics call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.40
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ/MT call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Stakeholders meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00

		1			
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 DOJ/MT/CDP meeting	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.50
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 review use of force case 2018-271407, enter into on line asse	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.80
01/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 special meeting/Zoom on bias free LMS training, developing	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 update phone call with Monitor Hassan	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.30
01/20/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CompStat meeting	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	1.00
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 MT Logistics weekly call	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	0.70
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Use of force reviews; Completed 2018-085454; reviewed 201	CLE MT Member Rate 8-220639 and 2019-268936 awa	Associate Consultant iting additional documentation	1.90
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Weekly MT/DOJ meeting; agenda on file. Identified several ur	Pro Bono Hours presolved topics that will require a	Associate Consultant additional meetings, much related	0.60 d to trainin
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 CDP/MT/DOJ/City meeting; discussed all items on agenda, a topics requiring meetings to resolve, etc.	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant virtual site visits to knock off all	<u>0.70</u> the extra
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 complete review and enter into on line assessment tool the us Christine Cole and DC O'Neill re missing video.	CLE MT Member Rate e of force report for case 2018-22	Associate Consultant 20639; include emails from team	1.00 member
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 View entire United Way of Cleveland public forum on the Cons	Pro Bono Hours sent decree	Associate Consultant	<u>1.50</u>
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Complete assignment to watch, review, and comment on: Us Search and Seizure intro training presentation; Search and Sepresentation; Cutural training for every district presentations			
01/29/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 phone call with Lisa Fink assisting her to open the LMS files p glitch reported by Lisa	Pro Bono Hours roperly so she can review as assig	Associate Consultant gned. Also, reopened presentation	0.70 n to verify
Scott Sargen	nt				28.00
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	3.00

72021		Betaned Reports 2	rer permitens, EEe ram vest			
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles		Hours
01/04/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Admin/emails	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/08/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 1 hour Admin/Tech issues Blue team/Harvest	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/10/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review and survey: Cases: 2018-104692 2018-197453 2018-223345	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		4.00
01/10/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Review and survey: Cases: 2018-104692 2018-197453 2018-223345	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.50
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Phase 3: 2018-161739 2019-275294	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		3.00
01/11/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Two cases for the day	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/14/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Ph 3 cases, 2019-239440 and 2018-389711, review and surv	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		3.00
01/14/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Ph 3 cases, 2019-239440 and 2018-389711, review and surv	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.50
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 2019-352548 review, survey, docs/ vids	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		2.00
01/15/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 2019-352548 review, survey, docs/ vids	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/16/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Case No. 2019-239843. Case, reports and survey. CWS miss	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/16/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Case No. 2019-239843. Case, reports and survey. CWS miss	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		2.00
01/19/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 FU re CWS, review vids re: 2019-239843. Now vids back onlin	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/25/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant		2.00
	2.2.0.0110			Т	Total 41	14.30

		-				
Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles		Hours
		Review emails and Box docs re: past surveys submitted for me	eeting			
Smoot Sean						23.50
01/05/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		1.50
	Cleveland	MT/DOJ Conf Call inc prep.				
01/06/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		<u>1.70</u>
		Rev disciplinary case documents 11 cases rec'd 1/4-1/6				
01/07/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		3.50
01/07/2021	Cleveland	Review semi-annual report incl. assessment re demonstration				0.00
		review seria diminal report filor. assessment re demonstration	Tresponse and protest policing in	nungs.		
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		3.50
	O.O.O.O.	Conf calls w DOJ, City, CDP, CPC, and MT including prep and	ł f/u			
	City of					
01/13/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		2.20
		Rev disciplinary case docs 15 cases rec'd 1/7-1/13.				
01/15/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		1.50
	Cleveland	Review comp stat slides				
	0					
01/22/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		3.60
		Rev disciplinary case docs 19 cases rec'd 1/15-1/22				
01/22/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	Pro Bono Hours	Partner		3.50
	Cleveland	Rev disciplinary case filed 16 cases rec'd 1/29				
		. ,				
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Partner		2.50
		Conf calls w DOJ MT, and City CDP MT and DOJ regarding C	D issues and various agenda item	ns related to compliance p	rogress	
Victor Ruiz						8.60
01/06/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/00/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLL IVIT IVIEITIDE! Kate	Associate Consultant		1.00
01/08/2021	City of	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		1.00
01, 00, 2021	Cleveland	Updated invitation: Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Call	0	7.0000.00.0		1100
01/12/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		1.00
		Monthly Stakeholders' Meeting (CPC, CPD, DOJ, City)				
04 /4 0 /2024	City of	Oleveland December 2020, Neverther 2021	CLE MT Marshar Data	A		0.50
01/12/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		0.50
		City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting				
01/13/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		0.50
	Cicveialiu	Cleveland Consent Decree Meeting				
	City of					
01/25/2021	Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant		0.50
					Total	414.30

Date	Client	Project	Task	Roles	Hours
		Review of District Neighborhood Awareness Training Curric	culum		
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Monthly update meeting between the City, CDP, DOJ and N	CLE MT Member Rate	Associate Consultant	0.80
01/26/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Meeting with United Way to plan the January 27th Consent	CLE MT Member Rate Decree Panel	Associate Consultant	0.80
01/27/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 United Way Consent Decree Panel Presentation	Pro Bono Hours	Associate Consultant	2.00
01/28/2021	City of Cleveland	Cleveland December 2020 - November 2021 Meeting with United Way to debrief on the panel presentation	Pro Bono Hours on on 1/27/2020	Associate Consultant	0.50