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Lynne Buck 

Michelle Heyer 

Heather Tonsing Volosin 

U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 

801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 

Cleveland, OH  44113 

Tim Mygatt 

U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 

Special Litigation Section 

950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 

Washington, DC  20530 

Barbara A. Langhenry 

Gary Singletary 

Sharon Dumas 

City of Cleveland 

601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 

Cleveland, OH  44114 

RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team —July 2019 Invoice 

I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 

“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 

Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 

The Team’s invoice for services rendered in July 2019 totals $75,962.10. The bill accounts for 

517.35 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from July 1, 2019 through July 

31, 2019.  Of this time 128.5 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of 

Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of over 31 percent of its time for July 2019 as pro bono time saved 

$32,125.00.   

Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 

within the confines of the total, five-year budget cap of $4.95 million to which the City, 

Department of Justice, and Court agreed in October 2015.  



2 

 

Activities, work, and tasks conducted during July 2019 included but were not limited to: 

 

• Continued, ongoing discussion and technical assistance Parties regarding upcoming 

training addressing: 

o Search and seizure; 

o Force Review Board; 

o Crisis intervention; 

o Bias-Free policing; and 

o Supervision. 

o Technical assistance and discussion regarding building internal capacity to draft 

lesson plans and adult learning methods. 

• Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and drafting of new policies, processes, 

procedures, manuals, and/or structures relating to: 

o Supervisory response to use of force incidents; 

o The City’s investigative structure (outside of IA) 

o Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command; 

o Investigation and review of force incidents by Force Investigation Team (“FIT”); 

o Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”); 

o Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal (“Internal Affairs”); 

o Chain of command misconduct review process; 

o Discipline process and discipline matrix; 

o Memorandum of Understanding (“MOU”) between CPD and Sheriff’s Department 

re: investigation of officer-involved shootings; and 

o Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”). 

• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding 

implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to: 

o Crisis intervention; 

o Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”); 

o District Policing Committees (“DPC”s); 

o Staffing; 

o Recruitment and hiring; and 

o Equipment and resources. 

• Ongoing discussions regarding re-establishment of CPC Selection Committee pursuant to 

expiration of four-year CPC Commissioner terms; 

• Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system; 
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• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and 

Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting 

regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and functions; 

• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome 

measurements; 

• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”), 

including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian complaint 

investigations; 

• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and 

adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and development; 

provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB Manual, and 

regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and 

• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer organizations, 

and community organizations. 

• Ongoing Use of Force outcome assessment. 

 

II. INVOICE SUMMARY 

 

 July 2019 

Billable Hours $74,007.50 

Overhead $1,954.60 

TOTAL $75,962.10 

 

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

 

 Total 

Hours 
Billed 

Hours 
Pro Bono 

Hours 
Total Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 70 48 22 $12,000.00 $745.01 

Modupe Akinola 24 10 14 $2,500.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 5.5 3 2.5 $750.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 33.3 30.3 3 $7,575.00 $1,168.84 

Joe Brann  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 
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Brian Center 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 17.5 12 5.5 $3,000.00 $26.00 

Randy Dupont  17.5 14 3.5 $3,500.00 $0.00 

Maggie Goodrich 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Ayesha Hardaway 34.6 24.6 10 $6,150.00 $14.75 

Tim Longo  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Brian Maxey 32 27.2 4.8 $6,800.00 $0.00 

Policing Project  

NYU Law  

50 29 21 $7,250.00 $0.00 

Charles Ramsey  2 2 0 $500.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 44.4 23.9 20.5 $5,975.00 $0.00 

Victor Ruiz 3.75 3.75 0 $937.50 $0.00 

Scott Sargent  19 15 4 $3,750.00 $0.00 

Charles See  16.3 6.6 9.7 $1,650.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 1 1 0 $250 $0.00 

Sean Smoot  30.5 24 6.5 $6,000.00 $0.00 

Tim Tramble  5.5 4 1.5 $1,000.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 110.5 110.5 0 $4,420.00 $0.00 

TOTAL 517.35 388.85 128.5 $74,007.50 $1,954.60 

 

* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland 

project.  

 

III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
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The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 

receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 

 

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 

meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 

so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 

for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 

compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 

or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 

constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 

 

Finally, some Team member invoices or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 

the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 

redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 

charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 

 

IV. CONCLUSION 

 

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 

receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 

approval. 

 

Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 

 

       Sincerely, 

       
                                                                                     

cc: Michelle Heyer 

Monica Madej 

Kevin Preslan 

Heather Tonsing Volosin 



July 1-31, 2019

Hassan Aden

To:
Meg Olsen
Via email

Description Hours Rate  Amount 

July 1: MT leadership logistics call to discuss pending matters, deliverables, 
timelines and upcoming site visits and priorities.  Correspondence with City and 
MT workgroup re: technical assistance provided by Rob Davis (Search and 
Seizure Training Curriculum).  Associated administrative tasks to onboard Rob 
Davis for this limited role (TA).  Call and correspondence with M. Bretz re: CD 
related deliverables, assignments etc.

3 250  $       750.00 

July 2: Email and correspondence with MT workgroups re: deliverables, site visits 
and other priorities.  Weekly update call with DOJ/USAO. Review of several 
pending motions to be filed imminently.

2.5 250  $       625.00 

July 3: Email and correspondence re: training, upcoming assessments, project 
management and deliverables.  Email and correspondence with the Court.

2 250  $       500.00 

July 5: Email and correspondence re: pending deliverables, training, curriculum 
and ongoing TA.  Project management and communication with the Court.  
Review of several pending documents.

2.5 250  $       625.00 

July 8: Email and correspondence re: CD related matters and pending 
deliverables. Call with M. Bretz re: project management and priorities. 2 250  $       500.00 

July 9: Call with M. Barge re: various pending matters with regard to the CD, project 
management and leadership transition.  Weekly update call with DOJ to discuss 
various project management priorities, deliverables, timelines, filings etc.  Bi-weekly 
Stakeholders meeting with the parties and the CPC.  Weekly Update call with the 
parties and the MT re: numerous CD related deliverables, timelines, and ongoing 
reviews. Call with M. Bretz re: project management and other deliverables and 
logistics.  Logistics re: TA call with the City, and preparation call with the MT, re: 
Search and Seizure Training pre-load.

5 250  $    1,250.00 

Billable Hours

For:
Cleveland Monitoring



July 10: Call with MT leadership team re: Search and Seizure curriculum and 
training pre-load.  Call with the City and DOJ re: Search and Seizure training.  
Several calls with Judge White re: upcoming meetings, priorities and other 
matters related to the CD.  Call with the monitor re: project management, and 
other CD related matters.  Review of several pending filings.

4 250  $    1,000.00 

July 12: Calls with parties re: logistics for Mayor's press conference on July 17.  
Follow up calls with DOJ and MT members. 3 250  $       750.00 

July 14: Call with G. White re: CD related matters and email and correspondence 
with DOJ and MT re: upcoming press conference. Email to City re: transition and 
MT leadership change.

2 250  $       500.00 

July 15: MT leadership logistics call.  Call with Judge White re: CD related 
matters.  Call with A. Hardaway re: Accountability Report (draft), MT leadership 
changes, and upcoming meeting logistics.  Call with R. Rosenthal re: various 
accountability workgroup areas and logistics for distributing deliverables.  Call 
with M. Barge re: CD related matters.  Email and correspondence with parties re: 
upcoming meeting logistics, deliverables etc..

4.5 250  $    1,125.00 

July 16: Call with M. Bretz re: project management, deliverables, timelines and 
priorities for the MT.  Call with G. White re: various CD related matters.  Call with 
C. See re: community engagement matters and logistics.  Weekly update call 
with the DOJ/CRT/USAO.  Email and correspondence re: filings, deliverables, 
assignment and other CD related matters.  Meeting with M. Barge in CLE re: MT 
leadership and assignments.

6 250  $    1,500.00 

July 17: Cleveland site visit.  Meeting with CPC selection committee at 3rd District 
Police Station.  Meeting with M. Barge re: various project management matters 
related to the CD.  Calls with DOJ re: various matters including Court filings 
related to the leadership transition.  Press conference and meet and greet at city 
hall re: MT leadership change.  Various calls with DOJ, MT workgroups, G. White 
re: SSA curriculum.  Call and emails with M. Bretz re: various MT deliverables, 
priorities, timelines and assignments for MT members.

8 250  $    2,000.00 

July 18: Review of numerous pending filings.  Email and correspondence with 
parties, MT and other stakeholders.  Review of budget and latest MT invoice.  
Administrative tasks associated with becoming the lead monitor.  Call with B. 
Maxey and emails associated with status of SSA curriculum.

5 250  $    1,250.00 

July19: Call with M. Barge about process and Court related matters and priorities.  
Call with M. Olson re: invoices and workflow.  Call with M. Bretz re: project 
management and priorities.  Call with MT workgroup for the upcoming UF 
Assessment.  SSA email, correspondence and calls.

4.5 250  $    1,125.00 

July 22: Call with MT leadership logistics group.  Call with M. Bretz re: project 
management and upcoming Court filings, meetings with Mayor Jackson, 
meetings with Judge Oliver and other CD related matters, meetings and priorities.  
Project management.  Email and correspondence re: filings.

3 250  $       750.00 

July 23: Call with DOJ/CRT re: numerous ongoing CD related matters, projects, 
deliverables and timelines.  Calls with MT members across the project lines to 
receive updates and priorities.  Call with M. Barge re: upcoming meetings and 
other priorities.  Email and correspondence re: training, accountability, outcome 
assessments and upcoming filings.

4.5 250  $    1,125.00 



July 24: Calls with MT members re: assignments, priorities, upcoming site visits 
and deliverables.  Logistics and project management.  Email and 
correspondence re: OPS matters.

3 250  $       750.00 

July 26: Calls with B. Maxey, T. Tramble and M. Barge on various topics related 
to the CD (Discipline Report, community engagement, upcoming site visits, 
community engagement opportunities etc..).  SSA Training curriculum call with 
parties to advance the curriculum to a point that the DOJ and the MT are 
comfortable approving the training so that it can proceed as scheduled for next 
week.  Review of Discipline Report, upcoming filings and various other 
correspondence relating to the CD.

5.5 250  $    1,375.00 

 $               -   

 $               -   

Total Billable Hours 70 250  $  17,500.00 

Reimbursable Expenses

July 16: RT airfare  $       308.59 

July 16: Parking DCA  $         62.00 

July 16: Uber from Hopkins Airport to Hotel  $         23.42 

July 18: Uber to Hopkins Airport  $         22.46 

July 18: Hotel (room and tax only)  $       328.54 

Total Reimbursable Expenses  $       745.01 

Total (Hours and Reimbursable Expenses)  $  18,245.01 

Pro Bono Hours 22 250  $    5,500.00 

Total Billed (includes Pro Bono Adjustment)  $  12,745.01 





Travel - $745.01

Report History & Comments

ID: 47576211 Policy:  TAG ExpensesClosed

$745CLE MT July 2019 Invoice Expenses .01

From

Hassan Aden )
To

Hassan Aden (


Date

Jul 2, 2019 to Jul 18, 2019

DATE MERCHANT TOTAL

 Jul 2 American Airlines $308.59

 Jul 16 Uber $23.42

 Jul 18 Marriott $328.54

 Jul 18 Reagan National Airport $62.00

 Jul 18 Uber $22.46

 $745.01
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You submitted this report (automatically closed due to submit-only policy) to aden@theadengroup.com
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Date: Jul 2

Merchant: American Airlines

Total: $308.59

Category: Travel

2

Date: Jul 16

Merchant: Uber

Total: $23.42

Category: Travel

3

Date: Jul 18

Merchant: Uber

Total: $22.46

Category: Travel

4

Date: Jul 18

Merchant: Reagan National Airport

Total: $62.00

Category: Travel

5

Date: Jul 18

Merchant: Marriott

Total: $328.54

Category: Travel

Documents
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Hassan Aden, MPA
Monitor
Cleveland Division of Police 

Begin forwarded message:

From: "American Airlines" <no-reply@notify.email.aa.com>
Date: July 2, 2019 at 9:13:06 AM MDT
To: "
Subject: Your trip confirmation-GUAYAV  16JUL

 
 

 

Hello Hassan Aden! Issued: Jul 2, 2019

 

 

Your trip confirmation and receipt
 

 
Record locator: GUAYAV

 
                     Manage Your Trip                    

 

Tuesday, July 16, 2019

DCA   CLE 
 

3:05 PM

 

4:38 PM
Washington Reagan Cleveland
 

American Airlines 5663 
OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE.

Seats: 1D
Class: Economy (S)
Meals:

 

mailto:no-reply@notify.email.aa.com
https://www.aa.com/reservation/view/find-your-reservation?recordLocator=GUAYAV&ntf=apr,tkt,eml,cta
https://www.aa.com/homePage.do
https://www.oneworld.com/
https://www.aa.com/reservation/view/find-your-reservation?recordLocator=GUAYAV&ntf=apr,tkt,eml,cta


 

 

 

 

 

Your trip receipt
 
 

 
    Master Card 

 
Hassan Aden
 

FARE-USD $ 260.46
 

TAXES AND CARRIER-IMPOSED FEES $ 48.13
 

TICKET TOTAL $ 308.59
 

 
 

Hotel offers  Car rental offers  Buy trip insurance  SuperShuttle

 
 
 
 

Contact us  |  Privacy policy
 

 
Baggage Information

Free entertainment with the American app »
 

Thursday, July 18, 2019

CLE   DCA 
 

12:49 PM

 

2:28 PM
Cleveland Washington Reagan
 

American Airlines 5645 
OPERATED BY PSA AIRLINES AS AMERICAN EAGLE.

Seats: 1D
Class: Economy (S)
Meals:

Hassan Aden AAdvantage # 
 

Ticket # 0012363807145

 
Get the American Airlines app

 

 

http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/icons/hotel
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/icons/car?extra_params=true&pickUpPlace=CLE&dropOffPlace=CLE&pickUpDate=07/16/2019&pickUpTime=1700&dropOffDate=07/18/2019&dropOffTime=1000&airlineCode=AA&flightNumber=5663&page=results
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/icons/insurance
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/icons/rideShare
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/contact-american/american-customer-service.jsp
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/support/privacy-policy.jsp
https://www.aa.com/i18n/travel-info/experience/entertainment/inflight-entertainment.jsp
https://www.aa.com/reservation/view/find-your-reservation?recordLocator=GUAYAV&ntf=apr,tkt,eml,cta
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.aa.android&hl=en


Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -
DCACLE-No free checked bags/ American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -CLEDCA-No free
checked bags/ American Airlines 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-DCACLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines
/UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-
CLEDCA-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158
LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-DCACLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23
KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CLEDCA-USD0.00/
American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM
ADDITIONAL ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCOUNTS MAY APPLY 

One or more of your flights is a Codeshare flight and is operated by a Partner Airline. If your
journey begins with a flight operated by one of American's Partner Airlines, then please check-in
with the Partner Airline for that portion of your journey. Upon check-in, they will check your
luggage to its final destination and provide boarding passes for your connecting flights, if
applicable.

If you have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare the itinerary must be canceled before the
ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the ticket has NO VALUE.. If the fare allows
changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply. 

You have up to 24 hours from the time of ticket purchase to receive a full refund if you booked at
least 2 days before departure. You must log in on aa.com or Contact Reservations to
cancel.  Once cancelled, your refund will be processed automatically.Refund Policy>>.

Some American Airlines check-in counters do not accept cash as a form of payment. For
more information, visit our Airport Information page.

SERVICE & SUPPORT ANIMAL REQUIREMENTS

For travel on or after April 1, 2019, the policy for traveling with Emotional Support and Service
animals has changed  Visit Traveling with Service Animals for more information.

        

Some everyday products, like e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when
transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked baggage.  Changes in temperature or
pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited
items may result in fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden
hazardous materials in your baggage like:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives
/ Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen
bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet
articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries for most consumer electronic devices in
carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium
batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette lighters and e-cigarettes must be removed from
checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may
not be used on-board the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may
require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage entirely. Passengers requiring these
items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of
international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the transporting air carriers, which are
herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on
which you may be ticketed may have different conditions of carriage.  International air
transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on file with
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal
Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are not restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on
liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or
perishable goods, and availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time

http://aa.com/
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/support/customer-service-plan.jsp#guaranteedfares
https://www.aa.com/i18n/travel-info/airports/airport-information.jsp
https://www.aa.com/i18n/travel-info/special-assistance/service-animals.jsp


periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the air carrier, 4. Rights
on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations,
check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rights of the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or
failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or
aircraft and rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the
transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the right to inspect the full text of each
transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon
request, to receive (free of charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference
from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of each air carrier's
terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on
the Conditions of Carriage link below.  

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's
conditions of carriage.

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and
confidential use of the intended recipient. This message contains confidential and proprietary
information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read,
searched, distributed or otherwise used by anyone other than the intended recipient. If you are not
an intended recipient, do not read, distribute, or take action in reliance upon this message. Do you
think you received this email by mistake? If so, please forward to privacy@aa.com with an
explanation, and then delete this message from your computer.

NRID: 1731113511620210122172300

http://www.aa.com/pubcontent/en_US/customerService/customerCommitment/conditionsOfCarriage.jsp?v_locale=en_US&v_mobileUAFlag=AA
mailto:privacy@aa.com


Total: $23.42
Tue, Jul 16, 2019

We're glad to have you as an Uber
Rewards Platinum Member.

Thanks for riding, Hassan

 

 

 

Switch

 

You rode with Sadeeah

    

  

Total $23.42
   You earned 46 points on this trip

Trip Fare $16.12

Subtotal $16.12

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $7.30

Amount Charged  

$23.42

https://click.uber.com/f/a/lKPwyTRH8IzzsIWq1U9kTA~~/AAAAAQA~/RgRfD2_rP0Q8aHR0cHM6Ly9oZWxwLnViZXIuY29tL2gvNTQ0MDhhMDctODdmNy00YmVkLWFmNDQtNzZjZDM5ODM1ZTgxVwR1YmVyQgoAAGs8Ll37zfEVUhZyZWNlaXB0c0BleHBlbnNpZnkuY29tWAQAAAAA
https://click.uber.com/f/a/e0wsnjaz66XyQR-Y0CUyNg~~/AAAAAQA~/RgRfD2_rP0QaaHR0cDovL3QudWJlci5jb20vdG9sbF9mYXFXBHViZXJCCgAAazwuXfvN8RVSFnJlY2VpcHRzQGV4cGVuc2lmeS5jb21YBAAAAAA~


4.95 Rating
 

Sadeeah is known for: 

Excellent Service

How was your ride?

RATE OR TIP

When you ride with Uber, your trips are insured in case of a covered
accident. Learn more.

04:48pm

6 Lower Dr, Cleveland, OH

05:06pm

1360 W Mall Dr, Cleveland,

OH

UberX 13.20 mi | 17 min
 

Invite your friends and family.

Get $5 off your next ride when you refer a friend to

try Uber. Share code: ala5c

https://click.uber.com/f/a/W3PcmU53xa4ARmWZeH8oHA~~/AAAAAQA~/RgRfD2_rP0RCaHR0cHM6Ly9yaWRlcnMudWJlci5jb20vdHJpcHMvNmU2M2U3YmYtNWZhNy00M2Y4LWE4MzItZGIyNGI4NGNiYmMzVwR1YmVyQgoAAGs8Ll37zfEVUhZyZWNlaXB0c0BleHBlbnNpZnkuY29tWAQAAAAA
https://click.uber.com/f/a/7_xaOgL_f9x4dZFaN8zgOA~~/AAAAAQA~/RgRfD2_rP0QhaHR0cHM6Ly93d3cudWJlci5jb20vcmlkZS9zYWZldHkvVwR1YmVyQgoAAGs8Ll37zfEVUhZyZWNlaXB0c0BleHBlbnNpZnkuY29tWAQAAAAA


Save up to 5% on your next ride with Uber

Cash

Spend less on your rides when you use Uber Cash.

You can purchase directly in the Uber app.  Learn

more

REPORT LOST ITEM ❯  CONTACT SUPPORT ❯  MY TRIPS ❯  

FAQ

Forgot password

Uber Technologies
1455 Market St
San Francisco, CA 94103

Privacy

Terms

https://click.uber.com/f/a/ZpE4gboyTmL17BNWc5BQaQ~~/AAAAAQA~/RgRfD2_rP0QkaHR0cHM6Ly93d3cudWJlci5jb20vYmxvZy91YmVyLWNhc2gvVwR1YmVyQgoAAGs8Ll37zfEVUhZyZWNlaXB0c0BleHBlbnNpZnkuY29tWAQAAAAA
https://click.uber.com/f/a/U1014hOFxNGcNc3qHaC6QA~~/AAAAAQA~/RgRfD2_rP0Q-aHR0cHM6Ly9oZWxwLnViZXIuY29tL2gvNTM1MzliZGUtZjZmNC00OTA5LTg1ZGUtZmEwYjk5ZjgyYmUwI19XBHViZXJCCgAAazwuXfvN8RVSFnJlY2VpcHRzQGV4cGVuc2lmeS5jb21YBAAAAAA~
file:///tmp/help.uber.com/riders
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GUEST FOLIO
  

CLEVELAND MARRIOTT DOWNTOWN

CLEVELAND MARRIOTT DOWNTOWN
127 PUBLIC SQUARE
CLEVELAND OH  44114

 2105
ROOM

NKNG
TYPE

  72
ROOM
CLERK

ADEN/HASSAN
      NAME

ADDRESS

  141.00
   RATE

07/18/19
    DEPART

07/16/19
    ARRIVE

14:19
   TIME

11:33
   TIME

PASSPORT:

   PAYMENT

 
ACCT#

MBV#:

Treat yourself to the comfort of Marriott Hotels in your home. Visit ShopMarriott.com.
This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed to pay in cash or by approved personal check or to authorize us to charge your credit card for all amounts charged to you. The amounts shown in the credit column opposite any credit card
entry in the reference column above will be charged to the credit card number set forth above. (The credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason the credit card company does not make payment on this account, you will
owe us such amount. If you are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days after check-out, you will owe us interest from the check-out date on any unpaid amount at the rate of 1.5% per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the
maximum allowed by law, plus the reasonable cost of collection, including attorney fees.

Signature X

07/16 ROOM-TR  2105, 1    141.00
07/16 SALESTAX  2105, 1     11.28
07/16 CTY TAX  2105, 1      7.76
07/16 CITY TAX  2105, 1      4.23
07/17 ROOM-TR  2105, 1    141.00
07/17 SALESTAX  2105, 1     11.28
07/17 CTY TAX  2105, 1      7.76
07/17 CITY TAX  2105, 1      4.23
07/18 CCARD-AX 328.54

PAYMENT RECEIVED BY  
.00

 

 

 

  

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement" on Marriott.com    

Your Marriott Bonvoy points/miles earned on your eligible earnings will be credited to your account. Check your
Marriott Bonvoy Account Statement for updated activity. See members.marriott.com for new Marriott Bonvoy
benefits.





Total: $22.46
Thu, Jul 18, 2019

We're glad to have you as an Uber
Rewards Platinum Member.

Thanks for riding, Hassan

 

 

 

 

You rode with David

    

  

Total $22.46
   You earned 44 points on this trip

Trip Fare $15.16

Subtotal $15.16

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $7.30

Amount Charged  

$22.46

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=QDYQ7MQTBF5X8FekeHanzTljNUncuNO30x6ih3WYDbc-3D_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SK5pi0-2FXNEyE1hMiImAE-2FTPcit09OhNKsiR-2BHu-2FDRTst3pSVHpiTbzJUf2MFEP8-2FHC9pqKOmAn4Oby6f7HIeMF-2FuEf0lfV5BJ9Q3Of-2BLcVfysdtEy-2FYcTlkwzcLB02QklbmMjd58akDIDLQV-2FxaYWYcw-3D


4.94 Rating
 

David is known for: 

Excellent Service

How was your ride?

RATE OR TIP

When you ride with Uber, your trips are insured in case of a covered
accident. Learn more.

12:01pm

1360 W Mall Dr, Cleveland,

OH

12:19pm

Concourse B, 5300 Riverside

Dr, Cleveland, OH

UberX 12.59 mi | 17 min
 

Invite your friends and family.

Get $5 off your next ride when you refer a friend to

try Uber. Share code: ala5c

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=E5Fht-2Bzc2SrMWnjw-2Brx3-2BCge-2BTDCYy8uto5SQzU7fOeVNOQeVpz4m1P4dr09tXreOowVVwsSp7Ie6EjdiuclzPpu0DxUM5J6UbPG9Q3ouzg-3D_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SKziTzTd8VG3A44xvAG9eVaCVZh82Rsyo4HvNieyeFb3o3YvcEhNgmYZeGJF4AJPljQ-2B20HrsORZiZjOSg0QyG4eBa5kcRR8U-2BGeg-2Fphl4BWZVO-2BgmWTvuK2hVBbUwAMAKoNAm2xuRnV9UbjyVcBx2qw-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKdecDS2-2BFZ7F7WZZvRKQflvZC7jwj9Ol1aO5L3-2FlNrMp_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SK9-2Bg6K8bPuZVKiNbZq1EUymzT9dN7BFUNDeJVKMUfO5i-2BMMAo0nGnpz7v0UnUWjwc1QTzdxSN9qGMynxPT-2F-2FtvHtXoEIIq4TemUAxdniAnYVSu3TPUXbSf4mbTzuSilyojUySNzir4DQ53OTYIIjMfc-3D


Save up to 5% on your next ride with Uber

Cash

Spend less on your rides when you use Uber Cash.

You can purchase directly in the Uber app.  Learn

more

REPORT LOST ITEM ❯  CONTACT SUPPORT ❯  MY TRIPS ❯  

FAQ

Forgot password

Uber Technologies
1455 Market St
San Francisco, CA 94103

Privacy

Terms

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKRVl-2FJFPuqNKlD0oeLprzbTuEzWyRGXo6tpRCSalqiE7_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SKyi0c-2FTN4-2BafFvcsAvWcRvUHim5Lp6qxk-2BoDjbugPDRSLYDALrcfrZfip-2FFZNmwyzjonwTcbK7VN-2FIqoQgjzNjaw79Z9udMQh2JAhX-2Fogkiz-2B2-2BIXEkaGMnIZaXT7E9y-2F2BdHHSof4Sy3lTX33AwvbM-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxge7rrmc1TB7MBPB0UVnv5WCgF8LXIrzArIFbD9VI0oCzeEZ-2BotxfMsld31I7yAsyBw6-2FN-2F5-2F0mi2b7tjaXiF-2FQ-3D_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SKwxvrQFu0TGq503NrfwziwtjGHXhyGarGE6R-2BQABHYeVQJo7xxCKBHQ8vhQvt4kLbA-2FhZO0i-2B2AooIl1PLiHD1TzaOKyNwXHTxzJCpCLnH83Fb3woYt-2Fk2bDXVtWfhW3co6MQzusjo2pCFHWqn5Tztk-3D
file:///tmp/help.uber.com/riders
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=E5Fht-2Bzc2SrMWnjw-2Brx3-2BCge-2BTDCYy8uto5SQzU7fOeY8Whb9IQreODC4SHBE5F-2F_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SK7Z9UPKVUe2iISm4OBr5qz3Ia7Wxj3YdfHfpaLAtDEwQH8X1f5RpKaSfW6ezA7RbkoIvrltR-2BW-2F4ifw0dDPniLTfonntQYAHtkTMFRfqQICcZYquuC2FbDKhhX60rvOc-2B5w5P2QXKtF4XWKz6A0QL5c-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxj5iFqf-2FESRS16p6bw9B-2BMWQqZiB-2BxjwRgeYbkjgMWvF_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SKytpznkjpxs2b2ZYFBQSSect-2Bj9WErkE3ySKIP2MCi8Y9fXaEOPdZgDfcKULLOmRilGhM-2FTfkH7Vxvo4Sbi8GD14fVtzWV05PX7r3H-2FBhJ-2Fxr32hbfP8Xjq1ax93Qpzy9nslDigrbFAtaf0nbpAnues-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxlPMkOdjjGMakTnjAIL7ePbKucTAwAxSOg7sPFFwzO5-2B-2BglOH2JuMg5JUK-2FYad4pICydKL0iBSnjTpe51IrGTwRLEmCubJfdjPReIlrwPUAbm-2BRa8IlcPD1k4P-2FiqEPsnM-2BEfr2iw7XxRtBPojNVhf25iKPLWtcMAKB4WYVSs4LF43eBnL-2BnKCTd1iwRDwZ-2FHg-3D-3D_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SK69ZleXNy9tbwazwNgXKVrs8dClTpxBDoA7NmIVqxHCa4Jwve7-2BN8wXHYrwc0LmseCIc-2Bh5x5fXNKGdn1uM2qlKNVdsh1YiYmXtKmliiUqT9cljZ6PwIY-2FGxgnNttW-2FXWOeBy0qkLgJVcb-2BPb70m28g-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKYosFxWyY-2FjhtDBZJR9cgRMpTXhOJzfGu1oYSzU-2FgYli_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SKytAV8vcAjl9HaydR4y3v0Pwv8gjRfGzvAaXCkcX5A4v2IHiO71pfGCTiCwBy00wHkJHa2sgUDxsnS2kR9oUI5wrnyoomgxuz-2BRaMler5o3xKqDpwxk5Ct2ZCOhJTPatQ9TUKNpj5usYFUbClXnxDto-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKYosFxWyY-2FjhtDBZJR9cgRO3B5BmldvuwJiY27V6X-2BB-2B_EX1yCmzlWJnMNpXaaThOWK833VJgX1d848TI6vkTEhOxlpToJ1pRobQeFjNiAVkUAraDDWHG1VR0azcvzDlVTLe6221BUhfAKE4xPJF1Ls-2Ffrqr0YCxyBJUGJ5KbCDr25ejygOTnbwP1bFr2DnzYgV7BlSpr71cCDvatkdma1ckYUfDto0qMdN9BGwY3iIb-2Bj9gNWaiToF7KrE9QZyMc3aVRBpnQVt6VZn5FXIyNRT0s3hPQcxIcVwanp6Kf3V60rnCcqV4p8FlB3AmR-2BQ3SK7yKFJ-2F0-2BTmLuOpHDU7Jg8xou98oCtAcjIe4w45URVnbILQUxnQ0LCX3B-2FzKVsg1MvFHpU0GXCIdxQuHvIqs3utSVO7opLl4RCVadcaDNhS1vaIQw6i4-2FI78s8oBP2CHSSyldVwV8MC9wWrsVvUjwoE-3D


Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 

Modupe Akinola 

 

TO:  Matthew Barge 

  21 CP Solutions 

 

FROM: Modupe Akinola 

 

DATE:  August 1, 2019 

 

July 2019 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 

7-1-19 through 7-31-19 Baseline Measures Analysis for report  22.0 

7-1-19 through 7-31-19 Baseline Measures follow up work and team 

conference calls 

  2.0 

 Total Hours Worked 24.0 

Total Billed Hours 10.0 

              Rate: $250/hour  

TOTAL BILLED $2,500 

Pro Bono Hours 14.0 

Travel Hours   0.0 

 



        Jennifer R. Albright  
              E-mail:   

 

TO:  Hassan Aden 

  Cleveland Police Monitor 

 

FROM: Jennifer Albright 

 

DATE:  August 1, 2019 

 

RE:  July 2019 Invoice for services to Cleveland PD 

 

 

Date   Activity       H:m   

 

07/10/2019  Phone conference with OPS re: reporting needs and use 

   of IAPro       0:54   

   

07/19/2019  Phone conference with Monitoring Team to plan use  

   of force review and review the team’s needs for project 

   management and documentation    0:48 

 

07/22/2019  Review use of force methodology memo to CPB  0:12 

 

07/24/2019  Phone conference with OPS re: IAPro use and reporting needs; 

   Phone call with Monitoring team to discuss remaining questions 

   and outstanding tasks.      1:30 

 

07/28/2019  Review OPS concerns with reporting needs in IAPro including 

   building address related IAPro reports.   2:06 

   

            

Total Hours Worked         5 hr 30 min 

 Rate: $250 / hour   

 

   Pro Bono Hours      2 hr 30 min 

 

   Total Billed (3 hours)      $750.00 

 

             

 

TOTAL INVOICE         $750.00 



MATTHEW BARGE 

JULY 2019 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 

07-01-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: IA, Court filings, 

training, additional monitoring issues.  Revise and edit engagement 

letter w/ H. Heintze re: UOF training. 

0.5 

07-02-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: CIT, UOF assessment, 

additional monitoring issues. 

0.2 

07-03-19 Various email communications w/ MT.  Revise and edit motion re: 

crisis intervention training; communicate w/ MT re: same. 

0.4 

07-07-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: crisis intervention, 

project logistics, semiannual report.  Revise and edit semiannual 

report chapters re: community engagement, CPOP, use of force; 

communicate w/ B. Chen re: same. 

2.1 

07-08-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: training review 

committee, scheduling, IAPro, arrested detainee interviews.  

Weekly internal MT call.  Conference call w/ B. Maxey re: search 

and seizure training.  Conference call w/ T. Mygatt.  Conference 

call w/ Hon. S. Oliver, Jr. 

1.8 

07-09-19 Conference call w/ H. Aden re: various monitoring issues.  

Conference call w/ MT, DOJ re: various monitoring issues.  

Weekly stakeholders' meeting with CDP, CPC, DOJ, MT.  Various 

email communications w/ MT re: logistics, deliverables 

3.2 

07-10-19 Conference call w/ MT re: SSA training.  Conference call w/ OPS, 

MT re: IAPro, data issues.  Conference call w/ CDP, DOJ, MT re: 

SSA training.  Various email communications w/ MT. 

2.2 

07-11-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: semiannual report 

drafting, monitoring leadership. 

0.1 

07-15-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: deliverables, upcoming 

logistics, search and seizure.  Weekly internal call w/ MT.  

Conference call w/ H. Aden re: various monitoring issues.  Edit and 

revise semiannual report chapters re: search and seizure, 

transparency, bias-free policing; communicate w/ B. Chen, H. Aden 

re: same. 

1.5 

07-16-19 Conference call w/ DOJ, MT.  Conference call with City, DOJ, MT 

re: CPC selection panel meeting, leadership transition.  Meet w/ H. 

Aden re: various monitoring issues.  Various email 

communications w/ CPD, DOJ, MT re: crisis intervention filing, 

leadership transition, use of force assessment, semiannual report.   

3.6 

07-17-19 Meet w/ City, CPC selection panel, DOJ, MT.  Participate in press 

conference, community meet-and-greet re: monitoring leadership 

change.  Meet w/ H. Aden re: various monitoring issues.  

6.4 



Conference call w/ A. Hardaway re: community engagement.  

Various email communications w/ MT re: IA/discipline, UOF 

assessment, Court filings. 

07-18-19 Conference call w/ H. Aden re: various monitoring issues.  Various 

email communications re: search and seizure training, supervisor 

training. 

0.6 

07-19-19 Review, revise, and edit use of force, crisis intervention sections of 

semiannual report; communicate w/ B. Chen re: same.  Various 

email communications w/ MT re: project management.  Conference 

call w/ H. Aden re: various monitoring issues.  Conference call w/ 

H. Aden, C. Cole, B. Maxey, J. Albright, M. Bretz re: use of force 
assessment.  Conference call w/ CPD, MT re: outcome measures.

2.5 

07-21-19 Email communications w/ MT re: search and seizure training, 

policy. 

0.1 

07-22-19 Weekly internal MT call.  Various email communications w/ MT 

re: UOF assessment, crisis intervention filing, monitoring website.  

Revise, edit, and reformat MT website; communicate w/ H. Aden 

re: same. 

1.6 

07-23-19 Review and edit memorandum re: UOF assessment; communicate 

w/ C. Cole re: same.  Conference call w/ DOJ, MT re: various 

monitoring issues.  Conference call w/ H. Aden re: CPC selection, 

IA, additional monitoring issues.  Edit and reformat MT website; 

communicate w/ H. Aden re: same.  Various email communications 

re: IA, UOF assessment, motion re: CPOP. 

1.4 

07-24-19 Various email communications re: OPS, UOF assessment.  Revise 

and edit semiannual report chapter re: Supervision; communicate 

w/ B. Chen re: same. 

0.8 

07-25-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: UOF assessment, 

training, IA, search and seizure training. 

0.1 

07-26-19 Revise and edit memorandum re: discipline; communicate w/ MT 

re: same; conference call w/ H. Aden re: same.  Various email 

communications re: IA Manual filings.  Conference call w/ CPD, 

DOJ, MT re: search and seizure training. 

3.1 

07-29-19 Conference call w/ C. Cole re: UOF assessment.  Various email 

communications w/ MT re: semiannual report, logistics. 

0.1 

07-30-19 Various email communications w/ MT re: use of force assessment, 

MT meeting logistics, OPS, outcome measures. 

0.2 

07-31-19 Conference call w/ DOJ, MT re: various monitoring issues.  

Various email communications w/ MT re: UOF assessment, 

semiannual report, scheduling. 

0.8 

Total Hours Worked 33.3 

Total Billed Hours 30.3 

Rate: $250/hour 

TOTAL BILLED $7,575.00 

Pro Bono Hours  3.0 



 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

 

Date Expense Amount 

16-Jul Dial7 (Residence to EWR) $  80.95 

16-Jul United Airlines (EWR to CLE, CLE to LGA)* $874.60 

16-Jul Uber (CLE to Downtown) $  24.57   

17-Jul Marriott (7/16–7/17) $164.27 

17-Jul Uber (Downtown to CLE) $  24.45 

 TOTAL $1,168.84 

 

* Due to weather, Mr. Barge’s flight from CLE to LGA was cancelled, which required Mr. Barge 

to make alternative arrangements to return to New York for other commitments.  Because the CLE 

to LGA portion of the trip was not refunded, reimbursement is sought for the original, purchased 

itinerary rather than the as-traveled costs of alternative rental car and hotel transportation. 

 

Mr. Barge does not bill for travel/transport time, meals, or miscellaneous personal expenses 

associated with the project and/or traveling for the project.  Whenever feasible to do so, he 

coordinates ground transportation with other Monitoring Team members. 







Thursday, August 1, 2019 at 5:48:19 PM Eastern Daylight Time
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Subject: [Business] Your Tuesday evening trip with Uber
Date: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 at 6:31:05 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: Uber Receipts
To:
AFachments: map_cc537d24-0992-412b-9049-05ef0b2e0758_wide, map_cc537d24-0992-412b-9049-

05ef0b2e0758

Total: $24.57
Tue, Jul 16, 2019

We're glad to have you as an Uber
Rewards Gold Member.

Thanks for riding,
Matthew

  

  

Total $24.57
   You earned 49 points on this trip

Your upfront price has been adjusted due to unanticipated tolls or
surcharges on this trip. Please see the receipt breakdown for details.

Trip Fare $17.27
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You rode with Nadine

4.88 Rating

Nadine is known for: 

Excellent Service

 

How was your ride?

RATE OR TIP

When you ride with Uber, your trips are insured in case of a covered
accident. Learn more.

UberX 13.26 mi | 19 min

Subtotal $17.27

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $7.30

Amount Charged  

$24.57

A temporary hold of $20.57 was placed on your payment method •••• 1001 at the start of the trip. This
is not a charge and has or will be removed. It should disappear from your bank statement shortly. Learn
More

xidcc537d24-0992-412b-9049-05ef0b2e0758
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=E5Fht-2Bzc2SrMWnjw-2Brx3-2BCge-2BTDCYy8uto5SQzU7fOdczYSKT98tk3bMxjzPmuQPfxkOsIZ0wy8xIWHCK5YMUNv7ynw5wPp16ikoYq7nnzk-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7J7ACc-2FXQ4xtSEKy4jwopG6-2FZ5ulX77FOJK90BkBB6IfLpcyIXUEVFz4UmM3EpDOHJG2bUPdyMI85I9yOXyDJHAHPIfa6-2BISDM5E4U8RHHRjlcUrWVDU5huAkjhI-2FikE1KL-2Fa7XV6pwQathnxdDK1nk-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKdecDS2-2BFZ7F7WZZvRKQflvZC7jwj9Ol1aO5L3-2FlNrMp_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7F-2BrMUFYmtcoBLyg3d2sqJXqGHHObbkAeMDQ1wSr2dslFM2U-2BJntjJsxSeAIwO9oVlhjKdy5BTNWTS-2B5IoVHztJieOhes4s7CJHcT2e40Yk3RIGw8gB3XjE8tdiIpHOWFpxp3vG8EupNN2Yy4FB7TDc-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=QDYQ7MQTBF5X8FekeHanzTljNUncuNO30x6ih3WYDbc-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7In4eDth2QmSRcPYIm-2Fd4AQrElHnu50v6VF-2F1MT-2Bjxi7N-2BMZ2mX5mpJkxjCuMwJmtxocjUutiVmscwtWuLL3-2B2nKKNrc1O5JOZW7-2BE69yJvxJ7FMNSEfCx7d3Cd5aWsv2S6eo-2Fgyokork6vw5gcrT5c-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=QDYQ7MQTBF5X8FekeHanzWSrZl-2FfpqGrr-2FKRTso2BBbaEVKy6K-2Fxu7YqE31T942O_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7PTxP3cbAUZR1j-2BRlKnjefAYpa5iqEYLPY95TzJR8TWjpvP5feIV5VoyJot9-2F36CHEpNIB81CLbV9asT5hnchuby137yfyJqHJ7UkHKeYSY8ti2opnoWg213eGlUN1rgpW-2BbGnHRPVP4U9lriYgRv8Q-3D
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06:11pm
Concourse B, 5300 Riverside
Dr, Cleveland, OH

06:30pm
208 St Clair Ave NE,
Cleveland, OH

 

Invite your friends and family.

Get $5 off your next ride when you refer a friend to try
Uber. Share code: yg6v6

 

Save up to 5% on your next ride with Uber
Cash

Spend less on your rides when you use Uber

Cash. You can purchase directly in the Uber app. 

Learn more

REPORT LOST ITEM ›  CONTACT SUPPORT ›  

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKRVl-2FJFPuqNKlD0oeLprzbTuEzWyRGXo6tpRCSalqiE7_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7E-2Bck9z7lkl1djENGZFvjbzAOwVAbuhB1YKYIYo33MQDr5ZOgL7DX6BytwkGDgMKRHeWEuF5y3OaeFY70D4Mlhp5qFr6NJjOoTCkSXFBMiJDtC9SrW-2B-2FrpC-2FupUTj4CyRMSDJTV2GiuI-2BzqpVgoW74U-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxge7rrmc1TB7MBPB0UVnv5WCgF8LXIrzArIFbD9VI0oCzeEZ-2BotxfMsld31I7yAsyBw6-2FN-2F5-2F0mi2b7tjaXiF-2FQ-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7HSaN5du6CXQAnWqzE22FuUqXPi5-2BJSVGWw7Ir13i6v0-2BUTH1MuuBDTA1HRBtWOcGQiqRidXpvRlcU9Nw9UTBHh-2BPZLuPAmNTFZZ9RPWtmhmpb22d7kFV5s1qqrxui5Y4YqILah10LTRgCWtjVux1lQ-3D
applewebdata://6D07F72F-A659-4214-886A-2BE9723EEFB2/help.uber.com/riders
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MY TRIPS ›  

FAQ

Forgot password

Uber Technologies
1455 Market St
San Francisco, CA 94103

Privacy

Terms

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=E5Fht-2Bzc2SrMWnjw-2Brx3-2BCge-2BTDCYy8uto5SQzU7fOeY8Whb9IQreODC4SHBE5F-2F_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7PP-2BNIJldLvp4KBvSrG3sBaP6zLP16lalMNzkCNb9P-2FUo0v2mGLGp5-2FdYvSiFEFv27drR4JSWfhPGG7CY8mur1uDoywR-2FFgLQV4AQVdh325-2FyHcExlMlIsgIeooHKSt3-2F-2Fs1ki7E5-2Fvh2x5icWI7TpQ-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxj5iFqf-2FESRS16p6bw9B-2BMWQqZiB-2BxjwRgeYbkjgMWvF_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7O9cEqTvw3pFB-2F8YKpnxQr3Jmz1kVq7loIqdlmSbdnPGv6DG8KDcyusJCJJ5LjG-2B3VplC1nVjYOZoGNXWHsyHx8t0rFqzW-2F6YL1w4gzReYNjLIw9y-2F3ayR2i-2F0rtMad-2Fu9-2BOwVTko7Myg4dAvKLbTLk-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxlPMkOdjjGMakTnjAIL7ePbKucTAwAxSOg7sPFFwzO5-2B-2BglOH2JuMg5JUK-2FYad4pICydKL0iBSnjTpe51IrGTwRLEmCubJfdjPReIlrwPUAbm-2BRa8IlcPD1k4P-2FiqEPsnM-2BEfr2iw7XxRtBPojNVhf25iKPLWtcMAKB4WYVSs4LF43eBnL-2BnKCTd1iwRDwZ-2FHg-3D-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7PI4fLfIDAtFECGF3ubSY-2BHLH082OBXM4QfLiypSebsMZwvgeJiNVjPDiHQ-2FUY2tHCRSNfwDvUEiu9q-2BPVUV42StdzF0hBsD-2Bhun1kJSPRZSyV-2B0CAT7liPqaXgiUz2A3vf-2FQm8-2FadrCcTrM62VHjIc-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKYosFxWyY-2FjhtDBZJR9cgRMpTXhOJzfGu1oYSzU-2FgYli_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7HG-2Bw6pCosAFhoLP9UojjsKYXUi7W2BeM70JoV2UOfH4W7dR2qIo7QdKJJPc-2FmuB9qd9hFKM-2FueIno8jQjah5C8FdMKgcot9HI9-2FlwSjwpgFjE5M941xcCXaCnSixX3IkE-2BIytxbnbLanH6HeIpc07w-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKYosFxWyY-2FjhtDBZJR9cgRO3B5BmldvuwJiY27V6X-2BB-2B_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVP-2FstvFdzcLd-2BgfCW6TSb-2B2UwKjpfJWfr3axlQF8wonUbfgeVKfuuBlEe310382aAX80HrdFT1ZqAP2J1Ka4dEIVGHWzgC4q5wg3aCQRor5a8YLxw5-2BetvDJN7hskq-2BpZ-2FfTDsw44FHprCLwSX-2B2h7Bat-2FRkQSJOAcaQDpAdDjQf3RWbcin4lu2PCYy5lWlPsXh6G4taTUY-2FlQX-2FoVy5FJQxEC6NGhP89uuNYHkBDkefFGL9dzFuBegajSXG7sNOjSo-2B1hABnMX7jPyhT-2BTfLg6k9TZWz7-2FCc8b965rVKrTw-3D


Thursday, July 18, 2019 at 2:25:21 PM Eastern Daylight Time

Page 1 of 4

Subject: [Business] Your Wednesday a1ernoon trip with Uber
Date: Wednesday, July 17, 2019 at 2:29:34 PM Eastern Daylight Time
From: Uber Receipts
To:
AGachments: map_dba16ca4-f596-4650-b031-24f1729a8d10_wide, map_dba16ca4-f596-4650-b031-

24f1729a8d10

Total: $24.45
Wed, Jul 17, 2019

We're glad to have you as an Uber
Rewards Gold Member.

Thanks for riding,
Matthew

  

  

Total $24.45
   You earned 48 points on this trip

Trip Fare $17.15

Subtotal $17.15

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees $7.30

Amount Charged  

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=QDYQ7MQTBF5X8FekeHanzTljNUncuNO30x6ih3WYDbc-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKkrfJK-2FWakfRm1aknb8VWkM0hk1yl9Otk1jZvcgMdMzlShGP0P1KzZDisw1dcWqGDb5Ix44-2F2c2RjUq494nauLvNvhCSDfCXEhk91gltyaGf4wiGYHyYmdGwifPDlt6jOem70xtfByZsQ-2BZUwQbCKSI-3D
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h

You rode with Carl

4.94 Rating

Carl is known for: 

Excellent Service

 

How was your ride?

RATE OR TIP

When you ride with Uber, your trips are insured in case of a covered
accident. Learn more.

02:11pm
1360 W Mall Dr, Cleveland, OH

02:29pm
Concourse B, 5300 Riverside
Dr, Cleveland, OH

UberX 12.60 mi | 18 min

$24.45
xiddba16ca4-f596-4650-b031-24f1729a8d10
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=E5Fht-2Bzc2SrMWnjw-2Brx3-2BCge-2BTDCYy8uto5SQzU7fOfJvLbZszlxZ9-2BeH-2FJNPk5dPNUT5SgOuPR50MOWcb3WOETrbzMN5tbI-2FNTwNtl-2BBro-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKg2EXavU-2BmxQE6dfAEWXBw2es-2FRB1IfNI7XaxLjrbcwA-2FTHq96yiuaducUZGLkBqTR0A-2B-2Bw6eISUh5ORkw-2BjsCvg5uFXBvPcxZUrbRTFvYCam0vcUUFKBmYBNwjCDPG9x-2FuveKTbdfSpXqSerzmD2RI-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKdecDS2-2BFZ7F7WZZvRKQflvZC7jwj9Ol1aO5L3-2FlNrMp_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKuVidE73mLczXW3H2ECDqKCoBKZwOEOIYazxRrcTIuQZY2r4MGFhshRqXiJUyM01-2BGszCdecNa0LWUpOOgbjt6pj3fWMgd9lOAEGQEXlbI1fyr1MdDZCxIS-2FWNOD8hRcxpJSXcyC0wYrpKIPsezFVq8-3D
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Invite your friends and family.

Get $5 off your next ride when you refer a friend to try
Uber. Share code: yg6v6

 

Save up to 5% on your next ride with Uber
Cash

Spend less on your rides when you use Uber

Cash. You can purchase directly in the Uber app. 

Learn more

REPORT LOST ITEM ›  CONTACT SUPPORT ›  

MY TRIPS ›  

FAQ

Forgot password

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKRVl-2FJFPuqNKlD0oeLprzbTuEzWyRGXo6tpRCSalqiE7_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKn8wD4GrqORRzGWWNjg7c3gbbvEQJqb3Iqt7PRyU5aBPhVxSKHtCUhtoktkt7P-2Ftaj2RsHhx1qzxavpuBhpjuUtSoqr4R4PeEKmsqMLB94dlvAiqWL0aqv8iVYpNisyIs72Bz9AiB8qwPo7BzIG8cmU-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxge7rrmc1TB7MBPB0UVnv5WCgF8LXIrzArIFbD9VI0oCzeEZ-2BotxfMsld31I7yAsyBw6-2FN-2F5-2F0mi2b7tjaXiF-2FQ-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKkcwycw1FpFOl5buTwm3sm62R0t3e26-2B0GGllTTWJGkHjnbsJ4Dog2aw7cxrpjX5SGsKNbSN-2FZDYKboPTIk1gLvvzS-2BcgX-2FlXN-2Bq1lcSBDGsjFaUFThy4Ux9XbP99QqdESjGT3tWwbz5XlIV67K0q00-3D
applewebdata://C1497E76-AB82-4F2F-8968-189BAB5FFA99/help.uber.com/riders
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=E5Fht-2Bzc2SrMWnjw-2Brx3-2BCge-2BTDCYy8uto5SQzU7fOeY8Whb9IQreODC4SHBE5F-2F_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKm0rY3VFDNa1kIH9bmtP00bV84Lgw4GbWHsQQ-2FFftzkontLl3Fo77WgdryP-2B-2FMKVqlyds1mbW-2BoUqJCoWkfGB5xPr7SyuDQq1HPe6f3YCod0UpPD6lk-2FZb4Kg4UXGP5f8L8dyzccuOSH0up9A-2FArzO8-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxj5iFqf-2FESRS16p6bw9B-2BMWQqZiB-2BxjwRgeYbkjgMWvF_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKjxhFi0lNpDi0FQOsrsF-2BXC-2BYQU9SSK87NIQns-2FYehMzuGo8C2CCzCoLlTLLcbd6RS7M3imsIYNiWz-2BNvUOnQUn-2Bnad-2FohnvUztClBQDlkJ-2BpFyIdVmg54w-2Bx1Hqn0hhIBMlU8zc0DV7Xe9evExh384-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=ITf-2BUi9bO5sUhPgUfzyAxlPMkOdjjGMakTnjAIL7ePbKucTAwAxSOg7sPFFwzO5-2B-2BglOH2JuMg5JUK-2FYad4pICydKL0iBSnjTpe51IrGTwRLEmCubJfdjPReIlrwPUAbm-2BRa8IlcPD1k4P-2FiqEPsnM-2BEfr2iw7XxRtBPojNVhf25iKPLWtcMAKB4WYVSs4LF43eBnL-2BnKCTd1iwRDwZ-2FHg-3D-3D_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKqUZa-2FBB1L2BsswdxW3ZDFGTrUrl-2BGMBegwRVs2N94KAkiSNDQMqeb6LdSFc79mowJPdqFsewQAKIvkjagxVBqxh4gKuCOC3t6rz55LMoR6Rb2UmyBvs9fFXCT90QxPle0A0ddsrnHPa2WJAoVr9aWw-3D
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Uber Technologies
1455 Market St
San Francisco, CA 94103

Privacy

Terms

https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKYosFxWyY-2FjhtDBZJR9cgRMpTXhOJzfGu1oYSzU-2FgYli_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKgr6dSkvGMan5LTiKfKPYMzEB46r8yzTwHDtD7h7aA0wkrr7onuaj6KUdv8ewUArkXydO1GMAjETBwM0ZijyVy0qpNA3QrbL-2BLWnE3OGUtaAAyGt-2BtFGXjfD2NG2wlYnIWPxmnnqb6rkQrm9Vwd6SJ0-3D
https://email.uber.com/wf/click?upn=Ac78kxLEU5x8sS8qIl5fKYosFxWyY-2FjhtDBZJR9cgRO3B5BmldvuwJiY27V6X-2BB-2B_eLFMrKDT8iBxZ-2Fbnk-2BZqvfwN8rdC2Am63mrWLCK-2BfTleuBUU7JePaT1O8hMk-2FS7EB8Ic6qPG6nrC232ZrVY7vSfC61dLZHaum92AvtSW1m2QsKgv2GaOhXykQQrcuArVt6CRVSRxgvZcgkYjhu-2FJq2oaxb0kFcKrIX7tAOv2nsbNPi3sZG0KbsRQCjqAzcCBWY3ZCMAx-2F3f71H5I8ywpIZKSoBZYYIDtHV-2BIKojytb2JiEhTvqOjUwUx3BDgnGetLX-2Fs2kb1qed5PQPG-2Ft4dKilNpxGN9tDGqcFs7l8268G5q10l9xCfFcMZRHzbU5unylPmBTgfm6Ybe7CAyErh-2BNDjJwHl4m7DDjZBxVCaNmfsaQQsY-2BAd3mPesNeA8r01khNjjLD7s-2Bj-2BFh3WCJtoU2KnUWK-2Fz5YJfLiQE9votBI-3D


Thursday, July 11, 2019 at 8:33:21 AM Eastern Daylight Time
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Subject: eTicket I)nerary and Receipt for Confirma)on G48KV0
Date: Thursday, July 11, 2019 at 8:32:08 AM Eastern Daylight Time
From: United Airlines, Inc.
To:

Confirmation: G48KV0
Check-In >

Airfare: 786.97U
S
D

Per Person Total: 874.60U
S
D

U.S. Transportation Tax: 59.03
September 11th Security Fee: 11.2
U.S. Flight Segment Tax: 8.4
U.S. Passenger Facility
Charge:

9

Receipt for confirmation number G48KV0

United logo link to home page
Issue Date: July 11, 2019

TRAVELER INFORMATION
Traveler eTicket Number Frequent FlyerNumber Seats

BARGE/MATTHEW 0162462302053 25D/23C

FLIGHT INFORMATION
Day, Date Flight ClassDeparture City and TimeArrival City and Time AircraftMeal
Tue,
16JUL19

UA2124E NEWARK, NJ 
(EWR - LIBERTY) 3:35
PM

CLEVELAND, OH 
(CLE) 5:19 PM

737-900

Wed,
17JUL19

UA4106M
CLEVELAND, OH 
(CLE) 4:40 PM

NEW YORK, NY 
(LGA - LAGUARDIA) 6:20
PM

ERJ-
145

Flight operated by EXPRESSJET AIRLINES INC. doing business as UNITED EXPRESS.

FARE INFORMATION

Fare Breakdown Form of Payment:

gits

https://www.united.com/travel/checkin/quickstart.aspx?camp=2004_email_ckin&irLocation=EWR&irPNR=G48KV0&LastName=BARGE&LangCode=en-US
http://www.united.com/
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eTicket Total: 874.60U
S
D

The airfare you paid on this itinerary totals: 786.97 USD

The taxes, fees, and surcharges paid total: 87.63 USD

Fare Rules: Additional charges may apply for changes in addition to any fare rules listed.

NONREF/0VALUAFTDPT/CHGFEE
Cancel reservations before the scheduled departure time or TICKET HAS NO
VALUE.

Baggage allowance and charges for this itinerary.

Baggage fees are per traveler

Origin and destination for checked baggage 1st bag 2nd

bag

Maximum weight and dimensions
per piece of baggage

Max wt / dim per piece
7/16/2019 Newark, NJ (EWR - Liberty) to

Cleveland, OH (CLE)
30.00
USD

40.00
USD 50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in (157.0cm)

7/17/2019 Cleveland, OH (CLE) to New York,
NY (LGA - LaGuardia)

30.00
USD

40.00
USD 50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in (157.0cm)

MileagePlus Accrual Details

 
BARGE/MATTHEW

Date Flight From/To Award
Miles PQM PQS PQD

7/16/2019 2124 Newark, NJ (EWR - Liberty)-Cleveland, OH (CLE)

7/17/2019 4106 Cleveland, OH (CLE)-New York, NY (LGA -
LaGuardia)

 

Matthew's MileagePlus Accrual totals:

Important Information about MileagePlus Earning
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Accruals vary based on the terms and conditions of the traveler’s frequent flyer program, the traveler’s
frequent flyer status and the itinerary selected. United MileagePlus® mileage accrual is subject to the rules
of the MileagePlus program

 
Once travel has started, accruals will no longer display. You can view your MileagePlus account for posted
accrual

 
You can earn up to 75,000 award miles per ticket. The 75,000 award miles cap may be applied to your
posted flight activity in an order different than shown

 PQD are a Premier status requirement for members in the U.S. only.

 Accrual is only displayed for MileagePlus members who choose to accrue to their MileagePlus account.

eTicket Reminders

 

Check-in Requirement - Bags must be checked and boarding passes obtained at least 30 minutes prior to
scheduled departure. Baggage will not be accepted and advance seat assignments may be cancelled if this
condition is not met.

EXCEPTION: When departing from Anchorage, Atlanta, Austin, Baltimore, Chicago, Cincinnati,
Cleveland, Dallas/Ft. Worth, Denver, Detroit, Fort Lauderdale, Greenville-Spartanburg, Guam, Honolulu,
Houston, Indianapolis, Jacksonville,

Kona, Las Vegas, Los Angeles, Maui, Miami, New York (LGA), Newark, Orange County (SNA), Orlando,
Philadelphia, Phoenix, Pittsburgh, Raleigh/Durham, Reno, San Diego, San Francisco, San Juan, PR (60
minutes), Savannah, Seattle, St. Louis,

St. Thomas, U.S. Virgin Islands (60 minutes), Tampa, Washington, DC (both IAD and DCA), the check in
requirement time for Passengers and Bags is 45 minutes except where noted.

 
Boarding Requirement - Passengers must be prepared to board at the departure gate with their boarding
pass at least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure.

 
Failure to meet the Boarding Requirements may result in cancellation of reservations, denied boarding,
removal of checked baggage from the aircraft and loss of eligibility for denied boarding compensation.

 Bring your boarding pass or this eTicket Receipt along with photo identification to the airport.

 

The FAA now restricts carry-on baggage to one bag plus one personal item (purse, briefcase, laptop
computer, etc.) per passenger. The fare rules for your ticket may restrict your carry-on baggage allowance
even further.

 
For up to the minute flight information, sign-up for our Flight Status Updates or call 1-800-824-6200; in
Spanish 1-800-426-5561.

 
If flight segments are not flown in order, your reservation will be cancelled. Rebooking will be subject to
the fare rules governing your ticket.

 For the most current status of your reservation, go to our Flight Status page.

 
Your eTicket is non transferable and valid for 1 year from the issue date unless otherwise noted in the fare
rules.

http://www.united.com/travel/policies/id/
https://www.united.com/web/en-US/content/flightStatus/updates.aspx
https://www.united.com/web/en-US/apps/travel/flightstatus/Default.aspx
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Data Protection Notice

Your personal data will be processed in accordance with the applicable carriers privacy policy and if your
booking is made via a reservation system provider ("GDS"), with its privacy policy. These are available at

http://www.iatatravelcenter.com/privacy or from the carrier or GDS directly. You should read this
documentation, which applies to your booking and specifies, for example, how your personal data is

collected, stored, used, disclosed and transferred

Customer Care Contact Information

We welcome your compliments, comments or complaints regarding United or a United travel experience.

You may contact us using our Customer Care form

Hazardous materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials on board aircraft in your luggage or on your person.
A violation can result in five years imprisonment and penalties of $250,000 or more (49 U.S.C. 5124).

Hazardous materials include explosives, compressed gases, flammable liquids and solids, oxidizers,
poisons, corrosives and radioactive materials. Common examples of hazardous materials/dangerous goods

include spare or loose lithium batteries, fireworks, strike-anywhere matches, aerosols, pesticides, bleach
and corrosive materials.

Additional information can be found on:

united.com restricted items page
FAA website Pack Safe page
TSA website Prohibited Items page

Refunds Within 24 Hours

When you book and ticket a reservation through united.com, the United mobile app, the United Customer
Contact Center, at our ticket counters or city ticket offices, or if you

use MileagePlus® miles to book an award ticket, we will allow you to cancel the ticketed reservation
without penalty and receive a 100 percent refund of the ticket price

to the original form of payment if you cancel the reservation within 24 hours of purchase and if the
reservation is made one week or more prior to scheduled flight departure.

https://www.united.com/web/en-US/content/contact/customer/default.aspx
http://www.united.com/web/en-US/content/travel/baggage/dangerous.aspx
http://www.faa.gov/about/initiatives/hazmat_safety/
http://www.tsa.gov/traveler-information/prohibited-items
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IMPORTANT CONSUMER NOTICES

Notice of Baggage Liability Limitations - For domestic travel between points within the
United States (except for domestic portions of international journeys), United’s liability for loss
of, damage to, or delay in delivery of a customer’s checked baggage is limited to $3,500 per
ticketed customer unless a higher value is declared in advance and additional charges are paid
(not applicable to wheelchairs or other assistive devices). For such travel, United assumes no
liability for high value, fragile, perishable, or otherwise excluded items; excess valuation may
not be declared on certain types of valuable articles. Further information may be obtained from
the carrier. For international travel governed by the Warsaw Convention (including the domestic
portions of the trip), maximum liability is approximately 640 USD per bag for checked
baggage, and 400 USD per passenger for unchecked baggage. For international travel governed
by the Montreal Convention (including the domestic portions of the trip), maximum liability is
1,131 SDRs per passenger for baggage, whether checked or unchecked. For baggage lost,
delayed, or damaged in connection with domestic travel, United requires that customers provide
preliminary notice within 24 hours after arrival of the flight on which the baggage was or was to
be transported and submit a written claim within 45 days of the flight. For baggage damaged or
delayed in connection with most international travel (including domestic portions of
international journeys), the Montreal Convention and United require customers to provide
carriers written notice as follows: (a) for damaged baggage, within seven days from the date of
receipt of the damaged baggage; (b) for delayed baggage, within 21 days from the date the
baggage should have been returned to the customer. Please refer to Rule 28 of United’s Contract
of Carriage for important information relating to baggage and other limitations of liability.
Notice of Incorporated Terms - Transportation is subject to the terms and conditions of
United’s Contract of Carriage, which are incorporated herein by reference. Incorporated terms
may include, but are not limited to: 1. Limits on liability for personal injury or death of the
customer, and for loss, damage, or delay of goods and baggage, including high value, fragile,
perishable, or otherwise excluded items. 2. Claims restrictions, including time periods within
which customers must file a claim or bring an action against the carrier. 3. Rights of the carrier
to change terms of the contract. 4. Rules about reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times,
and refusal to carry. 5. Rights of the carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform
service, including schedule changes, substitution of an alternate air carrier or aircraft, and
rerouting. The full text of United’s Contract of Carriage is available at united.com or you may
request a copy at any United ticket counter. Passengers have the right, upon request at any
location where United’s tickets are sold within the United States, to receive free of charge by
mail or other delivery service the full text of United’s Contract of Carriage.
Notice of Certain Terms - If you have purchased a restricted ticket, depending on the rules
applicable to the fare paid, one or more restrictions including, but not limited to, the following
may apply to your travel: (1) the ticket may not be refundable but can be exchanged for a fee for
another restricted fare ticket meeting all the rules/restrictions of the original ticket (including the
payment of any difference in fares); (2) a fee may apply for changing/canceling reservations; or
(3) select tickets may not be eligible for refunds or changes even for a fee; (4) select tickets
have no residual value and cannot be applied towards the purchase of future travel; or (5) travel
may be restricted to specific flights and/ or times and a minimum and/or maximum stay may be
required. United reserves the right to refuse carriage to any person who has acquired a ticket in
violation of any United tariffs, rules, or regulations, or in violation of any applicable national,
federal, state, or local law, order, regulation, or ordinance. Notwithstanding the foregoing, you
are entitled to a full refund if you cancel a ticket purchased at least a week prior to departure
within 24 hours of purchase.
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Notice of Boarding Times - For Domestic flights, customers must be at the boarding gate at
least 15 minutes prior to scheduled departure. For International flights, customers must be at the
boarding gate at least 30 minutes prior to scheduled departure. The time limits provided by
United in this Notice are minimum time requirements. Customer and baggage processing times
may differ from airport to airport. Please visit united.com for information regarding airport-
specific boarding times. It is the customer’s responsibility to arrive at the airport with enough
time to complete check-in, baggage, and security screening processes within these minimum
time limits. Please be sure to check flight information monitors for the correct boarding gate and
the departure time of your flight. Failure to be at the boarding gate by the required time could
result in the loss of your seat without compensation, regardless of whether you are already
checked in or have a confirmed seat and boarding pass.
Advice to International Passengers on Carrier Liability - Passengers on a journey involving
an ultimate destination or a stop in a country other than the country of departure are advised that
international treaties known as the Montreal Convention, or its predecessor, the Warsaw
Convention, including its amendments, may apply to the entire journey, including any portion
thereof within a country. For such passengers, the treaty, including contracts of carriage
embodied in applicable tariffs, governs, and may limit the liability of the Carrier in respect of
death or injury to passengers, and for destruction or loss of, or damage to, baggage, and for
delay of passengers and baggage.
Notice - Overbooking of Flights - Airline flights may be overbooked, and there is a slight
chance that a seat will not be available on a flight for which a person has a confirmed
reservation. If the flight is overbooked, no one will be denied a seat until airline personnel first
ask for volunteers willing to give up their reservation in exchange for compensation of the
airline’s choosing. If there are not enough volunteers, the airline will deny boarding to other
persons in accordance with its particular boarding priority. With few exceptions, including
failure to comply with the carrier’s check-in deadlines, which are available upon request from
the air carrier, persons, denied boarding involuntarily are entitled to compensation. The
complete rules for the payment of compensation and each airline’s boarding priorities are
available at all airport ticket counters and boarding locations. Some airlines do not apply these
consumer protections to travel from some foreign countries, although other consumer
protections may be available. Check with your airline or your travel agent.

Thank you for choosing United Airlines
united.com

Legal Notices. Privacy Policy
Copyright © 2019 United Airlines, Inc. All rights reserved.

For assistance, please contact United Airlines via telephone or via e-mail.

http://www.united.com/
http://www.united.com/web/en-US/content/legal.aspx
http://www.united.com/web/en-US/content/privacy.aspx


Date Description of Activities Hours
7/1/19 officer training surveys hunt, est methodology for UOF Reviews 0.50
7/2/19 emails, recruitment, UOF , detainees interviews 0.50
7/5/19 organizing detainees interviews calls and emails 0.50
7/8/19 UOF reviews planning and outcome measures collections/reviews 1.25
7/9/19 call with TSF on UOF, DOJ call, All Parties call 1.50
7/10/19 collecting and sharing emails for semi annual report, outcome measures 0.25
7/11/19 UOF Reviews planning 0.25
7/15/19 outcome measures reports - data discussions, arrested detainees set up 0.75
7/16/19 0.50
7/16/19 0.50
7/17/19 compstat meeting 1.00
7/18/19 UOF reviews set up and reporting, data discussion on outcome measures 1.00

7/19/19 finalizing methodology and numbers for UOF review memo, meeting on outcome 
measures 2.00

7/20/19 drafting UOF methodology and memo 2.00
7/22/19 discussions on data and uof reviews, call with TSF on interviews 1.00
7/23/19 call with DOJ 1.00
7/23/19 UOF Review and arrested detainee calls 1.00
7/24/19 UOF reviews and arrested detainee calls 1.00
7/29/19 emails and calls on UOF reviews 0.50
7/30/19 discussion on data for outcome measures 0.50

Total hours worked 17.50
Pro Bono hours 5.50
Total hours billed 12.00

Rate $250.00 hour 3,000.00$     
Expenses See Reimbursement Sheet for Detail 26.00$          

Total Invoice 3,026.00$     

Remit payment to:

Cindy Kassanos

8/5/19

Signature Date

INVOICE 
CHRISTINE M. COLE at COMMUNITY RESOURCES FOR JUSTICE

weekly call, UOF reviews, outcome measures

Invoice Period:  June 2019

Hassan Aden

August 5, 2019

Re:  Cleveland Monitoring



Date Expense description Amount Reference

7/9/19
telephone call with Professor Todd Foglesong, planning interviews of 
arrested detainees $14.00 1

7/22/19
telephone call with Professor Todd Foglesong, planning interviews of 
arrested detainees $12.00 2

Total expenses $26.00

Reimbursement for Expenses



ATTN: CHRISTINE M. COLE
Page: 1 of 4
Issue Date: May 25, 2019
Account Number:

Total due

$110.85
AutoPay is scheduled for:

Jun 01, 2019

Managing your AT&T bills, products, and services on the go? It's a snap with myAT&T. Go to
att.com/myatt to sign in or sign up.

Account summary

Your last bill $110.85

Payment, May 02 - Thank you! -$110.85

Remaining balance $0.00

Service summary

 Wireless Page 2 $110.85

Total services $110.85

Total due $110.85
AutoPay is scheduled to charge your card on Jun 01, 2019

ATTN: CHRISTINE M. COLE
AutoPay of $110.85 is scheduled for
Jun 01, 2019
Account number: 650372960
 

 

AT&T MOBILITY
PO Box 536216
Atlanta, GA 30353-6216

965000006503729600000000001108500000011085004

http://www.att.com/myatt
http://www.att.com/myatt


AT&T
Mobile Num508-
CALL DETA 508
User NameCHRISTINE COLE

SDDV=Shared Minutes

WIFI=Call over Wi-Fi

Item Day Date Time Number Called Call To Min Rate Code Airtime ChaLD/Add'l ChTotal Charge

1 Wednesda 6/26/2019 10:14AM 800-449-6332 Toll Free CL 7 WIFI 0 0 0

2 Wednesda 6/26/2019 11:12AM 508-393-2368 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

3 Wednesda 6/26/2019 12:23PM 617-972-6420 WATERTOWN MA 2 WIFI 0 0 0

4 Wednesda 6/26/2019 3:30PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 15 WIFI 0 0 0

5 Wednesda 6/26/2019 3:44PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 26 SDDV 0 0 0

6 Wednesda 6/26/2019 4:10PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

7 Wednesda 6/26/2019 4:10PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 2 WIFI 0 0 0

8 Wednesda 6/26/2019 4:12PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

9 Wednesda 6/26/2019 4:12PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 6 WIFI 0 0 0

10 Wednesda 6/26/2019 4:17PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 11 SDDV 0 0 0

11 Wednesda 6/26/2019 6:22PM 781-270-9200 BURLINGTON MA 3 WIFI 0 0 0

12 Wednesda 6/26/2019 7:02PM 508-725-3797 INCOMING CL 1 WIFI 0 0 0

13 Wednesda 6/26/2019 7:02PM 508-725-3797 INCOMING CL 3 SDDV 0 0 0

14 Thursday 6/27/2019 6:51PM 617-924-5692 WATERTOWN MA 1 WIFI 0 0 0

15 Friday 6/28/2019 09:05AM 781-270-9200 BURLINGTON MA 5 WIFI 0 0 0

16 Friday 6/28/2019 1:48PM 508-725-3797 INCOMING CL 2 WIFI 0 0 0

17 Friday 6/28/2019 2:58PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 1 WIFI 0 0 0

18 Friday 6/28/2019 3:04PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 WIFI 0 0 0

19 Friday 6/28/2019 3:05PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

20 Friday 6/28/2019 3:19PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 28 SDDV 0 0 0

21 Sunday 6/30/2019 1:35PM 202-297-7972 WASHINGTON DC 25 SDDV 0 0 0

22 Monday 7/1/2019 09:06AM 413-230-9479 INCOMING CL 23 SDDV 0 0 0

23 Monday 7/1/2019 09:29AM 866-316-1519 Toll Free CL 23 SDDV 0 0 0

24 Monday 7/1/2019 3:58PM 414-235-1764 MILWAUKEE WI 54 SDDV 0 0 0

25 Monday 7/1/2019 6:08PM 781-910-9241 LYNN MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

26 Tuesday 7/2/2019 08:20AM 508-393-2368 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0



27 Tuesday 7/2/2019 10:00AM 617-455-8941 INCOMING CL 53 SDDV 0 0 0

28 Tuesday 7/2/2019 11:00AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 21 SDDV 0 0 0

29 Tuesday 7/2/2019 2:17PM 312-459-1391 CHICAGO IL 16 SDDV 0 0 0

30 Tuesday 7/2/2019 5:05PM 978-337-7901 LOWELL MA 4 SDDV 0 0 0

31 Tuesday 7/2/2019 6:25PM 508-393-2368 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

32 Wednesda 7/3/2019 09:14AM 800-433-7300 Toll Free CL 3 SDDV 0 0 0

33 Wednesda 7/3/2019 09:30AM 913-201-8403 INCOMING CL 30 SDDV 0 0 0

34 Wednesda 7/3/2019 11:31AM 617-338-2345 BOSTON MA 40 SDDV 0 0 0

35 Wednesda 7/3/2019 1:00PM 503-679-2594 PORTLAND OR 21 SDDV 0 0 0

36 Wednesda 7/3/2019 1:30PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

37 Wednesda 7/3/2019 1:32PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 14 SDDV 0 0 0

38 Wednesda 7/3/2019 1:45PM 202-436-6235 WASHINGTON DC 14 SDDV 0 0 0

39 Wednesda 7/3/2019 2:13PM 508-393-2368 INCOMING CL 12 SDDV 0 0 0

40 Wednesda 7/3/2019 2:29PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 61 SDDV 0 0 0

41 Wednesda 7/3/2019 3:30PM 330-968-7916 KENT OH 15 SDDV 0 0 0

42 Wednesda 7/3/2019 3:31PM 207-467-5343 KENNEBUNK ME 15 SDDV 0 0 0

43 Wednesda 7/3/2019 3:57PM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

44 Wednesda 7/3/2019 4:08PM 781-910-9241 LYNN MA 12 SDDV 0 0 0

45 Wednesda 7/3/2019 4:20PM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

46 Wednesda 7/3/2019 4:20PM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 1 WIFI 0 0 0

47 Wednesda 7/3/2019 4:20PM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 5 SDDV 0 0 0

48 Wednesda 7/3/2019 4:25PM 414-704-2585 MILWAUKEE WI 17 SDDV 0 0 0

49 Wednesda 7/3/2019 5:57PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

50 Wednesda 7/3/2019 5:58PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

51 Thursday 7/4/2019 10:48AM 416-996-3468 INCOMING CL 6 SDDV 0 0 0

52 Friday 7/5/2019 09:38AM 508-308-7292 INCOMING CL 1 WIFI 0 0 0

53 Friday 7/5/2019 09:39AM 508-308-7292 INCOMING CL 9 SDDV 0 0 0

54 Friday 7/5/2019 12:20PM 216-698-6447 CLEVELAND OH 1 SDDV 0 0 0

55 Friday 7/5/2019 12:21PM 216-645-3308 CLEVELAND OH 2 SDDV 0 0 0

56 Friday 7/5/2019 12:27PM 508-308-7292 FRAMINGHAM MA 7 WIFI 0 0 0

57 Friday 7/5/2019 1:30PM 216-698-6447 INCOMING CL 5 SDDV 0 0 0



58 Friday 7/5/2019 2:38PM 508-308-7292 INCOMING CL 2 WIFI 0 0 0

59 Saturday 7/6/2019 7:28PM 781-270-9200 BURLINGTON MA 1 WIFI 0 0 0

60 Sunday 7/7/2019 09:59AM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 1 WIFI 0 0 0

61 Sunday 7/7/2019 10:00AM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 17 SDDV 0 0 0

62 Sunday 7/7/2019 10:22AM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 9 WIFI 0 0 0

63 Sunday 7/7/2019 10:30AM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 10 SDDV 0 0 0

64 Monday 7/8/2019 09:28AM 202-549-3178 WASHINGTON DC 8 SDDV 0 0 0

65 Monday 7/8/2019 09:41AM 617-224-1652 BOSTON MA 17 SDDV 0 0 0

66 Monday 7/8/2019 11:57AM 617-780-6681 INCOMING CL 55 SDDV 0 0 0

67 Monday 7/8/2019 12:56PM 978-250-0993 LOWELL MA 3 SDDV 0 0 0

68 Monday 7/8/2019 1:01PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 70 SDDV 0 0 0

69 Monday 7/8/2019 3:01PM 646-809-4267 NEW YORK NY 92 SDDV 0 0 0

70 Monday 7/8/2019 4:34PM 978-250-0993 LOWELL MA 5 SDDV 0 0 0

71 Monday 7/8/2019 5:08PM 617-549-8582 BOSTON MA 16 SDDV 0 0 0

72 Monday 7/8/2019 5:49PM 508-509-6699 ROCHESTER MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

73 Monday 7/8/2019 5:50PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

74 Monday 7/8/2019 5:54PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 18 SDDV 0 0 0

75 Monday 7/8/2019 6:12PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 6 WIFI 0 0 0

76 Monday 7/8/2019 6:17PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 38 SDDV 0 0 0

77 Monday 7/8/2019 6:56PM 617-924-9660 WATERTOWN MA 2 WIFI 0 0 0

78 Monday 7/8/2019 6:58PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 WIFI 0 0 0

79 Monday 7/8/2019 7:00PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 8 WIFI 0 0 0

80 Monday 7/8/2019 7:07PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 8 SDDV 0 0 0

81 Tuesday 7/9/2019 07:58AM 978-758-2689 LOWELL MA 30 SDDV 0 0 0

82 Tuesday 7/9/2019 10:00AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 54 SDDV 0 0 0

83 Tuesday 7/9/2019 12:09PM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 33 SDDV 0 0 0

84 Tuesday 7/9/2019 12:42PM 888-549-9901 Toll Free CL 5 SDDV 0 0 0

85 Tuesday 7/9/2019 2:31PM 800-356-8278 Toll Free CL 44 SDDV 0 0 0

86 Tuesday 7/9/2019 3:38PM 416-996-3468 TORONTO ON 1 SDDV 0 1 1

87 Tuesday 7/9/2019 3:40PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

88 Tuesday 7/9/2019 3:41PM 416-996-3468 TORONTO ON 15 SDDV 0 14 14

89 Tuesday 7/9/2019 4:17PM 978-270-8479 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0



90 Tuesday 7/9/2019 4:28PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

91 Tuesday 7/9/2019 4:37PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

92 Wednesda 7/10/2019 09:01AM 617-501-5089 SOMERVILLE MA 40 SDDV 0 0 0

93 Wednesda 7/10/2019 10:00AM 252-772-9901 INCOMING CL 63 SDDV 0 0 0

94 Wednesda 7/10/2019 1:08PM 202-436-6235 INCOMING CL 49 SDDV 0 0 0

95 Wednesda 7/10/2019 2:04PM 301-928-9619 SILVER SPG MD 14 SDDV 0 0 0

96 Wednesda 7/10/2019 2:32PM 877-456-8527 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

97 Wednesda 7/10/2019 3:31PM 612-481-8995 BLAINE MN 11 SDDV 0 0 0

98 Wednesda 7/10/2019 5:22PM 217-725-9979 INCOMING CL 17 SDDV 0 0 0

99 Wednesda 7/10/2019 5:39PM 217-725-9979 SPRINGFLD IL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

100 Thursday 7/11/2019 09:23AM 978-270-8479 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

101 Thursday 7/11/2019 11:30AM 781-308-3242 INCOMING CL 14 SDDV 0 0 0

102 Thursday 7/11/2019 11:44AM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

103 Thursday 7/11/2019 11:44AM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 36 SDDV 0 0 0

104 Thursday 7/11/2019 12:20PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 76 SDDV 0 0 0

105 Thursday 7/11/2019 2:04PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 17 SDDV 0 0 0

106 Thursday 7/11/2019 2:31PM 774-222-3887 BRIDGEWTR MA 34 SDDV 0 0 0

107 Thursday 7/11/2019 2:31PM 978-337-7901 LOWELL MA 34 SDDV 0 0 0

108 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:04PM 401-222-8147 CALL WAIT 4 SDDV 0 0 0

109 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:08PM 401-222-8147 CALL WAIT 1 WIFI 0 0 0

110 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:09PM 401-222-8147 CALL WAIT 15 SDDV 0 0 0

111 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:29PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 3 WIFI 0 0 0

112 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:31PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 5 SDDV 0 0 0

113 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:36PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 WIFI 0 0 0

114 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:36PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 21 SDDV 0 0 0

115 Thursday 7/11/2019 3:57PM 913-433-4336 KANSASCITY KS 4 SDDV 0 0 0

116 Thursday 7/11/2019 4:00PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

117 Thursday 7/11/2019 4:02PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 41 SDDV 0 0 0

118 Thursday 7/11/2019 4:42PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

119 Thursday 7/11/2019 4:59PM 202-721-9775 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

120 Thursday 7/11/2019 6:06PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 10 SDDV 0 0 0



121 Thursday 7/11/2019 6:27PM 202-870-4194 INCOMING CL 7 SDDV 0 0 0

122 Friday 7/12/2019 08:01AM 978-270-8479 INCOMING CL 5 SDDV 0 0 0

123 Friday 7/12/2019 12:27PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 3 SDDV 0 0 0

124 Friday 7/12/2019 12:30PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 63 SDDV 0 0 0

125 Saturday 7/13/2019 09:25AM 617-972-6431 WATERTOWN MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

126 Saturday 7/13/2019 09:26AM 617-972-6431 WATERTOWN MA 2 WIFI 0 0 0

127 Saturday 7/13/2019 7:34PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 8 SDDV 0 0 0

128 Sunday 7/14/2019 11:13AM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 15 SDDV 0 0 0

129 Sunday 7/14/2019 11:28AM 508-308-7292 FRAMINGHAM MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

130 Sunday 7/14/2019 11:28AM 781-910-9241 LYNN MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

131 Sunday 7/14/2019 11:30AM 508-308-7292 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

132 Sunday 7/14/2019 11:32AM 508-509-6699 ROCHESTER MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

133 Sunday 7/14/2019 11:33AM 978-657-6498 WILMINGTON MA 61 SDDV 0 0 0

134 Sunday 7/14/2019 3:05PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

135 Sunday 7/14/2019 3:07PM 202-297-7972 WASHINGTON DC 2 SDDV 0 0 0

136 Sunday 7/14/2019 3:21PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

137 Sunday 7/14/2019 3:23PM 386-445-9362 PALM COAST FL 13 SDDV 0 0 0

138 Sunday 7/14/2019 3:35PM 386-445-9362 PALM COAST FL 8 SDDV 0 0 0

139 Monday 7/15/2019 10:16AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 22 SDDV 0 0 0

140 Monday 7/15/2019 11:02AM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 48 SDDV 0 0 0

141 Monday 7/15/2019 4:14PM 414-235-1764 MILWAUKEE WI 19 SDDV 0 0 0

142 Monday 7/15/2019 5:01PM 847-912-0338 ZION IL 14 SDDV 0 0 0

143 Monday 7/15/2019 5:24PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 15 SDDV 0 0 0

144 Monday 7/15/2019 5:39PM 617-967-2565 WALTHAM MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

145 Monday 7/15/2019 5:43PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 15 SDDV 0 0 0

146 Tuesday 7/16/2019 07:40AM 302-547-4229 WILMINGTON DE 26 SDDV 0 0 0

147 Tuesday 7/16/2019 09:21AM 617-366-7284 BOSTON MA 20 SDDV 0 0 0

148 Tuesday 7/16/2019 09:41AM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 14 SDDV 0 0 0

149 Tuesday 7/16/2019 11:01AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

150 Tuesday 7/16/2019 11:01AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 44 SDDV 0 0 0

151 Tuesday 7/16/2019 2:50PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 5 SDDV 0 0 0

152 Tuesday 7/16/2019 2:55PM 781-308-3242 INCOMING CL 15 SDDV 0 0 0



153 Tuesday 7/16/2019 3:56PM 702-324-9635 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

154 Tuesday 7/16/2019 6:18PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 3 SDDV 0 0 0

155 Tuesday 7/16/2019 6:21PM 781-910-9241 LYNN MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

156 Wednesda 7/17/2019 08:54AM 617-594-3650 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

157 Wednesda 7/17/2019 09:05AM 617-594-3650 BOSTON MA 9 SDDV 0 0 0

158 Wednesda 7/17/2019 10:59AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 56 SDDV 0 0 0

159 Wednesda 7/17/2019 4:00PM 000-000-0000 BLOCKED 38 SDDV 0 0 0

160 Wednesda 7/17/2019 4:38PM 781-910-9241 LYNN MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

161 Wednesda 7/17/2019 4:43PM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 13 SDDV 0 0 0

162 Wednesda 7/17/2019 5:04PM 414-286-5064 MILWAUKEE WI 28 SDDV 0 0 0

163 Wednesda 7/17/2019 7:10PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 3 SDDV 0 0 0

164 Thursday 7/18/2019 11:50AM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 30 SDDV 0 0 0

165 Thursday 7/18/2019 12:31PM 978-758-2689 LOWELL MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

166 Thursday 7/18/2019 12:31PM 603-751-8606 PELHAM NH 31 SDDV 0 0 0

167 Thursday 7/18/2019 2:32PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 44 SDDV 0 0 0

168 Friday 7/19/2019 11:00AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 53 SDDV 0 0 0

169 Friday 7/19/2019 11:56AM 202-257-5111 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

170 Friday 7/19/2019 12:01PM 414-708-2346 MILWAUKEE WI 16 SDDV 0 0 0

171 Friday 7/19/2019 12:30PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 13 SDDV 0 0 0

172 Friday 7/19/2019 2:00PM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 45 SDDV 0 0 0

173 Friday 7/19/2019 2:45PM 617-233-4020 CAMBRIDGE MA 17 SDDV 0 0 0

174 Friday 7/19/2019 4:21PM 866-606-8220 Toll Free CL 6 SDDV 0 0 0

175 Friday 7/19/2019 5:31PM 617-455-8495 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

176 Friday 7/19/2019 5:32PM 617-894-3350 BOSTON MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

177 Friday 7/19/2019 5:33PM 617-455-8495 EASTBOSTON MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

178 Saturday 7/20/2019 11:18AM 508-485-0855 MARLBORO MA 18 SDDV 0 0 0

179 Saturday 7/20/2019 11:52AM 800-449-6332 Toll Free CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

180 Saturday 7/20/2019 12:04PM 978-875-2760 HUDSON MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

181 Saturday 7/20/2019 12:05PM 703-727-8182 LEESBURG VA 4 SDDV 0 0 0

182 Saturday 7/20/2019 12:09PM 703-727-8182 LEESBURG VA 41 SDDV 0 0 0

183 Monday 7/22/2019 07:40AM 781-910-9241 LYNN MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0



184 Monday 7/22/2019 07:44AM 781-910-9241 INCOMING CL 6 SDDV 0 0 0

185 Monday 7/22/2019 08:51AM 202-321-6157 WASHINGTON DC 39 SDDV 0 0 0

186 Monday 7/22/2019 09:30AM 617-780-6681 BOSTON MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

187 Monday 7/22/2019 09:35AM 617-780-6681 INCOMING CL 4 SDDV 0 0 0

188 Monday 7/22/2019 09:39AM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 13 SDDV 0 0 0

189 Monday 7/22/2019 09:59AM 866-316-1519 Toll Free CL 36 SDDV 0 0 0

190 Monday 7/22/2019 10:40AM 800-870-3513 Toll Free CL 3 SDDV 0 0 0

191 Monday 7/22/2019 11:00AM 416-996-3468 TORONTO ON 12 SDDV 0 12 12

192 Monday 7/22/2019 11:13AM 416-996-3468 CLEVELAND OH 1 SDDV 0 0 0

193 Monday 7/22/2019 11:17AM 617-512-6196 BOSTON MA 18 SDDV 0 0 0

194 Monday 7/22/2019 11:50AM 888-766-2484 Toll Free CL 9 SDDV 0 0 0

195 Monday 7/22/2019 1:01PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 66 SDDV 0 0 0

196 Monday 7/22/2019 2:07PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 7 SDDV 0 0 0

197 Monday 7/22/2019 2:14PM 774-222-3887 BRIDGEWTR MA 4 SDDV 0 0 0

198 Monday 7/22/2019 2:59PM 216-857-5063 INCOMING CL 8 SDDV 0 0 0

199 Monday 7/22/2019 4:21PM 781-308-3242 INCOMING CL 12 SDDV 0 0 0

200 Monday 7/22/2019 7:43PM 617-967-2565 INCOMING CL 3 WIFI 0 0 0

201 Tuesday 7/23/2019 08:04AM 617-594-3650 BOSTON MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

202 Tuesday 7/23/2019 08:18AM 617-594-3650 INCOMING CL 21 SDDV 0 0 0

203 Tuesday 7/23/2019 09:07AM 617-358-7500 INCOMING CL 18 SDDV 0 0 0

204 Tuesday 7/23/2019 10:01AM 612-670-6202 MINNEAPOLS MN 50 SDDV 0 0 0

205 Tuesday 7/23/2019 10:58AM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 4 SDDV 0 0 0

206 Tuesday 7/23/2019 11:02AM 855-286-3210 Toll Free CL 58 SDDV 0 0 0

207 Tuesday 7/23/2019 2:00PM 617-519-1078 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

208 Tuesday 7/23/2019 3:05PM 617-686-1809 INCOMING CL 32 SDDV 0 0 0

209 Tuesday 7/23/2019 4:01PM 717-443-4833 HARRISBURG PA 56 SDDV 0 0 0

210 Tuesday 7/23/2019 5:00PM 801-913-9675 SALT LAKE UT 36 SDDV 0 0 0

211 Tuesday 7/23/2019 6:34PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 3 SDDV 0 0 0

212 Tuesday 7/23/2019 6:40PM 978-270-8479 INCOMING CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

213 Wednesda 7/24/2019 08:43AM 571-274-7821 INCOMING CL 20 SDDV 0 0 0

214 Wednesda 7/24/2019 10:28AM 978-337-7901 LOWELL MA 1 SDDV 0 0 0

215 Wednesda 7/24/2019 11:57AM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 1 WIFI 0 0 0



216 Wednesda 7/24/2019 11:58AM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 1 SDDV 0 0 0

217 Wednesda 7/24/2019 11:58AM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 38 SDDV 0 0 0

218 Wednesda 7/24/2019 12:37PM 781-308-3242 RANDOLPH MA 63 SDDV 0 0 0

219 Wednesda 7/24/2019 2:49PM 913-201-8403 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

220 Wednesda 7/24/2019 2:59PM 913-201-8403 INCOMING CL 31 SDDV 0 0 0

221 Wednesda 7/24/2019 3:32PM 888-585-9008 Toll Free CL 68 SDDV 0 0 0

222 Wednesda 7/24/2019 4:40PM 207-400-7594 PORTLAND ME 68 SDDV 0 0 0

223 Wednesda 7/24/2019 5:47PM 202-297-7972 CALL WAIT 11 SDDV 0 0 0

224 Wednesda 7/24/2019 5:58PM 202-297-7972 INCOMING CL 2 SDDV 0 0 0

225 Wednesda 7/24/2019 6:00PM 617-352-5432 BOSTON MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

226 Wednesda 7/24/2019 6:02PM 978-250-0993 LOWELL MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

227 Wednesda 7/24/2019 6:08PM 978-270-8479 NEWBURYPT MA 2 SDDV 0 0 0

228 Thursday 7/25/2019 09:20AM 978-337-7901 INCOMING CL 61 SDDV 0 0 0

229 Thursday 7/25/2019 10:22AM 978-337-7901 LOWELL MA 16 SDDV 0 0 0

230 Thursday 7/25/2019 10:37AM 617-455-8941 EASTBOSTON MA 33 SDDV 0 0 0

231 Thursday 7/25/2019 1:10PM 978-250-0993 INCOMING CL 7 SDDV 0 0 0

232 Thursday 7/25/2019 3:16PM 774-222-3887 INCOMING CL 4 SDDV 0 0 0

233 Thursday 7/25/2019 4:52PM 978-337-7901 LOWELL MA 36 SDDV 0 0 0



 

Randolph Dupont 

 

TO:  Hassan Aden, Monitor 

  Cleveland Police Monitoring Team 

FROM: Randolph Dupont 

DATE:  August 5, 2019 

 

July 2019 Invoice 

Billable Hours 

 

Date Activity Hours 

07-02-19 Revisions and PDF conversions to CPD 40 Hour Specialized CIT 

Curriculum, Discussion and review of materials with MHRAC 

Training Committee members and Parties  

  3.2 

07-05-19 Discussion of progress on Crisis Intervention, technical writing 

for Semi-Annual Report 

  1.8 

07-08-19 Discussion and preparation with Training Subcommittee for 

MHRAC report, MHRAC bi-monthly meeting 

  1.1 

07-09-19 Discussion of Dispatch Training Curriculum issues, technical 

writing for Semi-Annual Report 

  2.4 

07-11-19 Discussion with parties and MHRAC Training Committee 

Dispatch Training Curriculum 

  0.5 

07-14-19 Technical writing for Semi-Annual report, discussion of Dispatch 

Training Curriculum 

  3.4 

07-17-19 Discussion of CIT Plus Pilot program with MHRAC   0.4 

07-23-19 Review of Dispatch Curriculum revisions, discussion of consent 

decree progress for Crisis Intervention 

  1.8 

07-25-19 MHRAC Training Committee meeting, follow-up discussion   0.9 

07-31-19 Discussion of Dispatch Training Curriculum, CPD adoption of 

Dispatch Pro-Q&A protocols, progress on on-going CPD Crisis 

In-service training 

  2.0 

   

 Total Hours Worked  17.5 

 Total Billed Hours  14.0 

 

 

Rate:  $250/hour    

 TOTAL BILLED $3500 

 Pro Bono Hours    3.5 

 



 

 

INVOICE 

 

From: Ayesha Bell Hardaway  To:  The Aden Group LLC 
                
  
 
 

Billable Hours and Expenses for July 2019 
 

DATE  DESCRIPTION          HOURS 

7/1/19 Prepare for and participate in conference call; email 
correspondence 

.7 

7/2/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; email 
correspondence 

1.7 

7/3/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls 1.2 

7/8/19 Participate in conference call; email correspondence .4 

7/9/19 Prepare for and participate in meetings; conference call 3.6 

7/10/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; email 
correspondence  

2.4 

7/11/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; email 
correspondence 

1.7 

7/15/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; review, analyze 
and revise documents 

5.7 

7/16/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls 1.4 

7/17/19 Prepare for and participate in meetings and conference calls; 
email correspondence 

7.2 

7/18/19 Participate in conference calls; email correspondence  .6 

7/22/19 Prepare for and participate in conference call; email 
correspondence 

2.3 

7/23/19 Conference call; email correspondence 1.3 

7/24/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; email 
correspondence 

2.3 

7/25/19 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; email 
correspondence 

1.4 



7/31/19 Participate in conference call .7 

Total Hours Worked                     34.6 

Pro Bono Hours                            10.0                                                   
Travel Hours                                                                                        5.5  
Total Hours Billed   (24.6)     x   Rate $250.00/hour             $6,150.00 
 
REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
7/9/19 Parking 10.00 

7/17/19 Parking  4.75 

Total Expense Amount Due (Transportation)    $14.75 
 





Brian Maxey - July 2019

lname local_date hours jobcode notes

Maxey 7/1/19 0.8 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT weekly meeting

Maxey 7/1/19 0.8 Cleveland Monitoring Team Strategy call w/Rob Davis/Ayesha

Maxey 7/2/19 0.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT/DOJ call

Maxey 7/2/19 0.8 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review Rob Davis comments/provide MT feedback

Maxey 7/8/19 0.3 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review and comment on CIT filing

Maxey 7/8/19 0.5 Cleveland Monitoring Team Internal discussions re: S&S

Maxey 7/8/19 0.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT weekly conference

Maxey 7/9/19 0.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team All parties call

Maxey 7/9/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT/DOJ call

Maxey 7/9/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team Stakeholders call

Maxey 7/10/19 0.3 Cleveland Monitoring Team Call w/parties re: S&S LP

Maxey 7/10/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team Discussion with MT/draft email re: S&S LP

Maxey 7/10/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team Call with OPS re: IAPro

Maxey 7/11/19 0.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team Call with DOJ re: S&S LP

Maxey 7/15/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT weekly call; create compare documents for S&S LP

Maxey 7/16/19 0.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team DOJ weekly call

Maxey 7/17/19 0.3 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT calls re: S&S

Maxey 7/17/19 0.5 Cleveland Monitoring Team DOJ call re: S&S

Maxey 7/17/19 1.3 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review S&S lesson plan; pre-load; DOJ comments

Maxey 7/18/19 0.3 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review Chief's video

Maxey 7/18/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team Draft email re: S&S; internal MT discussions

Maxey 7/18/19 1.5 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review S&S LP, pre-load, and compare documents

Maxey 7/18/19 1.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team TA call with CPD re: S&S

Maxey 7/19/19 0.8 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT call re: UOF review

Maxey 7/21/19 1.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team Drafted red-lines for S&S LP

Maxey 7/22/19 1.0 Cleveland Monitoring Team MT weekly call

Maxey 7/23/19 0.5 Cleveland Monitoring Team DOJ weekly call

Maxey 7/24/19 0.8 Cleveland Monitoring Team Call with Tim Cantrell re: IT

Maxey 7/25/19 0.5 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review CPOP policy filing

Maxey 7/25/19 0.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review revisions to S&S policy

Maxey 7/25/19 1.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review DPS Discipline Audit Memorandum

Maxey 7/28/19 2.2 Cleveland Monitoring Team UOF review - 2018-005041/010116

Maxey 7/29/19 1.7 Cleveland Monitoring Team Legal research and emails re: S&D policy

Maxey 7/31/19 1.8 Cleveland Monitoring Team Review semi-annual report and provide feedback

Total hours 32.0

@$250 $8,000.00

Subtract 15% pro bono 27.2

$6,800.00

Expenses

Hotel $0.00

Airfare $0.00

Uber 0

Airport parking 0

Expenses total $0.00

�1



Policing Project  
NYU School of Law 

 
 

  
Attention: Matthew Barge    Invoice Date: August 5, 2019 
    

July 2019 Invoice 
 
Policing Project Staff Hours  
Date Biller Description of Work Performed Time 
07/01/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 2.00 
07/01/2019 Brian Chen Call with monitoring team 0.75 
07/01/2019 Brian Chen Drafting court motion 1.00 
07/02/2019 Brian Chen Court motion 1.50 
07/02/2019 Brian Chen Call with DOJ 0.50 
07/02/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 1.00 
07/03/2019 Brian Chen Court motion 0.50 
07/03/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 1.50 
07/08/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 1.00 
07/08/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 1.00 
07/08/2019 Brian Chen Call with monitoring team 0.50 
07/09/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 1.00 
07/09/2019 Brian Chen Drafting semiannual report 0.75 
07/09/2019 Brian Chen Calls with DOJ, City, CPC 3.25 
07/10/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.50 
07/10/2019 Brian Chen Drafting semiannual report 1.50 
07/11/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 1.00 
07/11/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 2.00 
07/12/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 1.50 
07/12/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 1.00 
07/15/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 1.50 
07/15/2019 Brian Chen Call with monitoring team 0.75 
07/16/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 2.50 
07/16/2019 Brian Chen Call with DOJ 1.00 
07/16/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 1.00 
07/17/2019 Brian Chen Drafting court motion 1.50 
07/17/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.75 
07/18/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 2.00 
07/18/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.75 
07/19/2019 Brian Chen Court motion 1.50 
07/19/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.50 
07/19/2019 Brian Chen Call re: outcome measures 0.25 
07/21/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 0.50 



07/22/2019 Brian Chen Call with monitoring team 1.00 
07/23/2019 Brian Chen Court motion 2.50 
07/23/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.50 
07/26/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 2.92 
07/26/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.75 
07/28/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 1.00 
07/29/2019 Brian Chen Semiannual report 2.00 
07/29/2019 Brian Chen Correspondence 0.50 
07/31/2019 Brian Chen Call with DOJ 0.75  

Total Hours: 50  
Total Hours Billed (Rate: $250/hour): 29  
Total Billed: $7,250.00  
Pro Bono Hours: 21  
Brian Chen Travel Expenses*: $0.00  
Total Cost: $7,250.00 

*Paid separately. 
 



elphia, INVOICE
Charles H Ramsey & Associates DATE 8/4/19

INVOICE #
CUSTOMER ID

BILL TO Hassan Aden SHIP TO Charles H. Ramsey
Monitor

JOB

Airfare
Taxi/Uber
Hotel
Food
Travel time

Make all checks payabe to Charles H. Ramsey. Thank you for your business

$500.00
Invoice for July 2019
Total

Pro-bono Hours: 

Invoice for July 2019
 Conference Calls 2 hrs x $250 per hour $500.00
Review CPD Directives

Due on receipt
PAYMENT TERMS

AMOUNTDESCRIPTION



Rosenthal CLE Invoice 

Page | 1 
 

JULY 2019 INVOICE 
BILLABLE HOURS 

 
Date      Activity        Hours 

7/1/19 Monitoring Team logistics call; follow-up documentation and 
correspondence; accountability court filings 

1.15 

7/2/19 Monitoring Team/DOJ call; calls with DOJ and Monitoring Team re: 
OPS & Chief’s Hearings protocols; Correspondence review & 
response; edits to Chief’s protocol. 

2.6 

7/3/19 Correspondence regarding and edits to IA Manual. 0.25 

7/4/19 IA manual review and correspondence. 0.1 

7/5/19 Call with OPS. 1.0 

7/8/19 Monitoring team logistics meeting; Correspondence review 
(including 3 charge letters & 3 letters of reinstruction); 
continuation of editing – 1st draft of discipline audit memorandum.  

5.5 

7/9/19 DOJ/Monitoring Team meeting; monthly stakeholders meeting; 
CDP/City/Monitoring Team/DOJ meeting; finalization of first draft 
of discipline audit memorandum & correspondence to monitoring 
team; correspondence re: IA Manual. 

4.75 

7/10/19 OPS-IA Pro call (with Monitoring Team & OPS); follow-up call with 
OPS. 

1.2 

7/11/19 Correspondence re: IA manual & pre-disciplinary hearing protocol; 
Review and comment on OPS bi-weekly report; Editing of semi-
annual report; OPS bi-weekly meeting; Comments on mediation 
proposal to OPS workgroup; Edits to Chief’s hearing protocol & 
correspondence. 

5.0 

7/15/19 Monitoring Team logistics meeting; Call with IA Superintendent 
and DOJ re: IA manual and staffing & Sheriff OIS investigation; Call 
with IA Superintendent; Call with Monitor; Follow up 
correspondence and correspondence review and response; Editing 
to draft discipline audit memorandum. 

2.45 

7/16/19 Review of edits to discipline audit memorandum; Monitoring 
Team/DOJ all. 

1.1 

7/22/19 Monitoring Team logistics meeting; Review of edits and editing of 
draft discipline audit memorandum; Call with Monitoring Team 
members re: discipline audit report; Correspondence review 
(including 13 discipline letters). 

4.45 

7/23/19 Monitoring Team/DOJ meeting; Final edits to first draft of 
discipline audit memorandum; Review of documents for UOF case 
audit; UOF audit instruction/memo review; Correspondence re: 
OPS. 

4.25 

7/24/19 Call with OPS & Monitoring Team members re: IAPro use; 
Correspondence review and response; Call with Monitor; 
Documentation and follow-up correspondence; Review of annual 
report of DC OPS and follow-up correspondence to OPS; review of 
draft OPS website; review of OPS bi-weekly report. 

3.5 



Rosenthal CLE Invoice 

Page | 2 
 

7/25/19 Edits to IA Manual court filing; Edits to discipline audit 
memorandum; OPS bi-weekly meeting; Meeting follow-up 
documentation and correspondence. 

1.45 

7/29/19 Correspondence review; UOF case review and follow-up 
correspondence. 

1.35 

7/30/19 Correspondence review & response (including review of Chief’s 
hearing protocol, correspondence re: pending issues with 
Monitoring Team, UOF case review with Monitoring Team, 
correspondence with DOJ & DPS re: OPS appeals meeting); UOF 
case review (2 cases, including WCS footage). 

4.0 

7/31/19 DOJ/Monitoring meeting (partial attendance). 0.3 

 
Total Hours Worked:       44.4 

  Total Hours Billed:       23.9 
   Rate: $250/hour 
 
  TOTAL BILLED:        $5,975.00 
  Pro Bono Hours        20.5 
 

 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES: 

NONE 

 

 



Invoice Sunday, August 4, 2019

Victor A. Ruiz

 

July 2019

Bill To: Invoice Number

Customer Address

City, State, Zip , , 

Customer Name Hassan Aden

Work Description AmountBillable Hours Billing RateDate Worked

CPC Meeting $375.001.5 $250.007/8/2019

Press Conference $312.501.25 $250.007/17/2019

Call with Hassan $125.000.5 $250.007/24/2019

Review of emails $125.000.5 $250.007/25/2019

Total Billables $937.50

Total Billables $937.50

Total Pro Bono $0.00

Outstanding $937.50

Total Expenses $0.00

Make all checks payable to Victor A. Ruiz.



Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 
2019 Cleveland Project Bill – Charles R. See  

 
TO: Hassan Aden   

        Meg Olsen 

        21CP Solutions   
 
FROM: Charles R. See  
 
DATE: 08/04/2019   

 2019 INVOICE  
BILLABLE HOURS  

 
Date                                                    Activity                                                                              Hours___  
07/08/19                    CPC/Monitoring Team meeting__                                                      1 Hr._ ___ 
07/09/19                   Stakeholders’ meeting_                                                                        1 Hr .__    _ 
07/17/19                   Selection Panel planning meeting_                                                     2 Hrs.    _ 
07/17/19                   Press Conference City Hall                                                                 _1 Hr.     __ 
07/17/19                  Community Forum Re: Police Accountability_                                _2 Hrs.   __ 
07/23/19                  Planning Team conference call                                                          _.5 Hr.     __ 
07/25/19                  Engagement Team conference call_                                              __.8 Hr._____ 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
__________________________________________________________________________  
______________________________________________________________________________
______________________________________________________________________________
______________________________________________________________________________
______________________________________________________________________________
______________________________________________________________________________     
 
Total hours Worked:_16.3__  
 
Total Billed Hours: 6.6____ 
 
  Rate: $250 Per hour___ 
 
Total Billed: $1,650____ 
 
Pro Bono Hours:   
Pro Bono hours consisted of: travel, phone calls, meetings, correspondence, mileage expense, 
planning and various document review, and e-mails   
 



Please make check payable to  
  

 
Charles R. See, 
 
Charles R. See 
 
Director of Community Engagement  
Cleveland Police Monitoring Team  



Date: July 2019

To: Meg Olsen

Date Hours

7/16/2019 Organized and initial review files FRB 3.00

7/23/2019 Database testing new batch, problem solving IA Pro 2.00

7/29/2019 Batch cases  begin reviews/vids 5.00

7/30/2019 Batch cases review/vids 3.00

7/31/2019 Batch cases+file review/ vids 2.00

Total 15.00

Calls/Email+TCantrell Conf call online 4.00

Total worked 19.00

Billed 15 hours@250 $3,750.00

Pro Bono

2019-7    Cleveland Project Invoice - Scott  Sargent

mailto:3.5@210


Hours Worked 
 

Django Sibley 
  

 
 

 
 
Project:  Monitoring Team, Cleveland Police Department 
 
Month:  July, 2019 
 

Date Activities Hours 
7/17/19 Review draft 

memorandum re 
discipline audit. 

0.6 

7/20/19 Review draft 
memorandum re 
discipline audit. 

0.4 

7/22/19 Conference call with team 
re discipline audit draft 
memorandum. 

1.0 

   
   
   
   
   
   
Total   2.0 
   
   
   
   
   
 
 
 



Smoot Consulting, Inc. 
TO:  Hassan Aden 

  CLE Monitor 

FROM:  Sean M. Smoot 

DATE:  August 1, 2019 

JULY 2019 INVOICE   

 
BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 

7/1/19 Review Grvc Responses (4 cases Rec’d 7/1) 1.5 

7/8/19 Review Disciplinary and Charging Letter (6 cases rec’d 7/5) 2.0 

7/9/19 Review Disciplinary and Charging Letter (6 cases rec’d 7/9) 2.0 

7/16/19 Review docs re disciplinary system audit  

& CompStat Report 

5.0 

7/17/19 Review Disc Letters Re-instruction (2 cases rec’d 7/17) 

& MT corr. re accidental discharge case 

1.0 

7/23/19 Discipline Action Reviews (10 cases rec’d 7/22) 

Review for edit DPS Audit Report and supporting docs 

6.5 

7/26/19 Review of Disc Case Docs (1 Case rec’d 7/26) 

Review for edit updated draft DPS Audit Report and 

supporting docs 

3.5 

7/31/19 Review of Disc Case Docs (6 Cases rec’d 7/30-31) 2.5 

7/1-31/19 Emails, calls, research, review of files,   

 pro bono  

(6.5) 

   

   

  Total Billed Hours @ $250/hour 24 

   

 Non-Billed Pro Bono Travel hours   n/a 

 Additional Pro Bono hours   6.5 

 Total Pro Bono Hours  6.5 

   

 TOTAL DUE FOR HOURS BILLED $ 6,000.00 

   

   

   

   

   

   

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 

   

   

   

 EXPENSES SUBMITTED FOR REIMBURSEMENT $  n/a 

   

 TOTAL DUE $6,040.00 
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Hassan Aden Invoice # 19-007

Date Service Hrs.

07/08/19 CPC-MT Meeting 1

07/17/19 Monitor Press Conference 1

07/17/19 Police Oversight Community Meeting 2

07/25/19 CPC Application Outreach 1

07/26/19 CPC Application Outreach 0.5

Total Hours Worked (excluding travel) 5.5

Pro Bono Work Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $375.00 1.5

Pro Bono Travel Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $325.00 1.3

Pro Bono Mileage & Parking Rate: 0.535 /mile $0.00

Total Billed Rate: $250.00 /hour $1,000.00 4.00

2019 7 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE

July 2019 EXPENSES

SUMMARY OF HOURS WORKED

August 10, 2019
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2019 7 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE

Date Reimbursable Expense REF

Transportation

06/10/19 Parking 

Pro bono

Total Transportation

Accommodations

None this month

Total Accommodations

Per Diem

None this month

Total Per Diem

Other Expense

Total Other Expense

Total Billed Reimbursable Expenses

Pro Bono Contributions $700.00

Billed Hours $1,000.00

Billed Reimbursable Exp $0.00

Total Amount Due $1,000.00

$0.00

$0.00

Amount Paid

$0.00

SUMMARY OF REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00



July 1-31, 2019

Melissa Bretz

To:
Hassan Aden
Meg Olsen
Via email

Description Hours Rate  Amount 

July 1: MT Logistics Meeting.  Work on Internal Tracking Sheet and Deadline 
Spreadsheet.  Emails to parties regarding invoices, documents, meetings, 
deadlines, agendas, and other information.

7.5 40  $    300.00 

July 2: DOJ/MT Call.  Call with Hassan Aden.  Emails to parties regarding 
invoices, site visits, travel information, documents, deadlines, and other 
information.

5.5 40  $    220.00 

July 8: MT Logistics Call.  Call with Hassan Aden.  Work on Internal Tracking 
Sheet and Deadline Spreadsheet.  Emails to parties regarding documents, 
deadlines, document links, agendas, cancellations, scheduling, and other 
information.

9 40  $    360.00 

July 9: DOJ/MT Call, Monthly Stakeholders Meeting, City/CDP/DOJ/MT Call.  
Work on Internal Tracking Sheet.  Emails to parties regarding documents, 
deadlines, spreadsheets, agendas, updates, cancellations, and other 

7.5 40  $    300.00 

July 10: Call with MT regarding S&S Preload Discussion, S&S Preload 
Discusssion, OPS Use of IAPro Call, and Logistics Call with Hassan Aden.  Work 
on Internal Tracking Sheet and Deadline Spreadsheet.  Emails to parties 
regarding documents, meetings, deadlines, agendas, scheduling, and other 

8.5 40  $    340.00 

July 11: Emails to parties regarding cancellations, updates, documents, and 
other information.

2.5 40  $    100.00 

Billable Hours

For:
Cleveland Monitoring



July 12: MT Announcement Discussion.  Emails to parties regarding meetings, 
invoices, and other information. 3 40  $    120.00 

July 15: MT Logisitics Meeting.  Work on Internal Tracking Sheet and Deadline 
Spreadsheet.  Call with Hassan Aden.  Emails to parties regarding invoices, 
documents, deadlines, meetings, agendas, scheduling, updates, and other 

7.5 40  $    300.00 

July 16: DOJ/MT Call and Selection Panel Discussion.  Emails to parties 
regarding updates, documents, deadlines, document links, agendas, and other 
information.

5.5 40  $    220.00 

July 17: CompStat Meeting.  Call with Hassan Aden.  Work on Internal Tracking 
Sheet and Deadline Spreadsheet.  Emails to parties regarding meeting 
information, documents, scheduling, cancellations, and other information

5.5 40  $    220.00 

July 18: OPS Workgroup Call.  Emails to parties regarding cancellations, 
documents, scheduling, and other information. 4 40  $    160.00 

July 19: UOF Reviews Call, Outcome Measures Discussion, and Search & 
Seizure Discussion.  Emails to parties regarding scheduling, documentns, and 
other information.

5.5 40  $    220.00 

July 22: MT Weekly Logistics Mmeeting, DPS Discipline Audit Discussion.  Work 
on Internal Tracking Sheet and Deadline Spreadsheet.  Emails to parties 
regarding documents, meeting information, deadlines, agendas, contact 
information, and other information.

9 40  $    360.00 

July 23: DOJ/MT Call.  Work on Internal Tracking Sheet.  Emails to parties 
regarding meetings, agendas, documents, deadlines, cancellations, updates, 
scheduling, travel information, MT announcements, and other information.

6.5 40  $    260.00 

July 24: OPS Use of IAPro Follow-up Discussion.  Call with Hassan Aden.  Emails 
to parties regarding scheduling, travel information, documents, and other 
information.

7 40  $    280.00 

July 25: DOJ/MT Call.  Work on Internal Tracking Sheet. Emails to parties 
regarding travel information, documents, deadlines, updates, agendas, 
scheduling, cancellations, and other information.

8 40  $    320.00 

July 26: Amended S&S Modules Discussion.  Call with Hassan Aden. Emails to 
parties regarding scheduling, documents, and other information.

2.5 40  $    100.00 

July 29:  Emails to parties regarding cancellations, documents, and other 
information.

1 40  $      40.00 

July 31: DOJ/MT Call.  Work on Internal Tracking Sheet and Deadline 
Spreadsheet.  Emails to parties regarding cancellations, agendas, scheduling, 
and other information.

5 40  $    200.00 

40  $            -   

40  $            -   

40  $            -   



40  $            -   

40  $            -   

40  $            -   

40  $            -   

40  $            -   

Total Billable Hours 110.5 40  $ 4,420.00 

Reimbursable Expenses



Total Reimbursable Expenses  $            -   

Total (Hours and Reimbursable Expenses)  $ 4,420.00 
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