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III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well 
as receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated 
for meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project 
will do so on the standard, federal scale of $69 per day, with fractions of days rounded to the 
nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the 
end of the day would be compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Many Team members have 
waived their per diem charges, or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while 
traveling to Cleveland.  This constitutes additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 

Finally, some Team member invoices or bills may contain reference to meals or other costs for 
which the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items 
have been redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that 
contains billed charges are subtracted from the total.  In such instances, the arithmetic should be 
clear. 

IV. CONCLUSION

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 

Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 

Sincerely, 

Matthew Barge 

cc: 
Michelle Heyer 
Monica Madej 
Kevin Preslan 
Heather Tonsing Volosin 

















MATTHEW BARGE 
 

FEBRUARY 2016 INVOICE 
 

BILLABLE HOURS 
 
Date Activity Hours 
02-01-16 Communicate via email re: various monitoring 

issues.  Review, revise, and file materials. 
5.8 

02-02-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Participate in conference calls. 
Draft and review documents.   

7.4 

02-03-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues. 

2.8 

02-04-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues. Draft and review documents.   

3.9 

02-05-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Review materials.  Participate in 
conference calls. 

6.8 

02-06-16 Communicate via email re: various monitoring 
issues. 

3.4 

02-07-16 Communicate via email re: various monitoring 
issues.  Review materials. 

5.9 

02-08-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Attend stakeholder and 
community meetings.  Review documents. 

6.3 

02-09-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Participate in conference calls 
with stakeholders.  Review documents. 

11.3 

02-10-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Review documents. 

6.8 

02-11-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.   

2.6 

02-12-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Review documents. 

5.8 

02-13-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  
Review documents.  Draft and review documents. 

4.3 

02-14-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  
Review documents.  Draft and review documents. 

2.7 

02-15-16 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  
Review documents.  Draft and review documents. 

6.6 

02-16-16 Communicate by email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Participate in conference calls.  
Review documents.  Revise Monitoring Plan 

7.8 

02-17-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues. Draft and review documents.   

6.7 



02-18-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues. Draft and review documents.   

6.8 

02-19-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Participate in conference calls.  
Review documents. 

7.2 

02-20-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

3.0 

02-21-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents. 

2.9 

02-22-16 Attend stakeholder meeting. Communicate re: 
various monitoring issues.  Participate in conference 
call.  Draft and review documents. 

11.8 

02-23-16 Attend stakeholder and community meetings. 
Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents. 

11.6 

02-24-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate re: 
various monitoring issues.  Review documents. 

10.7 

02-25-16 Attend stakeholder meetings. Communicate re: 
various monitoring issues 

9.4 

02-26-16 Attend community and stakeholder meetings.  
Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues. Draft and review documents.   

4.7 

02-27-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents.   

7.0 

02-28-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents.   

3.3 

02-29-16 Communicate via email and telephone re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents.  
Attend meeting re: community engagement 
initiative. 

5.1 

Total Hours Worked 180.4 
Total Billed Hours   4.0 
              Rate: $250/hour 
TOTAL BILLED $1,000 
Pro Bono Hours 176.4 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 
7-Feb American Airlines (2/7)* $247.10 
7-Feb Dial7 (Residence to LGA) $  52.80 
7-Feb Taxi  (CLE to Downtown) $  42.60 
9-Feb Taxi  (Downtown to CLE) $  47.21 
8-Feb Taxi  (Hotel to ADAMHS Board Meeting) $  10.00 
9-Feb American Airlines (2/9)** $    5.60 



9-Feb Taxi (LGA to Residence) $  44.38 
10-Feb Renaissance Hotel (2/7 – 2/9) $291.26 
21-Feb American Airlines (2/21 – 2/25)*** $494.20 
21-Feb Taxi (CLE to Downtown) $  47.00 
22-Feb Taxi (Hotel to ADAMHS Board Meeting) $  10.00 
22-Feb Uber (ADAMHS Board Meeting to Downtown) $    5.37 
22-Feb Taxi (Downtown to Community Office) $  10.00 
25-Feb Taxi (Downtown to CLE) $  48.00 
26-Feb Renaissance Hotel (2/21 – 2/25) $1,020.56 

TOTAL $2,376.08 

Notes: 

* Due to a scheduling change, Mr. Barge flew only an outbound leg of a round-trip itinerary 
(totaling $494.20).  Accordingly, reimbursement is sought on this invoice for half ($247.10) of the 
total, corresponding to the leg flown.  The remainder will be invoiced when applied to a future 
itinerary.

**  Mr. Barge used frequent flier miles to book an awards ticket for this leg.  The $5.60 is the 
processing fee. 

***  Prior, cancelled itinerary (original travel for 1/24 – 1/29) ($488.20) applied, with additional 
fare collected ($6.00), accounting for $494.20 total.  See January 2016 Invoice at 6.  Because Mr. 
Barge subsequently re-booked travel at the end of the 2/21 – 2/25 trip for a destination (LAX) not 
related to the Cleveland monitoring, the receipt that would otherwise reflect cancellation and 
application of the 1/24 – 1/29 trip toward the as-flown 2/21 – 2/25 trip does not fully reflect this.  
However, it should be noted that Mr. Barge separately billed the City for the as-flown air travel 
on 1/25 and 1/29 and made reference to an original flight being canceled in the January invoice.  
Id.

Mr. Barge does not bill for meals or miscellaneous personal expenses.  Whenever feasible to do 
so, he coordinates ground transportation with other Monitoring Team members. 
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Subject: E-Ticket	Confirma1on-IUWZBF	07FEB
Date: Tuesday,	January	19,	2016	at	9:44:01	PM	Eastern	Standard	Time
From: American	Airlines@aa.com
To: MaMhew	Barge

Ticket Issued: Jan 19, 2016

Matthew Barge,
Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your
trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at  www.aa.com/options.   For
information regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please
visit www.aa.com/baggageinfo.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit
www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA
Self-Service machine. 

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.
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Carrier Flight # Departing Arriving Fare Code

American
4140

NEW YORK LGA 
SUN 07FEB
7:15 PM

CLEVELAND 

9:05 PM
S

OPERATED BY TRANS STATES AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

Matthew Barge Seat 4B Economy FF#:  

American
4137

CLEVELAND 
WED 10FEB
4:09 PM

NEW YORK LGA 

5:51 PM
S

OPERATED BY TRANS STATES AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

Matthew Barge Seat 4B Economy FF#:  

Record
Locator IUWZBF

Passenger Ticket # Fare-USD Taxes and Carrier-
Imposed Fees Ticket Total

  Matthew Barge 0012319692605 433.49 60.71 494.20

Baggage Information

Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -LGACLE-No free checked bags/ American Airlines BAG
ALLOWANCE -CLELGA-No free checked bags/ American Airlines 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-LGACLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 K  
UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CLELGA-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR 
LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-LGACLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM
2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CLELGA-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM ADDITIONAL
ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCOUNTS MAY APPLY 

You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The itinerary must be canceled before the ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the tic
has no value. If the fare allows changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply.

One or more of your flights is a Codeshare flight and is operated by a Partner Airline. If your journey begins with a flight operated by one of American's 
Airlines, then please check-in with the Partner Airline for that portion of your journey. Upon check-in, they will check your luggage to its final destination 
provide boarding passes for your connecting flights, if applicable.

Some everyday products, l ke e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked
baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may res  
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage like:



Thursday,	March	17,	2016	at	6:57:45	PM	Eastern	Daylight	Time
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Subject: E-Ticket	Confirma1on-ZVEEDV	09FEB
Date: Tuesday,	February	9,	2016	at	12:50:05	PM	Eastern	Standard	Time
From: American	Airlines@aa.com
To: MaKhew	Barge

Ticket Issued: Feb 9, 2016

Matthew Barge,
Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your
trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at  www.aa.com/options.   For
information regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please
visit www.aa.com/baggageinfo.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit
www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA
Self-Service machine. 

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.
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Carrier Flight # Departing Arriving Fare Code

American
4137

CLEVELAND 
TUE 09FEB
4:09 PM

NEW YORK LGA 

5:51 PM
T

OPERATED BY TRANS STATES AS AMERICAN EAGLE
  CHECK-IN WITH AMERICAN EAGLE

Matthew Barge Seat 4B Economy FF#  

Record
Locator ZVEEDV

Passenger Ticket # Fare-USD Taxes and Carrier-
Imposed Fees Ticket Total

  Matthew Barge 0012321466170 0 5.60 5.60

Baggage Information

Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -CLELGA-No free checked bags/ American Airlines
1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CLELGA-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BA  
CLELGA-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM ADDITIONAL ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCO
MAY APPLY 

You may have purchased a "Special Fare" and certain restrictions apply. Some fares are NON-REFUNDABLE. If the fare allows changes, a fee may be
assessed for the change.

One or more of your flights is a Codeshare flight and is operated by a Partner Airline. If your journey begins with a flight operated by one of American's 
Airlines, then please check-in with the Partner Airline for that portion of your journey. Upon check-in, they will check your luggage to its final destination 
provide boarding passes for your connecting flights, if applicable.

Some everyday products, l ke e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked
baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may res  
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage like:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries fo  
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette ligh
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage e
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.
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Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-882-8880 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please visit www.aa.com/airportexpec

If you are traveling internationally, please ensure that you have the proper documentation.   All necessary travel documents for the countries being visit
must be presented at airport check-in. Check with the consulate of these countries to determine the documents required.  Additional information can be 
at International Travel.

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's   conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be tick
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on f  
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are 
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, 
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the 
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rig  
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the 
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free o
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of e  
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.   

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message con
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or other
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distr bute, or take action in reliance upon th
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from yo
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 6662151544620911494074700
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Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries fo  
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette ligh
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage e
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please visit www.aa.com/airportexpec

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be tick
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on f  
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are 
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, 
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the 
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rig  
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the 
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free o
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of e  
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message con
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or other
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distr bute, or take action in reliance upon th
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from yo
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 1931336642461920434098600



Wednesday,	March	9,	2016	at	8:31:11	AM	Eastern	Standard	Time
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Subject: Dial7	Trip	Receipt	-	No	Reply
Date: Sunday,	February	7,	2016	at	5:42:32	PM	Eastern	Standard	Time
From: tripreceipt@dial7.com
To:
A1achments: UnRtled,	UnRtled,	1680918413.jpg

Confirmation #:  1680918413
Account #:  1
Account Name:  $
Passenger Name:  MATTHEW BARGE
Car #:  3470
Date/Time:  Feb 7 2016 5:15PM
Payment Type:  
  

PICKUP:

 
DROP OFF:
LGA

BASE FARE ($):  39.00
Tolls ($):  6.00
Tips ($):  7.80

Total Price ($):  52.80

  
SIGNATURE:

  
  
I AGREE TO ALL ABOVE CHARGES

  
Thank you for choosing us for your transportation needs.

This is your final receipt for your recent trip.
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Go Paperless - Go Green
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Subject: E-Ticket	Confirma1on-DPSMZM	24JAN
Date: Tuesday,	December	29,	2015	at	7:56:41	PM	Eastern	Standard	Time
From: American	Airlines@aa.com
To: MaLhew	Barge

Ticket Issued: Dec 29, 2015

Matthew Barge,
Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your
trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at  www.aa.com/options.   For
information regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please
visit www.aa.com/baggageinfo.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit
www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA
Self-Service machine. 

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.
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baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may res  
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage like:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries fo  
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette ligh
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage e
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please visit www.aa.com/airportexpec

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be tick
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on f  
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are 
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, 
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the 
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rig  
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the 
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free o
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of e  
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message con
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or other
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distr bute, or take action in reliance upon th
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from yo
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 4456292366232918563264400



Tuesday,	March	8,	2016	at	10:00:57	AM	Eastern	Standard	Time
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Subject: E-Ticket	Confirma1on-QADVAS	21FEB
Date: Saturday,	February	6,	2016	at	11:18:14	AM	Eastern	Standard	Time
From: American	Airlines@aa.com
To: MaJhew	Barge

Ticket Issued: Feb 6, 2016

Matthew Barge,
Thank you for choosing American Airlines / American Eagle, a member of the
oneworld® Alliance.  Below are your itinerary and receipt for the ticket(s)
purchased.  Please print and retain this document for use throughout your
trip.

You may check in and obtain your boarding pass for U.S. domestic electronic
tickets within 24 hours of your flight time online at AA.com by
using  www.aa.com/checkin or at a Self-Service Check-In machine at the
airport.  Check-in options may be found at  www.aa.com/options.   For
information regarding American Airlines checked baggage policies, please
visit www.aa.com/baggageinfo.

To receive updated flight status notifications, please visit
www.aa.com/notifications.

For faster check-in  at the airport, scan the barcode below at any AA
Self-Service machine. 

You must present a government-issued photo ID and either your boarding
pass or a priority verification card at the security screening checkpoint.

You can now Manage Your Reservation on aa.com, where you can check in
and purchase additional items to customize your journey. A variety of seating
options are also available for purchase to enhance your travel with features
such as convenient front of cabin location, extra legroom and early boarding.
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Some everyday products, l ke e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked
baggage.  Changes in temperature or pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited items may res  
fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden hazardous materials in your baggage like:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives / Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter
fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries fo  
consumer electronic devices in carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette ligh
and e-cigarettes must be removed from checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not be used on
the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage e
Passengers requiring these items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

Electronic tickets are NOT TRANSFERABLE.  Tickets with nonrestrictive fares are valid for one year from original date of issue.  If you have questions
regarding our refund policy, please visit www.aa.com/refunds.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

Check-in times will vary by departure location.  In order to determine the time you need to check-in at the airport, please visit www.aa.com/airportexpec

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's  conditions of carriage..

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the
transporting air carriers, which are herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on which you may be tick
may have different conditions of carriage.  International air transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on f  
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are 
restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or perishable goods, 
availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the 
carrier, 4. Rights on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rig  
the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the 
to inspect the full text of each transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon request, to receive (free o
charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of e  
carrier's terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

If you have a customer service issue, please Contact AA..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message con
confidential and proprietary information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched, distributed or other
used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an intended recipient, please do not read, distr bute, or take action in reliance upon th
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this message and its attachments from yo
computer.

  

Conditions of Carriage  Special Assistance  Flight Check-in  Flight Status Notification

NRID: 2711446211290610172736300
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Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Fees 02/01/2016 - Commun cat ons - rev ew Ba dw n Wa ace
survey; ema s w/P Ch sm re fo ow up to s te v s t, rev ew ISDM
mater a s;

0.60 $300.00 $180.00

Fees 02/03/2016 - Commun cat ons - phone ca s & e-ma s re UofF
meet ng and POA response/concerns; med a coverage ssues

0.30 $300.00 $90.00

Fees 02/04/2016 - Documents - down oad, pr nt and rev ew f na
vers on of Mon tor ng p an

0.40 $300.00 $120.00

Fees 02/05/2016 - Conference ca s/on ne meet ngs: week y ca
w/MT to rev ew resu ts of th s week's act v t es, d scuss
schedu ng of upcom ng s te v s ts, team observat ons, etc.

0.70 $300.00 $210.00

Fees 02/12/2016 - Research: rev ew CDP & MT ema s, gu debooks
from VERA and COPS off ce on po c ng d verse commun t es;
MT meet ng

2.20 $300.00 $660.00

Fees 02/19/2016 - Documents - rev ew/ed t/wr t ng:
memos/documents on base ne measures, budget response,
b ue team, recru tment po cy and p an, use of force worksheet;
p us pro bono work on s te v s t og s t cs (1 hr)

1.20 $300.00 $360.00

Fees 02/24/2016 - Documents - rev ew f na  vers ons of MT & DOJ
responses re use of force

0.40 $300.00 $120.00

Fees 02/26/2016 - Commun cat ons - phone ca s & e-ma s:
w/Comm. McCartney re s te v s t and D str ct 1 meet ng; rev ew
draft po c es and responses re LEP and An ma  Inc dents; after
act on etters, s te v s t schedu e (.6 hr pro bono on s te v s t and
adm n commun cat ons)

1.90 $300.00 $570.00

Fees 02/27/2016 - Commun cat ons - phone ca s & e-ma s: ema s
and d scuss on concern ng FOP/CPD engagement meet ng;
feedback on draft po c es,

1.10 $300.00 $330.00

Amount Due $2,640.00

INVOICE From Joseph Brann & Associates
 

  

Invo ce For PARCInvo ce ID 2016-2 Cleveland1

Issue Date 03/07/2016

Due Date 04/06/2016 (Net 30)
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Notes

February Fees (B ed ours - 8.8): $2,640.00 
February Pro Bono rs: 1.6 (45.8 year to date) 
February Expenses: $0 
Tota  Fees B ed to Date: $32,130.00
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BRIAN D. CENTER 

TO: Matthew Barge 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Brian Center 

DATE:  March 6, 2016 

FEBRUARY 2016 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 
2-4-16 Tc re mtg. between union and CPD; prep. memo re 

same 
1.4 

2-12 Attend MT meeting via phone 0.8 
2-14 Research publications re best practice for 

police/community trust 
1.0 

2-19 Attend MT mtg via phone 1.0 
2-21 Review docs re MT meetings, CPD recruitment 

policy, blue team worksheet. 
0.7 

2-26 Tc with MT and CPC  member re community trust, 
status of CPC efforts 

1.0 

2-29 Tc with CPC members, MT re CPC efforts 0.7 
Total Hours Worked 6.6 
Total Billed Hours 5 

              Rate: $250/hour 
TOTAL BILLED $1,250 
Pro Bono Hours 1.6 



Date 11 Hours
2/2/2016 Meeting to discuss draft of baseline measures and survey plan 1.00
2/2/2016 Review and respond to emails 0.25
2/3/2016 Review and respond to emails 0.25
2/5/2016 Call to discuss survey and baseline plans, all team member call 2.25
2/7/2016 Review and test of sharing platform Slack, work on measurements 1.50

2/8/2016
Meeting to work on baseline measurement document, review of data available, 
and sources.  Review of survey plan 1.50

2/9/2016 Review and respond to emails 0.50
2/10/2016 Writing for baseline plan and survey plan 1.50
2/10/2016 Review and respond to emails 0.50
2/12/2016 Writing baseline measurement plan 4.00
2/15/2016 Review and respond to emails 0.25
2/15/2016 Baseline measurement plan drafting 3.75

2/16/2016
Review and comment on Blue Team DNs, Blue Team plan, and budgets.  Work 
on baseline and survey plans. 3.50

2/19/2016
Meeting to review and plan schedule for meetings in CLE to advance the 
baseline data collection.  Participated in all team meeting.   2.00

2/23/2016
Reading and commenting on DNs, sending call for survey firms, emails and 
planning 2.00

2/24/2016
Setting meetings, review and comment on recruitment plan, work on IAU data, 
follow up on communications and requests 2.50

2/25/2016 Review and respond to emails 0.50

Total hours worked 27.75
Pro Bono hours 3.75
Total hours billed 24.00

Rate $250.00 hour 6,000.00$  
Expenses See Reimbursement Sheet for Detail $     0.0

Total Invoice $  6,000.00

Remit payment to:

3/2/2016

Signature Date

INVOICE 
CHRISTINE M. COLE at COMMUNITY RESOURCES FOR JUSTICE

Invoice Period:  February 2016

PARC
Attn: Meg Olsen
Date:  March 1, 2016

Re:  Cleveland Monitoring



Reimbursement for Expenses

Date Expense description Amount Reference
0 0 $0.00 1

2
3
4
5
6
7
8

Total expenses $0.00



Randolph Dupont 
 

TO:  Matthew Barge, Monitor 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 
 
FROM: Randolph Dupont 
 
DATE:  March 3, 2016 

February 2016 Invoice 
Billable Hours 

 

Date Activity Hours 
02-01-16 Cleveland Survey Information, MHRAC Meeting Documents 

Review, Policy Documents Review 
  0.7 

02-02-16 Ohio CIT Data Sheets Review, Scheduling, Policy and MHRAC 
Document Review, Phone Discussion of MHRAC Retreat, 
Review of Monitoring Team Progress, HPOA Meeting Minutes  

  6.7 

02-03-16 Review of Correspondence, Phone Discussion of MHRAC Mtg   1.7   
02-04-16 Policy Committee Meeting, Scheduling, Information review   2.0 
02-05-16 Review of Correspondence, Monitoring Team Meeting   1.1 
02-08-16 Conference Calls on MHRAC Memo, Document Review   3.2 
02-09-16 Discussion of CPC, Review of Correspondence, MHRAC Public 

Meeting Workgroup Meeting, Conference call on MHRAC 
Memo, CPD Dropbox Issues 

  3.4 

02-11-16 Discussion of Communications Memo and MHRAC Executive 
Committee Meeting Minutes, CPT Safety Memo  

  2.2 

02-12-16 Monitoring Team Meeting, Public Survey Draft Review   2.2 
02-16-16 MHRAC Public Meeting Workgroup Meeting, Cleveland Civic 

Events review, PMW communications plan review, discussion 
  3.5 

02-17-16 Follow up discussion of communications memo, Cleveland trip 
scheduling, Policy feedback  

  1.8 

02-19-16 Baseline measurements discussion, Use of Force discussion, 
review of proposed recruitment policy, Discussion of specialized 
police practices, review of annual community survey 

  1.2 

02-23-16 Information review (community and public meeting survey), 
communications plan, CIT training issue discussion 

  1.6 

02-25-16 MHRAC Public Meeting Workgroup, Cleveland Trip scheduling, 
discussion of CIT, Use of Force Policy Issues and CIT baseline 
issues, review of MHRAC community engagement strategy 

  4.0 

02-29-16 Cleveland Trip scheduling, review of CPD public safety docs    0.6 
  

Total Hours Worked 
 
35.9 

 Total Billed Hours 22.5 
               Rate: $250/hour  
 TOTAL BILLED $5625 
 Pro Bono Hours 13.4 

 





INVOICE 

From: Ayesha Bell Hardaway To:  Police Assessment Resource Center 

Billable Hours and Expenses for February 2016 

DATE DESCRIPTION   HOURS 

2/2/16 Conference Call with CPD and draft of follow-up correspondence 1.7 
2/2/16 Commissioner Meeting 1.5 
2/3/16 Meeting with City Director of Recreation 1.0 
2/3/16 Attend CPC Bias-Free Work Group Community Meeting 2.0 
2/4/16 Phone Conference with M. Barge .3 
2/5/16 Community Engagement Team Meeting 1.3 
2/5/16 Monitoring Team Meeting .8 
2/5/16 Phone Conference with M. Barge .4 
2/7/16 Conference Call re: CPC 2.0 
2/8/16 Attend CPC Bias-Free Work Group Community Meeting 1.8 
2/10/16 Meeting with S. Smoot 1.9 
2/10/16 Attend CPC Meeting 2.9 
2/12/16 Review and analyze 1st Year Monitoring Plan 2.1 
2/12/16 Meeting re: CPC Deadlines 1.0 
2/12/16 Monitoring Team Meeting 1.1 
2/18/16 Attend CPC Bias-Free Work Group Meeting 1.5 
2/19/16 Community Engagement Team Meeting 1.3 
2/19/16 Monitoring Team Meeting 1.4 
2/21/16 Review and analyze memorandums and emails 2.4 
2/22/16 Monitoring CET/CPC Conference Call .6 
2/22/16 Conference Call with C. See .4 
2/23/16 Monthly Meeting with Parties 1.5 
2/23/16 Presentation to and Discussion with MyCom 1.8 
2/24/16 Community Engagement Team Conference  Call 1.0 
2/24/16 Attend CPC Meeting 2.5 
2/25/16 Meeting with S. Perez 1.0 
2/25/16 Meeting with A. Body 1.0 
2/25/16 Attend CPC Bias-Free Work Group Meeting .8 



2/26/16 Meeting with A. King 1.0 
2/26/16 Conference Call with B. Center and C. See .5 
2/29/16 Meeting with Sgt. Higgins 1.0 
 

Total Hours Worked                       41.5 

Pro Bono Hours                                                                                    12.5 
Travel Hours                                                                                       14.5  
Total Hours Billed   (29.0)     x   Rate $250.00/hour     $7,250.00 
 
REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
2/3/16 Parking 4.75 
2/22/16 Parking 8.00 
2/23/16 Parking 9.00 
Total Expense Amount Due (Transportation)   $21.75 







TRAVEL/LODGING EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount 

TOTAL REIMBUSEEXPENSES:
   PER DIEM EXPENSES 

         TOTAL PER DIEM 

TOTAL INVOICED: 
$0 







REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Date Expense Amount REF 

Transportation $0 

Accommodations    $0 

Per Diem (1 day)      $0 

TOTAL EXPENSES $0 



DATE

To: Matthew Barge
Police Assessment Resource Center

Date Hours

2/23/2016 1.00

2/20/2016 1.00

2.00

Pro-Bono  Hours *

February 3.00

5.00

$500.00

Invoice

Review/Feedback on Recruiting Policy

Feb 2016

2016 2 Cleveland Project Bill - Scott  Sargent

Activity

Review and feedback on UOF Reporting Policy

TL

Conf Calls/Emails

Total Hours

@250 x 2



Ellen Scrivner, Ph.D., ABPP           
                    
 

               
                              

                                
 
   FEBRUARY 2016 CLEVELAND INVOICE 
        NO BILLABLE HOURS/ALL PRO BONO 
_____________________________________________________________ 
DATE    ACTIVITY            HOURS 
________________________________________________________________________ 
2/12/2016   Monitoring Team Conf Call       1.0 
________________________________________________________________________ 
 
2/19//2016   Monitoring Team Conf Call       1 ½ hours 
________________________________________________________________________ 
2/19/2016 Reviewed  Documents Including Biennial Community  

Survey Plan; Use of Force Worksheet; Baseline Assessment 
Measurement Plan; Official Budgets.      2 Hours 

________________________________________________________________________
     
2/28/2016   Reviewed and Commented on Recruitment Policy and Plan 

     2 Hours 
________________________________________________________________________  
    Total Hours      6.1/2 Hours 
____________________________________________________________ 
     
    TOTAL BILLED 

        All ProBono Hours    6.1/2 
    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement
2016 02 Cleveland Project Bill – Charles R. See

TO: Matthew Barge

Meg Olsen

Police Assessment Resource Center

FROM: Charles R. See

DATE: March 12, 2016
February 2016 INVOICE

BILLABLE HOURS

Date Activity Hours___
2/01/16____Sub-­‐committee Mental Health Community Engagement Committee__ _1.5___ __
2/03/16 Clergy meeting, Mt. Pleasant group, encourage their involvement 1.5
2/05/16 Engagement Team meeting, planning for community involvement_____1.3_____
2/05/16 Full team conference call, planning and review ________________ 0.8_____
2/08/16 Meeting, College of Urban Studies re: development of study guide 1.5
2/10/16 Community Police Commission meeting_________________________ 2.0_____
2/11/16 Public Forum C.P. Library re: Consent Decree 2.0
2/12/16 Full team conference call, planning and review 1.0
2/13/16____Meeting with CMHA resident leadership re: Consent Decree_________ 2.0_____
2/19/16 Full team conference call, planning and review 1.4
2/22/16 Conference calls with: Bell Hardaway, Barge, 0.9
2/22/16____Meeting with Chief Williams and a SCLC committee_________________1.5_____
2/23/16 Stakeholders’ meeting status update 1.5
2/23/16 Conference call: Judge Adrine, Dr. Carrington, re: constituent participation 0.8
2/24/16 Engagement Team meeting, planning for community involvement_________1.3__
2/24/16 Community Police Commission meeting 2.0
2/25/16 Meeting with Commission member re: Commission’s operations___ ____ __1.0__
2/25/16 Meeting with Commission members and Muslim community reps. 2.3
2/26/16 Meetng with Mental Health Advisory sub-­‐committee 1.5
2/26/16 Meeting with commission member re: Commission’s operations___________ 1.0__
2/27/16 Hispanic Clergy meeting re: involvement with the Consent Decree 1.4
2/29/16 Meeting with CMHA resident council leadership re: Study Group 0.7
_____________________________________________________________________________

Total hours Worked: 42.2

Total Billed Hours: ______30.9 ________________________________

____________________Rate: $250 Per hour



Total Billed: $7,725.00

Pro Bono Hours: 11.3

Pro Bono hours consisted of: travel time, phone calls, meetings, correspondence, mileage
expense, planning time and various document review, and e-­‐mails

Please make payable to Charles R. See

Charles R. See,

Charles R. See

Director of Community Engagement



2016 2 Cleveland Project Bill – Sean M. Smoot 

TO: Matthew Barge 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Sean M. Smoot 

DATE:  February 29, 2016 

FEBRUARY 2016 INVOICE 
BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 

2-01-16 Review BWUniv Survey 1.0 
2-02-16 Correspondence fr: CPPA 0.25 
2-02-16 Conf Call w/ Monitor Barge 0.25 
2-05-16 Conf Call w/ S Loomis 0.5 
2-05-16 Conf Call w Monitor & Team 0.75 
2-05-16 Review Job Desc. Data Collection & 

Analysis;  Blue Team 
Memo/Worksheet 

1.0 

2-08-16 CPC Training Docs 0.5 
2-09-16 Conf Call w/ S Loomis 0.25 
2-09-16 TRAVEL (Springfield-Chicago) [3.0] 
2-09-16 TRAVEL (MDW-CLE) [2.0] 
2-09-16 Meeting w Monitor  1.0 
2-10-16 Meetings CPPA Executive Board, 

CPD Intel Unit, CPD Cmd & Debrief 
4.5 

2-10-16 TRAVEL (CLE-MDW) [2.0] 
2-10-16 TRAVEL (Chicago-Springfield) [3.0] 
2-10-16 Report & Review CPPA & CPD 

Meetings w Monitor 
1.0 

2-11-16 Biennial Survey Document Review 1.0 

2-12-16 Prep for Team Conf Call  0.5 
2-12-16 Conf Call w. Monitor Barge & Team 1.0 
2-16-16 Use of Force Survey Questions 0.5 
2-16-16 Conf Call w/ Monitor 0.25 
2-19-16 DNS PDF Survey Docs; Recruit 

Survey Docs; Training & Recruitment  
1.5 

2-19-16 Conf Call w. Monitor & Team 1.25 
2-22-16 Rev. UOF DN; UOF, DV, and Proc. 

Justice Training Docs  
1.0 

2-23-16 Conf Call w. City Legal, DOJ, 
Monitor 

1.25 

2-23-16 TRAVEL (Springfield-Chicago) [3.0] 
2-23-16 TRAVEL (ORD-CLE) [2.0] 
2-23-16 Meeting w Monitor  1.5 



2-23-16 Blue Team Implementation Basics; 
RNC UOF Reporting Doc Review & 
Comment 

1.25 

2-24-16 Meetings w Monitor CPD Intel Unit, 
Cmd BH 

2.5 

2-24-16 Meetings w City Legal & Damien 
Scott re OPS 

2.25 

2-24-16 Rev. IA Pro Work Plan 0.5 
2-24-16 TRAVEL (CLE-ORD) [2.0] 
2-24-16 TRAVEL (Chicago-Springfield) [3.0] 
2-26-16 Rev. CDP Recruitment Plan Docs 0.5 
   
Hours Billed 20 @ $250   $5,000.00 
Pro Bono 
Hours 

  8.75 

TRAVEL Hours  20 
 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
 

Date Expense Amount 
2/9-10/16 Airfare (R/T – Chicago MDW – CLE) $ 511.96 
2/9/16 Uber Ride (CLE – Downtown Cleveland) $  55.22 
2/9-10/16 Lodging - Renaissance Hotel $145.63 
2/10/16 Uber Ride (Downtown Cleveland) $  19.05 
2/9-10/16 Parking – MDW $  46.00 
2/9-10/16 Mileage R/T SPI – MDW (403 Miles x $0.54 ) $ 217.62 
2/23-24/16 Airfare (R/T – Chicago ORD – CLE) $ 527.20 
2/23/16 Uber Ride (CLE - Downtown Cleveland) $  51.57 
2/24/16 Uber Ride (Downtown Cleveland) $  18.41 
2/24/16 Uber Ride (Downtown Cleveland) $  17.88 
2/24/16 Uber Ride (CLE - Downtown Cleveland) $  48.25 
2/23-24/16 Parking ORD $ 108.00 
2/23-24/16 Mileage R/T SPI – ORD (420 Miles x $0.54 ) $ 226.80 
2/23-24/16 Lodging – Renaissance CLE $ 290.09 
   
TOTALS   
 Airfare  $ 1,039.16 
 Lodging  $  435.72 
 Parking  $  154.00 
 Ground Trans & Mileage  $  654.80 
 M&E Per Diem $ -0- 
   
TOTAL  SUBMITTED FOR REIMBURSEMENT $2,283.68 
 
 
TOTAL DUE   $7,283.68 
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Southwest Airlines
P.O. Box 36647-1CR
Dallas, TX 75235 

Contact Us

Copyright 2016 Southwest Airlines Co. All Rights Reserved.
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Matthew Barge Invoice # 16-002

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC)

Date Service Hrs.

02/03/16 Meeting to discuss Recreation Center Outreach  & Youth Engagement 1

02/03/16 CPC LGBT Outreach meeting 2

02/04/16 Ride-Along 4th District 4

02/05/16 Community Engagement Team meeting 1

02/05/16 Full Monitoring Team conference call 0.7

02/09/16 Community Outreach calls & emails 0.25

02/12/16 Full Monitoring Team conference call 0.6

02/16/16 Community Outreach calls & emails 0.5

02/17/16 Community Outreach calls & emails 0.25

02/19/16 Community Engagement Team conference call 1

02/19/16 Full Monitoring Team conference call 1.25

02/23/16 My Comm Flow presentation 1.5

02/24/16 Community Outreach calls & emails 0.5

02/24/16 Community Engagement Team meeting 1.25

02/25/16 Review of Biennial Survey Plan & Baseline Assessment 0.5

02/26/16 Prep for Constant Contact Set-up 0.5

02/27/16 IT - Constant Contact setup & data entry 0.5

Total Hours Worked (excluding travel) 17.3

Pro Bono Work Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $1,500.00 6

Pro Bono Travel Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $562.50 2.25

Pro Bono Mileage Rate: 0.54 /mile $19.44

Total Billed Rate: $250.00 /hour $2,825.00 11.30

FEBRUARY 2016 EXPENSES

SUMMARY OF HOURS WORKED

March 2, 2016

2016 3 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE
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Date Reimbursable Expense REF

Transportation

02/03/16 Parking for Rec Center Engagement meeting 1

02/23/16 Parking for My Comm Flow presentation 2

Total Transportation

Accommodations

None this month

Total Accommodations

Per Diem

None this month

Total Per Diem

Total Billed Reimbursable Expenses

Pro Bono Contributions $2,081.94

Billed Hours $2,825.00

Billed Reimbursable Exp $8.75

Total Amount Due $2,833.75

SUMMARY OF REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

2016 3 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE

$4.75

$4.00

Amount Paid

$8.75

$8.75

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00






