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the City of Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of over 13 percent of its time for December 2021 as 
pro bono time saved  $7,800.00. 
 
Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total, five-year budget cap of $4.95 million to which the City, 
Department of Justice, and Court agreed in October 2015. The budget for year six is $794,000.00, 
which the monitoring team invoicing is well within. 
 
Activities, work, and tasks conducted during December 2021 included but were not limited to: 
 

• Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing 
training addressing:   (In-person audits resumed) 

 

! Force Review Board; 

! Crisis intervention; 

! Bias-Free policing; and 

! Supervision. 
 

• Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and drafting of new policies, processes, 
procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to: 

! Supervisory response to use of force incidents; 

! Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command; 

! Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”); 

! Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs (“IA”); 

! Chain of command misconduct review process; 

! Discipline process and 

! Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”). 

! Officer Intervention Program (OIP) 
 

• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding 
implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to: 

! Crisis intervention; 

! Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”); 

! District Policing Committees (“DPC”s); 

! Staffing; 

! Recruitment and hiring; and 
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• Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system.  
• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and 

Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting 
regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and functions; 

• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome 
measurements; 

• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”), 
including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian complaint 
investigations; 

• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and 
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and development; 
provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB Manual, and 
regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and 

• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer organizations, 
and community organizations. 

• Ongoing Use of Force outcome assessment, including reconciliation meetings and updates 
to assessors and the monitor. 

• Ongoing project management and coordination for deliverables (internal and with the City 
and DOJ) 

• Project management regarding priorities in the upcoming year and com,pletion of the 2022 
Monitoring Plan to be distributed to parties in January 2022. 

• Correspondence with the Court regarding a change in frequency for Court hearings and 
logistics for Public Hearings to keep the public informed of the progress of the Consent 
Decree. 

• Preparation for and coordination for hearings with the Court and the January in-person Site 
Visit (the visit was cancelled due to Covid-19 rates in Cleveland and will be rescheduled 
to coincide with a February 2022 Court Status Conference). 

• Discussions on the 2021 extensive OPS assessment report was that was completed in 
November. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
II. INVOICE SUMMARY 
 
 

 December 2021 

Billable Hours $53,075.00 
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Overhead/Expenses $1232.99 

TOTAL $54,307.99 

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

Total 
Hours 

Billed 
Hours 

Pro 
Bono 

Hours 
Total Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden   64.6 58.8 5.8 $14,700.00 $574.88 

Modupe Akinola 0.0 0.0 0.0 $0.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 0.0 0.0 0.0 $0.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 0.0 0.0 0.0 $0.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 9.1 8.5 0.6 $2,125.00 $632.11 

Ronnie Dunn 16.3 15.8 0.5 $3,950.00 $16.00 

Randy Dupont 2.7 2.1 0.6 $525.00 $0.00 

Lisa Fink 16.2 13.0 3.2 $3,250.00 $0.00 

Ayesha Hardaway 25.2 23.3 1.9 $5,825.00 $10.00 

Brian Maxey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Megan McDonough 10.5 8.3 2.2 $2,075.00 $0.00 

Rick Myers 5.2 3.6 1.6 $900.00 $0.00 

Charles Ramsey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 54.0 45.0 9.0 $11,250.00 $0.00 

Victor Ruiz 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 
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Scott Sargent  2.0 0.0 2.0 $0.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 1.0 0.0 1.0 $0.00 $0.00 

Charles See  24.7 21.9 2.8 $5,475.00 $0.00 

Sean Smoot  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Tim Tramble  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 75.00 75.00 0 $3,000.00 $0.00 

TOTAL 306.5 275.3 31.2 $53,075.00 $1232.99 

 
* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland 
project.  

 
 
 
III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
 
The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 
 
The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 
so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 
for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 
compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 
or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 
constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 
 
Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 
the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 
redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 
charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 
 
 
IV. CONCLUSION 
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We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 
 
Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 
 
       Sincerely, 

       
                                                                                     
cc: Michelle Heyer 
 





 Ca  w th C ty aw re:trans t on and Issue 24 matters. Ema  and correspondence. Rev ew and preparat on for FRB
on Fr day. Rev ew of a UF document. Ca  w th C. Co e re: Latera  H re Aud t and memo report ng resu ts to the
CDP/C ty/DOJ.

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Sen or Adv sor 2.00

 Trave  to C eve and for a s te v s t

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 4.00

 Meet ng w th G. Wh te re: trans t on and other CD re ated matters. Meet ng w th new CPC comm ss oners at the US
Atty's off ce. Meet ng w th commun ty representat ves re: trans t on teams for the new adm n strat on and other
matters concern ng CD progress. Rev ew of recent d sc p nary f nd ngs etters. Ema  and correspondence re: CD
re ated matters.

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Sen or Adv sor 1.00

 Reconc at on meet ng w th the part es ( nc ud ng preparat on)

12/10/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Sen or Adv sor 4.50

 Attended the month y Force Rev ew Board to assess comp ance.

12/10/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Sen or Adv sor 3.00

 Trave  back to DCA.

12/13/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 3.00

 Rev ew and correspondence re: OIS that occurred yesterday. Week y update MT eadersh p og st cs ca . Rev ew
of f na  memo on Latera  H re/Background memo to the part es. Work on the agenda for the January 2022 n-
person Genera  ema  and correspondence re: CD.

12/14/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 2.50

 Rev ew and subm ss on of f na  Latera  H re Memo to part es. Ca  w th M. Bretz re: de verab es and other CD
re ated matters and pr or t es. Rev ew of Mon tor ng P an. Ema  and correspondence.

12/15/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 2.00

 Rev ew of Updated Mon tor ng P an, documents re at ng to recent assessments/rev ews and ema  and
correspondence.

12/16/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.80

 Document rev ew re: Chappman case aud t. Ema  and correspondence.

12/17/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Sen or Adv sor 0.80

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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 Ema  and correspondence.

12/17/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 3.00

 F na  rev ew and approva  of Chappman case memorandum, rev ew of Mon tor ng P an 2022. Ema  and
correspondence.

12/19/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 2.50

 Ema  and correspondence w th the C ty and DOJ. F na zed two assessment/aud t reports to be sent to the
part es. Project management.

12/20/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 4.00

 Rev ew of Ch ef's and PSD D sc p ne Cases. Ema ed out two memos re: recent aud ts to part es. Ema  and
correspondence. Ca  w th M. Bretz re: ho day schedu es and pr or ty meet ngs, as we  as an update on
de verab es. Ca  w th R. Rosentha  re: OPS/IA matters. Ca  w th M. McDonough re: project management and
assessments.

12/21/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.80

 Ema  and correspondence and project management.

12/22/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 3.00

 Ca s w th DOJ/USAO re CD re ated matters and t me nes. Ema  and correspondence re og st cs for a ast m nute
meet ng re Chappman Report. Meet ng w th M. Bretz. Genera  ema  and correspondence and project
management.

12/23/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 3.00

 Rev ew and preparat on for meet ng w th the part es re: Chappman case rev ew and MT report. Ema  and
correspondence w th MT case rev ew team. Genera  ema  and correspondence.

12/24/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.80

 Rev ew and draft ng of updated Chappman Pursu t Invest gat on Report. Ema  and correspondence and work on
the f ng not ce to the Court.

12/28/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 2.00

 Ema  and correspondence, rev ew of documents assoc ated w th most recent MT f ng. Project management.

12/30/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 0.50

 Ema  and correspondence.

Char es See 24.70

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

2.00

 F rst D str ct CDP meet ng. Commun ty Re at ons

12/03/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.50

 F rst D str ct commun ty meet ng: Coffee w th a Cop.

12/03/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.30

 CPC meet ng re: CPOP work group

12/06/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

4.30

 Mon tored CIT Tra n ng. Phone ca  re: MHRAC

12/07/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

4.00

 Mon tored CIT tra n ng

12/08/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

3.00

 Mon tored CIT Tra n ng

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

4.50

 D vers on Center meet ng, CIT Tra n ng

12/10/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.00

 Phone ca s and ema s

12/17/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.80

 Phone ca s

12/23/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.00

 meet ng and phone ca s

12/27/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.30

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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 Rev ew court f ng, phone ca s

12/31/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.00

 Responded to a fata  nc dent nvo v ng a CDP Off cer.

CJI - Co e Chr st ne 9.10

12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.40

 Latera  Cand date Aud t memo, MT and DOJ teams meet ng

12/03/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 0.30

 work ng on Latera  Cand dates memo, re evant ema s on same top c, prep for UOF meet ng

12/06/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Sen or Adv sor 0.30

 Latera  Cand dates memo rev ew and ed t

12/07/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Latera  H res Assessment Sen or Adv sor 0.50

 memo and score sheet

12/07/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 0.50

 DOJ/MT meet ng

12/08/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.80

 DOJ/MT/C ty Law on trans t on, work on atera  memo and data

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.00

 UOF Assessment Presentat on and D scuss on

12/10/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Sen or Adv sor 0.30

 f na ze memo on atera  cand date rev ews

12/20/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 1.00

 Rev ew of tra n ng p an and og st cs ca  w th MT members, send ng Latera  score sheets

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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12/22/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Sen or Adv sor 2.00

 tra n ng p an rev ew

Django S b ey 1.00

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.00

 Zoom meet ng w th C eve and & DoJ

Hardaway Ayesha 25.20

12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.70

 Part c pate n meet ng w th DOJ.

12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.60

 Rev ew and ana yze current draft of CDP CPOP Data Co ect on s de presentat on.

12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.90

 Prepare for and part c pate n OPS B -Week y ca .

12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.60

 Pre m nary rev ew and ana ys s of C ty's Mot on Regard ng Charter Amendment Prov s ons.

12/03/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.50

 Rev ew, ana yze and rev se n t a  draft of memorandum regard ng CDP emp oyment pract ces.

12/06/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.40

 Part c pate n og st cs meet ng.

12/07/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.50

 Prepare for and part c pate n meet ng w th DOJ.

12/08/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.90

 Prepare for and part c pate n conference ca  w th C ty Law and DOJ.

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

2.80

 Prepare for FRB hear ng.

12/09/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.30

 Prepare for FRB hear ng.

12/10/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

7.00

 Prepare for and mon tor FRB hear ngs.

12/13/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.60

 Part c pate n MT meet ng.

12/13/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.70

 Part c pate n Tra n ng Sect on meet ng w th CDP and DOJ.

12/13/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

2.00

 Rev ew, ana yze and rev se draft assessment of Chappman nvest gat ons and adjud cat on.

12/16/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Assoc ate Consu tant
Profess ona  Fees

Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.60

 Prepare for and part c pate n OPS b -week y meet ng.

12/16/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.90

 Draft and f e Not ce to Court regard ng CDP Commun ty and Prob em Or ented Po c ng GPO and LMS Tra n ng.

12/16/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.30

 Rev ew and comment on draft assessment of pursu t nvest gat ons.

12/23/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.40

 Part c pate n meet ngs w th C ty of C eve and, CDP, and DOJ regard ng draft report on pursu t nvest gat ons.

12/26/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.50

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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 Draft Not ce to Court regard ng pursu t nvest gat ons rev ew; rev ew and rev se f na  report.

L sa F nk 16.20

12/02/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.00

 Rev ew document statuses; DOJ/MT Meet ng; fo ow-ups re: docs under rev ew.

12/06/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.50

 MT Log st cs Ca ; nterna  fo ow-ups re: 2022 MP draft; app y ng ed ts to accountab ty port on of Mon tor ng P an

12/06/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.80

 Ca  w R chard - d scuss ng 2022 MP and CDP de verab es

12/10/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.20

 2022 Mon tor ng P an & C ty Sem annua  Report rev ew/compare

12/11/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.30

 UOF po cy; 2022 Mon tor ng P an ed ts

12/13/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.70

 Prep for MT meet ng; MT Log st cs Meet ng; fo ow-ups re: CPOP f ng and Mon tor ng P an ed ts; Updat ng docs
n Box and ass gn ng to MT members; sk mm ng D str ct Awareness powerpo nts.

12/13/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.20

 Tra n ng B week y Ca ; fo ow-ups re: d str ct awareness tra n ngs; Prepped/sent UOF po c es to DOJ; rev ewed
prev ous CD docs and p ann ng for Tues meet ngs.

12/15/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Assoc ate
Consu tant

1.70

 Rev ew of Pursu t Report (Chappman)

12/15/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.90

 Ca  w R chard - d scuss ng Pursu t Report; Mon tor ng P an ed ts.

12/15/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Assoc ate
Consu tant

0.30

 Rev ewed performance eva s for reference for Mon tor ng P an ed ts

Date C ent Project Task Ro es Hours

Total 306.50
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12/01/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 - November
2022

Transportat on Sen or Adv sor $76.00

 Park ng at BOS 11/29 through 11/30

12/29/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 - November
2022

Transportat on Sen or Adv sor $316.90

 f ght on AA for trave  from Boston to C eve and

Hardaway Ayesha $10.00

12/21/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 - November
2022

Other Assoc ate
Consu tant

$10.00

 FRB hear ng - Park ng -12/10/2021

Ronn e Dunn $16.00

12/17/2021 C ty of
C eve and

C eve and December 2021 - November
2022

Transportat on Assoc ate
Consu tant

$16.00

 Park ng rece pt for 12/10 FRB Tra n ng

Total $1,232.99

Date C ent Project Category Ro es Amount
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$165.6812/06/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person Aden Hassan

Hotel (room and tax) for November 29 30 site visit.
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$292.8012/06/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

RT Airfare from DCA CLE Hopkins for site visit
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$17.2912/06/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from Hotel to Cleveland Hopkins on
11/30/2021
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$25.1812/06/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

Uber from CLE Hopkins to Hotel on 11/29/2021
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$73.9312/06/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person Aden Hassan

LYFT from DCA to Home. My flight was extremely
delayed and upon arrival there were very few Lyfts or
Ubers available and a surge surcharge was applied
to this fare. There were also no taxis available. As a
result of this surge charge, I will not bill the city for
my Uber to the airport on November 29.
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$198.5812/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Lodging

Person CJI - Cole Christine

one night at the Marriott Key Center
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$40.6312/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

Uber for Cole and Aden from Marriott to Airport in
CLE
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$76.0012/01/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

Parking at BOS 11/29 through 11/30
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$316.9012/29/2021

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Category Transportation

Person CJI - Cole Christine

flight on AA for travel from Boston to Cleveland
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