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T A G       
The Aden Group, LLC. 

8022 Fairfax Road   
Alexandria, VA 22308 
(571) 274-7821
www.theadengroup.com

By email 

September 14, 2022 (Revised October 4, 2022) 

Michelle Heyer 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suite 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 

Tim Mygatt 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 

Mark Griffin  
Ahmed Abonamah 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 

RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team —August 2022 Invoice 

I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 

The Team’s invoice for services rendered in August 2022 was $92,479.58. The bill accounts for 
484.1 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from August 1, 2022 through 
August 31, 2022.  Of this time 78.50 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City 
of Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of over 19 percent of its time for August 2022 as pro bono 
time saved  $19,625.00. 
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Team members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total budget for year seven of $1,104,670.40, which the monitoring team 
invoicing is well within. 
 
Activities, work, and tasks conducted during August 2022 included but were not limited to:   
 
• Continued, ongoing discussion, and technical assistance for upcoming and ongoing  
training addressing:  
  
• Force Review Board;  
  
• Crisis intervention;  
  
• Bias-Free policing; and  
  
• Supervision.  
  
• Ongoing technical assistance, review, redlining, and editing policies, processes,  
  
procedures, manuals, and reports, and/or structures relating to:  
  
• Supervisory response to use of force incidents;  
  
• Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command;  
  
• Review and analysis of use of force incidents by Force Review Board (“FRB”);  
  
• Investigation of internal misconduct by Internal Affairs (“IA”);  
  
• Chain of command misconduct review process;  
  
• Discipline process and  
  
• Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”).  
  
• Officer Intervention Program (OIP)  
  
• Continued, ongoing review, discussion, and provision of technical assistance regarding  
implementation of plans addressing Consent Decree requirements related to:  
  
• Crisis intervention;  
  
• Community and Problem-Oriented Policing (“CPOP”);  
  
• District Policing Committees (“DPC”s);  
  
• Staffing;  
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• Recruitment and hiring; and  
  
• Ongoing review of CPD officer discipline system.  
  
• Ongoing discussions and coordination with individuals fulfilling Data Analysis and  
Coordinator role within CPD and monthly Administrative “COMPSTAT” meeting  
regarding status of outstanding administrative and internal investigations and  
functions;  
  
• Coordination with and technical assistance to City and CPD officials on outcome  
measurements;  
  
• Continued, ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”),  
including regular status calls with stakeholders and real-time review of civilian  
complaint investigations;  
  
• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and  
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and  
development; provision of ongoing internal training; assistance in implementing PRB  
Manual, and regular, ongoing attendance of PRB meetings; and  
  
• Communication with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, MHRAC, police officer  
organizations, and community organizations.   
  
• Actively assessing Use of Force cases as part of the assessment launched in  
May 2022.  
  
• Ongoing project management and coordination for deliverables (internal and with the City and 
DOJ)  
  
• August 2022 in-person Monitoring Team Site Visit and Global Four meeting with the Court as 
well as meetings with City officials. 
  
• Site visit to meet with stakeholders and to hold meetings with the Mayor’s cabinet members to 
discuss implementation matters and build a working relationship as the consent decree moves 
into the next stages.   
  
• Bi-weekly meetings with City Law, DOJ and the Monitoring Team to discuss Section 115 
implementation progress, hiring of key positions and sensitive issues handled by and through 
City Law.   
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II. INVOICE SUMMARY 
 

 August 2022 

Billable Hours $83,235.00 

Overhead/Expenses $9,244.58 

TOTAL $92,479.58 

 
Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 
 
 

 Total 
Hours 

Billed 
Hours 

Pro 
Bono 

Hours 
Total Billed Expenses 

Hassan Aden 69.7 57.9 11.8 $14,475.00 $1,163.94 

Modupe Akinola 13 8 5 $2,000.00 $0.00 

Jennifer Albright 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Matthew Barge 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Shunta Boston 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Christine Cole 25 23.7 1.3 $5,925.00 $788.90 

Ronnie Dunn 38 28 10 $7,000.00 $0.00 

Randy Dupont 5.7 4.5 1.2 $1,125.00 
 

$0.00 

Lisa Fink 50.8 39.2 11.6 $9,800.00 $1,505.41 

Ayesha Hardaway 24.9 17.50 7.4 $4,375.00 $5.00 

Tammy Hooper 23 20 3 $5,000.00 $1,283.66 

Brian Maxey 0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 
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Megan McDonough 39 31.8 7.2 $7,950.00 $986.12 

Rick Myers 17 13.3 3.7 $3,325.00 $721.04 

Charles Ramsey  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Richard Rosenthal 52.2 
 

42.9 9.3 $10,725.00 $1,855.89 

Victor Ruiz 1.5 1.5 0 $375.00 $0.00 

Scott Sargent  11 9 2 $2,250.00 $0.00 

Django Sibley 2.2 2.2 0 $550.00 $0.00 

Charles See  20.6 15.6 5 $3,900.00 $0.00 

Sean Smoot  4 4 0 $1,000.00 $0.00 

Tim Tramble  0 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 

Melissa Bretz* 86.5 86.5 0.00 $3,460.00 $934.62 

TOTAL 484.1 405.6 78.5 $83,235.00 $9,244.58 

 
* Ms. Bretz, the Monitoring Team Coordinator, bills at a rate of $40/hour on the Cleveland 
project.  

 
III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
 
The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations. 
 
The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will do 
so on the standard, federal scale, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest quarter-day.  (Thus, 
for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of the day would be 
compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived their per diem charges 
or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to Cleveland.  This 
constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 
 
Finally, some Team member invoices, or bills contain reference to meals or other costs for which 
the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have been 
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redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that contains billed 
charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be clear. 
 
IV. CONCLUSION 
 
We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 
 
Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 
 
       Sincerely, 

                                                                                     
cc: Michelle Heyer 



Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 08/01/2022 – 08/31/2022

Total 484.10 Hours
405.60 Uninvoiced billable hours

Clients All clients

1
Project

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Tasks All tasks

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Aden Hassan 69.70

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.00

 Review of City's response to the Monitor's Memo regarding an arbitrator's decision. Review of the latest IA Case
Status Report spreadsheets for 202, 2021, 2022. Site visit to Cleveland. Preparation meeting with MT members.
Email and correspondence.

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 8.00

 Site visit in CLE: Meeting with MT. Meeting at DOJ. Calls with community members. Meeting with Judge Oliver re
various CD related matters. Global Four meeting at the Federal Courthouse. Meeting with MT to assign follow ups,
assignments and debrief from the meetings attended. Email and correspondence.

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 1.80

 Email and correspondence. Review of recent DNs. Box assignment review.

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.00

 Document review re: UF case review. Box document review. Review of discipline charge letters and recent DNs.
Logistics for follow up meetings from site visit. Review of the rolling Use of Force Assessment findings and call
with the outcome assessment team. Reviewed the FTO Program Assessment and Recommendations memo.
Email and correspondence.

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.80

 Call with DOJ re: City's proposal for the Implementation Team. Call with Tim Mygatt (DOJ/CRT). Email and
correspondence.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.30

 MT weekly logistics meeting. Email and correspondence.

Total 484.10
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08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.30

 Follow ups from MT logistics call re: upcoming meetings, Status Conference etc.. MT/City/DOJ bi-weekly call. Call
with M. Bretz re project management and deliverable timelines. Review and approval of documents in BOX. Email
and correspondence.

08/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.00

 Reviewed Training Modules and other tasks/reviews in Box submitted by CDP. Review of recent DNs and
discipline letters. Review of Box documents uploaded by City Law re: a case audit being conducted by the MT.
Email and correspondence. Project management.

08/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

 Continued review of documents in BOX. Review of draft 11th Semiannual Report. Email and correspondence.

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 5.00

 Completed initial review of the latest draft of the 11th Semi-annual report. The draft report will be distributed to the
parties shortly-established the logistics to do so for the MT. Completed the review of the UF assessment
compliance memorandum for first quarter 2022. Email and correspondence.

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.30

 Weekly MT Logistics call. Call with L. Fink and M. Bretz re deadlines, assignments and status of various
deliverables. Review of DPS and Chief’s cases spreadsheets. Email and correspondence.

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.30

 Email and correspondence. Review of several DNS. Internal coordination for several documents, including the 11th
Semiannual Report.

08/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.80

 Review of various Box assignments. Project management and logistics for upcoming meetings. Review of
assignments and deadlines. Email and correspondence.

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.00

 Call with M. Bretz re: logistics and agendas for upcoming meetings, assignments and follow ups to internal MT
requests. Box document review/edits/comments and approvals. Email and correspondence.

08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

 Review of Box documents, including the latest ABLE Facilitator guide and the latest draft of the 11th Semi-annual
Report. Project management and email and correspondence.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 2.00

 Review of Box documents, including the latest ABLE Facilitator guide and the latest draft of the 11th Semi-annual
Report. Project management and email and correspondence.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 3.50

 Weekly MT Logistics call and associated follow ups. Continued work on draft semiannual report. Review of Box
documents. Logistics for next site visit and court attendance in September. Review of recent DNs and Discipline
letters. Email and correspondence.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 4.50

 MT leadership call to discuss the compliance status of the CDs Training area, and to finalize edits to the 11th
Semiannual Report and distribution timelines. Weekly update call with DOJ. Follow up call with MT re: CD related
matters and priorities leading up to the September Status Conference with the Court. Bi-weekly call with the
City/CDP/DOJ and the MT. Email and correspondence and final approvals to distribute deliverables back to the
parties. Call with CLE Law Director M. Griffin.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.80

 Call with C. Cole re Outcome assessments, budget preparation for 2023 and other CD related matters. Email and
correspondence.

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

 Email and correspondence. Call with M. Bretz re: deliverables and logistics for the upcoming site visit. Review of
discipline charge letters. Call with Lisa to review final edits and comments before sending the 11th Semiannual
report to the parties.

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.30

 Email and correspondence. Review of discipline letters and arbitration decisions. Logistics and several follow up
calls. Calls with MT members re deliverables.

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

 Weekly MT logistics meeting and follow up to assigned tasks and deliverables. Email and correspondence. Call
with Judge Oliver re: CD related matters.

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 Email and correspondence re: CD related matters. Weekly update call with the DOJ. Review of recent DNs and
updates from the City.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 2.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Weekly call with City Law and DOJ re: various matters pertaining to the CD. Project management. Box document
review and approvals. Email and correspondence.

Charles See 20.60

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 DOJ/MT meeting/MT meeting/Global 4 Court meeting/MT debrief meeting

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

5.00

 DOJ/MT meeting/MT meeting/Global 4 Court meeting/MT debrief meeting

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Monitored CDP Scenario Training

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Engagement Team meeting

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 2nd District Community Relations Meeting

08/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Monitored Citizens' Acadamy Training

08/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Attended the Citizens' Academy graduation of 
CDP.

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Community Engagement call. Phone call re: The work of Community Policing Committees.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Meeting: MT/DOJ/City/CDP

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Community Safety meeting: City/CDP

Christine Cole 25.00

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

 work on G4 prep

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 8.00

 internal meetings, DOJ meetings, Global 4 Court attendance

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 Assessment Team meeting. Disc handcuffing and UOF plans and reviewed schedule

08/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Senior Advisor 0.20

 reviewing memo to file

08/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.30

 reviewing documents in Box. Master Training Plan, EAU Manual, OIP policy

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.60

 11th annual report

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.00

 weekly MT logistics team call, follow up

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 review of monthly recruitment/retention stats from DNs, review of news

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.20

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Assessment Team call

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.50

 emails and news

08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 1.50

 review of 11th report, review of POLIS training

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Senior Advisor 1.90

 Team call, work on 11th report, reviewing assessment details. Training Review Cmte Call

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Senior Advisor 3.00

 11 Semi Annual Report, DOJ/MT meeting, Meeting with all parties

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Senior Advisor 1.50

 assessment team meeting, work on 11th report comments with LF

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Senior Advisor 0.30

 Meeting on Search and Seizure report with CDP and DOJ

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

 MT weekly call

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Senior Advisor 0.50

 weekly meeting with DOJ

Django Sibley 2.20

08/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Reviewed/analyzed disciplinary determinations made in connection with CDP2019-0030 and DBI2020-0041.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Review disciplinary determinations made in cases 2021-0057 and 2021-0036.

Hardaway Ayesha 24.90

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Draft and revise sections to the 11th semi-annual report.

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

7.50

 Prepare for and participate in Global Four meeting with Judge Oliver.

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Participate in meeting regarding OPS with City Law, OPS Admin, and DOJ.

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Participate in CET meeting.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Participate in MT meeting.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Participate in meeting with CDP Training Section.

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Participate in meeting with DOJ; discuss preparations for bi-weekly meeting with H. Aden.

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Prepare for and participate in biweekly meeting with City Law, CDP, and DOJ.

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Participate in MT Logistics call.

08/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Revise section of semi-annual report.

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Prepare for and participate in meeting with OPS Administrator and PRB Chair.

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Revise section of semi-annual report.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Participate in MT meeting.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Participate in meeting with CDP Training Section and DOJ.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Participate in internal MT meetings regarding semi-annual draft.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Participate in bi-weekly meeting with City Law, CDP, and DOJ.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Participate in meeting with DOJ.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CPOP Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review and analyze draft 2023 Training Plan.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.70

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Review and analyze draft 2023 Training Plan.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Review and analyze draft 2023 Training Plan.

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

OPS/PRB (comp) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Participate in MT logistics call.

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Discussion with Judge Oliver.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Participate in meeting with City Law and DOJ.

Lisa Fink 50.80

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Semiannual Report drafting/editing - community engagement and CPOP section.

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Semiannual report editing - outcome measures & CIT sections, executive summary.

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

7.00

 MT administration meeting, Global 4 prep, meeting with DOJ, touching base on several sections of semiannual
report with MT members; Global 4 session at courthouse.

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Emails; reviewing arbitration filing by City; semiannual report (accountability section); document access for lawsuit
related request.

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Assigning several training documents, providing IA related documents to DOJ, document tracking, email follow-
ups.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Semiannual report editing - accountability section and other edits throughout; emails.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.10

 MT Logistics Meeting; semiannual report edits; weekly deadline email to City; other emails.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Prep for MT logistics meeting; training review status and follow-up with Rick.

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.90

 Review Session III training materials; assess DOJ outstanding items; DOJ/MT Meeting; assigning supervisor
training for review and tracking documents; Call with City and CDP re Implementation Team draft plan.

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Reviewed UOF Q1 2022 assessment report

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Review/edits to 11th semiannual report

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

4.40

 Checking in on status of several documents and sending follow-ups to MT members and a few to DOJ and CDP;
MT logistics pre-meeting and logistics meeting; follow-ups on deliverables; semiannual report drafting and editing;
Weekly deadline tracking and email to CDP/City.

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.10

 Adding comments to Active Threat Response module, response to CDP re: Session III, check-in with DOJ about
document status, semiannual report edits, semiannual report follow-up with Ayesha.

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Review FIT assessment methodology and DOJ's comments.

08/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.80

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Active Threat Response training comments and sent to DOJ, semiannual report drafting and edits.

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 FIT assessment methodology review

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Emails, session III IST status updates, skimmed crowd management policies and determining policy status for
assignment purposes.

08/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.10

 Updating Monitoring Team's website with filed documents; semiannual report edits and follow-ups.

08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Semiannual report edits

08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Semiannual report edits

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

3.40

 Emails re semiannual report and updating MT website; Prep for MT logistics meeting; MT logistics, semiannual
report follow-ups, training call follow-ups and skimming active threat comments from DOJ; Sent active threat
training, chatted with DOJ re comments; planning travel; semiannual report editing; Follow-up call with Richard
about semiannual report and OIS review.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Finalizing FIT methodology draft, chat with Richard re methodology, emailed to CDP.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.50

 Edits to semiannual report; multiple calls with MT members to resolve open items on semiannual report; DOJ/MT
meeting; Reviewing CDP's document status trackers; City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting; additional follow-ups re
semiannual report; Semiannual report edits and plan for final review; review OIS email/timelines; Uploading MT
invoices to website.

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 2023 Training Plan comments

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

3.40

 Edits to semiannual report and sent to the parties; document tracking and follow-ups on MT review assignments.

08/27/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Updates to MT website

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 MT document review status check; Reviewing and adding comments to Citizen Recording of Police Activity GPO.

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.10

 MT Logistics Call; Compiling weekly email to City/CDP re: Monitoring Plan deliverables.

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Prep for DOJ meeting, DOJ/MT meeting, follow-ups on pending document reviews, assigned updated S&S report
review, and sent response to CDP on FTO recommendations memo; receipt of docs from CDP and routed to
applicable MT members.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Reviewing Search & Seizure Report versions and making plan of action for review and follow-up meeting with MT
members.

McDonough Megan 39.00

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 CoP Discipline Assessment Check In (IA prelim Assessment)

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Assessment emails

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

5.00

 Team meetings, meeting with DOJ, Global 4

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

Obtaining Cleveland City ID credentials

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

Assessment meeting

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

CoP Discipline check in

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

Weekly logistics call

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.90

Weekly DOJ call, assessment correspondence

08/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

4.40

Draft memo summarizing MT rolling use of force assessment

08/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

2.30

Draft memo summarizing MT rolling use of force assessment

08/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

2.30

Handcuffing Data Review

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.30

Handcuffing assessment; semi-annual report

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.10

Work on Assessment Memo Draft

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Review draft methodology for MT search and seizure assessment

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Handcuffing assessment; weekly logistics meeting

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Assign new cases

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review PWT data collection tool

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

2.40

 Assessment and team email correspondence

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.60

 CoP Discipline analysis

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Review Methodology (Stop and Search Assessment)

08/20/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review draft methodology for MT search and seizure assessment

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Review draft methodology for MT search and seizure assessment

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.60

 logistics meeting; semiannual report

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10

Page 14 of 28



08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Review BWC questions

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review BWC questions

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 Methodology (Stop and Search Assessment)

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

4.30

 MT/DOJ Call and MT/City/DOJ Call; 11th semiannual review

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Weekly assessment call

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Search & Seizure Report Discussion; assessment correspondence

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Associate Consultant
Professional Fees

Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Juvenile handcuffing data analysis

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.90

 COP analysis spreadsheet (IA (prelim) Assessment)

Melissa Bretz 86.50

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Work on Travel Agenda. Calls coordinating internal meetings once onsite. Emails to parties regarding agendas,
travel information, meeting information, and other information

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

8.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 DOJ/MT Meeting, two MT Administrative Meeting, and Global Four Court Date. Emails to parties regarding
agendas, travel information, meeting information, documents, reservations, cancellations, trainings, and other
information.

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Emails to parties regarding travel information, documents, trainings, and other information.

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

6.50

 Implementation Team Process Meeting. Work on tracking documents, task lists, and BOX documents. Emails to
parties regarding scheduling, meeting information, trainings, cancellations, documents, status updates, BOX
access, scheduling, and other information.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

7.00

 MT Logistics Meetings and Bi-Weekly Training Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheets, task lists, and BOX documents.
Emails to parties regarding documents, status updates, meeting information, scheduling, agendas, applications,
meeting information, and other information.

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on tracking sheets, task lists, and BOX documents. Emails
to parties regarding agendas, meeting information, travel information, and other information.

08/11/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Work on Tracking Sheet, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding status updates, scheduling,
documents, deadlines, and other information.

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

6.50

 MT Logistics Meetings. Work on Tracking Sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding
scheduling, meeting information, travel information, documents, deadlines, status updates, and other information.

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.00

 DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking Sheets and BOX documents. Emails to parties regarding status updates,
meeting information, agendas, and other information.

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Truleo Demonstration Call. Work on Tracking Sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding
travel information, meeting information, scheduling, and other information.

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

4.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Bi-Weekly Community Engagement Team Meeting. Emails to parties regarding travel information, documents,
deadlines, scheduling, meeting information, and other information.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

6.00

 MT Logistics Meetings and Bi-Weekly Training Call. Work on Tracking Sheets, Task Lists, and BOX documents.
Emails to parties regarding agendas, travel information, scheduling, documents, deadlines, and other information.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting and City/CDP/DOJ/MT Meeting. Work on Tracking sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists.
Emails to parties regarding status updates, agendas, documents, deadlines, and other information.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

5.50

 Work on Tracking Sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Calls to Cleveland Hotels to negotiate lower rates for
site visit. Emails to parties regarding documents, deadlines, site visit, travel information, contact information,
meeting information, scheduling, letters of engagement, and other information.

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Calls to hotels to negotiate lower rates for Cleveland site visit. Emails to parties regarding hotel rates/travel
information, scheduling, reports from CDP, and other information.

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

8.50

 MT Logistics Meetings. Work on Tracking Sheets, BOX documents, and Task Lists. Emails to parties regarding
deadlines, documents, status updates, reports from CDP, scheduling, meeting information, travel information,
contact information, and other information.

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.50

 DOJ/MT Meeting. Emails to parties regarding reports from CDP, documents, deadlines, scheduling, agendas, and
other information.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Administrative Costs Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Bi-Weekly Meeting with City Law. Emails to parties regarding agendas, meeting information, travel information,
and other information.

Modupe Akinola 13.00

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

8.00

 Reviewing consolidated Outcome Measures, giving feedback to parties.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

5.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Reviewing consolidated Outcome Measures, giving feedback to parties.

Randolph Dupont 5.70

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Discussion on CPD Training Progress with Monitoring Team Member C. See

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Weekly Monitoring Team Meeting to assess progress and review deadlines

08/10/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Discussion with parties to the Consent Decree.

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.50

 QI Subcommittee Meeting with preparation time

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Weekly Monitoring Team Meeting to assess progress and review deadlines

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Review of local media article on diversion alternatives, correspondence with Consent Decree parties regarding
article

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.30

 CPD, DOJ, Monitoring Team CIT workgroup meeting, review of updated CIT Policy

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Correspondence with parties and review of CPD Critical Incidents

Richard Rosenthal 52.20

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

8.00

 On-Site visit: Monitoring Team internal meetings; meeting with DOJ; Court Hearing,

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.80

 Correspondence review; semi-annual report drafting; review of arbitration awards; IA Case Spreadsheet review;
OPS/DOJ meeting; Correspondence review.

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Correspondence re: CPD response to record request; Review of pending FIT cases; Case documentation.

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Discipline assessment tool instrument download and documentation.

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Semi-annual report edits; Review of GM applications; download of charge letters.

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

 MT/DOJ meeting; follow up call.

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Correspondence review (including edits to semi-annual report) and review and download of 12 disciplinary letters;
weekly upload to BOX.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Monitoring Team Logistics Meeting.

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.30

 Download of completed assessment tools and documentation.

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Monitoring Team/DOJ meeting; Monitoring Team/DOJ/City/CDP implementation plan meeting.

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Weekly logistics call.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.20

 Correspondence review (including review and documentation of discipline letters); rRview of draft semi-annual
report & follow up correspondence; Correspondence to OPS.

08/16/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.70

 Assessment – Review of instruments; correspondence; call with monitoring team member;
documentation/deconfliction.

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Correspondence re: Gannon OIS review; Review of DOJ edits to FIT methodology.

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

4.50

 Assessment correspondence and follow-up; Continued review of instruments and documentation.

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.80

 Monitoring Team meeting; OPS bi-weekly meeting; Correspondence review.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.30

 Monitoring Team weekly logistics call; follow up phone call.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.30

 Assessment – draft report updates per additional assessor evaluations.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Phone call re: FIT assessment methodology.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Review of City response to document request.

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Document review and follow up correspondence.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Monitoring Team/DOJ weekly meeting; DOJ/Monitoring Team/City/ CDP meeting.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Drafting of assessment report.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FIT Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Correspondence and review re: FIT assessment.

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.10

 Review of FRB Kilnapp checklists.

08/25/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Work on semi-annual report; Correspondence review; review of OPS Administrator applications.

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.40

 Drafting of assessment report.

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.70

 Correspondence review; review and documentation of arbitration decision.

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Monitoring Team Logistics Call.

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Preparation of assessment timeline fields; correspondence.

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Monitoring Team/DOJ meeting; Correspondence review, including DPS & COP spreadsheets; review of OPS
manual edits.

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Drafting of assessment report.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Monitoring Team/DOJ/City/CPD meeting.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

FRB Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Correspondence and firearms policy research.

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Timeliness data cleaning.

Rick Myers 17.00

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

6.00

 Monitor meeting in CLE, meeting with DOJ, then meeting with federal judge

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Monitor team meeting in CLE, meeting with DOJ, then meeting with federal judge

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

 observe training at range

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.40

 observe training at range

08/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.20

 Submit semi annual report materials and review training outline

08/17/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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 Submit semi annual report materials and review training outline

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.40

 Bi weekly training meeting and Box Assignments, feedback to Lisa and Christine

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.40

 Bi weekly training meeting and Box assignments

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.30

 work on about 10 Box assignments

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 work on and complete about 10 Box Assignments

08/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.60

 Review use of force 2022-0076

08/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Use of Force Assessement Associate
Consultant

1.60

 Review 2022-0076

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.40

 weekly DOJ meting

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.10

 weekly DOJ meeting

Ronnie Dunn 38.00

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Global 6 Meeting

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Attempted to observe 5th District Citizen Police Academy at Collinwood Rec Center. Not held.

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Weekly Assessment Mtg

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

0.80

 Methodology memo draft

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Implementation Team call

08/08/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 MT Logistics mtg

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MT/DOJ Mtg

08/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

3.00

 Review of Census dataset - Stop & Search Assesment

08/14/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Review Census dataset

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 MT Logistics mtg

08/18/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.10

 Truleo meeting

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/21/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Catching up on email communications.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 MT Logistics mtg

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.90

 DOJ/MT Mtg

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.70

 MT/DOJ/CDP Meeting

08/23/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Juvenile Female Handcuffing BWC memo

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Juvenile Female Handcuffing BWC Review memo

08/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

5.00

 Juvenile Female Handcuffing memo

08/28/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Drafting Juvenile Handcuffing memo

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 MT weekly logistics meeting

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.50

 Drafting Juvenile Female Handcuffing memo

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Juvenile Female Handcuffing memo

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.60

 MT/DOJ mtg

08/30/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

3.50

 Reviewing CDP Stop & Search Report and S&S methodlogy memo

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Stop and Search Assessment Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Preparing for S&S Assessment call with CDP Data Team & reviewing S&S Report, working on assessment
methodology

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CIT (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

1.50

 Juvenile Female Handcuffing memo

Scott Sargent 11.00

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Correspondence/policy review

08/13/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Finish comments on recording officers policy. Forward doc/comments to Lisa

08/15/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

4.00

 Review, comments on Integrated Active Threat Response training and agenda doc.

08/24/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Review revisions to CControl policies

08/29/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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 Correspondence/call with Lisa Fink

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

2.00

 Box files review. ABLE, OC, Active Shooter, Arrest and Control. Review final docs

Smoot Sean 4.00

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 2.20

 Review city legal response to monitors notice and review sources cited

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Partner 1.80

 Review arbitration awards rec’d 8/3/22

Tammy Hooper 23.00

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

8.00

 On-site team meetings with DOJ, Judge and City.

08/04/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

4.00

 COP Discipline Review

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

IA (prelim) Assessment Associate
Consultant

4.00

 COP Discipline Review

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 OIP Policy Review

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 RAID Lesson Plan Review

08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

2.00

 EAU Manual Review

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Total 484.10
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08/12/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Leader Dev Course Material Review

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 RAID Training Lesson Plan/Video Review

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Pro Bono Hours Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Quarterly UF Review Prep

Victor Ruiz 1.50

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

0.50

 Community engagement team meeting

08/19/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

CLE MT Member Rate Associate
Consultant

1.00

 Local team meeting

Total 484.10

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours
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Expense report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 08/01/2022 – 08/31/2022

Total $9,244.58

1 Client City of Cleveland

1 Project Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Categories All categories

Team Everyone

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Aden Hassan $1,163.94

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $54.00

 Parking for July 7, site visit.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $259.21

 Airfare for July 7 site visit.

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $26.72

 Uber from Airport to Hotel

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Senior Advisor $160.98

 Hotel for site visit

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Senior Advisor $321.96

 Lodging for August 1-3 site visit

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $54.00

 Parking at DCA for August 1-3 site visit

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $250.20

 RT Airfare for Aug 1-3 site visit

Total $9,244.58
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08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $27.91

 Uber to Airport from Hotel

08/22/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $8.96

 Uber to Courthouse

Christine Cole $788.90

08/05/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $331.94

 flight from BOS to CLE

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Senior Advisor $321.96

 Marriott 9

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $40.00

 Taxi from CLE to hotel

08/26/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Senior Advisor $95.00

 parking at Logan

Hardaway Ayesha $5.00

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$5.00

 Parking in Downtown Cleveland for OPS Meeting

Lisa Fink $1,505.41

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$1,096.26

 Roundtrip airfare from Eugene, OR to Cleveland, OH for August 1-3, 2022 site visit.

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$321.96

 Two night stay at Metropolitan at the 9 for site visit - Aug 1-3, 2022.

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $9,244.58
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08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$35.63

 Transportation from CLE Airport to Metropolitan at the 9 on August 1, 2022.

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$51.56

 Transportation from Metropolitan at the 9 to CLE Airport on August 3, 2022.

McDonough Megan $986.12

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$38.97

 Uber airport to hotel

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$35.97

 Uber CDP to airport

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$95.06

 Uber Home to LGA

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$137.94

 Uber LGA to Home

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$160.98

 Marriott - Autograph, one night

08/09/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$517.20

 Airfare LGA to CLE

Melissa Bretz $934.62

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$174.72

 Travel from Indian Head, Maryland to Cleveland, Ohio for Site Visit (August 1-3, 2022) [312.0 miles]

08/01/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$51.75

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $9,244.58
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 Per Diem for Cleveland, Ohio in August 2022 (travel day)

08/02/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$69.00

 Per Diem for Cleveland, Ohio in August 2022

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$174.72

 Travel from Cleveland, Ohio to Indian Head, Maryland - Site Visit (August 1-3, 2022) [312.0 miles]

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$412.68

 This receipt includes the room rate ($137.00/night), 8% sales tax ($10.96/night), 3% city tax ($4.11/night), 6.5%
occupancy tax ($8.91/night), and overnight valet ($42.00/night) plus 8% sales tax for valet ($3.36/night)

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$51.75

 Per Diem for Cleveland, Ohio in August 2022 (travel day)

Richard Rosenthal $1,855.89

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$1,314.25

 Airfare YVR-CLE; August 1 & 3, 2022 trip

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$40.41

 Airport Parking, August 1-3, 2022

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$39.00

 Taxi from CLE to hotel - 8/1/22

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$321.96

 Hotel, August 1-3, 2022

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$25.21

 Uber to CLE, August 3, 2022

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $9,244.58
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08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Meals Associate
Consultant

$66.00

 1 day per diem; August 2, 2022

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$24.53

 43.8 miles to YVR airport @ 57.5 cents per mile. August 1, 2022 [43.8 miles]

08/31/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Mileage Associate
Consultant

$24.53

 43.8 miles from YVR airport @ 57.5 cents per mile. August 3, 2022 [43.8 miles]

Rick Myers $721.04

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$348.60

 one way airfare to CLE from DEN

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$5.25

 bus fare to airport

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$45.23

 Uber from airport to hotel

08/07/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$321.96

 2 nights lodging

Tammy Hooper $1,283.66

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$867.70

 Airfare

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Transportation Associate
Consultant

$48.00

 Taxi to Hotel

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Other Associate
Consultant

$46.00

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Total $9,244.58
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 Airport Parking

08/03/2022 City of
Cleveland

Cleveland December 2021 - November
2022

Lodging Associate
Consultant

$321.96

 Hotel

Total $9,244.58

Date Client Project Category Roles Amount

Page 6 of 168



$54.0008/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Parking for July 7, site visit.
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$259.2108/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Airfare for July 7 site visit.
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$26.7208/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Uber from Airport to Hotel
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$160.9808/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Aden Hassan

Hotel for site visit
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$321.9608/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Aden Hassan

Lodging for August 1-3 site visit
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$54.0008/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Parking at DCA for August 1-3 site visit
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$250.2008/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

RT Airfare for Aug 1-3 site visit
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$27.9108/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Uber to Airport from Hotel
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$8.9608/22/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Uber to Courthouse
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$331.9408/05/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

flight from BOS to CLE
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$321.9608/26/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Christine Cole

Marriott 9

Page 46 of 168



Page 47 of 168



$40.0008/26/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

Taxi from CLE to hotel

Page 48 of 168



Page 49 of 168



Page 50 of 168



$95.0008/26/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

parking at Logan
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$5.0008/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Hardaway Ayesha

Parking in Downtown Cleveland for OPS Meeting
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$1,096.2608/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Roundtrip airfare from Eugene, OR to Cleveland,
OH for August 1-3, 2022 site visit.
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$321.9608/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Lisa Fink

Two night stay at Metropolitan at the 9 for site
visit - Aug 1-3, 2022.
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$35.6308/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Transportation from CLE Airport to Metropolitan
at the 9 on August 1, 2022.

Page 64 of 168



Page 65 of 168



Page 66 of 168



Page 67 of 168



$51.5608/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Lisa Fink

Transportation from Metropolitan at the 9 to CLE
Airport on August 3, 2022.
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$38.9708/09/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Uber airport to hotel
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$35.9708/09/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Uber CDP to airport
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$95.0608/09/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Uber Home to LGA
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$137.9408/09/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Uber LGA to Home
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$160.9808/09/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person McDonough Megan

Marriott - Autograph, one night
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$517.2008/09/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Airfare LGA to CLE
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$174.7208/01/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Melissa Bretz

Travel from Indian Head, Maryland to Cleveland,
Ohio for Site Visit (August 1-3, 2022) [312.0 miles]
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$51.7508/01/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Melissa Bretz

Per Diem for Cleveland, Ohio in August 2022
(travel day)

$69.0008/02/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Melissa Bretz

Per Diem for Cleveland, Ohio in August 2022

$174.7208/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Melissa Bretz

Travel from Cleveland, Ohio to Indian Head,
Maryland - Site Visit (August 1-3, 2022) [312.0
miles]
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$412.6808/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Melissa Bretz

This receipt includes the room rate
($137.00/night), 8% sales tax ($10.96/night), 3%
city tax ($4.11/night), 6.5% occupancy tax
($8.91/night), and overnight valet ($42.00/night)
plus 8% sales tax for valet ($3.36/night)
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$51.7508/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Melissa Bretz

Per Diem for Cleveland, Ohio in August 2022
(travel day)

$1,314.2508/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Airfare YVR-CLE; August 1 & 3, 2022 trip
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$40.4108/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Airport Parking, August 1-3, 2022
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$39.0008/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Taxi from CLE to hotel - 8/1/22
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$321.9608/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Richard Rosenthal

Hotel, August 1-3, 2022
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$25.2108/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Richard Rosenthal

Uber to CLE, August 3, 2022
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$66.0008/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Meals
Person Richard Rosenthal

1 day per diem; August 2, 2022

$24.5308/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Richard Rosenthal

43.8 miles to YVR airport @ 57.5 cents per mile.
August 1, 2022 [43.8 miles]
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$24.5308/31/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Mileage
Person Richard Rosenthal

43.8 miles from YVR airport @ 57.5 cents per
mile. August 3, 2022 [43.8 miles]
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$348.6008/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Rick Myers

one way airfare to CLE from DEN
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$5.2508/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Rick Myers

bus fare to airport
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$45.2308/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Rick Myers

Uber from airport to hotel
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$321.9608/07/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Rick Myers

2 nights lodging
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$867.7008/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Tammy Hooper

Airfare
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$48.0008/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Transportation
Person Tammy Hooper

Taxi to Hotel
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$46.0008/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Other
Person Tammy Hooper

Airport Parking

$321.9608/03/2022

Client City of Cleveland

Project
Cleveland December 2021 -
November 2022

Category Lodging
Person Tammy Hooper

Hotel
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