
By email 

May 22, 2017 

Lynne Buck 
Michelle Heyer 
Heather Tonsing Volosin 
U.S. Attorney’s Office, Northern District of Ohio 
801 West Superior Avenue, Suit 400 
Cleveland, OH  44113 

Emily Gunston 
Rashida Ogletree 
U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20530 

Barbara A. Langhenry 
Gary Singletary 
Sharon Dumas 
City of Cleveland 
601 Lakeside Avenue, Suite 106 
Cleveland, OH  44114 

RE: Cleveland Monitoring Team — April 2017 Invoice 

I. INTRODUCTION

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the Cleveland Monitoring Team (the 
“Team”) invoice for services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 
Agreement in U.S. v. City of Cleveland. 

The Team’s invoice for services rendered in April 2017 totals $107,474.65. The bill accounts for      
674.52 hours of time worked on the Cleveland monitoring project from April 1, 2017 through 
April 30, 2017.  Of this time, 297.4 hours were pro bono, e.g. unbilled and donated to the City of 
Cleveland.  The Team’s billing of more than 44 percent of its time for April 2017 as pro bono 
time saved the City $74,350.00.   



From the Team’s appointment on October 1, 2015 through April 30, 2017, over 43 percent of the 
Monitoring Team’s time has been donated as pro bono, saving the City $1,446,145.00. Team 
members do not bill for travel time, which provides additional savings. All activity operates 
within the confines of the total, five-year budget cap of $4.95 million to which the City, 
Department of Justice, and Court agreed in October 2015.  

• With CPD, the Mental Health Advisory Committee (“MHAC”), and the ADAMHS
Board, finalizing development of the Division’s initial eight (8)-hour training on crisis
intervention to be provided to all CPD officers;

• Continued technical assistance to CPD and its Training Section on CPD’s upcoming,
in-class 16-hour training and related, advance roll-call training on the new, Court-
approved use of force policies, including in-person observation and real-time
feedback of training curricula;

• Conducting of Consent-Decree-required survey of detained individuals;
• Conducting of Consent-Decree-required focus groups of Cleveland community

members to supplemented the biennial, phone-based survey;
• Preparation and filing of motions and formal communications to the Court regarding

various substantive issues;
• Ongoing technical assistance to the Office of Professional Standards (“OPS”),

including but not limited to construction of a plan to eliminate backlog of incomplete
or uninvestigated cases, business practice review and development, and weekly status
calls with OPS, DOJ, and the City on civilian complaint issues;

• Ongoing technical assistance to Police Review Board (“PRB”) regarding review and
adjudication of civilian complaints, including business practice review and
development, assistance in implementing new PRB Manual, and regular, ongoing
attendance of PRB meetings; Ongoing development of new systems and processes for
provision of in-service training in CPD generally, including new metrics for ensuring
logged participation, post-training outcome metrics, and adequate scenario-based
training tools.

• Continued discussions with the City on body-worn camera policy and equipment and
resource plan, including related communications with Parties, CPD, and equipment
manufacturers regarding technical, logistical, legal, and administrative issues;

• Continued review, redlining, and drafting of new policies, processes, procedures, and
structures relating to:

o Supervisory response to force investigations;
o Investigation and review of force incidents by Division chain of command;
o Investigation and review of force incidents by a new Force Investigation Team

(“FIT”);
o Review and analysis of force incidents by a new Force Review Board

(“FRB”);
o Restructuring of Internal Affairs (“IA”) function as required by the Consent

Decree and drafting of processes and Manuals relating to IA.
• Final implementation of the Community Engagement Framework for the Community

and Problem-Oriented Policing Plan ("CPOP"), including development of online,
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written, and video educational materials; lead coordination and advance planning for 
March 2017 community forums, including meeting with City, CPC, CPD, DOJ, and 
community organization representatives; review and analysis of community input and 
feedback re: same;  

• Continued review, editing, and redlining of policies relating to CPD disciplinary
process;

• Continued monitoring of initial City and CPD planning for implementation of field-
based reporting and Computer-Aided Dispatch (“CAD”) Division-wide;

• Preparation of results of systemic analysis of the quality of Division Internal Affairs
investigations, involving review of statistically significant sample of IA cases from
relevant time period via qualitative assessment instrument;

• Continued coordination with City and CPD officials on conducting the Consent
Decree required outcome measurements for calendar year 2016, including recently
hired group 3 to fulfill some of the functions of the Consent Decree-required Data
Analysis Coordinator; and

• Ongoing formal and informal communications with Court, City, CPC, CPD, DOJ,
MHAC, police officer organizations, and community groups and organizations.

II. INVOICE SUMMARY

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

April 2017

Billable Hours $94,280.00

Overhead $13,194.65

TOTAL $107,474.65

Total 
Hours

Billed 
Hours

Pro Bono 
Hours Total Billed Expenses

Hassan Aden 80 61.5 18.5 15,375.00 $2,065.15

Modupe Akinola 5 0 5 - -

Matthew Barge 82.3 35 47.3 $8,750.00 $994.37 

Joe Brann 0 0 0 - -

Brian Center 5.9 2.8 3.1 $700.00 -

Christine Cole 20.5 13 7.5 $3,250.00 -
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III. INDIVIDUAL INVOICES & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

The remainder of this document provides the individual invoices of all Team members, as well as 
receipts for travel, transportation, and accommodations.  

The City and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for 
meals and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Cleveland for work on the project will 
do so on the standard, federal scale of $69 per day, with fractions of days rounded to the nearest 
quarter-day.  (Thus, for instance, flying to Cleveland at 4:00pm and staying through the end of 
the day would be compensated for the half day of $34.50.)  Some Team members have waived 
their per diem charges, or elected to receive them only for some but not all days while traveling 
to Cleveland.  This constitutes an additional, ongoing savings to the City of Cleveland. 

Finally, some Team member invoices or bills may contain reference to meals or other costs for 
which the Team is not seeking reimbursement from the City.  In some instances, those items have 
been redacted by the team members.  In others, the un-billed charges as part of a bill that 

Randy Dupont 15.6 7.8 7.8 $1,950.00 -

Kelli Evans - - - - -

Maggie Goodrich 7.5 6.5 1 $1,625.00 -

Ayesha Hardaway 31.9 23.4 8.5 $5,850.00 $31.00

Tim Longo 17.3 6.5 10.8 $1,625.00 $827.91 

Policing Project 
NYU Law 

149.9 40 109.9 
(+ 36.3 Extern )

$10,000.00 $3,549.59

Charles Ramsey 33 30.5 2.5 $7,625.00 $1,278.62

Richard Rosenthal 57.4 44.9 12.5 $11,225.00 $1,363.93

Victor Ruiz 16.5 11 5.5 $2,750.00 -

Scott Sargent 16 8.5 7.5 $2,125.00 $854.43

Ellen Scrivner 7 4.5 2.5 $1,125.00 -

Charles See 41.6 19.1 22.5 $4,775.00 -

Sean Smoot 48.5 38.5 10 $9,625.00 $2,229.65

Tim Tramble 38.62 23.62 15 $5,905.00 -

TOTAL 674.52 377.12 297.4 $94,280.00 $13,194.65
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contains billed charges are subtracted from the total.  In these instances, the arithmetic should be 
clear. 

IV. CONCLUSION 

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and City of Cleveland.  Upon 
receiving such approval, we will submit the invoice to Judge Solomon Oliver for his review and 
approval. 

Please do not hesitate to contact us for any reason whatsoever. 

       Sincerely, 

        
                                                                                    Matthew Barge 
cc: 
Michelle Heyer 
Monica Madej 
Kevin Preslan 
Heather Tonsing Volosin
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April 1 - 30, 2017

Hassan	Aden

To:
Matthew	Barge 
Meg	Olsen
PARC
Via	email

Description Hours Rate  Amount 

April 3: Call with DOJ.  IA Manual discussion on redlines/comments/edits and next 
steps.  Correspondence and calls with MT re: specific tasks relating to next draft.  
Correspondence with MT members who conducted the recent IA Qualitative 
Assessment and their review of the IA Manual to provide input based on their 
review.  Call with the monitor re: upcoming deliverables, workflow and logistics.  
Weekly update MT all-team call.

4 250  $      1,000.00 

April 4: Meetings in Cleveland.  CPC meeting at USAO (parties and stakeholders). 
Meeting with City/USAO/CRT/CDP and MT (bi-weekly update meeting).  Meeting 
with Judge White.  Logistics for April 5 precinct visits and ride alongs.

8 250  $   2,000.00 

April 5: Review of IA manual.  Correspondence re: OPS and latest issue with 
complainant letters. FIT Manual review and call with RR.  

5 250  $   1,250.00 

Billable Hours

For:
Cleveland	Monitoring



April 7: Call with DOJ re: OPS disposition letters and backlog solutions.  Finished 
review and edits (in response to DOJ edits) on FIT Manual.  Latest FIT Manual draft 
sent to RR and TL for preparation and distribution.  Call with MB about management 
process for MT projects and deliverables.

3 250  $      750.00 

April 8: Calendar updates and creation of chart outlining all deliverables and due 
dates for this monitoring period.  Coordination with MT (TL, RR, AH, MB) re: meeting 
with the elected prosecutor re: FIT Manual responsibilities and general points 
regarding the consent decree.

4 250  $      1,000.00 

April 10: Review of six training modules for the 2017 UF Training program. 
Correspondence with MT re: training modules. MT Weekly update call.

3.5 250  $      875.00 

April 12: Call with MB and RN re: management plan for projects and deliverables for 
the CLE monitoring team.  Creation of new form to manage weekly updates on 
projects and deliverables.

2.5 250  $      625.00 

April13: Call with RN re: MT management activities and methods to accomplish 
goals.  Calls with MB re: administrative support and other overall management 
priorities.

3 250  $      750.00 

April 17: Review of IA/CPRB/OPS Semi-Annual report section.  Detailed review of 
current budget in order to make recommendations to monitor. Review of the ACLU 
recommendations on the Disciplinary Guidance GPO.  Call with the monitor re: 2017 
UF Training Plan and other ongoing projects.  Correspondence with NA and MO re: 
qualitative "Fit and Finish" work on the 2017 UF Training Curriculum Package.

4.5 250  $   1,125.00 

April 19: Call with CC re: upcoming site visit, Discipline review and spreadsheet. 
Call with MB.  Correspondence with MT members.

1.5 250  $      375.00 

April 20: Worked on addressing DOJ redlines on FIT Manual and correspondence 
with RR re: FIT Manual.  Review of Semi-annual report draft language. 

2 250  $      500.00 

April 24: Call with the monitor re: upcoming semi-annual report and other upcoming 
deliverables.  Call with Ruby re: re: deadline spreadsheet and organization of weekly 
update and deliverables call.  Weekly MT Call with full team.

3.5 250  $      875.00 

April 25: Correspondence with MT members re: assignments for Semi-Annual 
report.  Call with City and CDP re: ongoing projects and deliverables.  Call with MO 
re: establishing weekly deliverable spreadsheet and call with City/CDP/DOJ/MT.  
Review of letters (Loomis) and other documents pertinent to the project.  Continued 
review of budget (2017).  Logistics for meeting in CLE at the request of Judge White 
for April 28 (hotel, flights etc).

4.5 250  $   1,125.00 

April 26: Correspondence with MT re: 2017 CDP Equipment and Resource Plan (to 
be filed on April 28).  Call with Monitor re: ERP, and semi-annual report drafting 
assignments.  Review of latest draft of FIT Manual in preparation for meeting with 
CDP IA staff and Judge White on April 28.  Budget discussion with Monitor.

4 250  $      1,000.00 



April 27: Call with Monitor re: upcoming Court filings, 2017 Equipment and Resource 
Plan and other logistical managerial matters.  MT call with DOJ.  Call with Judge 
White re: FIT manual.  Latest FIT manual review (version dated 4-26-17).  Review of 
In-service Training Plan.  Call with RR re: meeting in Cleveland tomorrow.

4.5 250  $   1,125.00 

April 28: Cleveland site visit for meetings.  Met with CDP, DOJ and City re: FIT 
manual development process.  Met with DC O'Neill re: In-service training plan and 
other upcoming deliverables.  Met with USAO about progress to date and upcoming 
mutual priorities. 

4 250  $      1,000.00 

Total Billable Hours 61.5 250 $15,375.00

Reimbursable Expenses

April 3: RT Flight  $      508.40 

April 3: Hotel (room and tax)  $      312.22 

April 3: Uber to DCA  $        22.12 

April 4: Taxi from CLE Hopkins to hotel room (flight arrived at midnight)  $        41.00 

April 5: Uber to CLE Hopkins  $        19.10 

April 5: Uber from DCA to home  $        20.90 

April 27: Hotel (room and tax)  $      156.11 

April 27: RT Airfare from DCA to CLE  $      884.40 

April 27: Uber to DCA  $        22.19 

April 27: Uber from CLE Hopkins Airport to Hotel  $        19.91 



April 28: Uber from CDP HQ to CLE Hopkins Airport  $        35.75 

April 28: Uber from DCA to home  $        23.05 

Total Reimbursable Expenses  $   2,065.15 

Total Billed  $ 17,440.15 

 Pro bono hours 18.5 250 $4,625.00 



From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: [The Aden Group] Your Monday evening trip with Uber

Date: April 3, 2017 at 6:30 PM
To:

$22.12
Thanks for choosing Uber, Hassan

April 3, 2017 | uberX

06:06pm | , Fort Hunt, VA

06:28pm | 4 S Smith Blvd, Arlington, VA

You rode with Shahbaz

10.07
miles

00:22:20
Trip time

uberX
Car



miles Trip time Car

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Trip fare 22.12

Subtotal $22.12

$22.12

Issued by Rasier

Receipt ID # c6b335f3-2227-4b2b-816e-427fbc1e237c
xidc6b335f3-2227-4b2b-816e-427fbc1e237c
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a

free ride worth up to $15 when you

refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: ala5c



Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.



From: hassan aden
Subject: iScanner: Doc Apr 17, 2017, 9-38 AM

Date: April 17, 2017 at 9:38 AM
To: a

Scanned with iScanner iPhone app.
www.iscannerapp.net



Hassan



4/1/2017 Your trip – View reservations on aa.com - American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/selectReservationSubmit.do?fromHomePage=true&recordLocator=LYGWNS 1/4

Your trip
« Show all trips

Depart Washington, DC to Cleveland, OH
Monday, April 3, 2017

Flight Depart Arrive Travel time Aircraft Class Seats

 2035 American

Airlines 

8:03 PM
DCA

9:38 PM
CLT

1h 35m 320 Economy 11C

Estimated

8:03 PM
Terminal: C
Gate: 41

Estimated

9:38 PM
Terminal: ­­
Gate: C12
Baggage: ­­

Please note connection
time

Get alerts for this flight
Stop: Charlotte (CLT)

 2025 American

Airlines 

10:25 PM
CLT

11:57 PM
CLE

1h 32m 319 Economy 8C

Plan Travel Travel Information AAdvantage

Record locator:  LYGWNS

Trip name:  DCA/CLE   Edit

Issued: Monday, January 2, 2017

Status: Ticket pending


Cancel trip


Change seats


Email trip


Send to calendar


Print trip

https://www.aa.com/reservation/viewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/seats/viewres/select?flightNumber=2035&originAirport=DCA&destinationAirport=CLT&departureMonth=4&departureDay=3&recordLocator=LYGWNS
https://www.aa.com/seats/viewres/select?flightNumber=2025&originAirport=CLT&destinationAirport=CLE&departureMonth=4&departureDay=3&recordLocator=LYGWNS
https://www.aa.com/i18n/travel-info/partner-airlines/oneworld-airline-partners.jsp
https://www.aa.com/seats/viewres/select?flightNumber=2035&originAirport=DCA&destinationAirport=CLT&departureMonth=4&departureDay=3&recordLocator=LYGWNS
https://www.aa.com/homePage.do


4/1/2017 Your trip – View reservations on aa.com - American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/selectReservationSubmit.do?fromHomePage=true&recordLocator=LYGWNS 2/4

Flight Depart Arrive Travel time Aircraft Class Seats

Estimated

10:25 PM
Terminal: ­­
Gate: C11

Estimated

11:57 PM
Terminal: ­­
Gate: A10
Baggage: ­­

Get alerts for this flight

Return Cleveland, OH to Washington, DC
Wednesday, April 5, 2017

Flight Depart Arrive Travel time Aircraft Class Seats

 5530 American
Airlines
Operated by Psa Airlines As
American Eagle

7:55 PM
CLE

9:38 PM
CLT

1h 43m CR9 Economy 15C

Please note connection
time

Get alerts for this flight
Stop: Charlotte (CLT)

 1987 American

Airlines 

10:15 PM
CLT

11:38 PM
DCA

1h 23m 319 Economy 8F

Get alerts for this flight

Cost summary

Your total

508.40

Bag and optional fees Passenger x 1 $446.51

Taxes $61.89

https://www.aa.com/seats/viewres/select?flightNumber=5530&originAirport=CLE&destinationAirport=CLT&departureMonth=4&departureDay=5&recordLocator=LYGWNS
https://www.aa.com/seats/viewres/select?flightNumber=1987&originAirport=CLT&destinationAirport=DCA&departureMonth=4&departureDay=5&recordLocator=LYGWNS
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/support/optional-service-fees.jsp


4/1/2017 Your trip – View reservations on aa.com - American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/selectReservationSubmit.do?fromHomePage=true&recordLocator=LYGWNS 3/4

Passengers

Add / edit passenger information

Trip contact information

Add / edit passenger information

Upgrade your trip

We’ll add you to the upgrade standby list if you’re not confirmed before check in. Be sure you have enough 500­mile
upgrades in your account before you check in.

Flight Flight details Type of upgrade Upgrade?

   2035
Depart:   Washington (DCA) 
Arrive:  Charlotte (CLT)

Complimentary Requested

508.40
Includes all taxes and carrier­
imposed fees

Reservation and tickets
FAQs 

Price and Tax Information 


$
Carrier­imposed fees $0.00

Subtotal $508.40

AAdvantage® benefits

Main Cabin Extra $0.00

Priority $0.00

Same­day Standby $0.00

Total (all passengers) $508.40

Hassan Aden 31LXC40 (AAdvantage)

https://www.aa.com/pubcontent/en_US/utility/FAQs/reservations_FAQ.jsp
https://www.aa.com/mvc/tax/taxDisplay?bookingPathStateId=%3Cc:out%20value=%27%27/%3E


4/1/2017 Your trip – View reservations on aa.com - American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/selectReservationSubmit.do?fromHomePage=true&recordLocator=LYGWNS 4/4

Flight Flight details Type of upgrade Upgrade?

   2025
Depart:   Charlotte (CLT) 
Arrive:  Cleveland (CLE)

Complimentary Requested

   5530
Depart:   Cleveland (CLE) 
Arrive:  Charlotte (CLT)

Complimentary Requested

   1987
Depart:   Charlotte (CLT) 
Arrive:  Washington (DCA)

Complimentary Requested

Helpful links

 

Email trip

Bag and optional fees  

Send to calendar

Print trip  

Reservation and tickets FAQs  

500­mile upgrade terms and conditions 

https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/support/optional-service-fees.jsp
https://www.aa.com/pubcontent/en_US/utility/FAQs/reservations_FAQ.jsp
https://www.aa.com/i18n/aadvantage-program/terms-and-conditions.jsp#terms500mile


From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: [The Aden Group] Your Wednesday evening trip with Uber

Date: April 5, 2017 at 9:21 PM
To:

$20.90
Thanks for choosing Uber, Hassan

April 5, 2017 | uberX

08:50pm | 5 Aviation Cir, Arlington, VA

09:18pm | Fairfax Rd, Fort Hunt, VA

You rode with Tomeka

10.70
miles

00:28:48
Trip time

uberX
Car



miles Trip time Car

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Trip fare 20.90

Subtotal $20.90

$20.90

Issued by Rasier

Receipt ID # 9860c131-f289-46dc-bfaa-34492706cbde
xid9860c131-f289-46dc-bfaa-34492706cbde
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a

free ride worth up to $15 when you

refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: ala5c



Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.



From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: [The Aden Group] Your Wednesday morning trip with Uber

Date: April 5, 2017 at 11:05 AM
To:

$19.10
Thanks for choosing Uber, Hassan

April 5, 2017 | uberX

10:45am | 1325 E 6th St, Cleveland, OH

11:02am | 3 Upper Dr, Cleveland, OH

You rode with Mark

15.09
miles

00:17:32
Trip time

uberX
Car



miles Trip time Car

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Trip Fare 13.05

Subtotal $13.05

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees 6.05

$19.10

xidcb4c9c88-3081-4120-b670-d5d9066fdbe5
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a

free ride worth up to $15 when you

refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: ala5c



Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.









From:
Subject: iScanner: Doc Apr 28, 2017, 2-51 PM

Date: April 28, 2017 at 2:52 PM
To:

Scanned with iScanner iPhone app.
www.iscannerapp.net





From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: Your Friday afternoon trip with Uber

Date: April 28, 2017 at 11:26 AM
To:

$23.05
Thanks for choosing Uber, Hassan

April 28, 2017 | uberX

02:05pm | Terminal B/C Parking, Arlington, VA

02:25pm |   Fort Hunt, VA

You rode with Henry

9.55
miles

00:20:09
Trip time

uberX
Car



miles Trip time Car

Rate Your Driver

This trip was charged to Family.

Your Fare

Trip fare 23.05

Subtotal $23.05

$23.05

Issued by Rasier

Receipt ID # dcc4d771-d448-4da4-a6e9-319e9f4078ca
xiddcc4d771-d448-4da4-a6e9-319e9f4078ca
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a

free ride worth up to $15 when you

refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: ala5c



Share code: ala5c

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.



4/26/2017 Print trip and receipt – Your trip details – American Airlines

https://www.aa.com/reservation/printItinerary.do?forward=itineraryReceipt&isReceipt=true&anchorLocation=%2Freservation%2FfindReservationSubmit.do+aacomT… 1/1

Receipt

Endorsements/Restrictions
NONREF/SVCCHGPLUSFAREDIF/CXL BY FLT TIME OR NOVALUE

Terms and conditions:
If you’ve already begun travel, this receipt may only show portions of your trip not flown.

If your ticket involves travel outside the U.S., Canada, U.S. Virgin Islands or Puerto Rico and has been reissued, your ticket total may not include all taxes. Please contact
Reservations for the correct total.

A summary of all the terms and conditions that apply to your travel are available on aa.com/conditionsofcarriage.

AA RECORD LOCATOR: FERHZC
Get your boarding pass faster!
Scan this barcode at any
American Airlines Self-Service
Machine.

Washington to Cleveland
1 Adult
Thursday April 27, 2017 – Friday April 28, 2017

Total Paid:

AA Record Locator

FERHZC
Your record locator is your reservation confirmation number and
will be needed to retrieve or reference your reservation.

Reservation Name

DCA/CLE
Status: Ticketed Apr 25, 2017

$884.40 USD

Flight Depart Arrive

American Airlines

4364
Operated by Trans States As
American Eagle

Washington (DCA) April 27,
2017 07:42 PM
Travel Time : 1 h 29 m Class : Economy Seat : 12A

Cleveland (CLE) April 27, 2017 09:11 PM
Booking Code : M Plane Type : ER4

Flight Depart Arrive

American Airlines

4318
Operated by Trans States As
American Eagle

Cleveland (CLE) April 28, 2017 12:38 PM
Travel Time : 1 h 28 m Class : Economy Seat : 12B

Washington (DCA) April 28, 2017 02:06
PM
Booking Code : M Plane Type : ER4

Fare Amount

Adult
1  × $796.28 USD $796.28 USD

AAdvantage® Benefits

Main Cabin Extra $0.00 USD

Priority AccessSM $0.00 USD

Same-Day Standby $0.00 USD

Taxes & Carrier-Imposed Fees

Taxes $88.12 USD

Carrier-Imposed Fees $0.00 USD

Flight Subtotal

$884.40 USD

Flight information

PASSENGER TICKET NUMBER FREQUENT FLYER NUMBER FARE Tax/Fee/Charge TICKET TOTAL

ADEN,HASSAN 0012125683495 $796.28 USD 88.12 884.40

Payment Type:     Total $884.40 USD



From: Dorin Fleseriu via Square receipts@messaging.squareup.com
Subject: Receipt from Dorin Fleseriu

Date: April 28, 2017 at 8:44 AM
To:

Square automatically sends receipts to the email address you used at any Square seller.
Learn more

Dorin Fleseriu

How was your experience?

$35.75
Custom Amount $35.75

Total $35.75

Apr 28 2017 at 11:44 AM

#0s2Y

Auth code: 68597P



© 2017 Square, Inc.

1455 Market Street, Suite 600
San Francisco, CA 94103

Square Privacy Policy · Not your receipt?

Manage preferences  for digital receipts



From: Uber Receipts uber.us@uber.com
Subject: Your Thursday evening trip with Uber

Date: April 27, 2017 at 6:41 PM
To:

$19.91
Thanks for choosing Uber, Hassan

April 27, 2017 | uberX

09:19pm | Lower Dr, Cleveland, OH

09:40pm | 500 Lakeside Ave E, Cleveland, OH

You rode with Walter IV

16.25
miles

00:20:16
Trip time

uberX
Car



miles Trip time Car

Rate Your Driver

This trip was charged to Family.

Your Fare

Trip Fare 13.86

Subtotal $13.86

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees 6.05

$19.91

xidb4b1d4dd-dd3a-47d0-bdbc-18e72efd4247
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a

free ride worth up to $15 when you

refer a friend to try Uber.



Share code: ala5c

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Hassan Aden
Police Assessment Resource Cen

Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 350524
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

03-APR-17 00:44
05-APR-17 10:53
1
816

Tax ID :
The Westin Cleveland  APR-05-2017  11:00  DATZMAN
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
03-APR-17 RT816 Room Charge 134.00
03-APR-17 RT816 State Sales Tax 10.72
03-APR-17 RT816 City Tax 4.02
03-APR-17 RT816 County Tax 7.37
04-APR-17 RT816 Room Charge 134.00
04-APR-17 RT816 State Sales Tax 10.72
04-APR-17 RT816 City Tax 4.02
04-APR-17 RT816 County Tax 7.37
05-APR-17 -312.22

***For Authorization Purpose Only***

Date        Code         Authorized DCC
03-APR-17 27538P 348.4
03-APR-17 63723P 100

** Total  312.22 -312.22
*** Balance     0.00

Continued on the next page



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Hassan Aden Page Number  : 2 Invoice Nbr  : 350524
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

03-APR-17 00:44
05-APR-17 10:53
1
816

REST EASY - Nothing recharges mind and body like sound sleep. Experience superior rest at home with the Westin Heavenly(R) Bed, a revitalizing 
retreat for the sleep of your dreams. Learn more at westin.com/store

Tell us about your stay. www.westin.com/reviews

Signature_____________________



Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 

Modupe Akinola 

 

TO:  Matthew Barge 

  Police Assessment Resource Center 

 

FROM: Modupe Akinola 

 

DATE:  May 6, 2017 

 

April 2017 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours 

3-1-17 through 3-31-17 Outcome measures follow up emails, data collection, 

and calls 

5.0 

 Total Hours Worked 5.0 

Total Billed Hours 0.0 

              Rate: $250/hour  

TOTAL BILLED $0 

Pro Bono Hours 5.0 

Travel Hours 0.0 

 

 



MATTHEW BARGE 

APRIL 2017 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours

04-01-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

1.5

04-02-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

0.9

04-03-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

3.1

04-04-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

4.7

04-05-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

1.8

04-06-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

2.8

04-07-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

2.5

04-08-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

1.9

04-09-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

1.7

04-10-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

4.4

04-11-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

3.5

04-12-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

1.8

04-13-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

3.5

04-14-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

3.4



REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

04-15-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.  

2.6

04-16-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

3.8

04-17-17 Meet with stakeholders.  Communicate re: various 
monitoring issues.  Draft and review documents.

9.8

04-18-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

5.7

04-19-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

1.1

04-20-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 0.8

04-21-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 0.6

04-23-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 0.2

04-24-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

4.9

04-25-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 1.8

04-26-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

5.2

04-27-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

4.7

04-28-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

2.4

04-29-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues. 0.7

04-30-17 Communicate re: various monitoring issues.  Draft 
and review documents.

0.5

Total Hours Worked 82.3

Total Billed Hours 35.0

              Rate: $250/hour   

TOTAL BILLED $8,750.00

Pro Bono Hours 47.3



Notes: 

Mr. Barge does not bill for travel/transport time, meals, or miscellaneous personal expenses 
associated with the project and/or traveling for the project.  Whenever feasible to do so, he 
coordinates ground transportation with other Monitoring Team members.

Date Expense Amount

16-Apr American Airlines (BNA to CLE) $338.80

16-Apr Taxi (CLE to Downtown) $  45.00  

17-Apr American Airlines (CLE to LGA) $391.19

17-Mar Marriott (4/16 – 4/17) $156.11

17-Apr Uber (Downtown to CLE) $  48.07

17-Apr Taxi (LGA to Residence) $  15.20

TOTAL $994.37



Saturday,	April	15,	2017	at	10:05:22	AM	Eastern	Daylight	Time

Page	1	of	4

Subject: Your	trip	confirma.on-FBAISY	16APR
Date: Sunday,	April	2,	2017	at	5:07:21	PM	Eastern	Daylight	Time
From: American	Airlines@aa.com
To:

 
 

 
Hello Matthew Barge! Issued: Apr 2, 2017

 

 
Your trip confirmation and receipt

 

 
Record locator: FBAISY

 
                     View your trip                    

 

 
 

 

Sunday, April 16, 2017

BNA   ORD 
 

5:00 PM
 

6:47 PM
Nashville Chicago O'hare
 

American Airlines 3312 OPERATED BY ENVOY AIR AS
AMERICAN EAGLE.

Seats: --
Class: Economy (G)
Meals:

ORD   CLE 
 

9:40 PM
 

11:52 PM
Chicago O'hare Cleveland
 

American Airlines 3515 OPERATED BY ENVOY AIR AS
AMERICAN EAGLE.

Seats: --
Class: Economy (S)
Meals:

https://www.aa.com/reservation/emailHoldConfirmation.do?firstName=MATTHEW&lastName=BARGE&recordLocator=FBAISY
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Your trip receipt
 

 

     Reprint

 
Matthew Barge
 
FARE-USD $ 293.95
 

TAXES AND CARRIER-IMPOSED FEES $ 44.85
 

TICKET TOTAL $ 338.80
 

 
 

 

 
 

Matthew Barge AAdvantage # 
 
Ticket # 0012122083874

Book a hotel » Book a car » Buy trip insurance »

 

 
Schedule a ride »

http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/1/c0a541d6-fde0-42c7-a523-d2150ec2f977
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/2/c0a541d6-fde0-42c7-a523-d2150ec2f977
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/3/c0a541d6-fde0-42c7-a523-d2150ec2f977
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/4/c0a541d6-fde0-42c7-a523-d2150ec2f977
https://www.bookaahotels.com/index.html?&label=aa-email-conf
https://www.bookaahotels.com/index.html?&label=aa-email-conf
https://www.aa.com/car?src=AATD2C&pickUpPlace=CLE&dropOffPlace=BNA&pickUpDate=04/17/2017&pickUpTime=0000&dropOffDate=04/16/2017&dropOffTime=1500&airlineCode=AA&flightNumber=3515&page=results
https://www.aa.com/car?src=AATD2C&pickUpPlace=CLE&dropOffPlace=BNA&pickUpDate=04/17/2017&pickUpTime=0000&dropOffDate=04/16/2017&dropOffTime=1500&airlineCode=AA&flightNumber=3515&page=results
http://www.etravelprotection.com/aa/?csid=E11
http://www.etravelprotection.com/aa/?csid=E11
http://ubr.to/2jszlL2
http://ubr.to/2jszlL2
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Contact us  |  Privacy policy

 

 
You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The itinerary must be canceled before the
ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the ticket has no value. If the fare allows
changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply. 

You have 24 hours to cancel your trip for a full refund if you booked at least 7 days prior to
departure. You must cancel your trip before requesting a refund. To cancel your trip, login on
aa.com or Contact Reservations. For our refund policy and to request a refund, go to
www.aa.com/refunds.

Some American Airlines check-in counters do not accept cash as a form of payment. For
more information, visit our Airport Information page.

        

Some everyday products, like e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when
transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked baggage.  Changes in temperature or
pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited
items may result in fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden
hazardous materials in your baggage like:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives
/ Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen
bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet
articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries for most consumer electronic devices in
carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium
batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette lighters and e-cigarettes must be removed from
checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may
not be used on-board the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may
require airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage entirely. Passengers requiring these
items should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of
international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the transporting air carriers, which are
herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on
which you may be ticketed may have different conditions of carriage.  International air
transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on file with
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal
Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are not restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on
liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or
perishable goods, and availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time
periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the air carrier, 4. Rights
on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations,

 
Get the American Airlines app

  

https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/contact-american/american-customer-service.jsp
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/support/privacy-policy.jsp
https://www.aa.com/loyalty/login/optional
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/contact-american/american-customer-service.jsp
http://www.aa.com/refunds
https://www.aa.com/i18n/travel-info/airports/airport-information.jsp
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/american-airlines/id382698565?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.aa.android&hl=en
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on the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations,
check-in times and refusal to carry, 6. Rights of the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or
failure to perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or
aircraft and rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the
transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the right to inspect the full text of each
transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon
request, to receive (free of charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference
from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of each air carrier's
terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on
the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's
conditions of carriage..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and
confidential use of the intended recipient(s).  This message contains confidential and proprietary
information of American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read,
searched, distributed or otherwise used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are
not an intended recipient, please do not read, distribute, or take action in reliance upon this
message.   If you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and
promptly delete this message and its attachments from your computer.

NRID: 4642111929350216071446000

http://www.aa.com/pubcontent/en_US/customerService/customerCommitment/conditionsOfCarriage.jsp?v_locale=en_US&v_mobileUAFlag=AA










5/5/2017 Uber Riders

https://riders.uber.com/trips/6257e23b-2c4d-44f1-bd34-8ffe738459dc 1/2

FREE RIDES

NEW!

Matthew

My Trips

Profile

Payment

Free Rides

Drive with Uber

Log Out

Lost
something?
Check out

uber.com/lost

UBER HOME • CITIES •
DRIVERS

 Matthew 



YOUR TRIP
2:10 PM on April 17, 2017

Find Lost Item Get a Fare review Resend Receipt Request Invoice

CAR

UBERX
MILES

12.10
TRIP TIME

00:15:06

FARE BREAKDOWN

Trip Fare 13.15

Subtotal $13.15

Tolls,

Surcharges, and

Fees

2.05

CHARGED $15.20

You rode with
JEFFREY

RATE YOUR RIDE

   

2:10 PM
673-787 W Huron Rd, Cleveland, OH
44113, USA



2:28 PM
5300 Riverside Dr, Cleveland, OH 44135,
United States





https://riders.uber.com/invite
https://riders.uber.com/trips
https://riders.uber.com/profile
https://riders.uber.com/payment
https://riders.uber.com/invite
https://riders.uber.com/upgrade
https://riders.uber.com/logout
https://riders.uber.com/lost
https://www.uber.com/
https://www.uber.com/cities
https://www.uber.com/drivers
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/uber/id368677368
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.ubercab


5/5/2017 Uber Riders

https://riders.uber.com/trips/6257e23b-2c4d-44f1-bd34-8ffe738459dc 2/2

ABOUT US HELP CENTER CAREERS BLOG
 

ENGLISH

https://twitter.com/uber
https://www.facebook.com/uber
https://www.uber.com/about
https://help.uber.com/
https://www.uber.com/jobs
http://blog.uber.com/


BRIAN D. CENTER 

TO:  Matthew Barge 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Brian Center 

DATE:  May 5, 2017 

APRIL 2017 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours

4-10-17 Participate in Monitoring Team call to engage on all 
ongoing issues related to Consent Decree

1.0

4-17 Tc with MT and community engagement team re 
current strategy, planning for upcoming community 
meetings. 

0.5

4-21 Tc with MT and In Focus re focus group process; 
and tc with MT re community engagement strategy.

1.6

4-24 Tc with MT to engage on all ongoing issues related 
to consent decree

1.1

4-28 Tc with MT re community engagement strategy; 
prep. and review emails re community meetings and 
focus group planning.

0.6

4-29 Edit to semi-annual report on portion related to 
community policing

1.1

Total Hours Worked                        5.9

              Rate: $250/hour

TOTAL BILLED 2.8 ($700)

Pro Bono Hours 3.1



INVOICE 
CHRISTINE M. COLE at COMMUNITY RESOURCES FOR JUSTICE

PARC
Attn: Matthew Barge
Date: May 4, 2017

Re:  Cleveland Monitoring

Invoice Period:  April 2017

Date Description of Activities Hours

4/3/17
prep for calls reading and commenting on plans, monitoring plan, call with Data Analysis 
Team in CLE, MT Team call 3.00

4/4/17 participant in DOJ and City call 1.00
4/10/17 weekly outcomes measures call and weekly team meeting call, emails 1.50
4/18/17 call with DOJ, call with CDP and  City, emails and follow up 2.00
4/21/17 call re: community focus groups, follow up emails and planning 1.00
4/24/17 all team meeting, emails, prepping calls 1.50

4/25/17
doj call, disc with other members, reading reports on data analysis, semi annual report, 
training eval, equip and resource plan 2.00

4/26/17
outcome measures call, comms on focus groups, reviewing Data Analysis Plan, drafting 
report on IA measures 1.00

4/28/17 drafing semi-annual report and analysis of IA Qual study 2.00
4/30/17 drafing semi-annual report and analysis of IA Qual study 5.50

Total hours worked 20.50
Pro Bono hours 7.50
Total hours billed 13.00

Rate $250.00 hour  $ 3,250.00 
Expenses See Reimbursement Sheet for Detail  $ - 

Total Invoice  $ 3,250.00 

Remit payment to:

5/1/17

Signature Date

�1



Reimbursement for Expenses

Date Expense description Amount Reference
1
2
3
4
5
6
7

NR

Total expenses $0.00

�1



Randolph Dupont 

TO:  Matthew Barge, Monitor 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 
FROM: Randolph Dupont 
DATE:  May 8, 2017 

April 2017 Invoice 
Billable Hours 

Date Activity Hours

04-01-17 Discussion of Early Intervention program   0.5

04-04-17 Discussion of CPD 8 Hour curriculum, ADAMHS information   0.4

04-05-17 Discussions and Review of 8 Hour Curriculum feedback   1.6

04-06-17 MHRAC Agenda review, ADAMHS information   0.4

04-07-17 Revised 8 Hour Curriculum review   0.7

04-10-17 MHRAC scheduling, Review of 40 Hour Curriculum, MHRAC 
meeting, Discussion of 8 Hour Curriculum, Training Subcmte.

  3.6

04-13-17 CPD Safety Information, 40 Hour Curriculum information   0.7

04-17-17 Scheduling, Monitoring Team information, 8 Hour Curriculum 
feedback

  0.9

04-18-17 Review of CPD safety documents, Discussion of CIT 40 Hour 
training with MHRAC Training subcommittee

  1.4

04-19-17 Discussion of 8 Hour feedback, Joint working session on revising 8 
Hour Curriculum

  2.5

04-21-17 Discussion and feedback on 8 Hour curriculum   0.5

04-25-17 CPD Public Safety information, Curriculum evaluation discussion, 
8 Hour curriculum revisions

  0.9

04-29-17 Monitoring Team Semiannual public report   1.5 

Total Hours Worked 15.6



Total Billed Hours   7.8

              Rate: $250/hour   

TOTAL BILLED $1950

Pro Bono Hours    7.8



Maggie Goodrich 
LE Innovations, Inc. 

INVOICE # 2017 04 Cleveland Project Bill – Maggie Goodrich 

May 8, 2017 

Matthew Barge 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 4/01/17 through 4/31/17 
Cleveland Police Department Technology and Equipment Assessment 

     $1,625.00 TOTAL DUE: 

Please Remit Check to: 
LE Innovations, Inc. 

Date Hours Total

4/25/17 1 Pro bono

4/26/17 1 $250.00

4/28/17 2.5 $625.00

4/30/17 3 $750.00

Description

Call with L. Jones re RMS, CAD, LMS 
project status and vehicle plan; 
Review CPD Equipment and Resource 
Plan;

Draft outline for Third Monitoring 
Report

Draft content for Third Monitoring 
Report

Draft content for Third Monitoring 
Report

Total 7.5

Page !  of !1 1



INVOICE 

From: Ayesha Bell Hardaway To:  Police Assessment Resource Center 

Billable Hours and Expenses for April 2017 

DATE DESCRIPTION   HOURS 

4/3/17 Participate in conference call .8 

4/4/17 Prepare for and participate in meetings 2.5 

4/7/17 Prepare for and participate in conference calls 2.2 

4/10/17 Participate conference call 1.0 

4/11/17 Participate in conference calls 2.3 

4/12/17 Participate in conference call .4 

4/13/17 Prepare for and participate in meetings 1.7 

4/17/17 Prepare for and participate in conference calls; document 
revisions; email correspondence 

1.9 

4/18/17 Attend meeting; phone call 1.9 

4/19/17 Participate in meetings 2.0 

4/20/17 Prepare for and participate in meetings 3.8 

4/23/17 Draft document revisions 1.3 

4/24/17 Document revisions; email correspondence .6 

4/25/17 Document revisions 2.3 

4/26/17 Participate in meeting; conference call 1.9 

4/27/17 Participate in conference call; document revisions 1.3 

4/28/17 Document revisions .5 

4/30/17 Document revisions; email revisions 3.5 

Total Hours Worked  31.9 

Pro Bono Hours  8.5 



 5.6 Travel Hours          
Total Hours Billed   (23.4)     x   Rate $250.00/hour $5,850.00 

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
4/4/17 Parking 10.00 

4/19/17 Parking 10.00 

4/20/17 Parking 11.00 

Total Expense Amount Due (Transportation)  $31.00 





 



 



TIMOTHY J. LONGO, SR. 

TO: Matthew Barge 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Timothy J. Longo, Sr. 

DATE: April 1, 2017 

APRIL 2017 INVOICE 

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date Activity Hours

4/16/2017 Travel to Cleveland 4.0

4/17/2017 Force Training Review w/Training Unit, Judge 
White, Mr. Barge, Mr. Smoot, Mr. Sargent, and 
Commissioner Ramsey

4.0

4/17/2017 Meeting w/Mr. Barge and Judge Oliver 1.3

4/17/2017 Monitoring Team Conference Call and Call 
Preparation

1.0

4/18/2017 Travel to Charlottesville 4.0

4/29/2017 Preparation of Draft- 3rd semi-annual report 3.0



TRAVEL/LODGING EXPENSES 

         TOTAL PER DIEM $827.91

TOTAL HOURS 17.3

              Rate: $250/hour

TOTAL BILLED $1,625.00

Pro Bono Hours 10.8

Date Expense Amount

4/16-4/17/2017 Air-Travel (CHO to CLE Roundtrip) 559.60

4/16-4/17/2017 Lodging- Marriott 156.11

Taxi Transportation (Airport to Hotel- Roundtrip) 43.20

TOTAL REIMBUSEEXPENSES:

   PER DIEM EXPENSES

@69.00 per day 69.00



5/17/17, 11'11 PMFwd: Your trip confirmation-JERPLZ 16APR - Meg Olsen

Page 1 of 5https://outlook.office.com/owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessageItem&Item…2FfQBeoRAAEmNAg%2BAAA%3D&IsPrintView=1&wid=46&ispopout=1&path=

Fwd: Your trip confirmation-JERPLZ 16APR

---------- Original Message ----------
From: "American Airlines@aa.com" <notify@aa.globalnotifications.com>
To: 
Date: April 13, 2017 at 12:11 PM
Subject: Your trip confirmation-JERPLZ 16APR

 
 

 
Hello Timothy Longo! Issued: Apr 13, 2017

 

 
Your trip confirmation and receipt

 

 
Record locator: JERPLZ

 
 

                     View your trip                    

Sunday, April 16, 2017
 

CHO   ORD Seats: --

Timothy Longo

Sun 4/16/2017 9:20 AM

To:Meg Olsen 

https://www.aa.com/reservation/emailHoldConfirmation.do?firstName=TIMOTHY&lastName=LONGO&recordLocator=JERPLZ


5/17/17, 11'11 PMFwd: Your trip confirmation-JERPLZ 16APR - Meg Olsen

Page 2 of 5https://outlook.office.com/owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessageItem&Item…FfQBeoRAAEmNAg%2BAAA%3D&IsPrintView=1&wid=46&ispopout=1&path=

 

3:15 PM
 

4:15 PM

Charlottesville Chicago O'hare
 

American Airlines 3111 
OPERATED BY SKYWEST AIRLINES AS AMERICAN
EAGLE.

Class: Economy (V)
Meals:  

 
 

ORD   CLE 
 

5:10 PM
 

7:26 PM
Chicago O'hare Cleveland
 

American Airlines 3584 
OPERATED BY ENVOY AIR AS AMERICAN EAGLE.

Seats: --
Class: Economy (V)
Meals:  

 

 
Tuesday, April 18, 2017

 
CLE   PHL 
 

8:05 AM
 

9:30 AM
Cleveland Philadelphia
 

American Airlines 4179 
OPERATED BY AIR WISCONSIN AS AMERICAN EAGLE.

Seats: --
Class: Economy (V)
Meals:  

 
 

PHL   CHO 
 

1:10 PM
 

2:26 PM
Philadelphia Charlottesville
 

American Airlines 4819 
OPERATED BY PIEDMONT AIRLINES AS AMERICAN
EAGLE.

Seats: --
Class: Economy (V)
Meals:  

 

 

Timothy Longo AAdvantage # 4D5XH86 PLT
 
Ticket # 0012123934808

 

 

Your trip receipt



5/17/17, 11'11 PMFwd: Your trip confirmation-JERPLZ 16APR - Meg Olsen

Page 3 of 5https://outlook.office.com/owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessageItem&Item…FfQBeoRAAEmNAg%2BAAA%3D&IsPrintView=1&wid=46&ispopout=1&path=

 
 

   

 
Timothy Longo
 
FARE-USD $ 478.14
 

TAXES AND CARRIER-IMPOSED FEES $ 81.46
 

TICKET TOTAL $ 559.60
 

 
 

Book a hotel » Book a car » Buy trip insurance »

 

 
Schedule a ride »

 

 
 
 

Contact us  |  Privacy policy
 
  

Get the American Airlines app

  

 

 
Baggage Information

Baggage charges for your itinerary will be governed by American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -
CHOCLE-No free checked bags/ American Airlines BAG ALLOWANCE -CLECHO-No free
checked bags/ American Airlines 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines
/UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 1STCHECKED BAG FEE-
CLECHO-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158
LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CHOCLE-USD0.00/ American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23

https://www.bookaahotels.com/index.html?&label=aa-email-conf
https://www.bookaahotels.com/index.html?&label=aa-email-conf
https://www.aa.com/car?src=AATD2C&pickUpPlace=CLE&dropOffPlace=CLE&pickUpDate=04/16/2017&pickUpTime=1900&dropOffDate=04/18/2017&dropOffTime=0600&airlineCode=AA&flightNumber=3584&page=results
https://www.aa.com/car?src=AATD2C&pickUpPlace=CLE&dropOffPlace=CLE&pickUpDate=04/16/2017&pickUpTime=1900&dropOffDate=04/18/2017&dropOffTime=0600&airlineCode=AA&flightNumber=3584&page=results
http://www.etravelprotection.com/aa/?csid=E11
http://www.etravelprotection.com/aa/?csid=E11
http://ubr.to/2jszlL2
http://ubr.to/2jszlL2
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/1/ef7e0fe3-8c74-474e-903a-b5f3f3f89875
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/2/ef7e0fe3-8c74-474e-903a-b5f3f3f89875
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/3/ef7e0fe3-8c74-474e-903a-b5f3f3f89875
http://aa.appriss.com/marketing-api/live_links/TMPL1/4/ef7e0fe3-8c74-474e-903a-b5f3f3f89875
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/contact-american/american-customer-service.jsp
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/support/privacy-policy.jsp
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/american-airlines/id382698565?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.aa.android&hl=en
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KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM 2NDCHECKED BAG FEE-CLECHO-USD0.00/
American Airlines /UP TO 50 LB/23 KG AND UP TO 62 LINEAR IN/158 LINEAR CM ADDITIONAL
ALLOWANCES AND/OR DISCOUNTS MAY APPLY 

 

You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The itinerary must be canceled before the
ticketed departure time of the first unused coupon or the ticket has no value. If the fare allows
changes, a fee may be assessed for changes and restrictions may apply. 

You have 24 hours to cancel your trip for a full refund if you booked at least 7 days prior to
departure. You must cancel your trip before requesting a refund. To cancel your trip, login on
aa.com or Contact Reservations. For our refund policy and to request a refund, go to
www.aa.com/refunds.

 

Some American Airlines check-in counters do not accept cash as a form of payment. For
more information, visit our Airport Information page.

        

Some everyday products, like e-cigarettes and aerosol spray starch, can be dangerous when
transported on the aircraft in carry-on and/or checked baggage.  Changes in temperature or
pressure can cause some items to leak, generate toxic fumes or start a fire.  Carriage of prohibited
items may result in fines or in certain cases imprisonment.  Please ensure there are no forbidden
hazardous materials in your baggage like:

Some Lithium batteries (e.g. spares in checked baggage, batteries over a certain size), Explosives
/ Fireworks, Strike anywhere matches/ Lighter fluid,  Compressed gases / Aerosols Oxygen
bottles/ Liquid oxygen, Flammable liquids, Pesticides/ Poison, Corrosive material.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total) of medicinal and toilet
articles carried in your luggage, spare lithium batteries for most consumer electronic devices in
carry-on baggage, and certain smoking materials carried on your person. 

Certain items are required to be carried with you onboard the aircraft. For example, spare lithium
batteries for portable electronic devices, cigarette lighters and e-cigarettes must be removed from
checked or gate-checked baggage and carried onboard the aircraft. However, e-cigarettes may not
be used on-board the aircraft.

Traveling with medical oxygen, liquid oxygen, mobility aids and other assistive devices may require
airline pre-approval or be restricted from carriage entirely. Passengers requiring these items
should contact the airline operator for information on use of such devices.

To change your reservation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer to your record locator.

NOTICE OF INCORPORATED TERMS OF CONTRACT

Air Transportation, whether it is domestic or international (including domestic portions of
international journeys), is subject to the individual terms of the transporting air carriers, which are
herein incorporated by reference and made part of the contract of carriage.  Other carriers on
which you may be ticketed may have different conditions of carriage.  International air
transportation, including the carrier's liability, may also be governed by applicable tariffs on file with
the U.S. and other governments and by the Warsaw Convention, as amended, or by the Montreal
Convention.  Incorporated terms may include, but are not restricted to: 1. Rules and limits on
liability for personal injury or death, 2. Rules and limits on liability for baggage, including fragile or
perishable goods, and availability of excess valuation charges, 3. Claim restrictions, including time
periods in which passengers must file a claim or bring an action against the air carrier, 4. Rights on

https://www.aa.com/loyalty/login/optional
https://www.aa.com/i18n/customer-service/contact-american/american-customer-service.jsp
http://www.aa.com/refunds
https://www.aa.com/i18n/travel-info/airports/airport-information.jsp
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the air carrier to change terms of the contract, 5. Rules on reconfirmation of reservations, check-in
times and refusal to carry, 6. Rights of the air carrier and limits on liability for delay or failure to
perform service, including schedule changes, substitution of alternate air carriers or aircraft and
rerouting.   

You can obtain additional information on items 1 through 6 above at any U.S. location where the
transporting air carrier's tickets are sold.  You have the right to inspect the full text of each
transporting air carrier's terms at its airport and city ticket offices.  You also have the right, upon
request, to receive (free of charge) the full text of the applicable terms incorporated by reference
from each of the transporting air carriers.  Information on ordering the full text of each air carrier's
terms is available at any U.S. location where the air carrier's tickets are sold or you can click on
the Conditions of Carriage button below.  

Air transportation on American Airlines and the American Eagle carriers® is subject to American's
conditions of carriage..

NOTICE: This email and any information, files or attachments are for the exclusive and confidential
use of the intended recipient(s).  This message contains confidential and proprietary information of
American Airlines (such as customer and business data) that may not be read, searched,
distributed or otherwise used by anyone other than the intended recipient.  If you are not an
intended recipient, please do not read, distribute, or take action in reliance upon this message.   If
you suspect you have received this email in error, please notify the sender and promptly delete this
message and its attachments from your computer.

NRID: 5015585652661311104709300

 
 

http://www.aa.com/pubcontent/en_US/customerService/customerCommitment/conditionsOfCarriage.jsp?v_locale=en_US&v_mobileUAFlag=AA
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Fwd: Receipt from Abc Taxi Co. LLC

---------- Original Message ----------

From: "Abc Taxi Co. LLC via Square" <receipts@messaging.squareup.com>

To: 

Date: April 18, 2017 at 6:01 AM

Subject: Receipt from Abc Taxi Co. LLC

Square automatically sends receipts to the email address you used at any Square seller. Learn
more

Abc Taxi Co. LLC

How was your experience?

Timothy Longo

Tue 4/18/2017 11:38 AM

https://squareup.com/subscriptions/r?ee=eae755faa1cdebdb5a07cce44edfda39e694865a6a4c5b3bff0efa14--ZD1rRzU0NVRDNG9GS3RtZkJHJmU9JTIzYXV0b21hdGljLXJlY2VpcHQtbGVhcm4tbW9yZSZtJTVCYXBwLXZlcnNpb24lNUQ9NTFkOTg5NDI0OTFmYmU4Y2YzYWVmOTNjYzViYTA1ZWNiYmJmNTkyZSZtJTVCYXV0b21hdGljJTVEPXRydWUmbSU1Qm1lcmNoYW50LXRva2VuJTVEPUFNRVlDQlNRQ0taUUcmbSU1QnBheW1lbnQtdG9rZW4lNUQ9R1laWnZTUnVkZFFzbXpRSkloa29BME1GJm0lNUJyZWNlaXB0LXRva2VuJTVEPWFyR1laWnZTUnVkZFFzbXpRSkloa29BME1GJm49ZW1haWxjbGljayZyPWh0dHBzJTNBJTJGJTJGc3F1YXJldXAuY29tJTJGaGVscCUyRmVuLXVzJTJGYXJ0aWNsZSUyRjUyMTI
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$43.20
Custom Amount $36.00

Subtotal $36.00

Tip $7.20

Total $43.20

TIMOTHY J LONGO SR

Apr 18 2017 at 6:01 AM

#GYZZ

Auth code: 002173

© 2017 Square, Inc.

1455 Market Street, Suite 600
San Francisco, CA 94103

Square Privacy Policy · Not your receipt?
Manage preferences  for digital receipts

https://squareup.com/subscriptions/r?ee=5762f8a03a3f143fb7b1628bb1f90c8ee5d05cbfbde46b3c6b042c79--ZD1rRzU0NVRDNG9GS3RtZkJHJmU9JTIzcHJpdmFjeS1wb2xpY3kmbSU1QmFwcC12ZXJzaW9uJTVEPTUxZDk4OTQyNDkxZmJlOGNmM2FlZjkzY2M1YmEwNWVjYmJiZjU5MmUmbSU1QmF1dG9tYXRpYyU1RD10cnVlJm0lNUJtZXJjaGFudC10b2tlbiU1RD1BTUVZQ0JTUUNLWlFHJm0lNUJwYXltZW50LXRva2VuJTVEPUdZWlp2U1J1ZGRRc216UUpJaGtvQTBNRiZtJTVCcmVjZWlwdC10b2tlbiU1RD1hckdZWlp2U1J1ZGRRc216UUpJaGtvQTBNRiZuPWVtYWlsY2xpY2smcj1odHRwcyUzQSUyRiUyRnNxdWFyZXVwLmNvbSUyRnVzJTJGZW4lMkZsZWdhbCUyRnByaXZhY3ktbm8tYWNjb3VudA
https://squareup.com/subscriptions/r?ee=75dcc20f31da7f7390eecaea14e5de7a9aa86fd205f6628369bed32d--ZD1rRzU0NVRDNG9GS3RtZkJHJmU9JTIzbm90LXlvdXItcmVjZWlwdCZtJTVCYXBwLXZlcnNpb24lNUQ9NTFkOTg5NDI0OTFmYmU4Y2YzYWVmOTNjYzViYTA1ZWNiYmJmNTkyZSZtJTVCYXV0b21hdGljJTVEPXRydWUmbSU1Qm1lcmNoYW50LXRva2VuJTVEPUFNRVlDQlNRQ0taUUcmbSU1QnBheW1lbnQtdG9rZW4lNUQ9R1laWnZTUnVkZFFzbXpRSkloa29BME1GJm0lNUJyZWNlaXB0LXRva2VuJTVEPWFyR1laWnZTUnVkZFFzbXpRSkloa29BME1GJm49ZW1haWxjbGljayZyPWh0dHBzJTNBJTJGJTJGYWNjb3VudC5zcXVhcmV1cC5jb20lMkZub3QteW91ci1yZWNlaXB0JTJGYXJHWVpadlNSdWRkUXNtelFKSWhrb0EwTUY
https://squareup.com/subscriptions/r?ee=cd71b44681ac71b5af9a43032d23ccffcd61e8b5e86fff5b81bd3921--ZD1rRzU0NVRDNG9GS3RtZkJHJmU9JTIzbWFuYWdlLXByZWZlcmVuY2VzJm0lNUJhcHAtdmVyc2lvbiU1RD01MWQ5ODk0MjQ5MWZiZThjZjNhZWY5M2NjNWJhMDVlY2JiYmY1OTJlJm0lNUJhdXRvbWF0aWMlNUQ9dHJ1ZSZtJTVCbWVyY2hhbnQtdG9rZW4lNUQ9QU1FWUNCU1FDS1pRRyZtJTVCcGF5bWVudC10b2tlbiU1RD1HWVpadlNSdWRkUXNtelFKSWhrb0EwTUYmbSU1QnJlY2VpcHQtdG9rZW4lNUQ9YXJHWVpadlNSdWRkUXNtelFKSWhrb0EwTUYmbj1lbWFpbGNsaWNrJnI9aHR0cHMlM0ElMkYlMkZhY2NvdW50LnNxdWFyZXVwLmNvbSUyRm1hbmFnZS1yZWNlaXB0LXByZWZlcmVuY2VzJTJGYXJHWVpadlNSdWRkUXNtelFKSWhrb0EwTUY
https://squareup.com/subscriptions/r?ee=2db9f575e6eae8acbaa9b7469907c4d82974f24372407d55a97b57e4--ZD1rRzU0NVRDNG9GS3RtZkJHJmU9JTIzcmVjZWlwdC1zcXVhcmUtbG9nbyZtJTVCYXBwLXZlcnNpb24lNUQ9NTFkOTg5NDI0OTFmYmU4Y2YzYWVmOTNjYzViYTA1ZWNiYmJmNTkyZSZtJTVCYXV0b21hdGljJTVEPXRydWUmbSU1Qm1lcmNoYW50LXRva2VuJTVEPUFNRVlDQlNRQ0taUUcmbSU1QnBheW1lbnQtdG9rZW4lNUQ9R1laWnZTUnVkZFFzbXpRSkloa29BME1GJm0lNUJyZWNlaXB0LXRva2VuJTVEPWFyR1laWnZTUnVkZFFzbXpRSkloa29BME1GJm49ZW1haWxjbGljayZyPWh0dHBzJTNBJTJGJTJGc3F1YXJldXAuY29t


Policing Project  
NYU School of Law 

40 Washington Square South, Room 302 
New York, NY 10012 

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC) Invoice Date: May 5, 2017 
Attention:  Matthew Barge 

April 2017 Invoice 

Policing Project Staff Hours  

Date Biller Description of Work Performed Time 

4/1/2017 BF Conference with MP re: staffing Cleveland .3

4/1/2017 MP Conference w/BF re: staffing .3

4/3/2017 BF Review of projects in Cleveland and America Speaks .3

4/3/2017 MP Emails w/RN & C Duleba re: invoices/payment .5

4/3/2017 MP Conference with Katherine R. and Scott G. .7

4/3/2017 NO All team call .5

4/3/2017 NO Staff meeting .7

4/3/2017 NO CPOP Community engagement: continue to prepare for 
meeting, community engagement team call, call with 
RN, meetings with externs

7.4

4/3/2017 RN Calls re community engagement and weekly team call 1.7

4/4/2017 NO CPOP: continue to prepare for meeting, meeting with 
externs

6

4/4/2017 NO Policing Project Seminar 2

4/4/2017 NO Admin: email, scheduling, extern travel schedule .6

4/5/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: communications with stakeholders, 
continue to prepare for meetings, begin to review CPOP 
feedback

8.5

4/6/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: communications with stakeholders 5

4/7/2017 NO Community Engagement team call 1

4/7/2017 NO Prepare on-boarding materials for AS 2



4/7/2017 NO CPOP: continue to prepare for meetings, 
communications with stakeholders

4.6

4/7/2017 RN Conference call and emails 1

4/9/2017 BF Connecting with N Junior .2

4/10/2017 NO All-team call 1

4/10/2017 RN Conference call & emails 1

4/11/2017 NO LDF meeting: preparing and attending meeting 4

4/11/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: continue to prepare for meetings, 
communications with stakeholders, continue to review 
feedback

3

4/11/2017 NO Community Engagement Team call 1

4/11/2017 NO Admin: email, time, scheduling 1

4/11/2017 RN Conference call Community Engagement Team 1

4/12/2017 NO IA qualitative review 1.5

4/12/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: communications with stakeholders, 
prepare for meetings, begin to review feedback from 
meetings

6

4/12/2017 RN Call with Hassan and Matthew .7

4/13/2017 MP Met w/Scott G. to discuss CLE work, wrap-up .3

4/13/2017 NO Admin: IA qualitative review, prepare for NYU summit 
panel

1.5

4/13/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: communications with stakeholders, 
meeting with externs, continue to work on community 
organization questionnaire, continue to review feedback 
from forums

8.6

4/13/2017 RN Call with Hassan .8

4/14/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: communications with stakeholders, 
begin to review memos from externs, continue to prepare 
for upcoming meetings

7

4/14/2017 NO Admin: time, reimbursements, scheduling 1.5

4/17/2017 BF Conference with Team re: status of projects .3



4/17/2017 MP Briefed AS in on Cleveland .3

4/17/2017 AS Briefing on Cleveland .3

4/17/2017 NO Admin: emails, reimbursements, 3

4/17/2017 NO Community Engagement Call .7

4/17/2017 NO All-team Call .5

4/17/2017 NO CPOP: complete reviewing extern memo, continue to 
prepare for meetings, communications withe 
stakeholders

3

4/17/2017 RN Conference calls .8

4/18/2017 NO Travel to Cleveland 5

4/18/2017 RN Conference call with MT .4

4/18/2017 RN DOJ/MT call 1.1

4/18/2017 RN Biweekly parties call 1.1

4/19/2017 BF Conference with NO re: forums and staffing and America 
Speaks

.5

4/19/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: CDC meeting, Business district 
meeting, Police Foundation meeting, 5th DPC Meeting, 
call with BF, communications with stakeholders

14

4/19/2017 RN Meetings in Cleveland regarding CPOP and community 
engagement including with CDC; BID; Police 
Foundation

7

4/20/2017 BF Conference with CPC chairs re: America Speaks .2

4/20/2017 NO Travel to NY 4.5

4/20/2017 NO CPOP Engagement: continue to synthesize feedback, 
follow up emails, prepare for future meetings, 
communication with stakeholders

6

4/21/2017 NO CPOP: continue to review feedback, emails with 
stakeholders, prepare for community engagement 
meetings

2

4/21/2017 NO Call with Katherine R. re: outline .5

4/21/2017 NO Admin: emails, scheduling, travel details 2.3



Policing Project Extern Hours 

4/24/2017 BF Conference with M Barge re: hiring in Cleveland .4

4/24/2017 MP Talked w/Matthew about replacing NO .2

4/24/2017 RN Call with Hassan .3

4/24/2017 RN Conference call 1.6

4/26/2017 NO Semi-Annual Report: draft CPOP section 4

4/27/2017 NO Semi-Annual Report: draft CPOP section 4

4/29/2017 BF Review of job notice for NO replacement .2

4/30/2017 NO Semiannual report 2.5

Total Hours: 149.9

Total Hours Billed (Rate: $250/hour): 40

Total Billed: $10,000

Pro Bono Hours: 109.9

Date Biller Description of Work Performed Time 

4/3/2017 Scott G. Meeting with NO & Katherine R. to discuss forum 
feedback

.7

4/3/2017 Katherine R. Met with NO and Scott G. about ways to process 
responses from forums and bias-free policing 
feedback memo

.7

4/5/2017 Scott G. Scanned community forum feedback, uploaded as 
PDFs

.8

4/5/2017 Katherine R. Scanning Cleveland forum notes into PDFs .8

4/9/2017 Katherine R. Began reading and outlining outline of the bias-free 
policing memo

2

4/10/2017 Max I. More NO work .2

4/12/2017 Scott G. Review Qualtrics community organization survey for 
typo errors, functionality, appearance, etc.

.5



4/12/2017 Scott G. Review/analyze community forum feedback for 
themes/takeaways

2.5

4/12/2017 Katherine R. Went through forum responses and organized 
feedback

1

4/13/2017 Scott G. Review/analyze community forum feedback for 
themes/takeaways

.6

4/13/2017 Scott G. Meeting with NO and Katherine R. 1.4

4/13/2017 Scott G. Meeting with MP re: CLE .3

4/13/2017 Katherine R. Continued organizing feedback, met with NO and 
Scott G.

2

4/14/2017 Katherine R. Put together CPOP themes from forum responses 1

4/15/2017 Scott G. work on organizing and categorizing themes from 
forum feedback

1.2

4/15/2017 Katherine R. Put together CPOP themes from forum responses 2

4/16/2017 Katherine R. Bias free policing memo outline .8

4/17/2017 Katherine R. Outline of bias-free policing memo 3

4/17/2017 Katherine R. Reviewed/edited outline .8

4/21/2017 Scott G. Trip to Cleveland; took notes and/or gave part of 
presentation during 3 meetings

12

4/21/2017 Katherine R. Phone call NO to go over outline .5

4/30/2017 Scott G. Write up memo summarizing Cleveland community 
meetings on 4/19

1.5

Total Hours (all Pro Bono): 36.3



Policing Project 
NYU School of Law 

40 Washington Square South 
New York, NY 10012 

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC) Invoice Date: May 7, 2017 
Attention:  Matthew Barge 

April 2017 Invoice 
Expenses 
Date Biller Description of Expense Cost 
3/16/2017 PP Translation fee from Qualtrics 

LLC for Policing Project 
Survey* 

$640.00 

4/18/2017 PP Policing Project Extern Scott 
Glicksman flight to Cleveland 

$496.40 

4/18/2017 PP Scott Glicksman taxi to JFK 
Airport 

$55.44 

4/18/2017 PP Scott Glicksman taxi to Westin 
Hotel in Cleveland 

$19.47 

4/18/2017 PP Scott Glicksman Westin Hotel 
charge 

$312.22 

Total: $1,523.53 

*This charge was accidentally omitted from the March invoice, and is therefore included in the
April invoice.



Qualtrics LLC
333 W. River Park Drive
Provo UT 84604

Date 3/16/2017

Invoice # 87431

Bill To
New York University:Stern School of Business(360)
70 Washington Sq. South
New York NY 100012

Terms Net 30

Due Date 4/15/2017

PO #

Start Date 3/17/2017

End Date 3/16/2018

Tax ID: 45-4964116

US Banking Information
JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A.
201 S. Main Street, Suite 300
Salt Lake City, UT 84111

Account Name: Qualtrics, LLC
Account Number: 207865283
ABA Routing for ACH and Check: 124001545
ABA Routing for Wire: 021000021
SWIFT (Int’l): CHASUS33

For payments in GBP, EUR, or AUD, please use each
currency’s respective banking information below.

International Banking Information

To make payment online through credit card or electronic check/ACH, please visit our payment portal:
https://payments.qualtrics.com/invoice

VIA USPS
Qualtrics LLC
Dept# 880102
P.O. Box 29650
Phoenix, AZ 85038-9650

VIA OVERNIGHT COURIER
JPMorgan Chase (AZ1-2170)
Attn: Qualtrics, LLC
Dept #880102
1820 E. Sky Harbor Circle South
Phoenix, AZ 85034

Paper Check

JPMorgan Bank N.A
London Branch
25 Bank Street
London, E145JP
SWIFT: CHASGB2L

Account Name Account No.      IBAN
QUALTRICS - GBP      41390662         GB63CHAS60924241390662
QUALTRICS - EUR      41390933         GB21CHAS60924241390933
QUALTRICS - AUD      41390934         GB91CHAS60924241390934

Description
Qual416-0310SpanishTranslation
Translate into Spanish

Total
Amount Due

640.00
USD $640.00

 



SkyMiles®#*******500 >

From: Scott Glicksman
To: Duleba, Claire
Subject: Fwd: Your Flight Receipt - SCOTT GLICKSMAN 18APR17
Date: Wednesday, April 05, 2017 12:34:40 PM

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Delta Air Lines <DeltaAirLines@e.delta.com>
Date: Wed, Apr 5, 2017 at 12:24 PM
Subject: Your Flight Receipt - SCOTT GLICKSMAN 18APR17
To: 

Thanks for choosing Delta. Your Flight is confirmed.

Hello, SCOTT

 Your Trip Confirmation #: H4MVJO

Tue, 18APR DEPART ARRIVE

DELTA AIR LINES INC 4181*

MAIN CABIN (E)

NYC-KENNEDY

9:00pm

CLEVELAND, OH

11:07pm

Thu, 20APR DEPART ARRIVE

DELTA AIR LINES INC 3921*

MAIN CABIN (E)

CLEVELAND, OH

6:14am

NYC-KENNEDY

8:10am

*Flight 4181 Operated by ENDEAVOR AIR DBA DELTA CONNECTION
*Flight 3921 Operated by ENDEAVOR AIR DBA DELTA CONNECTION

RESTRICTED HAZARDOUS ITEMS

To ensure the safety of our customers and employees, Delta no longer accepts hoverboards or
any lithium battery powered self-balancing personal transportation devices on board its
aircraft. These items are prohibited as both carry-on and checked baggage.

Spare batteries for other devices, fuel cells, and e-cigarettes are permitted in carry-on
baggage only. If your carry-on bag contains these items and is gate checked, they must be
removed and carried in the cabin. Further information and specific guidelines regarding
restricted items can be found here.

KNOW BEFORE YOU GO

Due to increased TSA wait times, please arrive at John F. Kennedy International Airport (JFK) 2
hours before your scheduled departure time for all domestic flights and 3 hours before all
international flights.

http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/smnm
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/managetrip?ITINERARY.1.DL_REC_LOC=H4MVJO&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.FNAME=SCOTT&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.LNAME=GLICKSMAN
mailto:claire.duleba@nyu.edu
mailto:DeltaAirLines@e.delta.com
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/confnum?ITINERARY.1.DL_REC_LOC=H4MVJO&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.FNAME=SCOTT&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.LNAME=GLICKSMAN
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/hoverbrd


Passenger Info

NAME
SCOTT GLICKSMAN
SkyMiles #

FLIGHT SEAT
DELTA AIR LINES INC 4181 Select Seat
DELTA AIR LINES INC 3921 Select Seat

Visit delta.com or use the Fly Delta app to view, select or change your seat.
If you purchased a Delta Comfort+™ seat or a Trip Extra, please visit My Trips to access a receipt
of your purchase.

Flight Receipt

Ticket #: 0062378630234

Place of Issue: Delta.com

Ticket Issue Date: 05APR17

Ticket Expiration Date: 05APR18

METHOD OF PAYMENT

496.40 USD

CHARGES

Air Transportation Charges

Base Fare $435.34 USD

Taxes, Fees and Charges

United States - September 11th Security

Fee(Passenger Civil Aviation Security Service Fee) (AY)

$11.20 USD

United States - Transportation Tax (US) $32.66 USD

United States - Passenger Facility Charge (XF) $9.00 USD

United States - Flight Segment Tax (ZP) $8.20 USD

TICKET AMOUNT $496.40 USD

NONREF/NOCHGS/NOPRE RSVDSEAT

This ticket is non-refundable unless the original ticket was issued at a fully refundable fare. Some fares may not
allow changes. If allowed, any change to your itinerary may require payment of a change fee and increased fare.
Failure to appear for any flight without notice to Delta will result in cancellation of your remaining reservation.

Note: When using certain vouchers to purchase tickets, remaining credits may not be refunded. Additional charges
and/or credits may apply.

Fare Details: JFK DL CLE208.37TA7NA0BQ DL JFK Q18.60 208.37TA7NA0BQ USD435.34END ZP JFKCLE XF
JFK4.5CLE4.5

Checked Bag Allowance

The fees below are based on your original ticket purchase. If you qualify for free or

discounted checked baggage, this will be taken into account when you check in.

http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/chooseseat?ITINERARY.1.DL_REC_LOC=H4MVJO&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.FNAME=SCOTT&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.LNAME=GLICKSMAN
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/chooseseat?ITINERARY.1.DL_REC_LOC=H4MVJO&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.FNAME=SCOTT&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.LNAME=GLICKSMAN
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/dldotcom
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/dlapp
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/ticketno?ITINERARY.1.DL_REC_LOC=H4MVJO&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.FNAME=SCOTT&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.LNAME=GLICKSMAN
http://e.delta.com/a/hBY3yXAB8LP6IB89PgrNvSXXt.B8LP6IIL/ticketno?ITINERARY.1.DL_REC_LOC=H4MVJO&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.FNAME=SCOTT&ITINERARY.1.PSNGR_INFO.1.LNAME=GLICKSMAN


4/20/2017 Gmail - Your April 18 Trip with Ahmad Abdulqader

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=fe5a9c75ae&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15b83930961666f0&siml=15b83930961666f0 1/3

Your April 18 Trip with Ahmad Abdulqader
1 message

Juno Receipts <receipts@gojuno.com> Tue, Apr 18, 2017 at 8:17 PM
Reply­To: help@gojuno.com
To: 

Hey Scott,

Thank you for riding with us.

Because you rode with Juno, I earned $8.32 more

than with the competition at no additional

cost to you.

1 YOUR TRIP

April 18, 2017

$55.44
Including 10% Discount

530 E 13th St   
Manhattan — 6:11 PM

4 Central Terminal Area 
New York — 7:03 PM



4/20/2017 Gmail - Your April 18 Trip with Ahmad Abdulqader

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=fe5a9c75ae&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15b83930961666f0&siml=15b83930961666f0 2/3

2 FARE BREAKDOWN

Trip Fare 55.44

Subtotal $55.44

Charged

$55.44
Tax Summary
Before Taxes 49.93
Black Car Fund (2.44%) 1.08
Sales Tax (8.875%) 4.43

3 TRIP DETAILS

16.59 00:51:15 Bliss
Miles Trip time Car

4   YOUR DRIVER

You rode with Ahmad Abdulqader.

Affiliated with WEITER LLC

Dispatched by Vulcan Cars LLC

License Plate (T640868C)

FHV License Number: 5544977
Driver's TLC Number: 5734807
To submit a complaint to the NYC TLC,

Please call: 311

Ahmad Abdulqader

Yours,

WE ARE HERE 24/7

To contact us, simply reply to this email or call:

1­844­JUNO­USA (1­844­586­6872)



4/20/2017 Gmail - Your Tuesday evening trip with Uber

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=fe5a9c75ae&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15b845db7ae9df82&siml=15b845db7ae9df82 1/3

$19.47
Thanks for choosing Uber, Scott

April 18, 2017 | uberX

11:39pm | Lower Dr, Cleveland, OH

11:57pm | 655-777 St Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH

You rode with Michael

Your Tuesday evening trip with Uber
1 message

Uber Receipts <uber.us@uber.com> Tue, Apr 18, 2017 at 11:59 PM
To: 



4/20/2017 Gmail - Your Tuesday evening trip with Uber

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=fe5a9c75ae&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15b845db7ae9df82&siml=15b845db7ae9df82 2/3

13.12
miles

00:18:04
Trip time

uberX
Car

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Trip Fare 13.42

Subtotal $13.42

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees 6.05

$19.47

xid6b011fad­b08e­495a­97eb­85a3d2086fad
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a
free ride worth up to $15 when you
refer a friend to try Uber.

Share code: scottg742



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

Scott Glicksman
Police Assessment Resource Cen

Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 355534
Guest Number  : 312328
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Club Account  :

18-APR-17 23:59
20-APR-17
1
1636

Tax ID :
The Westin Cleveland  APR-20-2017  05:02  BARBNOE
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
18-APR-17 DEPOSIT -312.22
18-APR-17 RT1636 Room Charge 134.00
18-APR-17 RT1636 State Sales Tax 10.72
18-APR-17 RT1636 City Tax 4.02
18-APR-17 RT1636 County Tax 7.37
19-APR-17 1308 In Room Dining 24.52
19-APR-17 RT1636 Room Charge 134.00
19-APR-17 RT1636 State Sales Tax 10.72
19-APR-17 RT1636 City Tax 4.02
19-APR-17 RT1636 County Tax 7.37
20-APR-17 -24.52

Date        Code         Authorized DCC
18-APR-17 07468I 100

** Total  336.74 -336.74
*** Balance     0.00

Continued on the next page



Rosemary	Nidiry	
	

Police	Assessment	Resource	Center	(PARC)	
Invoice	Date:	April	22,	2017	
Attention:		Matthew	Barge	

April	19,	2017	Travel	Expenses	Invoice	

Expenses	
Date Biller Description of Expense Cost 
4/19 RN Car to LGA $ 48.80 
4/19 RN Flight (LGA/CLA RT) $ 668.40 
4/19 RN Uber to Cornucopia $ 20.79 
4/19 RN Per Diem (.75) $ 51.75 
4/19 RN Uber to CLE Airport $ 19.31 
4/19 RN Taxi from LGA $ 44.16 
Total $ 853.21 



Legends Limousine 
1 (888)-534-3637 www.legendslimousine.com 

Customer 

Time 

Pickup 

Dropoff 

Car Class 

Car# 

Cont# 

Pmt Type 

Pmt Status 

Fare 

Gratuity 

Convenience 
Fee 

Total 

Paid Before 

Current Pmt 

 

Rosemary Nidiry 

4/19/17 5:35 AM 

XXXXX XXX
BK: Brooklyn 11217 

LGA:DL 

LX 

68 

899472 

 Paid 

39.00 

7.80 

2.00 

48.80 

48.80 

Thank you for using Legends Limousine! 



SkyMiles®#*******011 >

Your Flight Receipt - ROSEMARY NIDIRY 19APR17
1 message

Tue, Apr 11, 2017 at 10:56 PMDelta Air Lines <DeltaAirLines@e.delta.com>
Reply-To: Delta Air Lines <support-b3j2q4ybfpayqkauzqx8kqc092xmva@e.delta.com> 
To:

Hello, ROSEMARY

 Your Trip Confirmation #: HOOWHZ

Wed, 19APR DEPART ARRIVE

DELTA AIR LINES INC 5126*

MAIN CABIN (L)

NYC-LAGUARDIA

6:50am

CLEVELAND, OH

8:38am

DELTA AIR LINES INC 5376*

MAIN CABIN (L)

CLEVELAND, OH

7:37pm

NYC-LAGUARDIA

9:15pm

*Flight 5126 Operated by EXPRESSJET DBA DELTA CONNECTION
*Flight 5376 Operated by EXPRESSJET DBA DELTA CONNECTION

RESTRICTED HAZARDOUS ITEMS

To ensure the safety of our customers and employees, Delta no longer accepts hoverboards or
any lithium battery powered self-balancing personal transportation devices on board its
aircraft. These items are prohibited as both carry-on and checked baggage.

Spare batteries for other devices, fuel cells, and e-cigarettes are permitted in carry-on
baggage only. If your carry-on bag contains these items and is gate checked, they must be
removed and carried in the cabin. Further information and specific guidelines regarding
restricted items can be found here.

KNOW BEFORE YOU GO

Due to increased TSA wait times, please arrive at LaGuardia Airport (LGA) 2 hours before your
scheduled departure time for all domestic flights and 3 hours before all international flights.

LaGuardia Construction Advisory

Please allow extra time for arrival to LaGuardia due to ongoing renovations. Click for more

Gmail - Your Flight Receipt - ROSEMARY NIDIRY 19APR17 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&...
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information.

Passenger Info

NAME
ROSEMARY NIDIRY
SkyMiles #*******

FLIGHT SEAT
DELTA AIR LINES INC 5126 13D
DELTA AIR LINES INC 5376 13D

Visit delta.com or use the Fly Delta app to view, select or change your seat.
If you purchased a Delta Comfort+™ seat or a Trip Extra, please visit My Trips to access a receipt
of your purchase.

Flight Receipt

Ticket #: 0062379340916

Place of Issue: Delta.com

Ticket Issue Date: 11APR17

Ticket Expiration Date: 11APR18

METHOD OF PAYMENT 

XX************ $668.40 USD

CHARGES

Air Transportation Charges

Base Fare $595.34 USD

Taxes, Fees and Charges

United States - September 11th Security

Fee(Passenger Civil Aviation Security Service Fee) (AY)

$11.20 USD

United States - Transportation Tax (US) $44.66 USD

United States - Passenger Facility Charge (XF) $9.00 USD

United States - Flight Segment Tax (ZP) $8.20 USD

TICKET AMOUNT $668.40 USD

NONREF/PENALTY APPLIES

This ticket is non-refundable unless the original ticket was issued at a fully refundable fare. Some fares may not
allow changes. If allowed, any change to your itinerary may require payment of a change fee and increased fare.
Failure to appear for any flight without notice to Delta will result in cancellation of your remaining reservation.

Note: When using certain vouchers to purchase tickets, remaining credits may not be refunded. Additional charges
and/or credits may apply.

Fare Details: LGA DL CLE297.67LA7UA0MQ DL LGA297.67LA7UA0MQ USD595.34END ZP LGACLE XF LGA4.5CLE4.5

Gmail - Your Flight Receipt - ROSEMARY NIDIRY 19APR17 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&...
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Checked Bag Allowance

The fees below are based on your original ticket purchase. If you qualify for free or

discounted checked baggage, this will be taken into account when you check in.

Wed 19 Apr 2017 DELTA AIR LINES INC: LGA  CLE

CARRY ON

FREE

FIRST

$25USD

SECOND

$35USD

Wed 19 Apr 2017 DELTA AIR LINES INC: CLE  LGA

CARRY ON

FREE

FIRST

$25USD

SECOND

$35USD

Transportation of Hazardous Materials

Federal law forbids the carriage of hazardous materials aboard aircraft in your luggage or on your person. A violation
can result in civil penalties. Examples include: Paints, aerosols, lighter fluid, fireworks, torch lighters, tear gases and
compressed gas cartridges.

There are special exceptions for small quantities (up to 70 ounces total). For further information visit
delta.com Restricted Items Section.

EARN MILES WITH AIRBNB. ›

Book your Airbnb via deltaairbnb.com and earn miles on all
stays. Plus, new guests also get $25 toward first qualifying
booking. Terms Apply.

BOOK YOUR SUMMER GETAWAY. ›

It's a great time to choose your next escape from more than
325 destinations on six continents.

 We have partnered with The Nature Conservancy to allow you to offset your carbon emissions from this trip. Go

Gmail - Your Flight Receipt - ROSEMARY NIDIRY 19APR17 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&...
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to delta.com/CO2 to calculate your CO2 emissions and learn more about offsetting.

Terms & Conditions

This ticket is non-refundable unless the original ticket was issued at a fully refundable fare. Some fares may not allow
changes. If allowed, any change to your itinerary may require payment of a change fee and increased fare. Failure to
appear for any flight without notice to Delta will result in cancellation of your remaining reservation.

Note: When using certain vouchers to purchase tickets, remaining credits may not be refunded. Additional charges
and/or credits may apply.

Checked Bag Allowance

*On Delta operated flights, you may carry on one bag and a small personal item at no charge.

Delta One™/First/Business Class weight allowance reverts to 50 lbs for all checked bags beyond regular free
allowance.

At the time of check in with Delta, SkyMiles Medallion members, SkyTeam Elite & Elite Plus and active US Military
personnel are eligible for fee waivers and other benefits. For more details, visit delta.com/baggage. Basic
Cardmembers with a Gold, Platinum, or Reserve Delta SkyMiles Credit Card from American Express are eligible for the
first bag fee waiver. More details on the program can be found at delta.com/firstbagfree.

A standard checked bag with Delta may be up to 50 lbs and 62 linear inches (per piece). Additional fees apply for
oversize, overweight, and/or additional pieces of checked baggage. Please review Delta's baggage guidelines for
details. Weight and size restrictions may vary when checking baggage on carriers other than Delta. Contact with the
operating carrier for detailed checked baggage allowances. You must be checked in at the gate by the applicable
check-in deadlines or your reservation may be cancelled. Please review Delta's check-in requirement guidelines for
details. Check-in requirements vary by airline, so if your ticket includes travel on other airlines, please check with the
operating carrier on your ticket.

Do you have comments about our service? Please email us to share them.

Conditions of Carriage

Air transportation on Delta and the Delta Connection® carriers is subject to Delta's conditions of carriage. They
include terms governing for example:

• Limits on our liability for personal injury or death of passengers, and for loss, damage of delay of goods and
baggage.
• Claim restrictions including time periods within which you must file a claim or bring action against us.
• Our right to change terms of the contract.
• Check-in requirements and other rules established when we may refuse carriage.
• Our rights and limits of our liability for delay or failure to perform service including schedule change, substitution of
alternative air carriers or aircraft, and rerouting.
• Our policy on overbooking flights, and your rights if we deny you boarding due to an oversold flight.

These terms are incorporated by reference into our contract with you. You may view these conditions of carriage on
delta.com, or by requesting a copy from Delta.

You have received this email because you elected to receive your Electronic Ticket receipt sent to you via email. If
you would like to take advantage of other Delta email programs featuring special fares, promotions, information and
flight updates, please visit: delta.com/emailprograms or delta.com/notifications.

This document establishes the creation of your electronic EMD(S) in our computer systems. It does not constitute a
document of carriage. Where this document is issued for transportation or services other than passenger air
transportation, specific terms and conditions may apply. These terms and conditions may be provided separately or
may be obtained from the issuing agent.

Copyright Information

This email message and its contents are copyrighted and are proprietary products of Delta Air Lines, Inc. Any
unauthorized use, reproduction, or transfer of this message or its contents, in any medium, is strictly prohibited.

This is a post only email (EMD+). Please do not respond to this message.

© 2017 Delta Air Lines, Inc. All rights reserved.

Gmail - Your Flight Receipt - ROSEMARY NIDIRY 19APR17 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&...
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Privacy Policy

Your privacy is important to us. Please review our Privacy Policy.

Gmail - Your Flight Receipt - ROSEMARY NIDIRY 19APR17 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&...
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$20.79
Thanks for choosing Uber, Rosemary

April 19, 2017 | uberX

09:25am | 6 Lower Dr, Cleveland, OH

09:46am | 2887 E 72nd St, Cleveland, OH

Your Wednesday morning trip with Uber
1 message

Sat, Apr 22, 2017 at 8:53 PMUber Receipts <uber.us@uber.com>

Gmail - Your Wednesday morning trip with Uber https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&s...
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You rode with Randy
13.61
miles

00:20:21
Trip time

uberX
Car

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Trip Fare 14.74

Subtotal $14.74

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees 6.05

CHARGED $20.79

xidb98b9918-1d79-4fe6-81c3-dc776f8c11bc
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a
free ride worth up to $15 when you
refer a friend to try Uber.

Gmail - Your Wednesday morning trip with Uber https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&s...
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Share code:
rosemaryn937ue

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.

Gmail - Your Wednesday morning trip with Uber https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&s...
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$19.31
Thanks for choosing Uber, Rosemary

April 19, 2017 | uberX

04:42pm | 655-777 St Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH

05:23pm | 3 Upper Dr, Cleveland, OH

Your Wednesday afternoon trip with Uber
1 message

Sat, Apr 22, 2017 at 8:53 PMUber Receipts <uber.us@uber.com>
To: 

Gmail - Your Wednesday afternoon trip with Uber https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&s...
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You rode with THURMAN
12.75
miles

00:41:19
Trip time

uberX
Car

Rate Your Driver

Your Fare

Trip Fare 13.26

Subtotal $13.26

Tolls, Surcharges, and Fees 6.05

CHARGED $19.31

xidde667d88-20b6-4373-8c09-ab19c300e45e
pGvlI2ANUbXFfyEOgxta1RMV082993

Invite your friends and family. Get a
free ride worth up to $15 when you
refer a friend to try Uber.

Gmail - Your Wednesday afternoon trip with Uber https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&s...
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Share code:
rosemaryn937ue

Need help?

Tap Help in your app to contact us with
questions about your trip.

Leave something behind? Track it down.

Gmail - Your Wednesday afternoon trip with Uber https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=ca57a2e5f7&view=pt&s...
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CREDIT RECEIPT 

HACK# : 00455584 
MEDALLION : 8U11 
04/19/17 22:11-22:41 
TRIP# : 12354 
RATE# : 1 
STAND. CITY RATE 
Miles R1 : 11.90 
FARE Rl : $35.50 
EXTRAS : $0.50 
STATE SRCHG: $0.50 
IMP.SRCHG. : $0.30 

����D TOTAL: $!�:r� 
***** 

AUTHOR
MID: ***********058 
ENTRY METHOD: 
CONTACT CHIP 
AID: A0000000041010 

002F 

APPL. NAME:  ATC: 
AC: 
8AB68835C5636FFF 

REC/I NU#: 12354 
TID: ***********279 

Contact TLC DIAL 3-1-1 



Nonny Onyekweli 
140 Hope St. 3D 

Brooklyn, NY 11211 
240 687 1357 

  
Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC)  
Invoice Date: April 30, 2017 
Attention:  Matthew Barge     

April 2017 Expenses Invoice 

Expenses 

*Flight change because I did not need to stay in Cleveland the extra night and incur 
another night at the hotel. 

Date Biller Description of Expense Cost

4/18 NO Car to LGA $28.80

4/18 NO Uber from CLE airport $19.82

4/19 NO Uber to Cornucupoia (CDC community 
forum)

$11.67

4/20 NO Taxi to Cle airport $15.24

4/20 NO Car from JFK $47.70

4/18-20 NO Per Diem (2 days @ daily rate) $138

4/18-20 NO Westin (2 nights) $312.22

4/18-20 NO Flight Round-trip $ 549.40

4/20 NO Fee to change flight* $50.00

Total $1172.85



Flight 
 

Apr 3 

 

 
 

 
to me 

 
 

 

 

  

  

Trip ID: 
SDFHK7Q9P 

If you have any questions, 
please call: 

1-866-951-6592 

  

Congrats, NONNEY! 

We're pleased to confirm the following details and  
transaction information for your upcoming trip named: 

Trip to Cleveland5 
  

 

    

Flights 

 
Flight Confirmation # 

G2BAZ4 

 

tel:(866)%20951-6592


Agency Reference # 
L4WQI8 

Departing Flight 

1 Ticket(s) | Tue, Apr 18 
Cancel your flight reservation online or call us at 1-866-951-6592 

 

Delta Air Lines 

DL 5271 *  
Canadair Regional Jet 700 | Economy  

*Operated by EXPRESSJET DBA DELTA CONNECTION  

New York 

9:30 AM 
LGA 

Tue, Apr 18 

    1hr 57min     

Non-stop 

Cleveland 

11:27 AM 
CLE 

Tue, Apr 18 

  
Additional Baggage Fees may apply. 

 

 

Returning Flight 

1 Ticket(s) | Fri, Apr 21 

 

Delta Air Lines 

DL 5306 *  
Canadair Regional Jet 700 | Economy  

*Operated by EXPRESSJET DBA DELTA CONNECTION  

Cleveland 

6:46 AM 
CLE 

Fri, Apr 21 

    1hr 43min     

Non-stop 

New York 

8:29 AM 
LGA 

Fri, Apr 21 

  
Additional Baggage Fees may apply. 

 

 

Passenger Information Request a Seat  

 
  

 

https://ultimaterewardspoints.chase.com/initialize-session?url=https%3a%2f%2fultimaterewardstravel.chase.com%2fSH%2fHandlers%2fReceptionDesk.ashx%3fpage%3dpaymentsummary%26ordid%3d23799695%26jp_cmp%3dcc%2fCNXEmail%2fema%2fTripConfirmation%2furCancelAir
tel:(866)%20951-6592
http://www.ixfr.com/C/hinikm/0/0/0/0/1/gjl/0/jlhi/geinjkkl
http://www.ixfr.com/C/hinikm/0/0/0/0/1/gjl/0/jlhi/geinjkkl
https://ultimaterewardspoints.chase.com/initialize-session?url=https%3a%2f%2fultimaterewardstravel.chase.com%2fSH%2fHandlers%2fReceptionDesk.ashx%3fpage%3dseatmap%26OrdID%3d23799695%26tpi%3d5336613%26tpl%3dSDFHK7Q9P


Passenger Flight 
 

NONNEY ONYEKWELI Esq Delta Air Lines 5271 
 

 
Delta Air Lines 5306 

   



Rules and Policies  
Cancellation: 

• If your reservation was made more than 7 days prior to your travel 
date: Cancellation is allowed in most cases before 9pm Mountain Time the day 
after you book your ticket for a full refund of the base fare and taxes, with no 
airline-imposed cancellation fee. A few airlines, such as Spirit, Frontier, Allegiant 
and Southwest Airlines, may have different timelines for cancellations. Call us 
for details at 1-866-951-6592. 

• If your reservation was made 7 days or less prior to your travel date: Only certain 
airlines permit free cancellation and a refund of the base fare and taxes, with no 
airline-imposed cancellation fee, until 9pm Mountain Time the day after your 
ticket is booked. A few airlines, such as Spirit, Frontier, Allegiant and Southwest 
Airlines, may have different timelines for cancellations. Airline Fare Rules can 
be viewed online on your Trip Details page. 

• For changes or cancellations outside of the free cancellation period see the 
Refunds section below. 

Refunds: 

• This ticket is non-refundable. 

• Some non-refundable tickets do not allow any changes. Some non-refundable 
tickets can be applied (for a limited time) toward future travel, but all changes to 
your itinerary may result in a fare adjustment and will incur a per ticket airline 
change fee. Airline Fare Rules can be viewed online on your Trip Details page. 
Changes or cancellations must be made by calling us at 1-866-951-6592. 

General: 

• All tickets are non-transferable. 

• Carry-on baggage restrictions will apply. Your selected airline's baggage fees will 
apply. Airlines may charge additional fees for miscellaneous services such as 
advance seat selection, food and beverage. Fees vary by airline so you must 
contact the airline directly or check their website for up to date information and 
pricing details. 

• A small number of air carriers may require us to confirm flight availability when 
booking. If there is any issue with availability, a travel representative will contact 
you within 24 hours to make alternate flight arrangements at no additional cost. 

• Government-issued photo identification is required at check-in and must match the 
name on the reservation. If this is an international flight, this reservation requires 
a passport and may require a visa and satisfaction of health requirements. 
Please contact the consulate of the destination country for current visa/passport 
and other entry requirements. 

• Please refer to the Travel Disclosures for more information. 

  

tel:(866)%20951-6592
https://ultimaterewardspoints.chase.com/initialize-session?url=https%3a%2f%2fultimaterewardstravel.chase.com%2fSH%2fHandlers%2fReceptionDesk.ashx%3fpage%3dtravelplanDetail%26tpi%3dSDFHK7Q9P_5336613
https://ultimaterewardspoints.chase.com/initialize-session?url=https%3a%2f%2fultimaterewardstravel.chase.com%2fSH%2fHandlers%2fReceptionDesk.ashx%3fpage%3dtravelplanDetail%26tpi%3dSDFHK7Q9P_5336613
tel:(866)%20951-6592
http://www.ixfr.com/C/jehefh/0/0/0/0/1/gjl/0/jlhi/geinjkkl


Payment Summary 

Total $549.40 USD 

Points Redeemed: 0 

Points Value Redeemed: $0.00 USD 

Amount Billed to Card: $549.40 USD 

XXXX-XXXX-XXXX-0464 
 

 

 
 
Flight Change 
 



 
Uber to LGA  



 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

$28.80 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Nonny 

April 18, 2017 | uberX 
 

 
    

 

   

 07:47am |  

   

 08:10am | Terminal C, East Elmhurst, NY 
  

    

 
 
Car from CLE 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  

Thanks for riding with Takias! 
April 18, 2017 at 11:29 AM 

 

  

  
 

 

Ride Details 
 

 

Lyft fare (13.19mi, 19m 5s) $19.82 
    

 

 Visa *0464 $19.82 
 



  
  

 

  

 
Pickup 11:29 AM 
 

  Inner Dr, Cleveland, OH 

 

  

 
Dropoff 11:48 AM 
 

  686 St Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH 
       

 
Uber to CornuCopia 
 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

$11.67 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Nonny 

April 19, 2017 | uberX 
 

 
    

 

   

 06:09pm | 1325 E 6th St, Cleveland, OH 

   

 06:24pm | 823 E 152nd St, Cleveland, OH 
  

    

 
 
Uber  to CLE airport 



 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

$15.24 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Nonny 

April 20, 2017 | uberX 
 

 
    

 

   

 05:09am | 655-777 St Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH 

   

 05:25am | 2 Upper Dr, Cleveland, OH 
  

  

 
 

 

$47.70 
Thanks for choosing Uber, Nonny 

April 20, 2017 | uberX 
 

 
    

   

 08:23am | JFK International Airport, Terminal 4, John F. Kennedy International Airport 

(JFK), Jamaica, NY 



 

   

 09:15am | 140 Hope St, Brooklyn, NY 
  

  

 
Westin (2 Nights) 

 



elphia, INVOICE
Charles H Ramsey & Associates DATE 5/1/17

INVOICE # 15
CUSTOMER ID

BILL TO SHIP TO Charles H. Ramsey
Charles H. Ramsey & Associates

Matthew Barge
Vice President& Deputy Director 
Police Assessment Resource Center 
New York, NY

JOB PAYMENT TERMS
Due on receipt

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Invoice for April 2017
Weekly Conference Calls 2hr x $250 per hour = $500
Review of CDP Directives 12.5hrs x $250 per hour = $3125.00

April Site Visit 16hrsx$250per hour= $4,000.00
Airfare $828.40
Taxi/Uber
Hotel $312.22
Food per diem $69day x 2days $138.00
Travel time Pro Bono

Invoice for April 2017

Total $8,903.62

Make all checks payabe to Charles H. Ramsey. Thank you for your business

�1

Pro Bono 2.5









Rosenthal PARC Invoice 

Page | 1 
 

RICHARD ROSENTHAL 

APRIL 2017 INVOICE 

 

BILLABLE HOURS 
 
Date      Activity        Hours 

4/3/17 Telephone Meetings 1.5 

4/4/17 Telephone Meetings/Correspondence 0.6 

4/7/17 Review of OPS Documents/Correspondence/Editing of FIT 
Manual/Telephone Meetings 

3.4 

4/8/17 FIT Manual editing/OPS document revisions 2.5 

4/10/17 Telephone Meeting 1.0 

4/13/17 Telephone Meetings 2.1 

4/15/17 Semi Annual Report 4.0 

4/16/17 Semi Annual Report 3.4 

4/17/17 Correspondence/Telephone Meetings 0.7 

4/18/17 Telephone Conference/Correspondence/Meeting 
preparation/Court filing/OPS document review & edit 

4.3 

4/19/17 Cleveland Meetings/PRB Meeting/Court filing 11.0 

4/20/17 OPS Office Meetings/Meetings with Law Department, DOJ & OPS 9.2 

4/23/17 OPS Documents & correspondence 0.5 

4/24/17 Telephone Meeting 1.3 

4/25/17 Telephone Calls/Telephone Meetings/Document Review/Court 
filing 

1.7 

4/26/17 Telephone Calls/Agenda & Policy edits/PRB manual 
edits/Correspondence 

2.5 

4/27/17 Telephone Meeting/Telephone Call/Policy 
Review/Correspondence review/court filing 

2.1 

4/28/17 Telephone Meeting & follow up telephone 
calls/Correspondence/FIT policy review/OPS document review 

4.1 

4/30/17 Semi-Annual Report 1.5 

 
  Total Hours Worked:       57.4 
  Total Hours Billed:       44.9 
   Rate: $250/hour 
 
  TOTAL BILLED:        $11,225 
  Pro Bono Hours        12.5 
 

 
REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

 
Date   Expense       Amount 

3/26/17 Airfare United Airlines $525.62* 

4/18/17 Parking at Vancouver Airport $35.92** 



Rosenthal PARC Invoice 

Page | 2 

4/18/17 Mileage to Airport (43.8 miles) @ $0.535/mile $23.43 

4/18/17 Taxi from Airport to Hotel $43.20 

4/18/17 ½ day per diem $34.50 

4/19/17 Per Diem $69.00 

4/20/17 Per Deim $69.00 

4/21/17 ½ day per diem $34.50 

4/21/17 Hotel – Renaissance Cleveland $468.33 

4/21/17 Taxi to Airport $37.00 

4/21/17 Mileage from Airport (43.8 miles) @$0.535 $23.43 

Total: $1,363.93 

*$734.66 CAD 
**$50.20 CAD 



U N I T E D ." A 8TAFI AlUIANCE:: t.i1EM8ER "i-J" 
Confirmation: 

HZZJKB 

Check-In > 
Issue Date: March 26, 2017 

Traveler 
ROSENTHAL/RICHARDALAN 
FLIGHT INFORMATION 

eTicket Number 

0162341557045 
Frequent Flyer 

UA-XXXXXX 
Seats 

24F/26F/31A/28F 

Day, Date Flight Class Departure City and Time 
Tue, 18APR17 UA0246 P VANCOUVER, BC CANADA 

(YVR) 9:45 AMI 
Tue, 18APR17 UA0702 P 

Fri, 21APR17 UA1875 T 

Fri, 21APR17 UA0287 T 

FARE INFORMATION 

CHICAGO, IL 
(ORD - O'HARE) 5:33 PM

CLEVELAND, OH 
(CLE) 7:47 AM

CHICAGO, IL 
(ORD - O'HARE) 9:20 AM 

Arrival City and Time Aircraft Meal 
CHICAGO, IL 737-800 Lunch
(ORD - O'HARE) 3:47 PM

CLEVELAND, OH 737-700
(CLE) 7:51 PM

CHICAGO, IL 737-700
(ORD - O'HARE) 8:20 AM

VANCOUVER, BC CANADA A-319 Purchase
(YVR) 11:50 AM

Fare Breakdown 
Airfare: 581.odcAD

12.10
20.00 

MileagePlus Account MileagePlus Miles Debited/ 
Award Used: 

Canadian Security Charge: 
Canada Airport Improvement 
Fee: 
Canada Goods and Services Tax: 
U.S. Customs User Fee: 
U.S. Immigration User Fee: 
U.S. APHIS User Fee: 
U.S. Transportation Tax: 
September 11th Security Fee: 
U.S. Passenger Facility Charge: 
Per Person Total: 

eTicket Total: 

30.66 
7.30 
9.30 
5.30 

48.00 
15.00 

6.00 
734.66CAD 

734.66CAD 

The airfare you paid on this itinerary totals: 581.00 CAD 

The taxes, fees, and surcharges paid total: 153.66 CAD 

Award Rules: 

Additional 
Charges: 

Additional charges may apply for changes in addition to any fare rules listed. 
NONREF/0VALUAFTDPT/CHGFEE;YUL POS END 
All changes must be made prior to the departure date, or the ticket has no value. 

Sun., Mar. 26, 2017/Visa 978� was charged 
 

75 USD for the / EDD 01629226176395
75.00 USD for: _M1leagePlus Ugrade Fee

Sun., Mar. 26, 2017/XXXXXX was charged 132.01 CAD for the / EDD 01629226164521 
132.01 CAD for: Premium Cabin Upgrade 

Sun., Mar. 26, 2017/ was charged 265.35 CAD for the / EDD 01629226164510 
265.35 CAD for: Premium Cabin Upgrade 

I 

Baggage allowance and charges for this itinerary. 

Baggage fees are per traveler 

Origin and destination for checked baaapqe 1st baa 2nd 
baa Max wt / dim per piece 

4/18/2017 Vancouver, BC Canada (YVR) to Cleveland, OH 0.00 CAD 0.00 CAD 70.0lbs (32.0kg) - 62.0in 
(CLE) (157.0cm) 

4/21/2017 Cleveland, OH (CLE) to Vancouver, BC Canada 25.00 35.00 50.0lbs (23.0kg) - 62.0in 
(YVR) USD USD (157.0cm) 







0 

11!!!!1!!!!!:

� \'.l.t-,1( OU\•ER 

- � INTrnNl!,TiONt,_ lTJ - AIRPORi 

Beyond, Every Day. 

Thank you for your reservation. Please print
1 
this \confirmation as it contains the details of your reservation and

additional practical information. In addition, an email confirmation will be sent to (r.rosenthal@shaw.ca) (if you have not 
received this email please be sure to check your �pam or junk folder). 

Parking Space 

Reference No. 
Car Park 

Arrive 
Depart 

Parking Sales Tax 
GST on Parking Sales Tax 

GST 
Price 

BCAACard No 
Saving 

Primary Access Method 
Secondary Access Method 

Name 
Daytime Telephone 

Email address 
License Plate 

Credit Card Type 
Credit Card Number 

TOTAL 

I 

X4862 

X4862 

jetSet Parking - BCAA 

Tue 18 April 2017 08:00 

Fri 21 April 2017 12:30 

8.30 

0.41 

1.98 

$50.20 

6202738780907018 
$9.80 

License Plate 
QR Code 

Mr Richard Rosenthal 
XXXXXXXX

 XXXXXX
Credit Card ************

$50.20 













R 
RENAISSANCE

« 

CLEVELAND HOTEL 

24 Public Square 
Cleveland, OH 44113 
(216) 696 - 5600 
(216)696-0432 FAX 

678 ROSENTHAl/RICHARD/M 134.00 04/21/17 11:00 
ROOM NAME 

NSKG 
TYPE 

ROOM 
CLERK BC V4SlC5 

ADDRESS 

I DATE I REFERENCE I 

04/18 ROOM 678, 1 
04/18 ROOM TAX 678, 1 
04/18 CITY TAX 678, 1 
04/18 CNTY TAX 678, 1 
04/19 ROOM 678, 1 
04/19 ROOM TAX 678, 1 
04/19 CITY TAX 678, 1 
04/19 CNTY TAX 678, l 
04/20 SANS SOU 1279 678 
04/20 ROOM 678, l 
04/20 ROOM TAX 678, l 
04/20 CITY TAX 678, 1 
04/20 CNTY TAX 678, l 

RATE DEPART TIME 

04/18/17 20:11 
ARRIVE TIME 

PAYMENT 

CHARGES 

134.00 
10.72 
4.02 
7.37 

134.00 
10.72 
4.02 
7.37 
5.00 

134.00 
10.72 
4.02 
7.37 

CREDITS 

GUEST FOLIO 

MRW#: XXXXX 

BALANCE DUE 

473.33 

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO: 

SEE "INTERNET PRIVACY STATEMENT" ON MARRIOTT.COM

R 
RENAISSANCE� 

f R
E

01r1 � ,tlfiHrT 

24 Public Square 
Cleveland, OH 44113 
(216) 696 -5600
(216l 698�RA ttb UNDER LICENSE 

INTERNATIONAL, INC. OR ONE OF ITS AFFILIATES 
This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed to pay in ca,h or by approved personal check or to authorize us to charge your credit card for all amounts charged to 
you. The amount shown in the credits column opposite any credit card entry in the reference column above will be charged to the credit card number set forth above. (The 
credit card company will bill in the usual manner.) If for any reason the credit card company does not make payment on this account, you will owe us such amount. If you 
are direct billed, in the event payment is not made within 25 days after check-out, you will owe us interest from the check-out date on any unpaid amount at the rate of 1.5'¥o 
per month (ANNUAL RA TE 18%), or the maximum allowed by law, plus the reasonable cost of collection, including attorney fees. 

SignalureX -------------,-----------------------

-omit

Student
Highlight



Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 
Victor A. Ruiz 

TO:  Matthew Barge 
  Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Victor A. Ruiz  

DATE:  5/1/2017 
April 2017 INVOICE 
BILLABLE HOURS 

Date 
Worked

Work Description Billable 
Hours

4/3/2017 Team Call re CPOP Meetings 0.75

4/3/2017 All Team Call 0.75

4/7/2017 Team call 0.75

4/8/2017 CPOP and Focus Group work 0.75

4/10/2017 All team call 1

4/11/2017 Team Call 1

4/12/2017 Call with Sandy re focus groups 0.25

4/17/2017 All team call 0.75

4/17/2017 Community Engagement Call 0.75

4/19/2017 CPOP Meeting Mid-Town 1

4/20/2017 Prep for CPOP Meeting 1.5

4/20/2017 CPOP Meeting Detroit Shoreway 2

4/21/2017 Focus group update call 0.75

4/21/2017 Team Call 1

4/22/2017 Review of InFocus focus group info 0.5

4/24/2017 Weekly team call 1.25

4/24/2017 Call w/ J. MacIntosh re focus groups 0.25

4/26/2017 Meeting with InFocus 1.5



REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 

Total Hours Worked 16.5

Total Billed Hours 11

              Rate: $250/hour $250

TOTAL BILLED $2,750.00

Pro Bono Hours 5.5

Travel Hours 3

Date Expense Amount REF

Parking $0

Transportation $0

Accommodations    $0

Per Diem (1 day)      $0

TOTAL EXPENSES $0



2017 4 Cleveland Project BUI- Scott Sargent 

DATE Ap'1l 1017 

To; Matthew Bargo 
Polko Assessment Resource Center 

Invoice 

... ActMty ·ttours

41!7/2017 Atta"� UOf Tramms PreView aca<Jemy/range (plus 2.5 pro bono) 

4/lR/2017 DOJ Meetln� and Clovol•1>d City MeeU,,q '00 

4/IS/2011 3rd D�trlcl 1l<le·a·loog ,.oo 

" 8.5 

Pro-1\ooo Hou,s 

Cool CoH,;E<nall,IUOf lloc, re,iew/ew aca<Jemy/range A

7.5 

Total Hours 16.00 

Worked 

8111ed 250,.8.5 $2,125.00 

2.5

& UOF training preview

- total pro bono

-total billed



Date(s) 

4/1612017 

furn 

4/1912017 

Tomi 

:',-:'·.�' 

2017-4 Cleve/and Pl()jec.t Expenses- Scott Sargent 

hwoictJ 

�, # Hotel # Food # Trans 

317.00 ' 468,33 ' 138.00 PO" 69.10 

317 00 468.33 0.00 69.10 

>: ''" :;;,;,-;c(\{i?\f�-' . . '-_., . ''· i . 

# 

1,3.4 

Total 

854.43 



















ELLEN SCRIVNER, Ph.D., ABPP 

TO: Matthew Barge 
Meg Olsen 
Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Ellen Scrivner 

DATE: May 1, 2017 

  APRIL 2017 INVOICE 
BILLABLE HOURS 

______________________________________________________________
_ 
DATE   ACTIVITY  
HOURS 
______________________________________________________________
_4-13-17 Reviewed 7 Use of Force Training Modules (Pro Bono) 2.5 

4-17-17 Conference Call with UOF Training Group  
re on site OUF Training Observations  1.0 

______________________________________________________________
_ 
4-24-17 Monitoring Team Call 1.5 

4-26-17 Prepared Comments for Semi-Annual Report/OIS 2.0 
And Submitted to M.Barge and H. Aden.  

____________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________ 
TOTAL HOURS     7 HOURS 

________________________________________________________ 

TOTAL BILLED HOURS  4.5 HOURS 
Rate: $250/hour 



T0TAL BILLED    $1125.00 

______________________________________________________________
_ 
__________________REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES 
DATE:  EXPENSE   AMOUNT  REF 
______________________________________________________________ 
No Reimbursable Expenses This Month 
______________________________________________________________ 
______________________________________________________________

______________________________________________________________  
______________________________________________________________ 

 Please remit to the Florida Address: 

Ellen Scrivner, Ph. D., ABPP 



Cleveland Monitoring Reimbursement 
2017 04 Cleveland Project Bill – Charles R. See 

TO: Matthew Barge 

        Meg Olsen 

        Police Assessment Resource Center 

FROM: Charles R. See  

DATE: 5/03/2017   
 2017 INVOICE  

BILLABLE HOURS 

Date  Activity  Hours___ 
04/03/17  Engagement Team Conference Call______  _.9 hrs._ 
04/03/17  All Team Conference Call_________________________  .7 hrs._ 
04/04/17  Stakeholders Meeting__  _1.5 hrs._ 
04/10/17   All Team Conference call__  _1.0 hr.__ 

04/11/17   Engagement Team Call________  _1.0 hr._ 
04/11/17  Second District Committee meeting_  1.8 hrs._ 
04/17/17  All Team Conference Call______  1.0 hrs._ 
04/19/17  5th District Committee meeting_  1.5hrs._ 
04/20/17       Meeting with Community Relations Board members_  _1.5hrs._ 

 _ 
04/21/17  Engagement Team Call_  _1.2 hrs.__ 
04/24/17  All Team Conference Call_  _1.1 hrs.__ 
04/25/17  Cleveland Community Police Commission Meeting_  2.0 hrs.__ 
04/26/17     in-Focus staff meetings______________________________    _1.5 hrs. _ 
04/26/17  Forth District Community Policing Meeting_  1.8 hrs.__ 
04/28/17  Engagement Team Conference Call____  _.6 hrs.__ 
________________________________________________________________________ 

Total hours Worked:_41.6_____  

Total Billed Hours: 19.1_______ 

  Rate: $250 Per hour_________ 

Total Billed: $4,775__________ 

Pro Bono Hours:___22.5  



Pro Bono hours consisted of: travel, phone calls, meetings, correspondence, mileage expense, 
planning and various document review, and e-mails   

Charles R. See, 

Charles R. See  

Director of Community Engagement 
Cleveland Monitoring Team  
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Matthew Barge Invoice # 17-004

Police Assessment Resource Center (PARC)

Date Service Hrs.

04/03/17 Community engagement team conference call 0.75

04/03/17 All-Team conference call 0.67

04/03/17 C-POP meeting coordination 1

04/04/17 C-POP community meeting coordination & outreach & food fundraising 0.5

04/05/17 C-POP community meeting coordination & outreach 0.5

04/06/17 C-POP community meeting coordination & outreach & food fundraising 1.25

04/07/17 Community engagement team conference call 1

04/10/17 All-Team conference call 0.9

04/10/17 Community partners conference call 1

04/11/17 Community engagement team conference call -DPC discussion 1

04/11/17 2nd District policing committee meeting & prep for presentation 1.75

04/17/17 Community engagement team call 0.5

04/17/17 All-Team conference call & community engagement team call 0.8

04/18/17 C-POP meeting coordination 1

04/19/17 CDC & business districts C-POP stakeholder meetings 6

04/19/17 5th District policing committee meeting 1.5

04/20/17 Outreach to C-POP community meetings partners 0.5

04/20/17 Meet with CDP to discuss district policing committees 0.8

04/21/17 Outreach to C-POP community meetings partners 1.2

04/21/17 Community engagement team call 1.1

04/24/17 All-Team call 1.5

04/25/17 Outreach to C-POP community meetings partners 1.1

04/25/17 CPC meeting 2.25

04/26/17 Outreach to C-POP community meetings partners 2

04/26/17 Focus group meeting 1.5

04/26/17 4th District policing committee meeting & prep for presentation 1.5

04/27/17 Outreach to C-POP community meetings partners 2

04/28/17 Community engagement team conference call 0.55

04/28/17 Prepare materials for Community Builders Conference 0.5

04/29/17 Cleveland Community Builders Conference 2

Total Hours Worked (excluding travel) 38.62

Pro Bono Work Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $3,750.00 15

Pro Bono Travel Hours Rate: $250.00 /hour $917.50 3.67

Pro Bono Mileage & Parking Rate: 0.54 /mile $28.08

Total Billed Rate: $250.00 /hour $5,905.00 23.62

2017 4 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE

April 2017 EXPENSES

SUMMARY OF HOURS WORKED

May 1, 2017



page 2 of 2

Date Reimbursable Expense REF

Transportation

Total Transportation

Accommodations

None this month

Total Accommodations

Per Diem

None this month

Total Per Diem

Other Expense

Total Other Expense

Total Billed Reimbursable Expenses

Pro Bono Contributions $4,695.58

Billed Hours $5,905.00

Billed Reimbursable Exp $0.00

Total Amount Due $5,905.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Amount Paid

SUMMARY OF REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

2017 4 CLEVELAND PROJECT BILL - TIMOTHY TRAMBLE
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